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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMETS

1.1 Shirts 100% Cotton

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name UNIFIRST CORPORATION
Open Date: Address 9019 RAILWOOD DR
Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012
at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77078

Contact BILL FREEMAN

Phone number 713-635-1100

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMENTS
1.1 Shirts, 100% Cotton, Permanent Press
RedCap or Equivalent
Note: Price to include 1 sewn on embroidered patch with County logo and department name and 1 sewn on
embroidered patch with employee name and/or title; American and Texas flags
County
Style Price Per
Description ITEM ID# UOM | Mfr Name | Number UOM
Long Sleeve, Regular, S 6861 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $16.79
Long Sleeve, Regular, M 6862 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $16.79
Long Sleeve, Regular, L 6863 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $16.79

Long Sleeve, Regular, XL 6864 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $16.79

Long Sleeve, Regular, 2XL 6865 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $16.79

Long Sleeve, Regular, 3XL 6866 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $18.79

Long Sleeve, Regular, 4XL 6867 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $18.79

Long Sleeve, Regular, 5XL 6868 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $18.79

Long Sleeve, Regular, 6XL 6869 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $18.79

Long Sleeve, Regular, 7XL 6870 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $20.79

Short Sleeve, Regular, S 6871 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $16.09
Short Sleeve, Regular, M 6872 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $16.09
Short Sleeve, Regular, L 6873 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $16.09

Short Sleeve, Regular, XL 6874 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $16.09

Short Sleeve, Regular, 2XL 6875 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $16.09

Short Sleeve, Regular, 3XL 6876 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $18.09

Short Sleeve, Regular, 4XL 6877 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $18.09

Short Sleeve, Regular, 5XL 6878 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $18.09

Short Sleeve, Regular, 6XL 6879 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $18.09

Short Sleeve, Regular, 7XL 6880 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $20.09

Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), M 6881 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $18.79

Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), L 6882 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $18.79
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), XL 6883 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $18.79
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 2XL 6884 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $18.79
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 3XL 6885 EA |uNIFIRST 0101 $20.79
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 4XL 6886 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $20.79
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 5XL 6887 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $20.79
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 6XL 6888 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $20.79
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 7XL 6889 EA JUNIFIRST 0101 $22.79
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), M 6890 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $18.09
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), L 6891 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $18.09
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), XL 6892 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $18.09
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 2XL 6893 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $18.09
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 3XL 6894 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $20.09
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 4XL 6895 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $20.09
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 5XL 6896 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $20.09
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 6XL 6897 EA JUNIFIRST 0201 $20.09
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 7XL 6898 EA  JUNIFIRST 0201 $22.09
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

1.2 Shirts 100% Cotton, Flame Resistant

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

UNIFIRST CORPORATION

Open Date: Address 9019 RAILWOOD DR

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77078
Contact BILL FREEMAN

Phone number

713-635-1100

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMENTS

1.2 SHIRTS, 100% COTTON, FLAME RESISTANT (For Welding) REDCAP OR EQUIVALENT

Note: Price to include 1 sewn on embroidered patch with County logo and department name and 1 sewn on
embroidered patch with employee name and/or title; American and Texas flags

County

Style Price Per
Description ITEM ID# UoM Mfr Name Number UoM
Long Sleeve, Regular, S 6903 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $37.70
Long Sleeve, Regular, M 6904 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $37.70
Long Sleeve, Regular, L 6905 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $37.70
Long Sleeve, Regular, XL 6906 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $37.70
Long Sleeve, Regular, 2XL 6907 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $37.70
Long Sleeve, Regular, 3XL 6908 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $39.70
Long Sleeve, Regular, 4XL 6909 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $39.70
Long Sleeve, Regular, 5XL 6910 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $39.70
Long Sleeve, Regular, 6XL 6911 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $39.70
Long Sleeve, Regular, 7XL 6912 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $41.70
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), M 6923 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $39.70
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), L 6924 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $39.70
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), XL 6925 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $39.70
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 2XL 6926 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $39.70
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 3XL 6927 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $41.70
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 4XL 6928 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $41.70
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 5XL 6929 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $41.70
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 6XL 6930 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $41.70
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 7XL 6931 EA UNIFIRST 09FT $43.70
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1.3 Shirts, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton, Soil Release Fabric

BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name UNIFIRST CORPORATION
Open Date: Address 9019 RAILWOOD DR
Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012
at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77078

Contact BILL FREEMAN

Phone number 713-635-1100

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMENTS

1.3 SHIRTS, 65% POLYESTER 35% COTTON, SOIL RELEASE FABRIC, REDCAP OR EQUIVALENT

Note: Price to include 1 sewn on embroidered patch with County logo and department name and 1 sewn on
embroidered patch with employee name and/or title; American and Texas flags
County
ITEM Style Price Per

Description ID# UOM Mfr Name | Number UOM
Long Sleeve, Regular, S 6941 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $13.34
Long Sleeve, Regular, M 6942 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $13.34
Long Sleeve, Regular, L 6943 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $13.34

Long Sleeve, Regular, XL 6944 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $13.34

Long Sleeve, Regular, 2XL 6945 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $13.34

Long Sleeve, Regular, 3XL 6946 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $15.34

Long Sleeve, Regular, 4XL 6947 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $15.34

Long Sleeve, Regular, 5XL 6948 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $15.34

Long Sleeve, Regular, 6XL 6949 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $15.34

Long Sleeve, Regular, 7XL 6950 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $17.34

Short Sleeve, Regular, S 6951 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $11.62
Short Sleeve, Regular, M 6952 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $11.62
Short Sleeve, Regular,L 6953 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $11.62

Short Sleeve, Regular, XL 6954 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $11.62

Short Sleeve, Regular, 2XL 6955 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $11.62

Short Sleeve, Regular, 3XL 6956 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $13.62

Short Sleeve, Regular, 4XL 6957 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $13.62

Short Sleeve, Regular, 5XL 6958 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $13.62

Short Sleeve, Regular, 6XL 6959 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $13.62

Short Sleeve, Regular, 7XL 6960 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $15.62

Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), M 6961 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $15.34
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), L 6962 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $15.34
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), XL 6963 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $15.34
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 2XL 6964 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $15.34
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 3XL 6965 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $17.34
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 4XL 6966 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $17.34
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 5XL 6967 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $17.34
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 6XL 6968 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $17.34
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 7XL 6969 EA UNIFIRST 0102 $19.34
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), M 6970 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $13.62
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), L 6971 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $13.62
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), XL 6972 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $13.62
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 2XL 6973 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $13.62
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 3XL 6974 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $15.62
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 4XL 6975 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $15.62
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 5XL 6976 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $15.62
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 6XL 6977 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $15.62
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails), 7XL 6978 EA UNIFIRST 0202 $17.62
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS
1.4 Coveralls, 100% Cotton

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

UNIFIRST CORPORATION

Open Date: Address 9019 RAILWOOD DR

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77078
Contact BILL FREEMAN

Phone number

713-635-1100

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMENTS

1.4 COVERALLS, 100% COTTON, G&K 23614 OR EQUIVALENT

Note: Price to include 1 sewn on embroidered patch with County logo and department name and 1 sewn on
embroidered patch with employee name and/or title; American and Texas flags

County
Style Price Per
Description ITEM ID# UOM Mfr Name | Number UOM

Regular, size 28 6979 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $31.00
Regular, size 30 6980 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $31.00
Regular, size 32 6981 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $31.00
Regular, size 34 6982 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $31.00
Regular, size 36 6983 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $31.00
Regular, size 38 6984 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $31.00
Regular, size 40 6985 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $31.00
Regular, size 42 6986 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $31.00
Regular, size 44 6987 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $31.00
Regular, size 46 6988 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $31.00
Regular, size 48 6989 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $35.00
Regular, size 50 6990 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $35.00
Regular, size 52 6991 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $35.00
Regular, size 54 6992 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $35.00
Regular, size 56 6993 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $35.00
Tall, size 36 6994 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $33.00
Tall, size 38 6995 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $33.00
Tall, size 40 6996 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $33.00
Tall, size 42 6997 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $33.00
Tall, size 44 6998 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $33.00
Tall, size 46 6999 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $33.00
Tall, size 48 7000 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $37.00
Tall, size 50 7001 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $37.00
Tall, size 52 7002 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $37.00
Tall, size 54 7003 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $37.00
Tall, size 56 7004 EA UNIFIRST 3001 $37.00
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BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS
1.5 Coveralls, 65% Polyester, 35% Cotton, Soil Release Fabric

Bidders name UNIFIRST CORPORATION
Open Date: Address 9019 RAILWOOD DR
Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012
at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77078

Contact BILL FREEMAN

Phone number 713-635-1100

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMENTS
1.5 COVERALLS,65% POLYESTER 35% COTTON, SOIL RELEASE FABRIC, G & K 98576 OR
EQUIVALENT
Note: Price to include 1 sewn on embroidered patch with County logo and department name and 1 sewn on
embroidered patch with employee name and/or title; American and Texas flags
County
ITEM Style Price Per
Description ID# UOM Mfr Name | Number UOM

Regular, size 28 7499 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $25.00
Regular, size 30 7500 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $25.00
Regular, size 32 7501 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $25.00
Regular, size 34 7502 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $25.00
Regular, size 36 7503 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $25.00
Regular, size 38 7504 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $25.00
Regular, size 40 7505 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $25.00
Regular, size 42 7506 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $25.00
Regular, size44 7507 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $25.00
Regular, size 46 7508 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $25.00
Regular, size 48 7509 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $29.00
Regular, size 50 7510 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $29.00
Regular, size 52 7511 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $29.00
Regular, size 54 7512 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $29.00
Regular, size 56 7513 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $29.00
Tall, size 36 7514 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $27.00
Tall, size 38 7515 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $27.00
Tall, size 40 7516 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $27.00
Tall, size 42 7517 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $27.00
Tall, size 44 7518 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $27.00
Tall, size 46 7519 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $27.00
Tall, size 48 7520 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $31.00
Tall, size 50 7521 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $31.00
Tall, size 52 7522 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $31.00
Tall, size 54 7523 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $31.00
Tall, size 56 7524 EA UNIFIRST 3002 $31.00
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

1.6 Industrial Pant, 65% Polyester, 35% Cotton, Jean Style Waistband with button
closure, front and back pockets

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ARAMARK UNIFORM AND CAREER

APPAREL

Open Date: Address 115 N. FIRST ST

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm BURBANK, CA 91502
Contact DEAN SCALIA

Phone number

818-973-3720

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMENTS

1.6 Industrial Pant, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton, Jean style waistband with button closure, front and back pockets.

RedCap or Equivalent

Style  |County Price|
DESCRIPTION ITEM ID UOM Mfr Name Number Per UOM
Size 28 7006 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 30 7007 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 32 7008 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 34 7009 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 36 7010 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 38 7011 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 40 7012 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 42 7013 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 44 7014 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
Size 46 7015 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
Size 48 7016 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
Size 50 7017 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
Size 52 7018 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
Size 54 7019 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
Size 56 7020 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99

1.7 Industrial Pant, 100% Cotton, Wrinkle Resistant, Preshrunk, Jean Style
Waistband with Button Closure, front & back pockets

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ARAMARK UNIFORM AND CAREER

APPAREL

Open Date: Address 115 N. FIRST ST

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm BURBANK, CA 91502
Contact DEAN SCALIA

Phone number

818-973-3720

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMENTS

pockets. Redcap or Equivalent

1.7 Industrial Pan, 100% Cotton,Wrinkle resistant,preshrunk, jean style waistband with button closure, front & back

County

Style Price Per
DESCRIPTION ITEM ID UoMm Mfr Name Number uUoMm
Size 28 7021 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $13.99
Size 30 7022 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $13.99
Size 32 7023 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $13.99
Size 34 7024 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $13.99
Size 36 7025 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $13.99
Size 38 7026 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $13.99
Size 40 7027 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $13.99
Size 42 7028 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $13.99
Size 44 7029 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $17.99
Size 46 7030 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $17.99
Size 48 7031 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $17.99
Size 50 7032 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $17.99
Size 52 7033 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $17.99
Size 54 7034 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $17.99
Size 56 7035 EA WEARGUARD 2015 $17.99
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1.8 Denim Jeans, Relaxed Fit,

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

14 oz Denim, 100% Cotton

Bidders name

ACE IMAGEWEAR

Open Date: Address 1302 BOYLES

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77020
Contact PETE KONYNDYK

Phone number

713-678-7910

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMENTS

1.8 Denim Jeans Relaxed Fit, 14 oz denim, 100% Cotton. Dickies style # 13292, 293 & 291 or

equivalent
County
Style Price Per
DESCRIPTION ITEM ID uoMm Mfr Name Number UOM
Size 30 - 44 7463 EA DICKIES CR393 $15.62
Size 46 - 50 7464 EA DICKIES CR393 $17.15

1.9 Denim Jeans, Regular Fit, 100% Cotton

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ACE IMAGEWEAR

Open Date: Address 1302 BOYLES

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77020
Contact PETE KONYNDYK

Phone number

713-678-7910

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMENTS

1.9 Denim Jeans Relaxed Fit, 100% Cotton, Dickies Style #9393-RNB or equivalent

Style County Price
DESCRIPTION ITEM ID UOM Mfr Name| Number Per UOM
Size 28 7841 EA DICKIES C993 $14.46
Size 30 7842 EA DICKIES C993 $14.46
Size 32 7843 EA DICKIES C993 $14.46
Size 34 7844 EA DICKIES C993 $14.46
Size 36 7845 EA DICKIES C993 $14.46
Size 38 7846 EA DICKIES C993 $14.46
Size 40 7872 EA DICKIES C993 $14.46
Size 42 7847 EA DICKIES C993 $14.46
Size 44 7848 EA DICKIES C993 $14.46
Size 46 7850 EA DICKIES C993 $15.92
Size 48 7851 EA DICKIES C993 $15.92
Size 50 7852 EA DICKIES C993 $15.92
Size 52 7853 EA DICKIES C993 $15.92
Size 54 7854 EA DICKIES C993 $15.92
Size 56 7855 EA DICKIES C993 $15.92
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS
1.10 Denim Jeans, Women'’s, 98% Cotton/2% Spandex

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ARAMARK UNIFORM AND CAREER
APPAREL

Open Date: Address 115 N. FIRST ST

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm BURBANK, CA 91502
Contact DEAN SCALIA

Phone number

818-973-3720

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMENTS

1.10 Denim Jeans, Women's, 98% Cotton/2% S

pandex, Levi's/G&K 16377 or equivalent

Style County Price|
DESCRIPTION ITEM ID UOM Mfr Name Number Per UOM
Size 4 7833 EA WEARGUARD 12274 $15.99
Size 6 7834 EA WEARGUARD 12274 $15.99
Size 8 7835 EA WEARGUARD 12274 $15.99
Size 10 7836 EA WEARGUARD 12274 $15.99
Size 12 7837 EA WEARGUARD 12274 $15.99
Size 14 7838 EA WEARGUARD 12274 $15.99
Size 16 7839 EA WEARGUARD 12274 $15.99
Size 18 7840 EA WEARGUARD 12274 $17.99

1.11 Industrial Trousers, Brown, PT-20 BN

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ARAMARK UNIFORM AND CAREER

APPAREL

Open Date: Address 115 N. FIRST ST

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm BURBANK, CA 91502
Contact DEAN SCALIA

Phone number

818-973-3720

PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL WORK GARMENTS

1.11 Industrial Trousers, Brown, PT-20 BN, G&K 14534 or equivalent

County
Style Price Per
DESCRIPTION ITEM ID UoM Mfr Name Number UOoM

Size 28 7856 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 30 7858 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 32 7859 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 34 7860 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 36 7861 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 38 7862 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 40 7863 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 42 7864 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 44 7865 EA WEARGUARD 201 $10.99
Size 46 7866 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
Size 48 7867 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
Size 50 7868 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
Size 52 7869 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
Size 54 7870 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
Size 56 7871 EA WEARGUARD 201 $12.99
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

PURCHASE OF CASUAL WEAR GARMENTS

2.1 Shirt, Twill, Short Sleeve, 60z, 100% Cotton, Button down collar, left chest
pocket, wood tone buttons

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ARAMARK UNIFORM AND CAREER APPAREL

Open Date: Address 115 N. FIRST ST

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm BURBANK, CA 91502
Contact DEAN SCALIA

Phone number

818-973-3720

PURCHASE OF CASUAL WEAR GARMENTS

2.1 Shirt, Twill, Short Sleeve, 6 0z. 100% Cotton, button down collar, left chest pocket,
wood tone buttons. Blue Generation B682135 or equivalent

Style County Price
DESCRIPTION uom Mfr Name Number Per UOM

Size XS - S EA WEARGUARD 3465 $23.99

Size M - L EA WEARGUARD 3465 $23.99

Size XL EA WEARGUARD 3465 $23.99

Size 2XL EA WEARGUARD 3465 $25.99

Size 3XL EA WEARGUARD 3465 $25.99
Size 4XL EA - - -
Optional line of script embroidery EA - - -
Optional embroidered County Logo EA - - -

2.2 Shirt, Peached Twill, Short Sleeve, 4.50z 100% Cotton, button down collar,

oversized round pocket, wood tone buttons

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ARAMARK UNIFORM AND CAREER APPAREL

Open Date: Address 115 N. FIRST ST

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm BURBANK, CA 91502
Contact DEAN SCALIA

Phone number

818-973-3720

PURCHASE OF CASUAL WEAR GARMENTS

2.2 Shirt, Peached Twill, Short Sleeve, 4.5 0z. 100% Cotton, button down collar, oversized round pocket, wood tone buttons.
Jerzees # J21 or Dockers/G&K 11284 or equivalent

Style County Price
DESCRIPTION UOM Mfr Name Number Per UOM

Size XS - S EA WEARGUARD 2283 $23.99

Size M - L EA WEARGUARD 2283 $23.99

Size XL EA WEARGUARD 2283 $23.99

Size 2XL EA WEARGUARD 2283 $25.99
Size 3XL EA - - -
Size 4XL EA - - -
Optional line of script embroidery LN - - -
Optional embroidered County Logo EA - - -
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

2.3 Shirt, Sports, 6.80z 100% Cotton Pique with left chest pocket, birdseye tipped
welt collar and cuffs, 2 button placket with wood toned buttons, dropped tails

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name ACE IMAGEWEAR
Open Date: Address 1302 BOYLES
Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012
at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77020
Contact PETE KONYNDYK
Phone number 713-678-7910

PURCHASE OF CASUAL WEAR GARMENTS

2.3 Shirt, Sports, 6.8 0z 100% cotton pique with left chest pocket, birdseye tipped welt collar and cuffs, 2 button placket with wood
toned buttons, dropped tails. Outerbanks # 5032

COUNTY
STYLE PRICE PER
DESCRIPTION UOM MFG NAME NUMBER UuoMm
Size XS - S EA REDKAP SK50 $20.10
Size M - L EA REDKAP SK50 $20.10
Size XL EA REDKAP SK50 $20.10
Size 2XL EA REDKAP SK50 $24.12
Size 3XL EA REDKAP SK50 $24.12
Size 4XL EA REDKAP SK50 $24.12
Optional line of script embroidery EA - - $2.50
Optional embroidered County Logo EA - - $4.95
2.4 Shirt, Polo, Active, 7.2 0z 94% cotton pique 6% spandex
BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms
Bidders name ACE IMAGEWEAR
Open Date: Address 1302 BOYLES
Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012
at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77020
Contact PETE KONYNDYK
Phone number 713-678-7910
PURCHASE OF CASUAL WEAR GARMENTS
2.4 Shirt, Polo, Active, 7.2 0z 94% cotton pique 6% spandex. Outerbanks # 5226
County Price
DESCRIPTION UOM Mfr Name Style Number Per UOM
Size XS - S EA OUTERBANKS S226 $25.55
Size M - L EA OUTERBANKS S226 $25.55
Size XL EA OUTERBANKS S226 $25.55
Size 2XL EA OUTERBANKS S226 $25.55
Size 3XL EA OUTERBANKS S226 $28.76
Size 4XL EA OUTERBANKS S226 $28.76
Optional line of script embroidery EA - - $2.50
Optional embroidered County Logo EA - - $4.95
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

2.5 Shirt, Polo, Ladies, 100% Peruvian pima cotton, Johnny style collar, side vents

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ARAMARK UNIFORM AND CAREER APPAREL

Open Date: Address 115 N. FIRST ST

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm BURBANK, CA 91502
Contact DEAN SCALIA

Phone number

818-973-3720

PURCHASE OF CASUAL WEAR GARMENTS

2.5 Shirt, Polo, Ladies, 100% Peruvian pima cotton, Johnny style collar, side vents. Devon & Jones # D140W

Style County Price
DESCRIPTION UOM Mfr Name Number Per UOM

Size XS - S EA DEVON & JONES 3451 $28.99

Size M- L EA DEVON & JONES 3451 $28.99

Size XL EA DEVON & JONES 3451 $28.99

Size 2XL EA DEVON & JONES 3451 $30.99
Size 3XL EA - - -
Size 4XL EA - - -
Optional line of script embroidery EA - - -
Optional embroidered County Logo EA - - -

2.6 Shirt, Camp, Bedford Cord, Short Sleeve, 68% Cotton 32% Rayon, Full Button
Front with wood buttons, fitted silhouette with front and back contour darts

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ARAMARK UNIFORM AND CAREER APPAREL

Open Date: Address 115 N. FIRST ST

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm BURBANK, CA 91502
Contact DEAN SCALIA

Phone number

818-973-3720

PURCHASE OF CASUAL WEAR GARMENTS

front and back contour darts. Cubavera # 78770

2.6 Shirt, Camp shirt, bedford cord, short sleeve, 68% cotton 32% rayon, full button front with wood buttons, fitted silhouette with

Style County Price Per
DESCRIPTION UOM Mfr Name Number UOM

Size XS - S EA WEARGUARD 4084 $21.99

Size M - L EA WEARGUARD 4084 $21.99

Size XL EA WEARGUARD 4084 $23.99

Size 2XL EA WEARGUARD 4084 $23.99

Size 3XL EA WEARGUARD 4084 $23.99
Size 4XL EA - - -
Optional line of script embroidery LN - - -
Optional embroidered County Logo EA - - -
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

PURCHASE OF OTHER BUSINESS / CASUAL GARMENTS

3.1 Classic Denim Shirt, 100% Cotton

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ARAMARK UNIFORM AND CAREER APPAREL

Open Date: Address 115 N. FIRST ST

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm BURBANK, CA 91502
Contact DEAN SCALIA

Phone number

818-973-3720

PURCHASE OF OTHER BUSINESS / CASUAL GARMENTS

3.1 Classic Denim Shirt, 100% Cotton, G&K 10411 & 74306 or equivalent

Style County Price

DESCRIPTION UOoM Mfr Name Number Per UOM
Men's, Long Sleeve, S - XL EA WEARGUARD 4091 $16.99
Men's, Long Sleeve, 2XL EA WEARGUARD 4091 $16.99
Men's, Long Sleeve, 3XL EA WEARGUARD 4091 $16.99
Men's, Long Sleeve, 4XL EA WEARGUARD 4091 $16.99
Men's, Long Sleeve, 5XL EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
Men's, Short Sleeve, S - XL EA WEARGUARD 4090 $15.99
Men's, Short Sleeve, 2XL EA WEARGUARD 4090 $15.99
Men's, Short Sleeve, 3XL EA WEARGUARD 4090 $15.99
Men's, Short Sleeve, 4XL EA WEARGUARD 4090 $15.99
Men's, Short Sleeve, 5XL EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
Women's, Long Sleeve, XS - XL EA WEARGUARD 14092 $16.99
Women's, Long Sleeve, 2XL EA WEARGUARD 14092 $16.99
Women's, Long Sleeve, 3XL EA - - -
Optional line of script embroidery EA - - -
Optional embroidered County Logo EA - - -
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

3.2 Classic Oxford Shirt, 60% Polyester, 40% Cotton

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

UNIFIRST CORPORATION

Open Date: Address 9019 RAILWOOD DR

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77078
Contact BILL FREEMAN

Phone number

713-635-1100

PURCHASE OF OTHER BUSINESS / CASUAL GARMENTS

3.2 Classic Oxford Shirt, 60% Polyester, 40% Cotton, G&K 26938, 27039, 12605 & 31805 or equivalent

Style County Price
DESCRIPTION UoM Mfr Name Number Per UOM

Men's, Long Sleeve, S - L EA EDWARDS 0820 $16.42
Men's, Long Sleeve, XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $16.42
Men's, Long Sleeve, 2XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $18.42
Men's, Long Sleeve, 3XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $20.42
Men's, Short Sleeve, S - L EA EDWARDS 0820 $14.70
Men's, Short Sleeve, XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $14.70
Men's, Short Sleeve, 2XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $16.70
Men's, Short Sleeve, 3XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $18.70
Women's, Long Sleeve, XS - L EA EDWARDS 0820 $15.69
Women's, Long Sleeve, XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $15.69
Women's, Long Sleeve, 2XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $17.69
Women's, Long Sleeve, 3XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $19.69
Women's, Short Sleeve, XS - L EA EDWARDS 0820 $14.26
Women's, Short Sleeve, XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $14.26
Women's, Short Sleeve, 2XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $16.26
Women's, Short Sleeve, 3XL EA EDWARDS 0820 $18.26
Optional line of script embroidery EA EDWARDS 0820 $0.75
Optional embroidered County Logo EA EDWARDS 0820 $2.50
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

PURCHASE OF INSTITUTIONAL MISCELLANEOUS GARMETS

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ROBINSON TEXTILES

Open Date: Address 152 W WALNUT ST, STE 250

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm GARDENA, CA 90248
Contact PAMELA KAUFMAN

Phone number

800-421-5582

PURCHASE OF INSTITUTIONAL MISCELLANEOUS GARMENTS

4.1 Shoes, Canvas, Men's, Step-in (pullover), Black, Med wt 7 oz canvas uppers, full cushion sewn-in insoles, non-skid vulcanized rubber
sole, machine washable. Bob Barker or Equivalent

Style UOM package | County Price Per
DESCRIPTION UOM Mfr Name Number size quoted UOM
Size 7 PR ROBTEX RTCS PAIR $2.68
Size 8 PR ROBTEX RTCS PAIR $2.68
Size 9 PR ROBTEX RTCS PAIR $2.68
Size 10 PR ROBTEX RTCS PAIR $2.68
Size 11 PR ROBTEX RTCS PAIR $2.68
4.2 Crew Socks, White, Cotton/Poly Blend, one size fits all. Bob Style UOM package | County Price Per
Barker or Equivalent UoM Mfr Name Number size quoted UoM
One size fits all Dz ROBTEX RTCSX DOz $5.75
Ankle Socks, White, Cotton/Poly Blend, one size fits all. Bob Barker Style UOM package | County Price Per
or Equivalent UoM Mfr Name Number size quoted UoM
One size fits all Dz ROBTEX RTASX DOz $5.75
Sports Socks, low cut, Cotton/Poly Blend, one size fits all, Bob Style UOM package | County Price Per
Barker or equivalent UOM Mfr Name Number size quoted UOM
One size fits all Dz - - - -
4.3 Institutional Uniform, Shirt, TriStitch, V Neck, Short Sleeve, one Style UOM package | County Price Per
breast pocket, Green. Bob Barker or Equivalent UoM Mfr Name | Number size quoted UoM
Small EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $3.80
Medium EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $3.80
Large EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $4.00
Extra-Large EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $4.00
2 XL EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $4.00
3 XL EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $4.40
2 XL EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $4.60
4.4 Institutional Uniform, Shirt, TriStitch, V Neck, Short Sleeve, one Style UOM package | County Price Per
breast pocket, Orange. Bob Barker or Equivalent UOM Mfr Name [ Number | size quoted UOM
Small EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $3.80
Medium EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $3.80
Large EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $4.22
Extra-Large EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $4.40
2 XL EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $4.62
3 XL EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $4.80
4 XL EA ROBTEX RTVS EA $5.00
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ROBINSON TEXTILES

Open Date: Address 152 W WALNUT ST, STE 250

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm GARDENA, CA 90248
Contact PAMELA KAUFMAN

Phone number

800-421-5582

PURCHASE OF INSTITUTIONAL MISCELLANEOUS GARMENTS

4.5 Institutional Uniform, Trousers, TriStitch, pull-on style, elastic
waistband, no drawstrings, no pockets, hemmed bottoms, Green.

Style UOM package | County Price Per

Bob Barker or Equivalent UoM Mfr Name Number size quoted UoM
Small EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $4.80
Medium EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $4.80
Large EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $5.10
Extra-Large EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $5.10
2 XL EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $5.10
3 XL EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $5.10
4 XL EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $5.90
4.6 Institutional Uniform, Trousers, TriStitch, pull-on style, elastic
waistband, no drawstrings, no pockets, hemmed bottoms, Orange. Style UOM package | County Price Per
Bob Barker or Equivalent uoM Mfr Name Number size quoted uoM
Small EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $4.80
Medium EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $4.80
Large EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $5.50
Extra-Large EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $5.50
2 XL EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $5.50
3 XL EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $5.50
4 XL EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $5.75
4.7 Institutional Uniform, Trousers, TriStitch, pull-on style, elastic
waistband, no drawstrings, no pockets, hemmed bottoms, Khaki Style UOM package | County Price Per
Bob Barker or Equivalent UoM Mfr Name | Number size quoted UoM
Small EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $4.90
Medium EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $4.90
Large EA ROBTEX RTEP EA $4.90
4.8 Shorts, Gym, pull-on style, white bias trim, elastic waistband, no
drawstring, no pockets, cotton/poly blend, Navy. Bob Barker or Style UOM package | County Price Per
Equivalent UoMm Mfr Name | Number size quoted UOM
Small EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.15
Medium EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.15
Large EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.15
Extra-Large EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.15
2 XL EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.15
3 XL EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.40
4 XL EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.40
4.9 Shorts, Gym, pull-on style, white bias trim, elastic waistband, no
drawstring, no pockets, cotton/poly blend, Orange. Bob Barker or Style UOM package | County Price Per
Equivalent UoM Mfr Name Number size quoted UuoM
Small EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.00
Medium EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.00
Large EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.75
Extra-Large EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.75
2 XL EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.75
3 XL EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.75
4 XL EA ROBTEX RTGS EA $3.75
4.10 Bra, Sports style, hook less pull-over, white. Bob Barker or Style UOM package | County Price Per
Equivalent UoM Mfr Name Number size quoted uoM
Small (32 AB) DZ ROBTEX RTSPB DOZ $21.00
Medium (34 A B) DZ ROBTEX RTSPB DOZ $21.00
Large (36 AB C) DZ ROBTEX RTSPB DOZ $21.00
Extra-Large (38 B C) DZ ROBTEX RTSPB DOZ $21.00
2 XL (40-42 B C D) DZ ROBTEX RTSPB DOZ $27.00
3 XL (44-46 B C D) DZ ROBTEX RTSPB DOZ $27.00
4 XL (48-50 B C D) Dz ROBTEX RTSPB DOz $27.00
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ROBINSON TEXTILES

Open Date: Address 152 W WALNUT ST, STE 250

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm GARDENA, CA 90248
Contact PAMELA KAUFMAN

Phone number

800-421-5582

PURCHASE OF INSTITUTIONAL MISCELLANEOUS GARMENTS

4.11 Panties, women's, brief style, poly cotton blend, white. Bob Style UOM package | County Price Per
Barker or Equivalent UOM Mfr Name Number size quoted UOM
Size 5 DZ ROBTEX RTPY DOZ $9.50
Size 6 DZ ROBTEX RTPY DOZ $9.50
Size 7 DZ ROBTEX RTPY DOZ $9.50
Size 8 DZ ROBTEX RTPY DOZ $9.50
Size 9 DZ ROBTEX RTPY DOZ $10.50
Size 10 DZ ROBTEX RTPY DOz $10.50
4.12 Underwear, men's, brief style, 100% cotton, white. Fruit of the Style UOM package | County Price Per
Loom or Equivalent UOM Mfr Name Number size quoted UOM
Small Dz ROBTEX RTBRF DOz $10.90
Medium Dz ROBTEX RTBRF DOz $10.90
Large Dz ROBTEX RTBRF DOz $10.90
Extra-Large Dz ROBTEX RTBRF DOz $10.90
2 XL Dz ROBTEX RTBRF DOz $11.90
3 XL Dz ROBTEX RTBRF DOz $12.90
4 XL DZ ROBTEX RTBRF DOZ $13.90
4.13 Briefs, unisex, mesh, disposable, white, one size fits most, Bob Style UOM package | County Price Per
Barker 1050 or equivalent uom Mfr Name Number size quoted uom
One size fits all 400/CS ROBTEX RTDBF CASE $200.00
Extra-Large 300/CS | ROBTEX RTDBF CASE $200.00
4.14 Cell smock, isolation/suicide, color green, Bob Barker 505JR Style UOM package | County Price Per
and 505 or equivalent uom Mfr Name Number size quoted uUoMm
Junior size EA ROBTEX RTCSS EA $80.00
One size fits most EA ROBTEX RTCSS EA $80.00
4.14 Boxers, men's, premium, cotton/polyester, color white, Bob Style UOM package | County Price Per
Barker EBXWHE or equivalent UOM Mfr Name Number size quoted UOM
Medium DOZ ROBTEX RTBX DOz $13.90
Large DOZ ROBTEX RTBX DOZ $13.90
Extra-Large DOZ ROBTEX RTBX DOZ $13.90
2XL DOz ROBTEX RTBX DOz $14.90
4.15 Coveralls, Inmate, short sleeve, with buttons, color khaki, Bob Style UOM package | County Price Per
Barker 24218 or equivalent uom Mfr Name Number size quoted uom
Small - ROBTEX RTC EA $9.90
Medium - ROBTEX RTC EA $9.90
Large - ROBTEX RTC EA $10.40
Extra-Large - ROBTEX RTC EA $10.40
XL . ROBTEX RTC EA $10.40
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

ROBINSON TEXTILES

Open Date: Address 152 W WALNUT ST, STE 250

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm GARDENA, CA 90248
Contact PAMELA KAUFMAN

Phone number

800-421-5582

PURCHASE OF INSTITUTIONAL MISCELLANEOUS GARMENTS

4.16 Jumpsuit, short sleeve, color orange, Bob Barker "OJSN

Style UOM package | County Price Per

Valuline "or equivalent UoM Mfr Name Number size quoted uoMm
Small - ROBTEX RTJ EA $10.50
Medium - ROBTEX RTJ EA $10.50
Large - ROBTEX RTJ EA $11.50
Extra-Large - ROBTEX RTJ EA $11.50
2XL - ROBTEX RTJ EA $11.50
4.17 Jumpsuit, High-Security, velcro closure, color orange, Bob Style UOM package | County Price Per
Barker OVJ or equivalent UoM Mfr Name Number size quoted UoM
Small - ROBTEX RTJIV EA $10.50
Medium - ROBTEX RTJIV EA $10.50
Large - ROBTEX RTJV EA $11.50
Extra-Large - ROBTEX RTJV EA $11.50
2XL - ROBTEX RTJIV EA $11.50
3XL - ROBTEX RTJIV EA $11.50
XL - ROBTEX RTIV EA $11.50
Style UOM package | County Price Per
4.18 Sweatshirt, crew neck, color gray UOM Mfr Name | Number size quoted UOoM
Small - ROBTEX RTSWT EA $6.00
Medium - ROBTEX RTSWT EA $6.00
Large - ROBTEX RTSWT EA $6.00
Extra-Large - ROBTEX RTSWT EA $6.00
2XL - ROBTEX RTSWT EA $7.00
4.19 Sportshirt, short sleeve, pique knit, color light gray, Charm-Tex Style UOM package | County Price Per
J200 or equivalent uoMm Mfr Name Number size quoted UoMm
Small - ROBTEX RTPS EA $5.00
Medium - ROBTEX RTPS EA $5.00
Large - ROBTEX RTPS EA $5.00
Extra Large - ROBTEX RTPS EA $5.00
2XL - ROBTEX RTPS EA $7.00
3XL - ROBTEX RTPS EA $7.00
4.20 T-Shirts, outerwear, cotton/poly jersey knit, short sleeve, round Style UOM package | County Price Per
neck, color orange UOM Mfr Name Number size quoted UOM
Small - ROBTEX RTTS EA $3.00
Medium - ROBTEX RTTS EA $3.00
Large - ROBTEX RTTS EA $3.00
Extra Large - ROBTEX RTTS EA $3.00
2XL - ROBTEX RTTS EA $5.00
3XL - ROBTEX RTTS EA $5.00
4AXL - ROBTEX RTTS EA $5.00
4.21 T-Shirts, outerwear, cotton/poly jersey knit, long sleeve, round Style UOM package | County Price Per
neck, color orange UoM Mfr Name Number size quoted UoM
Small - - - - -
Medium - - - - -
Large - - - - -
Extra Large - - - - -
2XL - - - - -
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

RENTAL AND LAUNDER OF UNIFORMS AS SPECIFIED IN THIS ITB

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

UNIFIRST CORPORATION

Open Date: Address 9019 RAILWOOD DR

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77078
Contact BILL FREEMAN

Phone number

713-635-1100

RENTAL AND LAUNDER OF UNIFORMS AS SPECIFIED IN THIS ITB

5.1 Shirts, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton with epaulets and button on shoulder , G&K 1010-015 or equivalent
Quantity Estimates for Parks Department

Style County Price
DESCRIPTION UuoMm Mfr Name | Number Per UOM
Long Sleeve, Regular EA REDKAP 0167 $0.356
Short Sleeve, Regular EA REDKAP 0607 $0.290
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails) EA REDKAP 1067 $0.356
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails) EA REDKAP 0607 $0.290
Department Name EA - - $1.250
Cost for embroidered patch with employee name and/or title EA - - $0.350
Cost for embroidered American Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
Cost for embroidered Texas Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
One time set up fee / prep fee per garment EA - - $0.500
5.2 Shirts, 100% Cotton, Permanent Press Style County Price
RedCap or Equivalent uoMm Mfr Name | Number Per UOM
Long Sleeve, Regular EA UNIFIRST 0101 $0.276
Short Sleeve, Regular EA UNIFIRST 0201 $0.262
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails) EA UNIFIRST 0101 $0.276
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails) EA UNIFIRST 0201 $0.262
Cost for embroidered patch with County Logo and Department Name EA - - $1.250
Cost for embroidered patch with employee name and/or title EA - - $0.350
Cost for embroidered American Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
Cost for embroidered Texas Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
One time set up fee / prep fee per garment EA - - $0.500
5.3 Shirts, 100% Cotton, Flame Resistant (for Welding) RedCap or Style County Price
Equivalent UOM Mfr Name | Number Per UOM
Long Sleeve, Regular EA  JUNIFIRST [09FT $0.353
Short Sleeve, Regular EA UNIFIRST - -
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails) EA UNIFIRST 09FT $0.353
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails) EA UNIFIRST - -
Cost for embroidered patch with County Logo and Department Name EA - - $1.250
Cost for embroidered patch with employee name and/or title EA - - $0.350
Cost for embroidered American Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
Cost for embroidered Texas Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
One time set up fee / prep fee per garment EA - - $0.500
5.4 Shirts, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton, Soil Release Fabric RedCap
or Equivalent Style County Price
Qty Estimates for Mosquito Control UoM Mfr Name | Number Per UOM
Long Sleeve, Regular EA UNIFIRST 0102 $0.166
Short Sleeve, Regular EA UNIFIRST 0202 $0.139
Long Sleeve, Tall (long tails) EA UNIFIRST 0102 $0.166
Short Sleeve, Tall (long tails) EA UNIFIRST 0202 $0.139
Cost for embroidered patch with County Logo and Department Name EA - - $1.250
Cost for embroidered patch with employee name and/or title EA - - $0.350
Cost for embroidered American Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
Cost for embroidered Texas Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
One time set up fee / prep fee per garment EA - - $0.500
Style County Price
5.5 Coveralls, 100% Cotton, G&K 1400 or equivalent UOM Mfr Name | Number Per UOM
Regular EA UNIFIRST 3001 $0.552
Tall EA UNIFIRST 3001 $0.552
Cost for embroidered patch with County Logo and Department Name EA - - $1.250
Cost for embroidered patch with employee name and/or title EA - - $0.350
Cost for embroidered American Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
Cost for embroidered Texas Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
One time set up fee / prep fee per garment EA - - $0.500
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name

UNIFIRST CORPORATION

Open Date: Address 9019 RAILWOOD DR

Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012

at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77078
Contact BILL FREEMAN

Phone number

713-635-1100

RENTAL AND LAUNDER OF UNIFORMS AS SPECIFIED IN THIS ITB

5.6 Coveralls, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton, Soil Release Fabric, G&K Style County Price
1404 or equivalent UOM Mfr Name Number Per UOM
Regular EA UNIFIRST 3002 $0.346
Tall EA UNIFIRST 3002 $0.346
Cost for embroidered patch with County Logo and Department Name EA - - $1.250
Cost for embroidered patch with employee name and/or title EA - - $0.350
Cost for embroidered American Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
Cost for embroidered Texas Flag Emblem on sleeve EA - - $0.500
One time set up fee / prep fee per garment EA - - $0.500
5.7 Industrial Pant, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton, Jean style waistband Style County Price
with button closure, front and back pockets. RedCap or Equivalent | UOM | Mfr Name [ Number Per UOM
Regular EA UNIFIRST 1002 $0.227
Tall EA UNIFIRST 1002 $0.227
5.8 Industrial Pant, 100% Cotton, Wrinkle resistant, preshrunk, jean
style waistband with button closure, front and back pockets. Style County Price
RedCap or Equivalent UoM Mfr Name | Number Per UOM
Regular EA UNIFIRST 1001 $0.347
Tall EA UNIFIRST 1001 $0.347
5.9 Jean Cut Work Pants, 10 oz twill, 50% polyester, 50% cotton, Style County Price
button waist, 5 pocket style. Dickies style # 4798 UOM | Mfr Name [ Number Per UOM
Regular EA UNIFIRST 10Al $0.284
Tall EA UNIFIRST 10Al $0.284
5.10 Denim Jeans Relaxed Fit, 14 oz denim, 100% Cotton. Dickies Style County Price
style # 13292, 293 & 291 uoMm Mfr Name | Number Per UOM
Regular EA UNIFIRST 10HD $0.366
Tall EA UNIFIRST 10HD $0.366
5.11 Denim Jeans Regular Fit, 15 0z unsinged denim, 100% Cotton. Style County Price
Dickies style # 17296 UuoMm Mfr Name | Number Per UOM
Regular EA UNIFIRST 1091 $0.309
Tall EA UNIFIRST 1091 $0.309
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

REPLACEMENT COST OF UNIFORMS UNDER RENTAL PROGRAM 0 TO 6 MONTHS

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name UNIFIRST CORPORATION
Open Date: Address 9019 RAILWOOD DR
Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012
at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77078
Contact BILL FREEMAN
Phone number 713-635-1100
Style County Price
Item # Description UOM | Mfr Name | Number Per UOM
6 REPLACEMENT COST OF UNIFORMS UNDER RENTAL PROGRAM 0 TO 6 MONTHS
Shirts, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton with epaulets
6.1|and button on shoulder EA UNIFIRST 0167 $23.01
6.2|Shirts, 100% Cotton, Permanent Press EA UNIFIRST 0101 $14.19
Shirts, 100% Cotton, Flame Resistant (for
6.3|Welding) EA UNIFIRST 09FT $31.17
Shirts, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton, Soil Release
6.4|Fabric EA UNIFIRST 0102 $10.74
6.5|Coveralls, 100% Cotton EA UNIFIRST 3001 $28.40
Coveralls, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton, Soil
6.6|Release Fabric EA UNIFIRST 3002 $22.40
Industrial Pant, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton, Jean
style waistband with button closure, front and
6.7|back pockets. EA UNIFIRST 1002 $14.69
Industrial Pant, 100% Cotton, Wrinkle resistant,
preshrunk, jean style waistband with button
6.8|closure, front and back pockets. EA UNIFIRST 1001 $17.87
Jean Cut Work Pants, 10 oz twill, 50% polyester,
50% cotton, button waist, 5 pocket style. Dickies
6.9|style # 4798 EA UNIFIRST 10Al $18.36
Denim Jeans Relaxed Fit, 14 oz denim, 100%
6.1|Cotton. Dickies style # 13292, 293 & 291 EA UNIFIRST 10HD $18.84
Denim Jeans Regular Fit, 15 0z unsinged denim,
6.11]100% Cotton. Dickies style # 17296 EA UNIFIRST 1091 $15.89
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

REPLACEMENT COST OF UNIFORMS UNDER RENTAL PROGRAM 6 TO 12 MONTHS

BID # 12-32 Purchase and / or rental of Uniforms

Bidders name UNIFIRST CORPORATION
Open Date: Address 9019 RAILWOOD DR
Thurs, Jan. 12, 2012
at 2:00 pm HOUSTON, TX 77078
Contact BILL FREEMAN
Phone number 713-635-1100
Style County Price Per
Item # Description UOM Mfr Name | Number UOM
7 REPLACEMENT COST OF UNIFORMS UNDER RENTAL PROGRAM 6 TO 12 MONTHS
Shirts, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton with epaulets
7.1]and button on shoulder EA UNIFIRST 0167 $23.01
7.2|Shirts, 100% Cotton, Permanent Press EA UNIFIRST 0101 $14.19
Shirts, 100% Cotton, Flame Resistant (for
7.3|Welding) EA UNIFIRST 09FT $31.17
Shirts, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton, Soil Release
7.4|Fabric EA UNIFIRST 0102 $10.74
7.5|Coveralls, 100% Cotton EA UNIFIRST 3001 $28.40
Coveralls, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton, Soil
7.6|Release Fabric EA UNIFIRST 3002 $22.40
Industrial Pant, 65% Polyester 35% Cotton, Jean
style waistband with button closure, front and
7.7|back pockets. EA UNIFIRST 1002 $14.69
Industrial Pant, 100% Cotton, Wrinkle resistant,
preshrunk, jean style waistband with button
7.8]closure, front and back pockets. EA UNIFIRST 1001 $17.87
Jean Cut Work Pants, 10 oz twill, 50% polyester,
50% cotton, button waist, 5 pocket style. Dickies
7.9|style # 4798 EA UNIFIRST 10AI $18.36
Denim Jeans Relaxed Fit, 14 oz denim, 100%
7.1|Cotton. Dickies style # 13292, 293 & 291 EA UNIFIRST 10HD $18.84
Denim Jeans Regular Fit, 15 0z unsinged denim,
7.11|100% Cotton. Dickies style # 17296 EA UNIEIRST 1091 $15.89
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