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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

HEAVY EQUIPMENT

ASPHALT RECYCLE MACHINE, WITHOUT OPERATOR

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME|

R.B. EVERETT & CO

HI-WAY EQUIPMENT CO. LLC

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS]

8211 RED BLUFF RD

926 N SAM HOUSTON PKWY E

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

PASADENA, TX 77507

HOUSTON, TX 77032

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

DEAN HENDERSON

DAN BLADE

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO.|

281-991-8161

281-987-1990

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

281-991-5967

281-987-1393

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

RICK VINCENT - 713-805-7970

ANNE CROW - 281-987-1990

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

WADE TINDALL - 281-991-8161

STEVE EVANS 281-987-1990

DESCRIPTION: COMM CODE: 975-13

(manually controlled) may be required.

2.1 ASPHALT RECYCLING MACHINE (Must meet the following minimum specifications:
Operating weight of 31,200 Ibs., diesel engine capacity of 300 HP, cutting width of 75 inches,
cutting depth of 14 inches. Automatic Liquid Portioning System (ALPS) and Water spray system

2.1.1 PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-13 $3,900.00 NO BID
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-13 $5,100.00 $5,067.00
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR INCLUDING ALPS &
WATER SPRAY 975-13 - $5,233.00
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-13 $12,000.00 $14,000.00
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR INCLUDING ALPS&
WATER SPRAY 975-13 - $14,500.00
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL TEREX RS 350 2008-09 WIRTGEN WR 2000XL
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 4 2
FLYWHEEL POWER 330 422
OPERATING WEIGHT 31,200 50,500
CUTTING DEPTH 14" 20"
CUTTING WIDTH 76" 94"
OPTIONS:
Automatic Liquid Portioning Systems (ALPS)| 975-13 - -
Water Spray Systems (Manually Controlled) 975-13 - -

Rental Locations in Brazoria Countyy

ALVIN / HOUSTON

actual working time on the jobsite.

All parts and accessories regularly supplied as standard, shall be included whether mentioned herein or not. All items should be priced - FOB
Destination Full Freight Allowed. Brazoria county will not pay for any additional transportation, shipping charges and/or fuel surcharges.
Prices bid per hour, or per month with opoerator shall include fuel, mileage and operator's wages, cost of move-in and move-out time, as well as
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

ASPHALT RECYCLE MACHINE CONT’D

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

R.B. EVERETT & CO

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

8211 RED BLUFF RD

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

PASADENA, TX 77507

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY|

DEAN HENDERSON

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,

281-991-8161

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER)

281-991-5967

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

RICK VINCENT - 713-805-7970

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

WADE TINDALL - 281-991-8161

DESCRIPTION: COMM CODE: 975-13

(manually controlled) may be required.

2.1 ASPHALT RECYCLING MACHINE (Must meet the following minimum specifications:
Operating weight of 31,200 Ibs., diesel engine capacity of 300 HP, cutting width of 75 inches,
cutting depth of 14 inches. Automatic Liquid Portioning System (ALPS) and Water spray system

2.1.3 OTHER SIZES AVAILABLE (WITHOUT OPERATOR)

PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-13 $4,400.00
PRICE PER WK(W/OUT OPERATOR 975-13 $7,900.00
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR, INCLUDING ALPS &
WATER SPRAY 975-13 NO BID
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-13 $18,900.00
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR INCLUDING ALPS&
WATER SPRAY 975-13 NO BID
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL TEREX RS425C
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 5
FLYWHEEL POWER 435
OPERATING WEIGHT 49,000
CUTTING DEPTH 16"
CUTTING WIDTH 96"
OPTIONS:
Automatic Liquid Portioning Systems (ALPS) 975-13 -
Water Spray Systems (Manually Controlled) 975-13 -

Rental Locations in Brazoria County

actual working time on the jobsite.

All parts and accessories regularly supplied as standard, shall be included whether mentioned herein or not. All items should be priced - FOB
Destination Full Freight Allowed. Brazoria county will not pay for any additional transportation, shipping charges and/or fuel surcharges.
Prices bid per hour, or per month with opoerator shall include fuel, mileage and operator's wages, cost of move-in and move-out time, as well as
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

BULLDOZER RENTAL, D3 CAT, D4 CAT AND D6 CAT OR EQUAL

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

ALVIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

3375 E HWY 6

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

ALVIN, TX 77511

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

TONY BROWN

RICKY KUBECZKA

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,|

979-233-7368

281-331-3177

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-0888

281-585-4012

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

RICKY KUBECZKA - 281-331-3177

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

SEAN MCCULLOUGH - 281-331-3177

DESCRIPTION: COMM CODE: 375-13

items usually associated with bulldozer work.)
COMM CODE: 375-34 & 375-35

2.2 BULLDOZER RENTAL (With Blade, KG Cutter Blade, Root Rake, and all other incidental

2.2.1 D3 CATERPILLAR OR EQUAL

PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $251.00 $250.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $744.00 $750.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $2,231.00 $2,210.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -

PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -

PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2009 CAT D3K-XL 2007-08 PRESSTA TD7
HORSEPOWER 70 74
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 30 3

Rental Locations Freeport, Texas ALVIN, TX 77511
2.2.2 D4 CATERPILLAR OR EQUAL

PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $289.00 $280.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $859.00 $850.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $2,571.00 $2,550.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -

PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -

PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2009 CAT D4K-XL DESSTA TD8
HORSEPOWER 80 80
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 28 1

Rental Locations in Brazoria County

Freeport, Texas

ALVIN, TX 77511
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

BULLDOZER RENTAL, D3 CAT, D4 CAT AND D6 CAT OR EQUAL

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

ALVIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

3375 E HWY 6

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

ALVIN, TX 77511

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY|

TONY BROWN

RICKY KUBECZKA

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-7368

281-331-3177

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-0888

281-585-4012

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

RICKY KUBECZKA - 281-331-3177

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

SEAN MCCULLOUGH - 281-331-3177

DESCRIPTION: COMM CODE: 375-13

items usually associated with bulldozer work.)
COMM CODE: 375-34 & 375-35

2.2 BULLDOZER RENTAL (With Blade, KG Cutter Blade, Root Rake, and all other incidental

2.2.3 D6 CAT OR EQUAL

PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $540.00 $580.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,619.00 $1,740.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $4,858.00 $5,220.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2009 CAT D6K-XL

2005-06 DRESSTA TD12

HORSEPOWER

125

142

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

24

2

Rental Locations

Freeport, Texas

ALVIN, TX 77511

NO BID RECEIVED FOR D7, D8 OR D9 CAT OR EQUIVALENT

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

TRACKHOE (Medium size, such as Caterpillar 215, John Deere 690B or equal)

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

TONY BROWN

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-7368

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER| 979-233-0888
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368
DESCRIPTION:

2.3 TRACK HOE (Medium size, such as Caterpillar 215, John Deere
690B, or equal.)
2.3.1 PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $374.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,122.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $3,358.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2009 CAT 312
HORSEPOWER 90
OPERATING WEIGHT 28,970
DIGGING DEPTH 19'10"
MAXIMUM REACH 28'3"
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 15
Rental Locations Freeport, Texas
2.3.2 OTHER SIZES AVAILABLE
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $472.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,415.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $4,246.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2009 320C CAT

HORSEPOWER 138
OPERATING WEIGHT 47,400
DIGGING DEPTH 21'7"
MAXIMUM REACH 31'10"
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 34

OPTIONAL - BOOM JACKHAMMER

13643.00 per month

Rental Locations

Freeport, Texas

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

TRACKHOE with BOOM JACK HAMMER (Medium size, such as Caterpillar 215, John Deere 690B or equal)

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

NEFF RENTAL INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

128 21ST STREET

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

TEXAS CITY, TX 77590

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

ROBERT VEAZEY

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,

409-948-4498

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 409-942-4320
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING Jerry Boatright - 409-948-4498
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING Deanna Elza - 409-948-4498
DESCRIPTION:

2.3 TRACK HOE (Medium size, such as Caterpillar 215, John Deere

690B, or equal.)

2.3.1 PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -

PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -

PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -

PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -

PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -

PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

HORSEPOWER

OPERATING WEIGHT

DIGGING DEPTH

MAXIMUM REACH

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

OPTIONAL - BOOM JACKHAMMER

DAY-$361;WK-$903;MTH-$2436

Rental Locations

Texas City, TX

DRAGLINE

NO AWARD, NO BIDS RECEIVED

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

EXCAVATOR RENTAL, Split Award

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

ALVIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

3375 E HWY 6

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

ALVIN, TX 77511

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY|

TONY BROWN

RICKY KUBECZKA

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO.

979-233-7368

281-331-3177

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-233-0888 281-585-4012
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368 RICKY KUBECZKA - 281-331-3177
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368 SEAN MCCULLOUGH - 281-331-3177
DESCRIPTION: SPLIT AWARD

2.5 EXCAVATOR RENTAL (1 CY Track Excavator, 26,000 Ib. weight

class.)

2.5.1 PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $374.00 $375.00

PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,122.00 $1,125.00

PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $3,358.00 $3,375.00

PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -

PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -

PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2009 CAT 312

2008 HYNDAI 140

HORSEPOWER 90 119
OPERATING WEIGHT 28,970 30,820
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 15 1

Rental Locations

Freeport, Texas

ALVIN, TX 77511

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

CRANE RENTAL, 20 Ton;80 Ton;110 Ton;120 Ton;160 Ton;200 Ton;250 Ton;300 Ton;350 Ton

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MAXIM CRANE WORKS, L.P.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

5014 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY]

FRANKIE BURRIS

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-6361

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

RENEWAL 3/9/11- 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-233-6365
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING JOHN SHELTON - 979-482-2959
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING TANYA FERGUSON - 979-233-6361
DESCRIPTION:

2.6 CRANE RENTAL
2.6.1 - 20-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HR W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $356.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,067.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-35 $3,200.00

$100.00
PRICE PER HR WITH OPERATOR 975-35 8 HR MIN
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 .
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR -
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 1998-2002
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE $20.00

$400 EACH WAY / 5% FUEL

Rental Locations SURCHARGE
2.6.2 - 80-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 .
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 -

$180.00
PRICE PER HR WITH OPERATOR 975-35 8 HR MIN
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -

2000-2008

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

7

Rental Locations

8 HR MIN PORT TO PORT
5% FUEL SURCHARGE

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

CRANE RENTAL, continued

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MAXIM CRANE WORKS, L.P.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

5014 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

FRANKIE BURRIS

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-6361

RENEWAL 3/9/11- 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-6365

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

JOHN SHELTON - 979-482-2959

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

TANYA FERGUSON - 979-233-6361

DESCRIPTION:

2.6 CRANE RENTAL

2.6.3 - 110-TON MOTOR CRANE

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 :
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 :
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 ;
PRICE PER HR WITH OPERATOR 975-35 $185.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 :
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 :
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2000-2007
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 6
8 HR MIN PORT TO PORT
Rental Locations 5% FUEL SURCHARGE
2.6.4 - 120-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 :
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 :
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 ;
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 :
PRICE PER HR WITH OPERATOR 975-35 $200.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 :
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 ;
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 :
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2006-2009
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 4
8 HR MIN PORT TO PORT

Rental Locations 5% FUEL SURCHARGE
2.6.5 - 160-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HR W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 :
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 ;
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 :
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 ;
PRICE PER HR WITH OPERATOR 975-35 $230.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 ;
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 ;
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 :

2002-2009

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

6

Rental Locations

8 HR MIN PORT TO PORT
5% FUEL SURCHARGE

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

CRANE RENTAL, continued

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME|

MAXIM CRANE WORKS, L.P.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS|

5014 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY|

FRANKIE BURRIS

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,

979-233-6361

RENEWAL 3/9/11- 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-6365

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

JOHN SHELTON - 979-482-2959

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

TANYA FERGUSON - 979-233-6361

DESCRIPTION:

2.6 CRANE RENTAL

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

2.6.6 - 200-TON MOTOR CRANE

PRICE PER HR W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 .
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 .
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER HR WITH OPERATOR 975-35 $250.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 .
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2002-2006
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 7
8HR MIN-PORT TO PORT
5% FUEL SURCHARGE
Rental Locations $250 IN & $250 OUT FOR FREIGHT
2.6.7 - 250-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HR W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 .
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 .
PRICE PER HR WITH OPERATOR 975-35 $280.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 .
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2004-2009
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 3
8HR MIN-PORT TO PORT
50 FUEL SURCHARGE
Rental Locations $400 IN & $400 OUT FOR FREIGHT
2.6.8 - 300-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HR W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 .
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER HR WITH OPERATOR 975-35 $300.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 .
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 .

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

1999-2009 LIEBHERR

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

4

Rental Locations

8HR MIN-PORT TO PORT
5% FUEL SURCHARGE
$600 IN & $600 OUT FOR FREIGHT

CRANE RENTAL, continued

3/23/2010
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BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MAXIM CRANE WORKS, L.P.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

5014 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY|

FRANKIE BURRIS

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-6361

RENEWAL 3/9/11- 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-233-6365
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING JOHN SHELTON - 979-482-2959
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING TANYA FERGUSON - 979-233-6361
DESCRIPTION:
2.6 CRANE RENTAL
2.6.8 - 300-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HR W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 .
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 .
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 .
PRICE PER HR WITH OPERATOR 975-35 $300.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 .
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 .
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 1999-2009 LIEBHERR
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 4
8HR MIN-PORT TO PORT
5% FUEL SURCHARGE
Rental Locations $600 IN & $600 OUT FOR FREIGHT
1.6.9 - 350-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HR W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 .
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 -
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 .
PRICE PER HR WITH OPERATOR 975-35 $365.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 .
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

1998-2002 LIEBHERR & DEMAG

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

4

Rental Locations

8HR MIN-PORT TO PORT
5% FUEL SURCHARGE
$800 IN & $800 OUT FOR FREIGHT

3/23/2010
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SELF PROPELLED VIBRATORY SHEEPSFOOT (PADFOOT) ROLLER, SINGLE

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

TONY BROWN

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,|

979-233-7368

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-233-0888
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368
DESCRIPTION:
2.7 SELF-PROPELLED VIBRATORY SHEEPSFOOT (PADFOOT)
ROLLER
2.7.1 - SINGLE DRUM CAT CP563C OR EQUIV.:
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $400.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,190.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $3,566.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2009 CP56 CAT
SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM SINGLE
DRUM WIDTH 84"
HORSEPOWER 150
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 21
Rental Locations Freeport, Texas
2.7.2 - OTHER SIZES AVAILABLE
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $302.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $905.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $2,707.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2009 CAT CP433

SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM SINGLE
DRUM WIDTH 66"
HORSEPOWER 100
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 30

Rental Locations

Freeport, Texas

3/23/2010
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SELF PROPLLED VIBRATORY SHEEPSFOOT (PADFOOT) ROLLER, DUAL DRUM

NO AWARD

SELF PROPELLED FLAT-WHEELED (SMOOTH) ROLLER, SINGLE AND DUAL DRUM

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

NEFF RENTAL INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

128 21ST STREET

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

TEXAS CITY, TX 77590

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

TONY BROWN

ROBERT VEAZEY

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-7368

409-948-4498

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-233-0888 409-942-4320
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368 Jerry Boatright - 409-948-4498
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368 Deanna Elza - 409-948-4498
DESCRIPTION:
2.8 SELF-PROPELLED FLAT-WHEELED (SMOOTH) ROLLER
2.8.1Bidder to furnish specifications
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $383.00 $606.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,143.00 $1,164.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $3,421.00 $2,991.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2009 CS56 CAT 2005-'08 SD70 INGERSOLL RAND
SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM 84" SINGLE
DRUM WIDTH 84" 66"
HORSEPOWER 150 99
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 22 4
Rental Locations Freeport, Texas Texas City, TX
2.8.2 OTHER SIZES AVAILABLE
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $272.00 $429.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $812.00 $733.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $2,423.00 $1,926.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 - -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2009 CAT CS433

2005-'08 DD24 INGERSOLL RAND

SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM SINGLE DUAL
DRUM WIDTH 66" 48"
HORSEPOWER 100 32
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 15 4
Rental Locations Freeport, Texas Texas City, TX

3/23/2010
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HIGH SPEED ROTARY MIXER

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

TONY BROWN

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,|

979-233-7368

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-233-0888
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368
DESCRIPTION:

2.9 HIGH-SPEED ROTARY MIXER FOR LIMING OPERATIONS

PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $846.00

PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $2,508.00

PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $7,221.00

PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -

PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -

PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2009 CAT RM300

SINGLE OR DUAL SINGLE
WIDTH OF CUT (MAXIMUM) 8'
DEPTH OF CUT 16"
HORSEPOWER 350
OPERATING WEIGHT 53,911
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 12

Rental Locations

Freeport, Texas

ASPHALT PAVER, 10’ AND 12’

NO AWARD, NO BIDS RECEIVED

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

TELESCOPIC BOOM EXCAVATING & GRADING MACHINES

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS
BIDDERS NAME HI-WAY EQUIPMENT CO. LLC
DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS 926 N SAM HOUSTON PKWY E
WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010 HOUSTON, TX 77032
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY DAN BLADE
MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011 TELEPHONE NO., 281-987-1990
RENEWAL 3/9/11- 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 281-987-1393
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING ANNE CROW - 281-987-1990
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING STEVE EVANS 281-987-1990
DESCRIPTION:
2.11 TELESCOPIC BOOM EXCAVATING & GRADING MACHINE GRADALL XL 3100 & XL 4100
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,155/ $1,267.00
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $2,667 / $3,000.00
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $6,800 / $7,800.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2008 GRADALL XL 3100/ XL4100
BUCKET CAPACITY 5/8CY/1CY
MAX TELESCOPING BOOM LENGTH 27'5" 1 30'
MIN TELESCOPING BOOM LENGTH 11'4" [ 12'5"
TELESCOPING BOOM TRAVEL 16'1"/ 17'7"
HORSEPOWER 173 /238
OPERATING WEIGHT 35,100 / 47,500
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 1-Jan
Rental Locations ALVIN / HOUSTON
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PNEUMATIC TIRED ROLLER

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

TONY BROWN

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,

979-233-7368

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-0888

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

DESCRIPTION:

2.12 PNEUMATIC TIRED ROLLER - Must meet the following minimum specifications: Nine (9)
wheel articulated, pneumatic tired roller, weighing at least 11,000 Ibs., ballastable to at least
30,500 Ibs.; diesel engine capacity of at least 80 HP @ 2500 RPM. Roller shall have a minimum
of nine (9) wheels, with five (5) on the front and four (4) on the rear. Roller shall be equipped with
8x15 14 ply smooth compactor type tires. EXAMPLE: ROSCO Tru-Pac 915 Roller.

PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $217.00
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $642.00
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,921.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
NUMBER OF WHEELS 9
HORSEPOWER 100
OPERATING WEIGHT 10,775

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2009 PS 150 CAT

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

7

Rental Locations

Freeport, Texas

TRACK MOUNTED MULTI-PURPOSE MILLING MACHINE, 41,500 LBS OPERATING WEIGHT

NO AWARD - NO BIDS RECEIVED

3/23/2010

PAGE 18 OF 38
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TRACK MOUNTED MULTI-PURPOSE MILLING MACHINE, 83,000 LBS OPERATING WEIGHT

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

JAVELINA CONSTRUCTION SOUTH

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

4741 HWY 46 WEST

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 78132

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

JEFF BINFORD

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,

830-625-3061

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

830-625-3063

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

DANA BINFORD - 830-625-3061

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

JANA SAFFELL - 830-625-3061

DESCRIPTION:

materials not accessible to milling machine)

2.13.2 TRACK MOUNTED MULTI-PURPOSE MILLING MACHINE. (Must meet the following
minimum specifications: operating weight of 83,000 Ibs., diesel engine capacity of 525 HP, cutting
width of 77. EXAMPLE: CMI PR500C Milling Machine. Pricing shall include operating personnel,
fuel, maintenance, water truck, cutting bits and move-in. General Contractor or County to provide
water source, trucking of milled material, traffic control, necessary clean-up and removal of

DEPTH AT <10,000 SQ. YD.

1" 975-35 $1.95
2 975-35 $1.95
3" 975-35 $1.95
4-6" 975-35 $1.95
6-10" 975-35 $1.95
10-12" 975-35 $1.95
DEPTH AT 10-19,999 SQ. YD.

1" 975-35 $0.51
2 975-35 $0.51
3" 975-35 $0.51
46" 975-35 $0.65
6-10" 975-35 $0.85
10-12" 975-35 $1.05
DEPTH AT >20,000 SQ. YD.

1" 975-35 $0.29
2 975-35 $0.29
3" 975-35 $0.35
46" 975-35 $0.45
6-10" 975-35 $0.85
10-12" 975-35 $1.05
HORSEPOWER 800

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2 CMI 800;1990,2004
1 ROAD TEC RX900 2007

OPERATING WEIGHT 84,000
DIESEL ENGINE CAPACITY 300 GAL
CUTTING WIDTH 84"
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 3

Rental Locations

NEW BRANFELS

3/23/2010
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MOTOR GRADER

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

TONY BROWN

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 20111

TELEPHONE NO,

979-233-7368

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-233-0888
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368
DESCRIPTION:
2.14 MOTOR GRADER
2.14.1 Must meet the following minimum specifications: operating weight
18,500 Ibs., 68 HP, 10" blade. EXAMPLE: Fiat Allis 65C.
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $293.00
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $880.00
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $2,631.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
HORSEPOWER 68
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2008 NORAM 65E
SIZE BLADE 10'
OPERATING WEIGHT 18,500
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 6
OPTION: 12' BLADE N/A
Rental Locations i Freeport, Texas
2.14.2 Must meet the following minimum specifications: operating weight
31,000 Ibs., 140 HP, 12' blade. EXAMPLE: CAT 12H
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $523.00
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,568.00
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR 975-34 $4,696.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 -
HORSEPOWER 140

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2008 CAT 12H

SIZE BLADE 12
OPERATING WEIGHT 28,830
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 7
OPTION: 14' BLADE N/A

Rental Locations

Freeport, Texas

3/23/2010
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INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT

BUFFER
NO AWARD - NO BIDS RECEIVED

COMPACTOR, VIBRATING

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME] MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

TONY BROWN

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 20111

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-7368

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-0888

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.0 INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT

3.2 COMPACTOR RENTAL, VIBRATING 21 X 19" PLATE (Plate
[Tamps)

PRICE PER DAY

PRICE PER WEEK

PRICE PER MONTH

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

SPLIT AWARD

$45.00 $40.00
$130.00 $120.00
$385.00 $360.00

2007 MQ MVC77

BASED ON AVAILABILITY

4

AS MANY AS NEEDED

CEMENT MIXER, GAS OPERATED, TOWABLE, 9 CUBIC FEET

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

NES RENTALS INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

CLUTE, TX 77531

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

CHRIS PIKE

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 20111

TELEPHONE NO|

979-388-0078

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-388-9372

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785

DESCRIPTION:

3.3 CEMENT MIXER, GAS OPERATED, TOWABLE

6 CUBIC FOOT, PRICE PER DAY

6 CUBIC FOOT, PRICE PER WEEK

6 CUBIC FOOT, PRICE PER MONTH

9 CUBIC FOOT, PRICE PER DAY

9 CUBIC FOOT, PRICE PER WEEK

9 CUBIC FOOT, PRICE PER MONTH

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

$60.00

$180.00

$540.00

UPON REQUEST

2

3/23/2010
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CONCRETE SAW, HAND HELD, ELECTRIC
BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME| MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC
DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS 3403 Hwy 332 East
WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010 Freeport, TX 77541
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTEDBY TONY BROWN
MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011 TELEPHONE NO. 979-233-7368
RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-233-0888
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368
DESCRIPTION:
3.4 CONCRETE SAW, HAND HELD, ELECTRIC
PRICE PER DAY $30.00
PRICE PER WEEK $85.00
PRICE PER MONTH $255.00
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2009 STIHL ST400
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 4
3.4.1 - 14" HIGH SPEED BLADE, COST PER EACH $7.99
3.4.2 - 12" HIGH SPEED BLADE, COST PER EACH $6.99

CONCRETE SAW, WALK BEHIND

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME] MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS] 3403 Hwy 332 East 6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010 Freeport, TX 77541

TONY BROWN

FREEPORT, TX 77541
MELISSA REEVES

QUOTED BY
CONTRACT TERM:

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011 TELEPHONE NO| 979-233-7368 979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-233-0888 979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368 MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING Tony Brown - 979-233-7368 NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.5 CONCRETE SAW, WALK BEHIND

PRICE PER DAY $51.00 $50.00
PRICE PER WEEK $153.00 $150.00
PRICE PER MONTH $459.00 $450.00
HORSEPOWER 13 13

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2007 MQ 13HP

BASED ON AVAIABILITY

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

2

AS MANY AS NEEDED

3.5.1 - 14" HIGH SPEED BLADE, COST PER EACH

$7.99

3.5.2 - 18-20" HIGH SPEED BLADE, COST PER EACH

$10.99
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CONCRETE VIBRATOR, 1", 1-3/8” AND 2 SHAFT HEAD

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME] MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS|

3403 Hwy 332 East

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

TONY BROWN

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,

979-233-7368

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-0888

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

DESCRIPTION:

3.6 CONCRETE VIBRATOR 1", 13/8", 2" SHAFT HEAD

PRICE PER DAY $26.00
PRICE PER WEEK $77.00
PRICE PER MONTH $230.00
HORSEPOWER 2
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2008 MQ 2HP
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 3

SURFACE GRINDER

NO AWARD

MAGNETIC DRILL

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY|

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.8 MAGNETIC DRILL

PRICE PER DAY $40.00
PRICE PER WEEK $120.00
PRICE PER MONTH $360.00

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

BASED ON AVAILABILITY

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

AS MANY AS NEEDED

3/23/2010
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PILOT BIT, 7/16” TO %™; 9/16” TO 1”"; 2”

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

NES RENTALS INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

CLUTE, TX 77531

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

CHRIS PIKE

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO||

979-388-0078

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-388-9372

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785

DESCRIPTION:

3.8.1 PILOT BIT, JANCY SLUGGER OR EQUIVALENT, COST

PER EACH EVOLUTION
3.8.1 SIZE:

7/16" TO 1/2" $3.99
9/16" TO 1" $3.99

2" $4.51

ANNULAR CUTTER, BIT % SHANK, JANCY SLUGGER OR EQUIVALENT

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

NES RENTALS INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

CLUTE, TX 77531

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

CHRIS PIKE

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,|

979-388-0078

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-388-9372

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785

DESCRIPTION:

3.8.2 ANNULAR CUTTER BIT, 3/4" SHANK, JANCY SLUGGER OR
EQUIVALENT, cost per each

BRAND

EVOLUTION

1/2"

$21.62

9/16"

$22.35

5/8"

$22.35

11/16"

$24.81

3/4"

$24.81

3/16"

13/16" - $27.45

7/8"

$28.18

5/16"

15/16" - $29.81

3/23/2010
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ANNULAR CUTTER, BIT % SHANK, JANCY SLUGGER OR EQUIVALENT, CONTINUED
BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME NES RENTALS INC.
DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS 425 W PLANTATION DRIVE
WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010 CLUTE, TX 77531
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY CHRIS PIKE
MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011 TELEPHONE NO.| 979-388-0078
RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-388-9372
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785
DESCRIPTION:
3.8.2 ANNULAR CUTTER BIT, 3/4" SHANK, JANCY SLUGGER OR
EQUIVALENT, cost per each
BRAND EVOLUTION
1" $31.23
11/16" $34.26
11/8" $37.20
13/16" $40.49
11/4" $44.90
15/16" $48.58
13/8" $53.20
17/16" $58.02
11/2" $64.09
19/16" $72.63
15/8" $76.48
3.8.2 ANNULAR CUTTER BIT, 3/4" SHANK, JANCY SLUGGER OR
EQUIVALENT, cost per each
BRAND
111/16" $80.30
13/4" $83.80
113/16" $87.65
17/8" $91.96
115/16" $96.22
2" $100.42
21/16" $106.63
21/8" $110.80
2 3/16" $115.00
2 1/4" $119.58
2 5/16" $123.77
23/8" $128.29

FLAT BORING BIT, JANCY SLUGGER OR EQUIVALENT
NO AWARD
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CHIPPING HAMMER, 15LB, AIR

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

NES RENTALS INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

CLUTE, TX 77531

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

CHRIS PIKE

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,|

979-388-0078

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-388-9372

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785

DESCRIPTION:

3.9 CHIPPING HAMMER, 15 LB.

PRICE PER DAY $15.00
PRICE PER WEEK $45.00
PRICE PER MONTH $135.00
ELECTRIC OR AIR AIR

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

DEMOLITION HAMMER, 30 LB

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

NES RENTALS INC.

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

CLUTE, TX 77531

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

CHRIS PIKE

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,

979-388-0078

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-388-9372

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.10 DEMOLITION HAMMER, 30 LB.

PRICE PER DAY $35.00 $30.00
PRICE PER WEEK $105.00 $90.00
PRICE PER MONTH $315.00 $270.00
ELECTRIC OR AIR ELECTRIC AIR

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

BASED ON AVAILABILITY

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

AS MANY AS NEEDED

3.10.1 POINTED BITS, cost per each

$10.00

3.10.2 CHISELED BITS, cost per each

$10.00
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RIVET BUSTER, 30 LB

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

NES RENTALS INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

CLUTE, TX 77531

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

CHRIS PIKE

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO.,

979-388-0078

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-388-9372

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785

COMM CODE: 375-13

3.11 RIVET BUSTER, 30 LB.

PRICE PER DAY $25.00
PRICE PER WEEK $75.00
PRICE PER MONTH $225.00
ELECTRIC OR AIR AIR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL -
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 1

JACK HAMMER, 35LB

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY|

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,|

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER)

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.12 JACK HAMMER, 35 LB.

PRICE PER DAY $30.00
PRICE PER WEEK $90.00
PRICE PER MONTH $270.00
ELECTRIC OR AIR AIR

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

BASED ON AVAILABILITY

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

AS MANY AS NEEDED

3.12.1POINTED BITS, cost per each

$16.00

3.12.2 CHISELED BITS, cost per each

$16.00
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JACK HAMMER, 60LB

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS 6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY]

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.13 JACK HAMMER, 60 LB.

PRICE PER DAY $40.00
PRICE PER WEEK $120.00
PRICE PER MONTH $360.00

ELECTRIC OR AIR

AIR / ELECTRIC

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

BASED ON AVAILABILITY

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

AS MANY AS NEEDED

3.13.1 POINTED BITS, cost per each

$16.00

3.13.2 CHISELED BITS, cost per each

$16.00

JACK HAMMER, 90LB

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

TONY BROWN

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,|

979-233-7368

RENEWAL 3/9/11 -9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-0888

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

DESCRIPTION:

3.14JACK HAMMER, 90 LB.

PRICE PER DAY $26.00
PRICE PER WEEK $77.00
PRICE PER MONTH $230.00
ELECTRIC OR AIR AIR

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2009 KENT 90LB

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

2

3.14.1 POINTED BITS, cost per each

$19.99

3.14.2 CHISELED BITS, cost per each

$24.99
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LIFT ARTICULATING BOOM, 45’ OR EQIVALENT

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

NES RENTALS INC.

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

CLUTE, TX 77531

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

CHRIS PIKE

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,|

979-388-0078

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-388-9372

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.15 LIFT, ARTICULATING BOOM, 45' OR EQUIVALENT

PRICE PER DAY $200.00 $150.00

PRICE PER WEEK $495.00 $450.00

PRICE PER MONTH $1,150.00 $1,350.00

BOOM LENGTH 45 -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL GENIE 745 BASED ON AVAILABILITY
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 12 AS MANY AS NEEDED

LIFT ARTICULATING BOOM, 60” OR EQUIVALENT

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME]

NES RENTALS INC.

H & E EQUIPMENT SERVICES

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS]

425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

18144 IMPERIAL VALLEY DRIVE

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

CLUTE, TX 77531

HOUSTON, TX 77060

FREEPORT, TX 77541

QUOTED BY|
CONTRACT TERM:

CHRIS PIKE

DENNIS MCMATTON

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011 TELEPHONE NO|

979-388-0078 281-821-4600

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER

979-388-9372 281-821-4664

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

CHRIS PIKE - JOHN - MELISSA REEVES -
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING 979-388-0078 281-821-4600 979-665-5746
NORMA VARGAS - RHONDA LIGON - NANCY KEY -

773-695-2785 281-821-4600

979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.16 LIFT, ARTICULATING BOOM, 60' OR EQUIVALENT
500 - 1000 LB CAPASITY

PRICE PER DAY - - $200.00

PRICE PER WEEK $550.00

PRICE PER MONTH $1,495.00 - -

BOOM LENGTH 60 60 -

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL GENIE Z60 2008 GENIE 26034 BASED ON AVAILABILITY

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

12

AS MANY AS NEEDED

POST HOLE AUGER, ONE MAN, AUGER BIT 10” WIDE 36” DEEP

NO AWARD
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WATER PUMP, PORTABLE

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME]|

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

NES RENTALS INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

CLUTE, TX 77531

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY|

TONY BROWN

CHRIS PIKE

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-7368

979-388-0078

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/811

FAX NUMBER]

979-233-0888

979-388-9372

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785

DESCRIPTION:

discharge hose and strainer)

3.18 WATER PUMP, PORTABLE (to include 20 ft. suction hose, 50 ft.

2" PRICE PER DAY $34.00 $30.00
2" PRICE PER WEEK $102.00 $90.00
2" PRICE PER MONTH $306.00 $270.00
3" PRICE PER DAY $43.00 $40.00
3" PRICE PER WEEK $128.00 $120.00
3" PRICE PER MONTH $383.00 $360.00
4" PRICE PER DAY $60.00 -
4" PRICE PER WEEK $179.00 -
4" PRICE PER MONTH $536.00 -
6" PRICE PER DAY $102.00 -
6" PRICE PER WEEK $306.00 -
6" PRICE PER MONTH $918.00 -
GASOLINE OR AIR GAS -
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2009 MQ -
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 2 -
3.18.1 ADDITIONAL 20 FT. SUCTION HOSE, add per day - $10.00
3.18.2 ADDITIONAL 50 FOOT DISCHARGE HOSE, add per day - $10.00

SCAFFOLDING

NO AWARD

SEWER AUGER

NO AWARD

TILLER, WALK BEHIND, REAR TINE, GAS & TILLER TOW BEHIND

NO AWARD
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TRENCHER, WALK BEHIND, SELF PROPELLED, 2’ DEEP 4” WIDE

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.
DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS 6719 E HWY 332
WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010 FREEPORT, TX 77541
CONTRACT TERM: OO0 2K MELISSA REEVES
MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011 TELEPHONE NO) 979-233-1300
RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-233-1322
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300
DESCRIPTION:

3.22 TRENCHER

3.22.2 WALK BEHIND, SELF PROPELLED, 2' DEEP, 4" WIDE

PRICE/DAY/EACH $100.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $300.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $900.00

TRENCHER, WALK BEHIND, SELF PROPELLED, 2’ DEEP 6” WIDE

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME NES RENTALS INC.
DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS 425 W PLANTATION DRIVE
WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010 CLUTE, TX 77531
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTEDBY CHRIS PIKE
MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 20111 TELEPHONE NO| 979-388-0078
RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 979-388-9372
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785
DESCRIPTION:
3.22 TRENCHER
3.22.3 WALK BEHIND, SELF PROPELLED, 2' DEEP, 6" WIDE
PRICE/DAY/EACH $110.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $330.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $990.00
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RIDE ON TRENCHER, 3-4’ DEEP, 6” WIDE, 3-4’ DEEP 8 WIDE AND 3-4’ DEEP AND 12" WIDE

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

NES RENTALS INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

CLUTE, TX 77531

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY]

TONY BROWN

CHRIS PIKE

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO |

979-233-7368

979-388-0078

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-0888

979-388-9372

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785

DESCRIPTION:

3.22.4 RIDE ON TRENCHER, 3-4' DEEP, 6" WIDE

PRICE/DAY/EACH $179.00 -
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $536.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH - $1,450.00
3.22.5 RIDE ON TRENCHER, 3-4' DEEP, 8" WIDE
PRICE/DAY/EACH $179.00 -
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $536.00 -
PRICE/MONTH/EACH - $1,450.00
3.22.6 RIDE ON TRENCHER, 3-4' DEEP, 12" WIDE
PRICE/DAY/EACH $179.00 -
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $536.00 -
PRICE/MONTH/EACH - $1,450.00

SKID STEER LOADER, BOBCAT 773 OR EQUIVALENT
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BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO.,

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.23 SKID STEER LOADER - BOBCAT 773 OR EQUIVALENT

PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $155.00
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $465.00
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,200.00

PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR

PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR

PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

BASED UPON AVAILABILITY

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

AS MANY AS NEEDED

ATTACHMENTS FOR BOBCAT 773 OR EQUIVALENT
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BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME]

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS;

3403 Hwy 332 East

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY|

TONY BROWN

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-7368

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER]

979-233-0888

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.23.1 ATTACHMENTS FOR BOBCAT 773 OR EQUIVALENT

3.23.1 AUGER 12" BIT

PRICE/DAY/EACH $14.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $42.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH - 90..00
3.23.2 AUGER 16" BIT
PRICE/DAY/EACH - $25.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH - $50.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH - $90.00
3.23.3 AUGER 18" BIT
PRICE/DAY/EACH $19.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH - $50.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH - $90.00
3.23.4 AUGER 24" BIT
PRICE/DAY/EACH $23.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $67.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $200.00

3.23.5 AUGER 36" B

T

PRICE/DAY/EACH

PRICE/WEEK/EACH

PRICE/MONTH/EACH

CEMENT BREAKER 500 LB HYDRAULIC DEMO HAMMER

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME]

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS|

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

QUOTED BY|
CONTRACT TERM:

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011 TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.23.6 CEMENT BREAKER 500 LB HYDRAULIC DEMO HAMMER

PRICE/DAY/EACH $55.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $165.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $495.00

SWEEPER, 6 FT

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

MUSTANG RENTAL SERVICES INC

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

3403 Hwy 332 East

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

Freeport, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

TONY BROWN

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO.|

979-233-7368

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-0888

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

Tony Brown - 979-233-7368

DESCRIPTION:

3.23.7 SWEEPER 6 FT.

PRICE/DAY/EACH $98.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $293.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $880.00

FORK LIFT

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

NES RENTALS INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS 425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

CLUTE, TX 77531

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

CHRIS PIKE

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,

979-388-0078

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-388-9372

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

CHRIS PIKE - 979-388-0078

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NORMA VARGAS - 773-695-2785

DESCRIPTION:

3.23.8 FORK LIFT

PRICE/DAY/EACH $25.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $75.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $225.00

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

AIR COMPRESSOR

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

NES RENTALS INC.

H & E EQUIPMENT SERVICES

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

425 W PLANTATION DRIVE

18144 IMPERIAL VALLEY DRIVE

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

CLUTE, TX 77531

HOUSTON, TX 77060

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY

CHRIS PIKE

DENNIS MCMATTON

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO,

979-388-0078

281-821-4600

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-388-9372

281-821-4664

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

CHRIS PIKE -
979-388-0078

JOHN -
281-821-4600

MELISSA REEVES -
979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NORMA VARGAS -
773-695-2785

RHONDA LIGON -
281-821-4600

NANCY KEY -
979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.24 AIR COMPRESSOR

3.24.1 100 CFM

PRICE/DAY/EACH $50.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $150.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $450.00
3.24.2 185 CFM
PRICE/DAY/EACH $50.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $150.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $450.00
3.24.3 250 CFM
PRICE/DAY/EACH $75.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $225.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $675.00
3.24.4 375 CFM
PRICE/DAY/EACH $100.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $300.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $900.00
3.24.5 750 CFM
PRICE/DAY/EACH $150.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $450.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $1,350.00

3.24.6 1300 CFM

PRICE/DAY/EACH $500.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $1,200.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $2,900.00

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

BASED ON AVAILABILITY

USE

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY

AS MANY AS NEEDED

PORTABLE LIGHT CART WITH TWO 500 WATT BULB

NO AWARD

TOWER LIGHTS, 10’ HEIGHT, ONE 1,000 WATT BULB

NO AWARD

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

TOWER LIGHTS, 15* HEIGHT, TWO 1,000 WATT BULBS, 3000 WATT GENERATOR

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY]

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.25.3 TOWER LIGHTS, 15' HEIGHT, TWO 1,000 WATT BULBS, 3000
WATT GENERATOR

PRICE/DAY/EACH $40.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $120.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $360.00

TOWABLE LIGHT PLANTS, 30 HEIGHT, FOUR 1,000 WATT BULBS, 5000 WATT GENERATOR

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME|

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY|

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-1300

RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.25.4 TOWABLE LIGHT PLANTS, 30' HEIGHT, FOUR 1,000 WATT
BULBS, 5000 WATT GENERATOR

PRICE/DAY/EACH $40.00
PRICE/WEEK/EACH $120.00
PRICE/MONTH/EACH $360.00

TRAILER MOUNTED BOOM /LIFT (40° WORKING HEIGHT LIFT CAPASITY ANSI, CSA OF 500 LBS)

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

BRIGGS EQUIPMENT INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING

ADDRESS

6719 E HWY 332

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010

FREEPORT, TX 77541

CONTRACT TERM:

QUOTED BY]

MELISSA REEVES

MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011

TELEPHONE NO|

979-233-1300

RENEAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11

FAX NUMBER

979-233-1322

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

MELISSA REEVES - 979-665-5746

CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING

NANCY KEY - 979-233-1300

DESCRIPTION:

3.26 TRAILER MOUNTED BOOM / LIFT (40FT working height, lift
capasity ANSI, CSA of 500 Ibs)

PRICE PER DAY $140.00
PRICE PER WEEK $420.00
PRICE PER MONTH $1,260.00

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

BASED ON AVAILABILITY

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

AS MANY AS NEEDED

3/23/2010
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

TRAILER MOUNTED BOOM / LIFT (60 WORKING HEIGHT LIFT CAPASITY ANSI, CSA OF 500 LBS)

BID #10-33 EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME| H & E EQUIPMENT SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS| 18144 IMPERIAL VALLEY DRIVE
WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2010 HOUSTON, TX 77060
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY DENNIS MCMATTON
MARCH 9, 2010 - MARCH 8, 2011 TELEPHONE NO., 281-821-4600
RENEWAL 3/9/11 - 9/8/11 FAX NUMBER 281-821-4664
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING JOHN - 281-821-4600
CONTACT NAME FOR BILLING RHONDA LIGON - 281-821-4600

DESCRIPTION: COMM CODE: 375-13

3.27 TRAILER MOUNTED BOOM / LIFT (60FT working height, lift
capasity ANSI, CSA of 500 Ibs)

PRICE PER DAY $200.00
PRICE PER WEEK $600.00
PRICE PER MONTH $1,800.00

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE $2.00

TRAILER MOUNTED BOOM / LIFT (80 WORKING HEIGHT LIFT CAPASITY ANSI, CSA OF 500 LBS)

NO AWARD
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