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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

1.1 HERBICIDE, 41% ISOPROPYLAMINE - (ROUND UP PRO) PRIMARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME|

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

Friday, May 1, 2009

4211 COLCHESTER CT

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842

CONTRACT TERM:
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

PRIMARY AWARD

CONTACT RICK BENNETT
QUOTED BY RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONE]}

NUMBER] 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER 979-690-8369

Person to contact
for placing orders

RICK BENNETT

1.1 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE (41% Isopropylamine

Salt of Glyphosate) Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: ROUND UP PRO Comm Code| County ID UOM Delivered UOM

1 gallon size 675-90 824 GAL

2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 825 GAL $38.40 $96.00
30 gallon drum 675-90 826 DRUM $35.75 $1,072.50
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: INLET 90 Comm Code] County ID uoMm Delivered uoMm
Price Per Gallon 675-55 7567 $12.00 $12.00
State Mixing Rate 1 QT /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5

DOES COMPANY RETRIEVE CONTAINERS AFTER USE? Y /N NO

HERBICIDE, 41% ISOPROPYLAMINE — (ROUND UP PRO) SECONDARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC

Friday, May 1, 2009

8930 LAWNDALE STE B

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

HOUSTON, TX 77501

CONTRACT TERM:

JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

CONTACT] STAN JONES
QUOTED BY
STAN JONES
TELEPHON
NUMBER] 713-924-6929
FAX NUMBER 713-921-0074

Person to contact

SECONDARY AWARD for placing orders STAN JONES
1.1 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE (41% Isopropylamine
Salt of Glyphosate) Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: ROUND UP PRO Comm Code|] County ID UOM Delivered UOM
1 gallon size 675-90 824 GAL -
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 825 GAL $39.44 $98.60
30 gallon drum 675-90 826 DRUM $37.24 $1,117.20
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: RED RIVER 90 Comm Code|] County ID UoM Delivered UOM
Price Per Gallon 7567 $6.70 $6.70
State Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5

DOES COMPANY RETRIEVE CONTAINERS AFTER USE? Y /N

YES - TRIPLE RINSED 15 AND / OR 30
GAL DRUMS - CALL FOR
ARRANGEMENTS
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

ALTERNATE, HERBICIDE, 41% ISOPROPYLAMIN - (RAZOR PRO), PRIMARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC

Friday, May 1, 2009

8930 LAWNDALE STE B

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

HOUSTON, TX 77501

CONTRACT TERM:
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

CONTACT| STAN JONES
QUOTED BY STAN JONES
TELEPHONE

NUMBER| 713-924-6929
FAX NUMBER 713-921-0074

Person to contact

PRIMARY AWARD for placing orders STAN JONES
1.1 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE, ALTERNAT (41%
ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) COMM Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: RAZOR PRO CODE |COUNTY ID UuoM Delivered UOM
1 gallon size 675-90 2149 GAL
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2150 GAL $24.00 $60.00
30 gallon drum 675-90 2151 DRUM $23.50 $705.00
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: RED RIVER 90 CODE |COUNTY ID| UOM Delivered UOM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 675-55 7567 $6.70 $6.70
Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL

ALTERNATE, HERBICIDE, 41% ISOPROPYLAMIN — (GLYSTAR PLUS), SECONDARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

Friday, May 1, 2009

4211 COLCHESTER CT

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842

CONTRACT TERM:
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

CONTACT] RICK BENNETT
QUOTED BY]
RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONE
NUMBER| 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER 979-690-8369

Person to contact

SECONDARY AWARD for placing orders RICK BENNETT
1.1 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE, ALTERNAT (41%
ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) COMM Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: GLYSTAR PLUS CODE |COUNTY ID UOM Delivered uoMm
1 gallon size 675-90 2149 GAL
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2150 GAL $24.00 $60.00
30 gallon drum 675-90 2151 |DRUM $23.50 $705.00
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: INLET 90 CODE |COUNTY ID| UOM Delivered UOM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 675-55 7567 $12.00 $12.00
Mixing Rate 1 QT /100 GAL
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

1.2 HERBICIDE,CONCENTRATE, 50.2% ISOPROPYLAMINE — (ROUND UP PRO CONCENTRATE),PRIMARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

Friday, May 1, 2009

4211 COLCHESTER CT

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842

CONTRACT TERM:
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

PRIMARY AWARD

CONTACT| RICK BENNETT
QUOTED BY RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONE]

NUMBER] 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER 979-690-8369

Person to contact
for placing orders

RICK BENNETT

1.2 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE, CONCENTRATE

(50.2% ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: ROUND UP PRO CONCENTRATE CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM

1 gallon size 675-90 2681 GAL -

2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2682 GAL $43.75 $109.38
30 gallon drum 675-90 2661 DRUM $43.25 $1,297.50
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: INLET 90 CODE ID UoOM Delivered UoM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567 - $12.00 $12.00
Mixing Rate 1 QT /100 GAL

DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5

1.2HERBICIDE,CONCENTRATE,50.2% ISOPROPYLAMINE —(ROUND UP PRO CONCENTRATE),SECONDARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC

Friday, May 1, 2009

8930 LAWNDALE STE B

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

HOUSTON, TX 77501

CONTACT STAN JONES
UOTED BY
CONTRACT TERM: S STAN JONES
TELEPHONE]
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010 NUMBER) 713-924-6929
FAX NUMBER 713-921-0074
Person to contact
SECONDARY AWARD for placing orders STAN JONES
1.2 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE, CONCENTRATE
(50.2% ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: ROUND UP PRO CONCENTRATE CODE 1D UOM Delivered UOM
1 gallon size 675-90 2681 GAL -
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2682 GAL $45.00 $112.50
30 gallon drum 675-90 2661 |DRUM $44.40 $1,332.00
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: RED RIVER 90 CODE 1D UOM Delivered UOM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567 $6.70 $6.70
Mixing Rate 1-2 QT /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

1.3 HERBICIDE, AQUATIC,(53.5% ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) — (RODEO)PRIMARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME]|

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

Friday, May 1, 2009

4211 COLCHESTER CT

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842

CONTRACT TERM:
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

PRIMARY AWARD

CONTACT| RICK BENNETT
QUOTED BY RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONE

NUMBER 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER 979-690-8369

Person to contact
for placing orders

RICK BENNETT

1.3 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE, AQUATIC (53.5%

ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: RODEO CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM

1 gallon size 675-90 827 GAL NO BID NO BID
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 828 GAL $44.80 $112.00
30 gallon drum 675-90 829 DRUM $44.80 $1,344.00
SPREADER, HERBICIDE, AGRICULTURAL ADJUVANT COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: INLET 90 CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567 $12.00 $12.00

State Mixing Rate

1 QT /100 GAL

DELIVERY: DAYS ARO

5

1.3HERBICIDE,AQUATIC,(53.5% ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) -(RODEO)SECONDARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME|] RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC

Friday, May 1, 2009

8930 LAWNDALE STE B

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

HOUSTON, TX 77501

CONTACT] STAN JONES
UOTED BY
CONTRACT TERM: > STAN JONES
TELEPHONE]}
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010 NUMBER 713-924-6929
FAX NUMBER| 713-921-0074
Person to contact
SECONDARY AWARD for placing orders STAN JONES
1.3 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE, AQUATIC (53.5%
ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: RODEO CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM
1 gallon size 675-90 827 GAL NO BID NO BID
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 828 GAL $ 52.00 | $ 130.00
30 gallon drum 675-90 829 DRUM $ 51.00 | $ 1,530.00
SPREADER, HERBICIDE, AGRICULTURAL ADJUVANT COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: RED RIVER 90 CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567 $6.70 $6.70

State Mixing Rate

2 QTS /100 GAL

DELIVERY: DAYS ARO

5

HERBICIDES AND APPLICATION - PAGE 5 OF 12



BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

ALTERNATE, HERBICIDE, AQUATIC, 53.5% ISOPROPYLAMINE — (AQUA STAR), PRIMARY AWARD
BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION
DATE OF BID OPENING:
Friday, May 1, 2009
10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY
4211 COLCHESTER CT
COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842

BIDDERS NAME

CONTACT RICK BENNETT

CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY RICK BENNETT
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010 NUMBER] 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER 979-690-8369

Person to contact

PRIMARY AWARD RICK BENNETT

for placing orders

1.3 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE, AQUATIC, ALTERNATE

(53.5 ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND:AQUASTAR CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM

1 gallon size 675-90 2153 GAL

2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2154 GAL $30.95 $77.38
30 gallon drum 675-90 2155 DRUM $30.25 $907.50
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: INLET 90 CODE ID UOM Delivered UOoM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567 $12.00 $12.00
State Mixing Rate 1 QT /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5

ALTERNATE, HERBICIDE, AQUATIC, 53.5% ISOPROPYLAMINE — (AQUANEAT), SECONDARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME|

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC

Friday, May 1, 2009

8930 LAWNDALE STE B

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

HOUSTON, TX 77501

CONTACT STAN JONES
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY STAN JONES
TELEPHONE]
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010 NUMBER 713-924-6929
FAX NUMBER 713-921-0074
Person to contact
SECONDARY AWARD for placing orders STAN JONES
1.3 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE, AQUATIC, ALTERNATE
(53.5 ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND:AQUANEAT CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM
1 gallon size 675-90 2153 GAL -
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2154 GAL $31.00 $77.50
30 gallon drum 675-90 2155 DRUM $30.50 $915.00
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND:RED RIVER 90 CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567 $6.70 $6.70
State Mixing Rate 2 QTS /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

1.4 HERBICIDE, 31.8% TRICLOPYR ACID — (GARLON 3A), PRIMARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

Friday, May 1, 2009

4211 COLCHESTER CT

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842

CONTRACT TERM:
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

PRIMARY AWARD

CONTACT] RICK BENNETT
QUOTED BY RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONH]

NUMBER| 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER 979-690-8369

Person to contact
for placing orders

RICK BENNETT

1.4 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE, (31.8% TRICLOPYR

ACID) COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: GARLON 3A CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM

1 gallon size 675-90 830 GAL -

2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 831 GAL $66.50 $166.25
30 gallon drum 975-90 832 DRUM $66.50 $1,995.00
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND:INLET 90 CODE ID uoM Delivered UOM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 675-55 7567 - $12.00 $12.00
Mixing Rate 1 QT /100 GAL

DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5

1.4HERBICIDE, 31.8% TRICLOPYR ACID — (GARLON 3A), SECONDARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME|

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC

Friday, May 1, 2009

8930 LAWNDALE STE B

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

HOUSTON, TX 77501

CONTACT STAN JONES
UOTED BY
CONTRACT TERM: o STAN JONES
TELEPHONE]
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010 NUMBER] 713-924-6929
FAX NUMBER 713-921-0074
Person to contact
SECONDARY AWARD for placing orders STAN JONES
1.4 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE, (31.8% TRICLOPYR
ACID) COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND: GARLON 3A CODE ID UOM |Delivered UOM
1 gallon size 675-90 830 GAL
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 831 GAL $68.00 $170.00
30 gallon drum 975-90 832 DRUM $67.50 $2,025.00
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND:RED RIVER 90 CODE ID UOM |Delivered UoM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 675-55 7567 $6.70 $6.70
Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5
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1.5 HERBICIDE, 27.76% PYRIDINE CARBOXYLIC — (ARSENAL), PRIMARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC

Friday, May 1, 2009

8930 LAWNDALE STE B

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

HOUSTON, TX 77501

CONTACT STAN JONES
QUOTED BY] STAN JONES
TELEPHONE]
CONTRACT TERM: NUMBER] 713-924-6929
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010 FAX NUMBER 713-921-0074
Person to contact
PRIMARY AWARD for placing orders STAN JONES
1.5 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE (PYRIDINE
CARBOXYLIC ACID WITH PROPANAMINE SALT-27.76%, Extended
INERT INGREDIENTS - 72.4%) COMM COUNTY Price/gal. Price
BRAND: CODE ID UOM Delivered Delivered
1 gallon size 675-90 2158 GAL
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 833 GAL $72.00 $180.00
15 gallon drum 675-90 2159 DRUM $72.00 $1,080.00
30 gallon drum 675-90 834 DRUM - -
Extended
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM COUNTY Price/gal. Price
BRAND: CODE ID UOM Delivered Delivered
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 675-55 7567 $6.70 $6.70
Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5

1.5HERBICIDE, 27.76% PYRIDINE CARBOXYLIC — (ARSENAL), SECONDARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

Friday, May 1, 2009

4211 COLCHESTER CT

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842

CONTRACT TERM:

JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

CONTACT RICK BENNETT
QUOTED BY|
RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER 979-690-8369

Person to contact

SECONDARY AWARD for placing orders RICK BENNETT
1.5 WEED KILLER, HERBICIDE (PYRIDINE
CARBOXYLIC ACID WITH PROPANAMINE SALT-27.76%, Extended
INERT INGREDIENTS - 72.4%) COMM COUNTY Price/gal. Price
BRAND: CODE ID UOM Delivered Delivered
1 gallon size 675-90 2158 GAL - -
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 833 GAL $169.80 $424.50
15 gallon drum 675-90 2159 DRUM $169.80 $2,547.00
30 gallon drum 675-90 834 DRUM - -
Extended
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM COUNTY Price/gal. Price
BRAND: CODE ID UOM Delivered Delivered
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 675-55 7567 $12.00 $12.00
Mixing Rate 1 QT /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

1.6 HERBICIDE, 22% AMMONIUM SALT OF IMAZAPIC - (PLATEAU) PRIMARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

Friday, May 1, 2009

4211 COLCHESTER CT

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842

CONTACT RICK BENNETT
QUOTED BY RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONE]
CONTRACT TERM: NUMBER 979-268-5206
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010 FAX NUMBER 979-690-8369

Person to contact
for placing orders

PRIMARY AWARD RICK BENNETT

1.6 PLATEAU { (+)-2- [4,5-dihydro-4-methyl-4-(1-

methylethy)-5-0x0-1H-imidazol-2-yl]1-5-methyl-3pyridine

carboxylic acid} - not less than 22%. Inert ingredients - COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
76.4% - Low Usage ltem CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM

1 gallon size 675-90 1460 GAL $197.50 $197.50
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2162 GAL $197.50 $493.75
15 gallon size 675-90 2163 DRUM $197.50 $2,962.50
30 gallon drum 675-90 2164 DRUM - -
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND:INLET 90 CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567 - $12.00 $12.00
Mixing Rate 1 QT /100 GAL

DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5

1.6 HERBICIDE, 22% AMMONIUM SALT OF IMAZAPIC — (PLATEAU) SECONDARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING: BIDDERS NAME| RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC
Friday, May 1, 2009 8930 LAWNDALE STE B
10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME HOUSTON, TX 77501
CONTACT] STAN JONES
QUOTED BY]|
STAN JONES
TELEPHONE]
CONTRACT TERM: NUMBER] 713-924-6929
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010 FAX NUMBER 713-921-0074
Person to contact
SECONDARY AWARD for placing orders STAN JONES
1.6 PLATEAU { (+)-2- [4,5-dihydro-4-methyl-4-(1-
methylethy)-5-o0xo0-1H-imidazol-2-yl]1-5-methyl-3pyridine
carboxylic acid} - not less than 22%. Inert ingredients - COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
76.4% - Low Usage ltem CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM
1 gallon size 675-90 1460 GAL $210.00 $210.00
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2162 GAL $210.00 $525.00
15 gallon size 675-90 2163 DRUM $205.00 $3,075.00
30 gallon drum 675-90 2164 DRUM - -
SURFACTANT, HERBICIDE COMM COUNTY Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND:RED RIVER 90 CODE ID UOM Delivered UOM
Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567 - $6.70 $6.70
Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5
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1.7 SPREADER, STICKER, DISPOSITION AID, DRIFT RETARDANT (SECURE ULTRA DRIFT CONTROLI) PRIMARY

AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC

Friday, May 1, 2009

8930 LAWNDALE STE B

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

HOUSTON, TX 77501

CONTRACT TERM:
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

CONTACT] STAN JONES
QUOTED BY| STAN JONES
TELEPHONH]

NUMBER] 713-924-6929
FAX NUMBER 713-921-0074

Person to contact

PRIMARY AWARD for placing orders STAN JONES
DESCRIPTION Comm Code] County ID
1.7 DRIF-TROL 2 Deposition Aid — Drift Retardant
(Polyvinyl Polymer (Polyacrylamide) 36%; Constituents.
Ineffective as Spray Adjuvant 64%). Comm Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND:SECURE ULTRA DRIFT CONTROL Code County ID UOM |Delivered UOM
1 quart 675-90 2172 QRT $8.50 $8.50
1 gallon size 675-90 1020 GAL
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2170 GAL
30 gallon drum 675-90 2171 DRUM

1.7 SPREADER, STICKER, DISPOSITION AID, DRIFT RETARDANT (DRIF-TROL Il) SECONDARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

Friday, May 1, 2009

4211 COLCHESTER CT

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842

CONTRACT TERM:
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

CONTACT RICK BENNETT
QUOTED BY|
RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER] 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER 979-690-8369

Person to contact

SECONDARY AWARD for placing orders RICK BENNETT
DESCRIPTION Comm Code| County ID
1.7 DRIF-TROL 2 Deposition Aid — Drift Retardant
(Polyvinyl Polymer (Polyacrylamide) 36%; Constituents.
Ineffective as Spray Adjuvant 64%). Comm Price/gal. PRICE PER
BRAND:DRIFT-TROL 2 Code County ID UOM Delivered UOM
1 quart 675-90 2172 QRT $8.90 $8.90
1 gallon size 675-90 1020 GAL - -
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2170 GAL - -
30 gallon drum 675-90 2171 DRUM - -
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

1.8 DYE, HERBICIDE - PRIMARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC

Friday, May 1, 2009

8930 LAWNDALE STE B

10:00 A.M,, LOCAL TIME

HOUSTON, TX 77501

CONTACT STAN JONES
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY] STAN JONES
TELEPHONE]
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010 NUMBER 713-924-6929
FAX NUMBER 713-921-0074
Person to contact
PRIMARY AWARD for placing orders STAN JONES
1.8 DYE, HERBICIDE, TURF MARK, LOCATE BLUE OR Price/gal. PRICE PER
EQUIVALENT. Comm Code| County ID uoMm Delivered UoM
1 quart 675-90 1495 QT $10.50 $10.50
1 gallon size 675-90 2175 GAL $31.00 $31.00
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2173 GAL $28.50 $71.25
30 gallon drum 675-90 2174 DRUM -

1.8 DYE, HERBICIDE - PRIMARY AWARD

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME|

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

Friday, May 1, 2009

4211 COLCHESTER CT

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842

CONTRACT TERM:

JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

CONTACT] RICK BENNETT
s RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONE]

NUMBER 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER 979-690-8369

Person to contact

SECONDARY AWARD for placing orders RICK BENNETT
1.8 DYE, HERBICIDE, TURF MARK, LOCATE BLUE OR Price/gal. PRICE PER
EQUIVALENT. Comm Code| County ID uom Delivered UuoM
1 quart 675-90 1495 QT - -
1 gallon size 675-90 2175 GAL $41.00 $41.00
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 2173 GAL $37.25 $931.25
30 gallon drum 675-90 2174 DRUM - -
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS

SUPPLY AND APPLICATION OF HERBICIDES

NO AWARD, NO BIDS RECEIVED

APPLICATION ONLY, USING COUNTY SUPPLIED CHEMICALS

BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME

EL CAMPO SPRAYING, INC.

Friday, May 1, 2009

2601 N. MECHANIC STREET

10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME

EL CAMPO, TX 77437

CONTRACT TERM:
JUNE 11, 2009 - JUNE 10, 2010

CONTACT KEITH STRNADEL
QUOTED BY KEITH STRNADEL
TELEPHONH]

NUMBER 979-543-7811
FAX NUMBER| 979-543-9120

Person to contact
for placing orders

KEITH STRNADEL

4.0 APPLICATION ONLY, USING COUNTY
SUPPLIED CHEMICALS

COMM COUNTY
4.1 EQUIPMENT CODE ID PRICE
4.1.1 4 WD Trucks, Spray Equipment @ Hr. 988-89 2654 $100.00
4.1.2 Tractor, Tanks, and Spray Equipment @ /Hr. 988-89 2655 $75.00
4.1.3 Application Mileage Charge 988-89 2656 $0.25
COMM COUNTY
4.2 LABOR CODE ID
4.2.1 Application One Man @ /Hr. 988-89 2659 $15.00
4.2.2 Application Two Men @ /Hr. 988-89 2660 $30.00
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