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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS
ITB#09-04 HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL

SELF-PROPELLED VIBRATORY SHEEPSFOOT (PADFOOQOT) ROLLER

SINGLE DRUM

BID #09-04 HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

EQUIPMENT SUPPORT SERVICES

JANUARY 25, 2009 - JANUARY 24, 2010

DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS 2220 NORTH GORDON
FRIDAY, JANUARY 2, 2009 ALVIN, TX 77511
CONTRACT TERM:
QUOTED BY

TOM SINGLETARY

WITH THE OPTION OF ONE (1) SIX (6) MONTH RENEWAL

TELEPHONE NO.

281-331-1521

FAX NUMBER

281-331-9209

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING

TOM SINGLETARY

CONTACT TELEPHONE NUMBER FOR RENTING

281-331-1521

DESCRIPTION

Comm Code

1.7 SELF-PROPELLED VIBRATORY SHEEPSFOOT (PADFOOT) ROL

LER

1.7.1 - SINGLE DRUM CAT CP563C OR EQUIV.:

PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $400.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,200.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $3,600.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2006 - 2008 CASE SV212

SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM SINGLE
DRUM WIDTH 87"

HORSEPOWER 148HP
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 4705
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS
ITB#09-04 HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL

SINGLE DRUM, CONTINUED

BID #09-04 HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME| EQUIPMENT SUPPORT SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS 2220 NORTH GORDON
FRIDAY, JANUARY 2, 2009 ALVIN, TX 77511
CONTRACT TERM:

JANUARY 25, 2009 - JANUARY 24, 2010 ORCER TOM SINGLETARY
WITH THE OPTION OF ONE (1) SIX (6) MONTH RENEWAL TELEPHONE NO. 281-331-1521
FAX NUMBER 281-331-9209

DESCRIPTION Comm Code

CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING TOM SINGLETARY

CONTACT TELEPHONE NUMBER FOR RENTING 281-331-1521

1.7.2 - OTHER SIZES AVAILABLE

PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $325.00
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $950.00
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $2,800.00
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 2006 - 2008 CASE SV208
SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM SINGLE
DRUM WIDTH 66"
HORSEPOWER 99HP
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 10 +
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS
ITB#09-04 HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL

SINGLE DRUM, CONTINUED

BID #09-04 HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME

ROMCO EQUIPMENT CO.

AHERN RENTALS

DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS 8450 BREEN 100 FELLOWS RD
FRIDAY, JANUARY 2, 2009 HOUSTON, TX 77064 HOUSTON, TX 77047
CONTRACT TERM:
QUOTED BY TOM BEARD

JANUARY 25, 2009 - JANUARY 24, 2010

JOHN HOLLEY

WITH THE OPTION OF ONE (1) SIX (6) MONTH RENEWAL

TELEPHONE NO.

713-937-3005

713-413-2700

FAX NUMBER 713-937-7541 713-413-2701
DESCRIPTION Comm Code
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING TOM BEARD JOHN HOLLEY
CONTACT TELEPHONE NUMBER FOR RENTING 713-899-0139 713-413-2700
1.7.4 - OTHER SIZES AS AVAILABLE VOLVO SD25F
$300.00 + $75.00 PICKUP &
PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,096.00 DELIVERY EACH WAY
$900.00 + $75.00 PICKUP &
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $1,487.00 DELIVERY EACH WAY
$2700.00 + $75.00 PICKUP &
PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 $2,654.00 DELIVERY EACH WAY
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID NO BID
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID NO BID
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID NO BID

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

2007/2008 VOLVO IRSD25F

DYNAPAC CA121PD

SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM SINGLE SINGLE PADFOOT
DRUM WIDTH 42" 54"

HORSEPOWER 44HP 58HP

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 2103 4
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BRAZORIA COUNTY CONTRACT SHEETS
ITB#09-04 HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL

SINGLE DRUM, CONTINUED

BID #09-04 HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BIDDERS NAME AHERN RENTALS
DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS 100 FELLOWS RD
FRIDAY, JANUARY 2, 2009 HOUSTON, TX 77047
CONTRACT TERM:
QUOTED BY
JANUARY 25, 2009 - JANUARY 24, 2010 JOHN HOLLEY
WITH THE OPTION OF ONE (1) SIX (6) MONTH RENEWAL TELEPHONE NO. 713-413-2700
FAX NUMBER 713-413-2701
DESCRIPTION Comm Code
CONTACT NAME FOR RENTING JOHN HOLLEY
CONTACT TELEPHONE NUMBER FOR RENTING 713-413-2700

1.7.5 - OTHER SIZES AS AVAILABLE

$275.00 + $75.00 PICKUP & DELIVERY

PRICE PER DAY W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 EACH WAY

$800.00 + $75.00 PICKUP & DELIVERY
PRICE PER WK W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 EACH WAY

$2400.00 + $75.00 PICKUP &

PRICE PER MO W/OUT OPERATOR 975-34 DELIVERY EACH WAY
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID
PRICE PER WK WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID
PRICE PER MO WITH OPERATOR 975-35 NO BID
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL AMMANN AC30P4B
SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM SINGLE PADFOOT
DRUM WIDTH 49"
HORSEPOWER 57HP
NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 2
DUAL DRUM
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