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LIBRARY PERIODICALS 
 
ITB #05-02 LIBRARY PERIODICALS

DATE OF BID OPENING
1 October 2004 - 2:00 PM

Contract Term

January 1, 2005 to December 31, 
2005

Option for 2 Renewal Periods
 

TITLE
Comm 
Code

Qty   
(# of 

Subs) UOM

NO.OF 
ISSUES/

SUB

MO/QTR/S
EMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

NO.OF 
ISSUES/

SUB

MO/QTR/S
EMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

AARP MEMBERSHIP/AMERICAN 
ASSOCIATION OF RETIRED PERSONS 
(MEMBERSHIP INCLUDES THE AARP 
NEWS BULLETIN AND AARP THE 
MAGAZINE) 700-15 4 ea. - - - - 6 MO $10.00 $40.00

ALLURE 700-15 2 ea. 12 MO $9.95 $19.90 - - - -

AMERICAN BABY 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $10.00 $10.00

AMERICAN GIRL (NO LESS THAN ONE 
YEAR) (NO 3 YEAR RATE) 700-15 7 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $14.00 $98.00

AMERICAN HERITAGE (FLEXIBLE EDITION) 
(SELECTED ARTICLES AVAILABLE ONLINE) 
(WILL NOT PRORATE) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $10.00 $30.00

AMERICAN HERITAGE OF INVENTION & 
TECHNOLOGY (PREVIOUSLY TITLED 
INVENTION & TECHNOLOGY) 700-15 2 ea. 4 QTR $12.95 $25.90 - - - -

AMERICAN PATCHWORK & QUILTING 
(BETTER HOMES AND GARDENS) (WILL 
PRORATE) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $15.00 $30.00

AMERICAN RIFLEMAN (SUBSCRIPTION 
COMES WITH MEMBERSHIP TO  THE 
NATIONAL RIFLE ASSOCIATION OF 
AMERICA) (AVAILABLE ONLINE 
WWW.NRAHQ.ORG) 700-15 1 ea. 1 ANN $28.75 $28.75 - - - -

ANTIQUE TRADER WEEKLY (PUBLISHED 
ON WEDNESDAYS) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 52 WKLY $26.00 $26.00

ANTIQUES & COLLECTING MAGAZINE 
(PREVIOUSLY TITLED ANTIQUES & 
COLLECTING HOBBIES) (WILL NOT 
PRORATE) (NO 3 YEAR RATE AVAILABLE) 
(NO LONGER AVAILABLE ONLINE) 700-15 4 ea. - - - - 12 MO $32.00 $128.00

ARCHAEOLOGY 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $15.00 $45.00

ARTISTS MAGAZINE 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $14.00 $14.00

ASTRONOMY MAGAZINE (WILL NOT 
PRORATE) 700-15 2 ea. 12 MO $27.95 $55.90 - - - -

ATLANTIC MONTHLY THE 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 10 MO $13.00 $39.00

AUSTIN AMERICAN STATESMAN (MONDAY 
- SUNDAY) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 365 DAILY $417.00 $417.00

FAX NUMBER 718.972.4695 508.845.9826
TEL NUMBER 800.728.3728 800.842.2077

QUOTED BY MICHAEL BRULL MARY COHEN

BROOKLYN, NY 11219 SHREWSBURY, MA 01545

1243 48TH STREET 56 MAPLE AVENUE
BIDDERS  NAME DELTA MAGAZINE GROUP, INC. EVA SUBSCRIPTIONS, INC.
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AVIATION W EEK & SPACE TECHNOLOGY 
(INCLUDES INTERNATIONAL PRODUCT 
NEW S) (SECOND ISSUE IN JAN IS THE 
AEROSPACE SOURCE BOOK) 700-15 2 ea. 51 WKLY $62.00 $124.00 - - - -

BARRONS NEW S (AVAILABLE ONLINE) 
(PRICES VARY FROM STATE TO STATE) 700-15 2 ea. 52 WKLY $99.95 $199.90 - - - -

BETTER HOMES & GARDENS 700-15 11 ea. 12 MO $11.95 $131.45 - - - -

BIRDERS W ORLD (PUBLISHED EVEN 
MONTHS) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $14.00 $28.00

BLACK BELT (INCLUDES YEARBOOK) 
(FORMERLY TITLED KARATE KUNG FU 
ILLUSTRATED) (NO LESS THAN 1 YEAR) 
(NO 3 YEAR RATE) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 12 MO $20.00 $60.00

BLACK ENTERPRISE 700-15 1 ea. 12 MO $1.00 $1.00 - - - -

BON APPETIT (NO LESS THAN 1 YEAR/NO 
3 YEAR RATE) 700-15 4 ea. 12 MO $14.00 $56.00 - - - -

BOOK LINKS 700-15 3 ea. 6 BI-MO $28.95 $86.85 - - - -

BOOKLIST (INCLUDES REFERENCE 
BOOKS BULLETIN) (FORMERLY TITLED 
BOOKLIST AND SUBSCRIPTION BOOKS 
BULLETIN) (AVAILABLE ONLINE 
W W W .ALA.ORG) (CLAIMS W ITHIN 12 
MONTHS) (3 YEAR RATE NO LONGER 
AVAILABLE) (W ILL PRORATE) 700-15 11 ea. 22 BI-WK $80.00 $880.00 - - - -

BOYS LIFE 700-15 4 ea. 12 MO $11.95 $47.80 - - - -

BOYS QUEST 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $21.00 $21.00

BRIDES (CONDE NAST) (ADVANCE 
MAGAZINE GROUP) (PREVIOUSLY TITLED 
BRIDES & YOUR NEW  HOMES) (W ILL NOT 
PRORATE) 700-15 5 ea. 6 BI-MO $10.00 $50.00 - - - -

BUDGET LIVING MAGAZINE 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $9.00 $9.00

BUSINESS 2.0 (FORMERLY TITLED E 
COMPANY) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $12.00 $12.00

BUSINESS W EEK (INCLUDES FULL 
ONLINE VERSION AVAILABLE @ 
W W W .BUSINESSW EEK.COM) 700-15 6 ea. 52 WKLY $29.95 $179.70 - - - -  
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CALLIOPE (EXPLORING WORLD HISTORY) 
(ACADEMIC YEAR BASIS) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 9 MO $29.00 $58.00

CAMPUS LIFE (AVAILABLE FOR 1 YEAR 
ONLY) (AVAILABLE ONLINE) (5 REGULAR 
ISSUES PLUS 4 COLLEGE PREP ISSUES) 
(COLLEGE GUIDES IN FEB/AUG/OCT/DEC) 700-15 1 ea. 6 BI-MO $7.95 $7.95 - - - -

CAR & DRIVER 700-15 9 ea. 12 MO $9.95 $89.55 - - - -

CAT FANCY (BACK ISSUES NOT 
AVAILABLE) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 12 MO $14.00 $28.00

CHILD MAGAZINE (JUN/JUL & DEC/JAN 
COMBINED) (FORMERLY CHILDRENS 
MAGAZINE MONTHLY) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 10 MO 8.00$     $8.00

CHRISTIAN SCIENCE MONITOR 700-15 1 ea. - - - -
5 WKLY 
(MON-FRI) $179.00 $179.00

CHRISTIANITY TODAY (WILL NOT 
PRORATE) (NO 2 OR 3 YEAR RATES) 
(NOT AVAILABLE ONLINE) 700-15 4 ea. 12 MO $14.95 $59.80 - - - -

COASTAL LIVING 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 8 MO $10.00 $30.00

COBBLESTONE (DISCOVER AMERICAN 
HISTORY) (ACADEMIC YEAR BASIS) 
(INCLUDES CUMULATIVE INDEX IN JAN 
ISSUE) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 9 MO $30.00 $60.00

COLLECTOR MAGAZINE & PRICE GUIDE 
(ANTIQUE TRADER PRICE GUIDE TO 
ANTIQUES AND COLLECTORS ITEMS) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 12 MO $15.00 $45.00

CONDE NAST TRAVELER (NOT 
AVAILABLE FOR LESS THAN 1 YEAR) 700-15 1 ea. 12 MO $9.95 $9.95 - - - -

CONGRESSIONAL DIGEST (INCLUDES 
CONGRESSIONAL DIGEST CUMULATIVE 
INDEX) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 10 MO $68.00 $136.00

CONSUMER REPORTS (INCLUDES 
ANNUAL BUYING GUIDE IN DEC) 
(WWW.CONSUMERREPORTS.ORG) 700-15 13 ea. - - - - 12 MO $18.00 $234.00

CONSUMER REPORTS ON HEALTH 
(PREVIOUSLY TITLED CONSUMER 
REPORTS HEALTH LETTER) (ALSO 
AVAILABLE ONLINE) (NOT AVAILABLE 
FOR LESS THAN 1 YEAR) (NO 3 YEAR 
RATES AVAILABLE) 700-15 4 ea. 12 MO $22.95 $91.80 - - - -

COOKS ILLUSTRATED (FORMERLY TITLED 
COOKS MAGAZINE) (WILL NOT PRORATE) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $24.00 $24.00  
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COSMOPOLITAN (CLAIMS WITHIN 60 DAYS 
OF THE 1ST OF THE MONTH ORDER IS 
PLACED) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $21.00 $21.00
COUNTRY LIVING (CLASSIC AMERICAN 
HOMES WILL MERGE INTO THIS TITLE) 
(WILL NOT PRORATE) (NO BACKSTARTS) 
(NO 3 YEAR RATE) (CLAIMS WITHIN 60 
DAYS OF 1ST OF MONTH OF ORDER 
DATE) 700-15 9 ea. 12 MO $12.95 $116.55 - - - -

CRAFTS N THINGS (4 COMBINED ISSUES 
AND 4 SINGLE ISSUES) (WILL NOT 
PRORATE) (ONLY AVAILABLE FOR 1 YEAR) 700-15 10 ea. - - - - 8 MO $21.00 $210.00

CRISTINA LA REVISTA (SPANISH) (ONLY 
AVAILABLE FOR 1 YEAR) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 12 MO $13.00 $39.00

CRITICAS 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $40.00 $200.00

CURRENT HISTORY (ACADEMIC YEAR 
BASIS) (INCLUDES ONLINE) (DOES NOT 
PUBLISH IN JUNE, JULY, AUG) (WILL NOT 
PRORATE) 700-15 2 ea. 9 MO $43.00 $86.00 - - - -

CYCLE WORLD 700-15 2 ea. 12 MO $10.95 $21.90 - - - -

DIG: THE ARCHAEOLOGY MAGAZINE FOR 
KIDS 700-15 1 ea. 9 MO $32.00 $32.00 - - - -

DISCOVER 700-15 8 ea. 12 MO $12.95 $103.60 - - - -

DOG FANCY (BACK ISSUES NOT 
AVAILABLE) 700-15 2 ea. 12 MO $12.95 $25.90 - - - -

EBONY 700-15 6 ea. 12 MO $9.95 $59.70 - - - -

EDUCATION DIGEST THE (ACADEMIC 
YEAR BASIS) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 9 MO $47.00 $94.00

ENTERTAINMENT WEEKLY (WILL 
PRORATE) (NO 3 YEAR RATE AVAILABLE) 
(NO INTERNET SALES PERMITTED) 700-15 10 ea. - - - - 56 WKLY $30.00 $300.00
ENVIRONMENT (ALSO AVAILABLE ONLINE) 
(COMBINED ISSUES FOR JAN/FEB AND 
JULY/AUG) (CLAIMS FOR US 
SUBSCRIBERS WITHIN 6 MONTHS) (NO 3 
YEAR RATE) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 10 MO $98.00 $98.00

ESPN THE MAGAZINE 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 26 BI-WK $15.00 $15.00

ESQUIRE (FORMERLY TITLED ESQUIRE 
FORTNIGHTLY) (CLAIMS WITHIN 60 DAYS 
OF 1ST OF MONTH THAT ORDER IS 
PLACED) 700-15 2 ea. 12 MO $10.95 $21.90 - - - -

ESSENCE (NEW YORK): THE MAGAZINE 
FOR TODAY'S BLACK WOMAN 700-15 2 ea. 12 MO $10.95 $21.90 - - - -
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FACES: PEOPLE PLACES & CULTURES 
(ACADEMIC YEAR BASIS) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 9 MO $29.00 $29.00

FAMILY CIRCLE (NO LESS THAN 1 YEAR) 700-15 7 ea. 15 MO $9.95 $69.65 - - - -

FAMILY HANDYMAN ( JULY/AUG & 
DEC/JAN ISSUES COMBINED) 700-15 7 ea. 10 MO $14.95 $104.65 - - - -

FAMILYFUN (JUN/JUL & DEC/JAN 
COMBINED) 700-15 8 ea. - - - - 10 MO $5.00 $40.00

FARM JOURNAL (WILL NOT PRORATE) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $25.00 $25.00

FDA CONSUMER ($8 CANCELLATION FEE) 
(CLAIMS WITHIN 6 MONTHS) (WILL NOT 
PRORATE) 700-15 1 ea. 6 BI-MO $14.00 $14.00 - - - -

FIELD & STREAM (WILL PRORATE) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 12 MO $8.00 $40.00

FINESCALE MODELER (ISSUES JA, FEB, 
MAR, APR, MAY, JUL, SEP, OCT, NOV, 
DEC) (NOT AVAILABLE FOR LESS THAN 1 
YEAR) (CLAIMS WITHIN 6 MONTHS OF 
COVER DATE) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 10 MO $28.00 $28.00

FLYING (NO 9 MONTHS) (WILL NOT 
PRORATE) 700-15 3 ea. 12 MO $12.95 $38.85 - - - -

FORBES (INCLUDES DIRECTORY 
ISSUES/AMERICAS BEST BIG 
COMPANIES/FORBES FYI/FORBES ASAP) 
(AVAILABLE ONLINE AT NO ADDITIONAL 
CHARGE WWW.FORBES.COM) (WILL 
PRORATE) 700-15 4 ea. 26 BI-MO $26.95 $107.80 - - - -

FOREIGN AFFAIRS 700-15 2 ea. 6 BI-MO $38.00 $76.00 - - - -

FORTUNE (INCLUDES ONLINE ACCESS) 
(INCLUDES DOUBLE 500 DIRECTORY) 700-15 2 ea. 26 BI-MO $24.95 $49.90 - - - -

GIRLS LIFE (WILL NOT PRORATE) (ONLY 
AVAILABLE FOR 1 YEAR) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $12.00 $60.00

GLAMOUR (ALSO AVAILABLE ONLINE @ 
WWW.GLAMOUR.COM) (NO LESS THAN 1 
YEAR) 700-15 9 ea. 12 MO $10.00 $90.00 - - - -

GOLF MAGAZINE 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 12 MO $9.00 $27.00

GOOD HOUSEKEEPING (MR FOODS 
EASY COOKING HAS MERGED INTO THIS 
TITLE) (CLAIMS WITHIN 60 DAYS OF 1ST 
OF MONTH THAT ORDER IS PLACED) 700-15 11 ea. 12 MO $11.00 $121.00 - - - -
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GQ GENTLEMENS QUARTERLY (NO LESS 
THAN 1 YEAR) 700-15 2 ea. 12 MO $9.95 $19.90 - - - -

GUNS & AMMO 700-15 2 ea. 12 MO $11.00 $22.00 - - - -
HARPERS BAZAAR (NO BACKSTARTS) (NO 
3 YEAR PRICE) (BACK ISSUES AVAILABLE) 
(WILL NOT PRORATE) (CLAIMS WITHIN 60 
DAYS OF 1ST OF MONTH OF ORDER 
DATE) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 12 MO $9.00 $18.00

HEALTH (FORMERLY TITLED IN HEALTH) 
(PUBLISHED WITH SOME COMBINED 
ISSUES) (AVAILABLE ONLINE) 700-15 4 ea. 10 MO $12.95 $51.80 - - - -

HERITAGE QUEST 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $28.00 $84.00

HIGHLIGHTS FOR CHILDREN (INDEX IN 
DEC ISSUE) 700-15 5 ea. 12 MO $26.04 $130.20 - - - -

HISPANIC MAGAZINE (AVAILABLE IN 
ENGLISH ONLY) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 12 MO $12.00 $60.00

HISTORY MAGAZINE 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $24.00 $48.00
HOME EDUCATION MAGAZINE (INCLUDES 
FREE ONLINE MONTHLY NEWSLETTER) 
(WILL NOT PRORATE) 700-15 4 ea. 6 BI-MO $32.00 $128.00 - - - -

HOME MAGAZINE (COMBINED ISSUE FOR 
DEC/JAN & JULY/AUG) (NO 9 MONTH 
RATES AVAILABLE) 700-15 2 ea. 10 MO $12.95 $25.90 - - - -

HOPSCOTCH (WILL NOT PRORATE) 700-15 1 ea. 6 BI-MO $24.95 $24.95 - - - -

HORSE & RIDER (INCORPORATES HORSE 
LOVERS) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 12 MO $10.00 $20.00

HOT ROD 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 12 MO $13.00 $39.00

HOUSTON BUSINESS JOURNAL 
(INCLUDES BOOK OF LISTS) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 52 WKLY $85.00 $170.00

IN BRITAIN (1 YEAR SUBSCRIPTIONS 
ONLY) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $20.00 $40.00

IN STYLE 700-15 2 ea. 12 MO $15.00 $30.00 - - - -
INFORMATION TODAY (JULY/AUG 
COMBINED) (ALSO AVAILABLE ONLINE) 
(INCLUDES LINK UP) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 11 MO $73.00 $73.00

INSTRUCTOR (WILL NOT PRORATE) (NO 2 
OR 3 YEAR RATE) (PREVIOUSLY PRIMARY 
OR INTERMEDIATE EDITIONS) 
(PREVIOUSLY TITLED INSTRUCTOR AND 
TEACHER) (NO 9 MONTH AVAILABLE) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 9 MO $13.00 $26.00

INVESTORS BUSINESS DAILY (INCLUDES 
GUIDE TO INVESTORS DAILY MONEY IN 
STOCKS AUDIO TAPE 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 260

DAILY 
(MON-FRI) $290.00 $870.00

JAMA/JOURNAL OF THE AMERICAN 
MEDICAL ASSOCIATION (INCLUDES 
ONLINE) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 48 WKLY $448.00 $448.00
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JET (PUBLISHED ON MONDAYS) (WILL 
NOT PRORATE) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 52 WKLY $19.00 $95.00

KIDS DISCOVER 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 12 MO $20.00 $100.00
KIPLINGERS PERSONAL FINANCE 
MAGAZINE (FORMERLY CHANGING TIMES) 
(WILL PRORATE) 700-15 4 ea. 12 MO $10.00 $40.00 - - - -

LADIES HOME JOURNAL (NOT AVAILABLE 
ONLINE) 700-15 7 ea. 12 MO $9.95 $69.65 - - - -

LADYBUG 700-15 2 ea. - - - - $34.00 $68.00

LATINA 700-15 6 ea. - - - - 11 MO $8.00 $48.00
LIBRARY ADMINISTRATORS DIGEST (NOT 
PUBLISHED IN JUL OR AUG) (WILL NOT 
PRORATE PER PUBLISHED...) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 10 MO $45.00 $45.00
LIBRARY HOTLINE (PUBLISHED WEEKLY 
EXCEPT FOR THE LAST 2 WEEKS OF DEC) 
(CLAIMS WITHIN 6 MONTHS) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 50 WKS $114.00 $114.00

LIBRARY JOURNAL (INCLUDES ONLINE 
ACCESS) 700-15 11 ea. - - - - 20 BI WKLY $140.00 $1,540.00

LIBRARYSPARKS MAGAZINE 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 9 MO $60.00 $120.00
LOCUS/ THE NEWSPAPER OF THE 
SCIENCE FICTION FIELD (CLAIMS WITHIN 
6 MONTHS OF ISSUE DATE) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $55.00 $55.00

MAD MAGAZINE 700-15 9 ea. - - - - 12 MO $14.00 $126.00
MAILBOX INTERMEDIATE LEVEL (GRADES 
4 - 6) (PUBLISHED EVERY OTHER MONTH 
STARTING IN AUG) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $25.00 $50.00
MAILBOX KINDERGARTEN (PRINT 
SUBSCRIBERS RECEIVE FREE ONLINE 
EXCERPTS) (NO LESS THAN 1 YEAR) 700-15 4 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $24.00 $96.00

MAILBOX PRESCHOOL (PRINT 
SUBSCRIBERS RECEIVE FREE ONLINE 
EXCERPTS) (WILL NOT PRORATE) (NO 9 
MONTH RATE AVAILABLE) 700-15 6 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $24.00 $144.00

MAILBOX PRIMARY LEVEL (GRADES 1 - 3) 
(PRINT SUBSCRIBERS RECEIVE FREE 
ONLINE EXCERPTS) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $24.00 $72.00

MARTHA STEWART LIVING 700-15 6 ea. - - - - 12 MO $15.00 $90.00

MARY ENGELBREIT'S HOME COMPANION 
(NO 3 YEAR RATE) 700-15 2 ea. 6 BI-MO $13.95 $27.90 - - - -

MEMORY MAKERS: THE FIRST SOURCE 
FOR SCRAPBOOKING IDEAS 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 8 BI-MO $14.00 $28.00

MENS HEALTH MAGAZINE (JAN/FEB & 
JUL/AUG COMBINED ISSUES) 700-15 3 ea. 10 MO $20.00 $60.00 - - - -

MENTAL FLOSS: FEEL SMART AGAIN 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $22.00 $22.00
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ITB #05-02 LIBR AR Y  PE R IOD ICALS

DATE OF BID OPENING
1 October 2004 - 2:00 PM

Contract Term

January 1, 2005 to December 31, 
2005

Option for 2 Renewal Periods
 

TITLE
Comm 
Code

Qty    
(# of 

Subs) UOM

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

FAX NUMBER 718.972.4695 508.845.9826
TEL NUMBER 800.728.3728 800.842.2077

QUOTED BY MICHAEL BRULL MARY COHEN

BROOKLYN, NY 11219 SHREWSBURY, MA 01545

1243 48TH STREET 56 MAPLE AVENUE
BIDDERS  NAME DELTA MAGAZINE GROUP, INC. EVA SUBSCRIPTIONS, INC.

 
MODERN BRIDE 700-15 4 ea. 6 BI-WK $9.95 $39.80 - - - -

MONEY (INCLUDES EXTRA ISSUE IN DEC) 
(INCLUDES MONEY.COM) 700-15 9 ea. - - - - 13 MO $20.00 $180.00

MORE (NEW YORK) MAGAZINE: SMART 
TALK FOR SMART WOMEN 700-15 2 ea. 10 MO $13.95 $27.90 - - - -

MORNINGSTAR FUNDINVESTOR 
(FORMERLY TITLED MORNINGSTAR 
INVESTOR) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 12 MO $99.00 $297.00

MOTHER EARTH NEWS 700-15 4 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $14.00 $56.00

MOTOR BOATING (PREVIOUSLY TITLED 
MOTOR BOATING & SAILING) 700-15 3 ea. 12 MO $10.95 $32.85 - - - -

MOTOR TREND 700-15 4 ea. - - - - 12 MO $10.00 $40.00

MS (WILL NOT PRORATE) (NO 9 MONTH 
RATE AVAILABLE) 700-15 2 ea. 6 BI-MO $35.00 $70.00 - - - -

MUSCLE & FITNESS (JOE WEIDERS) 700-15 1 ea. 12 MO $17.95 $17.95 - - - -

MUSCLE & FITNESS HERS 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $24.00 $24.00

MYSTERY SCENE 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 5 BI-MO $32.00 $64.00

NATION THE (DOES NOT INCLUDE INDEX) 
(MONDAYS EXCEPT FOR 2 WEEKS IN JAN 
& BIWEEKLY JULY THROUGH SEPT) (ALSO 
AVAILABLE ONLINE) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 47 WKLY $45.00 $90.00

NATIONAL GEOGRAPHIC KIDS (FORMERLY 
TITLED NATIONAL GEOGRAPHIC WORLD) 
(NO LESS THAN 1 YEAR) 700-15 7 ea. 10 MO $12.95 $90.65 - - - -

NATIONAL GEOGRAPHIC MAGAZINE 
(PUBLISHER REQUIRES THAT INDEX BE 
ORDERED SEPARATELY) (AVAILABLE 
ONLINE 
@WWW.NATIONALGEOGRAPHIC.COM) 
(COMES ALSO WITH NATIONAL 
GEOGRAPHIC SOCIETY MEMBERSHIP) 700-15 11 ea. 12 MO $23.95 $263.45 - - - -
NATIONAL GEOGRAPHIC TRAVELER (WILL 
NOT PRORATE) (NO 3 YEAR RATE 
AVAILABLE) 700-15 4 ea. 8 MO $11.95 $47.80 - - - -

NATIONAL REVIEW 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 25 BI-WK $25.00 $75.00
NATURAL HISTORY (DEC/JAN & JUL/AUG 
COMBINED) (ALSO COMES WITH 
MEMBERSHIP TO THE AMERICAN 
MUSEUM OF NATURAL HISTORY) (NO 
BACKSTARTS) (WILL NOT PRORATE) (NOT 
AVAILABLE FOR LESS THAN 1 YEAR) 700-15 1 ea. 10 MO $19.95 $19.95 - - - -
NEIL SPERRYS GARDENS (FORMERLY 
TITLED NEIL SPERRYS GARDENS & MORE) 
(NO 9 MONTH RATE AVAILABLE) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $22.00 $66.00
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I TB #05 -02  LIBR AR Y  PE R IOD ICALS

DATE OF BID OPENING
1 October 2004 - 2:00 PM

Contract Term

January 1, 2005 to December 31, 
2005

Option for 2 Renewal Periods
 

TITLE
Comm 
Code

Qty    
(# of 

Subs) UOM

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

FAX NUMBER 718.972.4695 508.845.9826
TEL NUMBER 800.728.3728 800.842.2077

QUOTED BY MICHAEL BRULL MARY COHEN

BROOKLYN, NY 11219 SHREWSBURY, MA 01545

1243 48TH STREET 56 MAPLE AVENUE
BIDDERS  NAME DELTA MAGAZINE GROUP, INC. EVA SUBSCRIPTIONS, INC.

 

NEW REPUBLIC 700-15 2 ea. 48 WKLY $33.95 $67.90 - - - -

NEW YORK TIMES BOOK REVIEW 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 52 WKLY $64.00 $64.00

NEW YORK TIMES/NATIONAL 
EDITION/SUNDAY W/BOOK REVIEW 
(INCLUDES EMPLOYMENT 
ADVERTISEMENTS & SECTIONS 8 & 9 
WHICH ARE THE MAGAZINE AND BOOK 
REVIEW) (SUNDAY ONLY) (NO 3 YEAR) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 52 WKLY $300.00 $600.00

NEW YORKER THE WEEKLY 700-15 4 ea. 52 WKLY $31.00 $124.00 - - - -

NEWSWEEK (PUBLISHED MONDAYS) 700-15 11 ea. 52 WKLY $30.00 $330.00 - - - -

NICKELODIAN 700-15 8 ea. 10 MO $13.95 $111.60 - - - -

NINTENDO POWER MAGAZINE 700-15 11 ea. 12 MO $13.95 $153.45 - - - -

O THE OPRAH MAGAZINE (AVAILABLE 
ONLINE @WWW.OPRAH.COM) (NO 3 
YEAR RATE) (WILL NOT PRORATE) 
(CLAIMS WITHIN 60 DAYS OF 1ST OF 
MONTH THAT ORDER IS PLACED) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 12 MO $16.00 $80.00

ODYSSEY (ADVENTURES IN SCIENCE) 
(ACADEMIC YEAR BASIS) 700-15 4 ea. - - - - 9 MO $30.00 $120.00

ORGANIC GARDENING (NO 3 YEAR RATE) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $15.00 $30.00

OUTDOOR LIFE (COMBINED ISSUES 
DEC/JAN & JUNE/JULY) (ALSO 
AVAILABLE ONLINE) 700-15 2 ea. 10 MO $1.00 $2.00 - - - -

PACK-O-FUN (PUBLISHED FEB APRIL 
COMBINED ISSUES FOR JUNE/JULY OCT 
NOV/DEC) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $20.00 $60.00

PAGES MAGAZINE (FOR PEOPLE WHO 
LOVE BOOKS) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $18.00 $18.00

PAPER CRAFTS MAGAZINE 
(PREVIOUSLY TITLED CRAFTS 
MAGAZINE) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 8 MO $12.00 $60.00

PARENTS MAGAZINE (AVAILABLE 
ONLINE @ WWW.PARENTS.COM) (NO 
CANCELLATIONS ACCEPTED...) 700-15 9 ea. 12 MO $5.00 $45.00 - - - -

PC MAGAZINE 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 22 BI-WK $22.00 $22.00

PEOPLE EN ESPANOL 700-15 7 ea. 10 MO $7.00 $49.00 - - - -
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I TB # 05 -02  LIBR AR Y  PE R IOD ICALS

DATE OF BID OPENING
1 October 2004 - 2:00 PM

Contract Term

January 1, 2005 to December 31, 
2005

Option for 2 Renewal Periods
 

TITLE
Comm 
Code

Qty    
(# of 

Subs) UOM

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

FAX NUMBER 718.972.4695 508.845.9826
TEL NUMBER 800.728.3728 800.842.2077

QUOTED BY MICHAEL BRULL MARY COHEN

BROOKLYN, NY 11219 SHREWSBURY, MA 01545

1243 48TH STREET 56 MAPLE AVENUE
BIDDERS  NAME DELTA MAGAZINE GROUP, INC. EVA SUBSCRIPTIONS, INC.

PEOPLE WEEKLY (TIME INC) (AVAILABLE 
ONLINE @ WWW.PEOPLE.COM) 700-15 12 ea. - - - - 52 WKLY $99.00 $1,188.00

POPULAR MECHANICS (NO TEACHERS 
GUIDE) (VIEW CURRENT ISSUES ONLINE 
@ WWW.POPULARMECHANICS.COM) (NO 
3 YEAR RATES) (NO BACKSTARTS) 
(CLAIMS WITHIN 60 DAYS OF 1ST OF 
MONTH THAT ORDER IS PLACED) 700-15 6 ea. 12 MO $11.95 $71.70 - - - -

POPULAR PHOTOGRAPHY & IMAGING 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 12 MO $12.00 $36.00

POPULAR SCIENCE (ONLINE AT NO 
CHARGE WWW.POPSCI.COM) 700-15 7 ea. 12 MO $10.00 $70.00 - - - -

PRACTICAL HOME SCHOOLING 
(INCORPORATES HOMESCHOOL PC) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - $32.00 $96.00

PREMIERE 700-15 3 ea. 12 MO $10.00 $30.00 - - - -

PREVENTION (AVAILABLE ONLINE @ 
WWW.PREVENTION.COM) 700-15 4 ea. 12 MO $10.00 $40.00 - - - -

PSYCHOLOGY TODAY (AVAILABLE 
ONLINE) 700-15 4 ea. 6 BI-MO $12.95 $51.80 - - - -
PUBLISHERS WEEKLY (INCLUDES ONLINE) 
(MAILED ON MONDAYS) (LAST TWO 
WEEKS OF DEC ARE COMBINED) 
(INCLUDES 4 SPECIAL ANNOUNCEMENT 
ISSUES) 700-15 7 ea. 51 WKLY $214.00 $1,498.00 - - - -

QUICK COOKING (TASTE OF HOME) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $17.00 $51.00

QUILT (WILL NOT PRORATE) (NO 3 YEAR 
RATE AVAILABLE) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 4 QTR $13.00 $26.00

QUILTERS NEWSLETTER (JULY/AUG AND 
JAN/FEB ISSUES ARE COMBINED) 700-15 3 ea. 10 MO $19.95 $59.85 - - - -

RANGER RICK (INCLUDES RANGER RICK 
NATURE CLUB MEMBERSHIP) (HAS AN 
INDEX THAT IS FREE UPON REQUEST BY 
SUBSCRIBER) (NO 3 YEAR RATE) 700-15 9 ea. 12 MO $12.95 $116.55 - - - -

READERS DIGEST 700-15 7 ea. 12 MO $12.95 $90.65 - - - -

REAL SIMPLE 700-15 4 ea. 12 MO $16.95 $67.80 - - - -
REDBOOK (AVAILABLE ONLINE AT 
WWW.REDBOOKMAG.COM) (CLAIMS 
WITHIN 60 DAYS OF 1ST OF MONTH THAT 
ORDER IS PLACED) 700-15 4 ea. 12 MO $9.95 $39.80 - - - -

REVIEW OF TEXAS BOOKS 
(JUNE/SEPT/DEC & DOUBLE ISSUE IN DEC) 
(CALENDAR YEAR BASIS) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 4 QTR $14.00 $14.00

ROAD & TRACK 700-15 4 ea. 12 MO $10.95 $43.80 - - - -
ROLLING STONE (ALSO AVAILABLE ON CD-
ROM) 700-15 9 ea. - - - - 26 BI-WK $14.00 $126.00

ROMANTIC TIMES BOOK CLUB 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 12 MO $43.00 $129.00

RUNNERS WORLD 700-15 1 ea. 12 MO $16.95 $16.95 - - - -

SALTWATER SPORTSMAN 700-15 1 ea. 12 MO $13.95 $13.95 - - - -

SATURDAY EVENING POST 700-15 2 ea. 6 BI-MO $10.00 $20.00 - - - -
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ITB #05-02  LIBR AR Y  PE R IOD ICALS

DATE OF BID OPENING
1 October 2004 - 2:00 PM

Contract Term

January 1, 2005 to December 31, 
2005

Option for 2 Renewal Periods
 

TITLE
Comm 
Code

Qty    
(# of 

Subs) UOM

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

FAX NUMBER 718.972.4695 508.845.9826
TEL NUMBER 800.728.3728 800.842.2077

QUOTED BY MICHAEL BRULL MARY COHEN

BROOKLYN, NY 11219 SHREWSBURY, MA 01545

1243 48TH STREET 56 MAPLE AVENUE
BIDDERS  NAME DELTA MAGAZINE GROUP, INC. EVA SUBSCRIPTIONS, INC.

 
SCHOLASTIC NEW YORK TIMES UPFRONT 
(TEACHERS EDITION) (PREVIOUSLY 
TITLED SCHOLASTIC UPDATE) (ACADEMIC 
YEAR BASIS) (INCLUDES TEACHING GUIDE 
AND DESK COPY OF STUDENT EDITION) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 14 MO $24.00 $72.00

SCHOOL LIBRARY JOURNAL (WITH INDEX) 
(NO 2 OR 3 YEAR RATES) (CLAIMS WITHIN 
6 MONTHS) (NO BACKSTARTS) (WILL 
PRORATE) 700-15 11 ea. - - - - 12 MO $123.00 $1,353.00

SCIENCE (ALSO AVAILABLE ONLINE) 
(ALSO COMES WITH AMERICAN 
ASSOCIATION FOR THE ADVANCEMENT 
OF SCIENCE MEMBERSHIP) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 51 WKLY $500.00 $1,000.00

SCIENCE NEWS (INCLUDES ONLINE 
ACCESS FOR SINGLE USER ONLY) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 52 WKLY $52.00 $260.00

SCIENTIFIC AMERICAN MAGAZINE 
(CERTAIN ARTICLES ONLINE @ 
WWW.SCIAM.COM) (DOES NOT COME 
WITH SCIENTIFIC EXPLORATIONS) 
(INCLUDES FREE MIND AND BRAIN ISSUE 
WITH SUBSCRIPTION) 700-15 4 ea. - - - - 12 MO $33.00 $132.00

SELECCIONES DEL READERS DIGEST 
(SPANISH) (WILL NOT PRORATE) 700-15 6 ea. - - - - 12 MO $13.00 $78.00

SELF (AVAILABLE ONLINE @ 
WWW.SELF.COM) 700-15 2 ea. 12 MO $9.95 $19.90 - - - -

SEVENTEEN (CLAIMS WITHIN 60 DAYS OF 
1ST OF MONTH THAT ORDER IS PLACED) 700-15 10 ea. 12 MO $12.95 $129.50 - - - -

SEW NEWS: THE FASHION HOW-TO 
MAGAZINE 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $14.00 $14.00

SKATEBOARDER MAGAZINE 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 12 MO $13.00 $26.00

SKEPTICAL INQUIRER 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $15.00 $30.00

SMART COMPUTING (FORMERLY TITLED 
PC NOVICE) (ALSO AVAILABLE @ 
WWW.SMARTCOMPUTING.COM) (WILL 
NOT PRORATE) 700-15 9 ea. - - - - 12 MO $29.00 $261.00

SMART MONEY (CLAIMS WITHIN 60 DAYS 
OF 1ST MONTH THAT ORDER IS PLACED) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 12 MO $10.00 $20.00

SMITHSONIAN MAGAZINE (INCLUDES 
SMITHSONIAN NATIONAL ASSOCIATES 
MEMBERSHIP) ( COMES ALSO WITH 
SMITHSONIAN RESIDENT ASSOCIATE 
MEMBERSHIP) (SMITHSONIAN 
CONTRIBUTING MEMBERSHIP) (COOPER 
HEWITT NATIONAL DESIGN MUSEUM 
MEMBERSHIP) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 12 MO $15.00 $75.00

SOUND & VISION (FORMED BY THE 
MERGER OF STEREO REVIEW & VIDEO 
MAGAZINE) 700-15 2 ea. 10 MO $9.95 $19.90 - - - -

SOUTHERN LIVING (NOT AVAILABLE FOR 
LESS THAN 1 YEAR) (NO 2 OR 3 YEAR 
RATE) 700-15 11 ea. - - - - 12 MO $20.00 $220.00
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I TB # 0 5 -0 2  LIBR AR Y  PE R I OD I CALS

DATE OF BID OPENING
1 October 2004 - 2:00 PM

Contract Term

January 1, 2005 to December 31, 
2005

Option for 2 Renewal Periods
 

TITLE
Comm 
Code

Qty    
(# of 

Subs) UOM

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

FAX NUMBER 718.972.4695 508.845.9826
TEL NUMBER 800.728.3728 800.842.2077

QUOTED BY MICHAEL BRULL MARY COHEN

BROOKLYN, NY 11219 SHREWSBURY, MA 01545

1243 48TH STREET 56 MAPLE AVENUE
BIDDERS  NAME DELTA MAGAZINE GROUP, INC. EVA SUBSCRIPTIONS, INC.

 

SOUTHWEST ART 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $17.00 $17.00
SPORTS ILLUSTRATED (CLAIMS WITHIN 6 
MONTHS) (NO 3 YEAR RATE) (WILL 
PRORATE) 700-15 10 ea. 56 WKLY $38.95 $389.50 - - - -
SPORTS ILLUSTRATED FOR KIDS (TWO 
ISSUES ARE PERIODICALLY COMBINED 
AND THERE IS AN OCCASIONAL OR 
EXPANDED ISSUE) (AVAILABLE ONLINE @ 
WWW.SIKIDS.COM) (WILL PRORATE) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 13 MO $19.00 $95.00

SUCCESSFUL FARMING (ALSO AVAILABLE 
ONLINE) (WILL PRORATE) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $15.00 $15.00
SUNSET MAGAZINE (ALSO AVAILABLE 
ONLINE) (INDEX AVAILABLE BUT NOT 
INCLUDED) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 12 MO $14.00 $28.00

TASTE OF HOME (NO REPLACEMENT 
ISSUES) (WILL PRORATE) 700-15 5 ea. 6 BI-MO $16.00 $80.00 - - - -

TECHNOLOGY REVIEW-ENGLISH EDITION 
(PREVIOUSLY TITLED MITS TECHNOLOGY 
REVIEW) (DOUBLE ISSUES IN JAN/FEB 
AND JULY/AUG) (INCLUDES ONLINE) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 10 MO $19.00 $19.00
TEEN PEOPLE (COMBO ISSUES IN 
JUNE/JULY & DEC/JAN) 700-15 11 ea. - - - - 10 MO $7.00 $77.00

TEXAS EMPLOYMENT LAW LETTER 
(INCLUDES ANNUAL INDEX  AND FREE 
BINDER) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $277.00 $277.00

TEXAS FISH & GAME 700-15 9 ea. - - - - 12 MO $10.00 $90.00

TEXAS GARDENER 700-15 6 ea. 6 BI-MO $15.00 $90.00 - - - -

TEXAS HIGHWAYS (WILL PRORATE) 700-15 11 ea. - - - - 12 MO $16.00 $176.00

TEXAS MONTHLY 700-15 11 ea. - - - - 12 MO $10.00 $110.00

TEXAS OBSERVER (ALSO AVAILABLE 
ONLINE @ WWW.TEXASOBSERVER.ORG) 
(NO 9 MONTH RATE) (WILL NOT PRORATE) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 26 BI-WK $30.00 $90.00

TEXAS PARKS & WILDLIFE (JAN THROUGH 
DEC) (INDEX INCLUDED) 700-15 10 ea. - - - - 12 MO $12.00 $120.00

TEXAS SPORTSMAN (WILL NOT PRORATE) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 12 MO $14.00 $70.00
TEXAS STATE HISTORICAL ASSOCIATION 
MEMBERSHIP (MEMBERSHIP INCLUDES 4 
ISSUES OF RIDING LINE/4 ISSUES OF 
SOUTHWESTERN HISTORICAL 
QUARTERLY AND ANNUAL MEETING 
NOTES) 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 4 QTR $100.00 $300.00
THE FARMER STOCKMAN 
(INCORPORATES OKLAHOMA FARMER 
STOCKMAN AND TEXAS FARMER 
STOCKMAN) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $23.00 $23.00
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I TB #05 -02  LIBR AR Y  PE R IOD ICALS

DATE OF BID OPENING
1 October 2004 - 2:00 PM

Contract Term

January 1, 2005 to December 31, 
2005

Option for 2 Renewal Periods
 

TITLE
Comm 
Code

Qty    
(# of 

Subs) UOM

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

FAX NUMBER 718.972.4695 508.845.9826
TEL NUMBER 800.728.3728 800.842.2077

QUOTED BY MICHAEL BRULL MARY COHEN

BROOKLYN, NY 11219 SHREWSBURY, MA 01545

1243 48TH STREET 56 MAPLE AVENUE
BIDDERS  NAME DELTA MAGAZINE GROUP, INC. EVA SUBSCRIPTIONS, INC.

 
THIS OLD HOUSE (INCORPORATES 
TODAYS HOMEOWNER) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 10 MO $15.00 $75.00

THRASHER 700-15 3 ea. 12 MO $12.95 $38.85 - - - -

THREADS 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $28.00 $28.00

TIME MAGAZINE (AVAILABLE ONLINE @ 
WWW.TIME.COM) (NOT AVAILABLE IN 
SPANISH) (INCLUDES WEEKLY 
SUPPLEMENT) (WILL PRORATE) 700-15 11 ea. - - - - 56 WKLY $30.00 $330.00

TODAYS BLACK WOMAN (NO LESS THAN 1 
YEAR PER PUBLISHED…) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 9 MO $27.00 $54.00

TRAILER LIFE (ALSO AVAILABLE ONLINE) 700-15 1 ea. 12 MO $10.95 $10.95 - - - -
TUFF STUFF (SPORTS CARDS MAGAZINE 
& PRICE GUIDE MERGED WITH THIS 
TITLE) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $20.00 $20.00

TV Y NOVELLAS (WILL NOT PRORATE) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 26 BI-WK $22.00 $44.00

UNABASHED LIBRARIAN (WILL PRORATE) 
(PUBLISHED FEB MAY AUG AND NOV) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 4 QTR $65.00 $65.00

UNCANNY X MEN 700-15 7 ea. 12 MO $26.00 $182.00 - - - -

US NEWS & WORLD REPORT/AG CODE 
HGNT (ALSO AVAILABLE ONLINE AT NO 
CHARGE--NOT FULL TEXT AS PRINT 
VERSION) (FORMERLY TITLED US NEWS) 700-15 10 ea. - - - - 52 WKLY $20.00 $200.00

US WEEKLY 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 52 WKLY $35.00 $105.00

USA TODAY NEWSPAPER (MON - FRI 
EDITION) 700-15 7 ea.

65      
(per qtr.) DAILY $26.95 $754.60 - - - -

    COMMENT:   TOTAL IS PER YEAR

VANIDADES CONTINENTAL (SPANISH) 
(PREVIOUSLY TITLED VANIDADES) 700-15 5 ea. - - - - 26 BI-WK $40.00 $200.00

VANITY FAIR 700-15 4 ea. 12 MO $15.00 $60.00 - - - -

VEGETARIAN TIMES 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $15.00 $15.00

VOGUE (AVAILABLE ONLINE @ 
WWW.VOGUE.COM) 700-15 2 ea. 12 MO $14.95 $29.90 - - - -

VOICE OF YOUTH ADVOCATES (VOYA) 
(FEB APR JUN AUG OCT DEC) ($10.00 
CANCELLATION FEE) (NO 6 MONTHS 
RATE) (WILL NOT PRORATE) 
(WWW.VOYA.COM) (NO 3 YEAR RATE 
AVAILABLE) 700-15 2 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $50.00 $100.00

WALL STREET JOURNAL (CA/CT/SD/LA/TX) 
(260 ISSUES: MON - FRI ONLY) 
(APPLICABLE LOCAL TAX INLCLUDED IN 
PRICE--SEND COPY OF YOUR TAX 
EXEMPT LETTER TO AVOID) 700-15 7 ea. 260 DAILY $170.00 $1,190.00 - - - -

WASHINGTON TIMES NEWS WEEKLY 
EDITION (NOT AVAILABLE FOR 9 MONTHS) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 52 WKLY $30.00 $30.00
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ITB #05-02  LIBR AR Y  PE R IOD ICALS

DATE OF BID OPENING
1 October 2004 - 2:00 PM

Contract Term

January 1, 2005 to December 31, 
2005

Option for 2 Renewal Periods
 

TITLE
Comm 
Code

Qty    
(# of 

Subs) UOM

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

NO.OF 
ISSUES

/SUB

MO/QTR/
SEMI-

ANN/ANN
UNIT 

PRICE
EXT 

PRICE

FAX NUMBER 718.972.4695 508.845.9826
TEL NUMBER 800.728.3728 800.842.2077

QUOTED BY MICHAEL BRULL MARY COHEN

BROOKLYN, NY 11219 SHREWSBURY, MA 01545

1243 48TH STREET 56 MAPLE AVENUE
BIDDERS  NAME DELTA MAGAZINE GROUP, INC. EVA SUBSCRIPTIONS, INC.

 
WEB FEET PRINT CORE (SUBJECT 
GUIDE/BEST WEB SITES FOR MID 
SCH/ADULT) (BINDER AND INSERTS) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 3 MO $190.00 $190.00

WEIGHT WATCHERS MAGAZINE 700-15 3 ea. 6 BI-MO $10.95 $32.85 - - - -

WIRED (ALSO AVAILABLE ONLINE @ 
WW W.W IRED.COM) (MAXIMUM LINUX 
MAGAZINE MERGED WITH THIS TITLE) 700-15 4 ea. 12 MO $10.00 $40.00 - - - -

WIZARD:  THE GUIDE TO COMICS 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $28.00 $28.00

WOMANS DAY 700-15 1 ea. 17 MO $8.95 $8.95 - - - -

WORKBENCH MAGAZINE 700-15 4 ea. - - - - 6 BI-MO $15.00 $60.00

WORKING MOTHER (AVAILABLE ONLINE 
@ WWW .W ORKINGMOTHER.COM) 
(DEC/JAN AND JUN/JUL COMBINED) 
(W ILL NOT PRORATE) 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 10 MO $9.00 $9.00

WRITERS DIGEST 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 12 MO $14.00 $42.00

YM MAGAZINE (YOUNG & MODERN) 
(FORMERLY YOUNG MISS) 700-15 1 ea. 10 MO $9.95 $9.95 - - - -

YOU & THE LAW (QUICK AND EASY-TO-
USE ADVICE ON EMPLOYMENT LAW ) 700-15 1 ea. *NO BID *NO BID *NO BID *NO BID

YOUR BIG BACKYARD 700-15 3 ea. - - - - 12 MO $12.00 $36.00

ZOOBOOKS 700-15 1 ea. - - - - 12 MO $14.00 $14.00

*NO BID - No Bids Received.  Order direct from publisher.  
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