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ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION Qty UOM UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

1 Remove exist concrete pad (10+ +/- thick) 960 SF 5.00$                      4,800.00$               NO BID NO BID

2 Remove exist pipe culvert 84 LF $85.00 7,140.00$               NO BID NO BID

3 Cem. Treated Crushed Concrete base (12" thick) 87 SY $59.75 5,198.25$               NO BID NO BID

4 HMAC transition (surf course-var. depth) 347 SY $70.00 24,290.00$             NO BID NO BID

5 Precast bridge elements 4 EA $20,000.00 80,000.00$             NO BID NO BID

6 Precast concrete piles (10 at 35') 350 LF $61.00 21,350.00$             NO BID NO BID

7 Abutments 22 CY $1,135.00 24,970.00$             NO BID NO BID

8 Erection 1 LS $19,350.00 19,350.00$             NO BID NO BID

9 Shear Keys 1 LS $16,300.00 16,300.00$             NO BID NO BID

10 Railing 200 LF $78.00 15,600.00$             NO BID NO BID

11 Concrete Approach Slabs (10' x 32') 36 SY $270.00 9,720.00$               NO BID NO BID

12
Metal Beam Guard Fence, Salv & Relocate and Remove (Include 2 turn down 
sections) 100 LF $30.00 3,000.00$               NO BID NO BID

13 60" concrete culvert (rubber gasket joints) (backfill w. C.S.S. - 1.5 sack/cy) 84 LF $850.00 71,400.00$             NO BID NO BID

14 PZ-22 sheet pile (2 rows 30' x 36' deep) 2,880 SF $44.00 126,720.00$           NO BID NO BID

15 detour with signs and barricades and removal 1,000 SY $50.00 50,000.00$             NO BID NO BID

16 mobilization and general 1 LS $55,000.00 55,000.00$             NO BID NO BID

TOTAL OF ALL BID ITEMS

17 Deductive alternate HS-20 bridge design 1 LS

1 ALTERNATE BID-MUST BE EQUAL TO DESIGN SPECS

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS NONE NO BID

INSURANCE INCLUDED YES NO BID

YES NO BIDBID BOND INCLUDED

BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED YES NO BID

$534,838.75 NO BID

NO BID no bid

DECEMBER 16, 2009 AT 2:00 P.M.

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
ITB#10-23 QUINTANA BRIDGE AT CR 723

DATE OF BID OPENING

WEDNESDAY

TELEPHONE NUMBER

C&D CONSTRUCTORS, INC.

2810 ANICE

HOUSTON, TX 77039

TOM-MAC, INC

P.O. BOX 262541

HOUSTON, TX 77207

QUOTED BY

NO BID NO BID

FAX NUMBER

BIDDERS  NAME

THOMAS W. MCMILLIAN C.L. MELENDEZ

713-991-7317

713-991-7364

281-442-2468

DATE PRINTED 12/17/2009


