PRINTED 10/9/2009

ITB# 10-07 FOOD SERVICE

Bidders

PRODUCTS BID TABULATION Name |Gulf Coast Paper K & L Supply, Inc. GREAT SOUTHWEST PAPER CO, INC PHYSICIAN SALES AND SERVICE STAPLES CONTRACT & COMMERCIALTEC SYSTEMS DBA NUTEC MFR INTERBORO PACKAGING
DATE OF BID OPENING:
WEDNESDAY, OCT. 7, 2009, address |P.O. Box 1540 505 Bains, Suite 325 P.0. BOX 15618 15550 VICKERY DR, STE 200 6400 HOLLISTER RD 908 GARNET CT 114 BRACKEN RD
Clute, TX 77531 Brookshire, TX 77423-9317 HOUSTON, TX 77220-5618 HOUSTON, TX 77032 HOUSTON, TX 77040 NEW LENOX, IL 60451 MONTGOMERY, NY 12549-2600
contact |Glenn Williams Mike Brahm
phone |979-265-6149 800-288-2744 713-223-5050 281-210-9736 713-934-6400 815-722-2800 845-457-2700
fax 979-265-7266 281-934-3590
comm MFG VENDOR MFG uom VEnDOR | MFG UoMm VENDOR | MFG UOM | MFG | venpor | MFG UOM | MFG | VENDOR | MFG UOM | MFG | venpor | MFG UOM | MFG | venpor | MFG uom
ITEM | cope |counrvo| NAME DESCRIPTION PKG uom MFG NAME | PART# PKG | UOM | PRICE |MFGNAME| PART# | PKG | UOM | PRICE |[MFG NAME| PART# | PKG | UOM | PRICE | NAME | PART# | PKG | UOM | PRICE | NAME | PART# | PKG | UOM | PRICE | NAME | PART# | PKG | UOM | PRICE | NAME | PART# | PKG | UOM | PRICE
1.0 FOOD SERVICE
ALUMINUM FOIL, EXTRA HEAVY
1.1 | 01017 | 6337 |Reynolds|DUTY (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 18"X1000'RL|  RL REYNOLDS 625 |18x1000| RL | $61.57 |REYNOLDS| 625 |18X1000| EA | $67.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALUMINUM FOIL, EXTRA HEAVY
1.2 | 01017 | 6338 |Reynolds|DUTY (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 18"X500' RL RL REYNOLDS 632 18X500 | RL | $69.21 |REYNOLDS| 632 | 18X500 | EA | $69.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BAG, 7"X12" 4MIL POLY FLAT 7X121000
1.3 | 66524 | 6339 |Concord |(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 1000/CS cs NO BID NOBID | NOBID [NOBID| NOBID | CONCORD | 4ML M CS | $59.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BAG, SANDWICH WAX PAPER,
SQUARE-OPEN END, 3" x 1 3/4" x 6
1.4 | 64060 | 6340 |Specialty|1/2" (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 8/1000/CS cs SPECIALTY 1201 8/1M CS | $10.50 |SPECIALTY| 8X1000 | 8M CS | $98.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BAG, RESEALABLE STORAGE
GALLON SIZE (BRAND OR
1.5 | 66577 | 6341 |Reynolds|EQUIVALENT) 250/CS cs REYNOLDS | RS1011 250 CS | $21.18 |[REYNOLDS| RS1011 | 250/CS | CS | $25.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BAG, RESEALABLE STORAGE QT DRK9460
1.6 | 66577 | 6342 |Reynolds|1.75MIL (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 500/CS cs REYNOLDS | RS78 500 CS | $25.93 | zIPLOC 1 500/CS | CS | $30.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BAG, ICE 10#, 11" X 21" PLAIN POLY
1.7 | 64060 | 6343 | Huck |(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 1000/CS cs HUCK 10PPIB M CS | $42.97 |HUCKSTER| 1016 1000 | CS | $62.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BOWL, 12 OZ WHITE SATIN
PLACESETTER SATIN TABLEWARE
1.8 | 64060 | 6344 | Pactiv |(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 8/1251M/CS|  CS PACTIV | TH10012 | 1IM/CS | CS | $17.31 | PACTIV | TH0012 | 1000 | CS | $24.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CAN FUEL, JELLED 6 HOURS
1.9 | 88540 | 6345 | Sterno |(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) cs cs NO BID NOBID | NOBID [NOBID| NOBID | STERNO | 72XX 720 CS | $59.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DISPENSER, CUP ADJUSTABLE
STAINLESS STEEL, PULL TYPE FOR 4;
1.10 | 16533 | 6346 | Solo |155 CUPS (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) EA EA SOLO EAD15 EA EA | $4199 | soLo EAD15 1 EA | $25.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUPS, 8 0Z STYROFOAM
1.11 | 64060 | 6389 | DART [(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 1mICS cs DART 838 M CS | $17.40 | DART 818 M Cs | $17.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUPS, 10 OZ STYROFOAM
1.12 | 64060 | 6347 | DART [(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) imICs cs DART 10J10 M CS | $19.95 | DART 10J10 M CS | $22.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUPS, 12 OZ STYROFOAM
1.13 | 64060 | 6348 | DART [(BRAND OR EQUIVLANET) 1mICS cs DART 12312 M CS | $22.20 | DART 12312 M Cs | $23.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUPS, 14 OZ STYROFOAM
1.14 | 64060 | 6350 | DART [(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) mICcs cs DART 14316 M CS | $29.12 | DART 14714 M CS | $32.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUPS, 16 OZ STYROFOAM
1.15 | 64060 | 6387 | DART [(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 1mICS cs DART 16316 M CS | $32.08 | DART 16J16 M Cs | $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUPS, CONE WATER CUP
ROLLEDRIM, 4-1/40Z (BRAND OR 200/PK
1.16 | 64060 | 6351 | Solo |EQUIVALENT) 5MICS cs KONI 42RCON 5M CS | $48.97 | KONLI | 42RCON| 5M CS | $60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUPS, 4 OZ CONICAL WATER CUP,
1.17 | 64050 | 6388 BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 5M/CS cs KONI 4RCON 5M CS | $48.97 | KONLI | 4RCON | 5M CS | $60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUPS, 5 OZ. PLASTIC TRANSLUCENT
1.18 | 64060 | 6612 | DART [(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 2mICS cs DART 5N25 2500 CS | $3213 | DART 5N25 5500 | CS | $60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUPS, 7 0Z PLASTIC TRANSLUCENT |  200/PK
1.19 | 64060 | 6352 | DART [(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 2mics cs DART 7N25 2500 CS | $40.25 | DART 7N25 2500 | CS | $70.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUPS, BAKING PAPER (BRAND OR
1.20 | 64050 | 6353 | Dixie |EQUIVALENT) 20/500 cs NO BID NOBID | NOBID [NOBID| NOBID | DIXIE 15CX 10M CS | $69.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
KNIFE, FORK, SPOON, SALT &
PEPPER, NAPKIN (INDIVIDUALLY
1.21 | 64060 | 6354 PACKAGED) (BRAND OR 250/CS cs DISPOZO | PICPAK | 5/100 CS | $41.60 | DISPOZO | PICPAK | 5/100 | CS | $43.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVES, FOOD POLY SERVING LINE,
EMBOSSED, LARGE, CLEAR (BRAND
1.22 | 20142 | 6355 OR EQUIVALENT) 10 BX/100 cs TIDI 10473 | 10/100 | CS | $1550 | GALAXY | 61X370L | 10X100 | CS | $14.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HAIRNET, LT WT 15-DENIER SINGLE
STRAND NYLON BLACK, 1/4" LEFT
1.23 | 65243 | 6356 |Cellucap|APERTURE 28" X-LARGE (BRAND | 10 BX/144 cs CELLUCAP | HNS500 | 10/144 | CS |$13544| BLANK | HN500 | 10/144 | CS |$135.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LINER, PAN FULL SIZE, PARCHMENT
1.24 | 64080 | 6357 | Dispozo [PAPER (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 1mICS cs NO BID NOBID | NOBID [NOBID|NOBID | PRIME |BPL-R29 | 1000 | CS | $36.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PLATES, 3 COMPARTMENT 10.25",
STYROFOAM (BRAND OR
1.25 | 64060 | 6358 | DART |EQUIVALENT) 125/500 cs DART 10CPHQ | 500 CS | $29.50 | DART | 10CPHQ | 500 CS | $30.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PLATES, DINNER, 9", STYROFOAM
1.26 | 64060 | 6613 | DART [(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 4/125 cs DART 9PWC 500 CS | $16.10 | DART 9PWC 500 Ccs | $19.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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1.0 FOOD SERVICE
SPOONS, MED WT PLASTIC, WHITE
1.27 | 64060 | 6359 | Solo [(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 1mICS cs DISPOZO WMS M Ccs | $8.00 SOLO | MEDWH | 1000 | CS | $10.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TRAY, 1 COMP HINGED LID CARRY-
OUT CONTAINERS, 9-1/8"X9"X3-1/4" 41125
1.28 | 64060 | 6360 | Pactiv |[WHITE (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 200/CASE cs PACTIV TDI9901 | 200 CS | $14.62 | DART 2904 200 CS | $21.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TRAY, 3 COMP HINGED LID CARRY-
OUT CONTAINERS, 9-1/8'X9"X3-1/4" 41125
1.29 | 64060 | 6361 | Pactiv |[WHITE (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) | 200 /CASE cs PACTIV__ | TDI19903 | 200 CS | $14.62 | DART 2905 200 Cs | $21.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TRAY, 5 COMP SCHOOL LUNCH, 8-
1/4" X 10-1/4" WHITE (BRAND OR
1.30 | 64060 | 6362 | Pactiv |EQUIVALENT) 500/CS cs PACTIV_ | TH10500 | 500 CS | $23.19 | PACTIV | TH10500 | 500 CS | $29.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WRAP, PLASTIC 18" X 3000' (BRAND
1.31 | 64060 | 6363 |Reynolds|OR EQUIVALENT) RL RL REYNOLDS 915 RL RL | $24.47 |REYNOLDS| 915 18X3M | EA | $25.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADDITIONAL COMMENTS NONE NONE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
|BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED YES YES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS NONE NONE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
|ESCALATION AFTER 1 YEAR % LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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