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DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 A.M., C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER

 Price Extended Price Price Price Price Extended Price Price Extended Price

$2,274.28
$125,085.40

$5,200.00 $286,000.00 $2,300.00
$126,500.00

$2,467.31
$135,702.05

$11.50 $5,750.00 $30.00 $15,000.00 $15.00 $7,500.00 $6.50 $3,250.00

$3.50
$22,050.00

$12.00 $75,600.00 $8.00
$50,400.00

$5.50
$34,650.00

$3,450.00
$6,900.00

$2,700.00 $5,400.00 $1,500.00
$3,000.00

$2,500.00
$5,000.00

$2,875.00
$5,750.00

$2,500.00 $5,000.00 $800.00
$1,600.00

$1,000.00
$2,000.00

$27,600.00
$27,600.00

$30,000.00 $30,000.00 $28,490.00
$28,490.00

$5,500.00
$5,500.00

$193,135.40

$417,000.00

$217,490.00

*LBP
LOCAL BIDDER'S 
PREFERENCE

$186,102.00
3% LBP ($180,515.94)

INCLUDED

NONE

Included Revised Bid Offer Sheet INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

INCLUDED

NONE

INCLUDED

VERNOR MATERIAL & 
EQUIPMENT CO.

435 COMMERCE STREET

FREEPORT, TX 77541
MARK TAYLOR

979-233-3366

979-233-6167

INCLUDED

*PAGE 25 NOT INCLUDED 

INCLUDED

NONE

LINCO CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.

15490 VOSS ROAD

SUGAR LAND, TX 77498
STEVE BROWN

281-498-6882

281-498-6889

INCLUDED

INCLUDED CONTRACTORS QUALIFICATION 
STATEMENT

252-293-4488

NONE

BYRD BROTHERS EMERGENCY 
SERVICES LLC

5164 LAMM ROAD

WILSON, NC
BRUCE CRAINE

STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION - QTY 1 EA

TOTAL BID PRICE

252-293-4490

INCLUDED

HUNTSVILLE, TX 77340

1214 SAM HOUSTON AVE STE 3

BNT SERVICES LLC

Bonds Included INCLUDED

936-291-7604

936-291-7600

THERESA O'BRIEN

REMOVAL OF OSSF SYSTEM - QTY 2 EA

REMOVAL OF WATER WELLS - QTY 2 EA

NONE

INCLUDED

NONEAdditional Information

Addendum Included

Exceptions to Terms & Conditions

ITB#09-83 CLEARING AND GRUBBING FOR ROADWAY & 
DRAINAGE
 IMPROVEMENTS ALONG CR 58

1.0 CLEARING AND GRUBBING

1.1 SUPPLEMENTAL PRICE 

2.0 FENCING
(6300 linear feet)

PRICE PER ACRE - 55 acres

Fill Dirt - 500 cubic yards

Insurance Included INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
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THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 A.M., C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER

 

Included Revised Bid Offer Sheet

STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION - QTY 1 EA

TOTAL BID PRICE

Bonds Included

REMOVAL OF OSSF SYSTEM - QTY 2 EA

REMOVAL OF WATER WELLS - QTY 2 EA

Additional Information

Addendum Included

Exceptions to Terms & Conditions

ITB#09-83 CLEARING AND GRUBBING FOR ROADWAY & 
DRAINAGE
 IMPROVEMENTS ALONG CR 58

1.0 CLEARING AND GRUBBING

1.1 SUPPLEMENTAL PRICE 

2.0 FENCING
(6300 linear feet)

PRICE PER ACRE - 55 acres

Fill Dirt - 500 cubic yards

Insurance Included

Price Extended Price Price Extended Price Price Extended Price Price Extended Price

$3,500.00
$192,500.00

$3,641.24
$200,268.20

$3,400.00
$187,000.00

NO BID
NO BID

$8.00 $4,000.00 $20.57 $10,285.00 $10.00 $5,000.00 NO BID NO BID

$4.50
$28,350.00

$5.72
$36,036.00

$2.25
$14,175.00

NO BID NO BID

$1,500.00
$3,000.00

$1,485.35
$2,970.70

$1,500.00
$3,000.00

NO BID NO BID

$3,500.00
$7,000.00

$386.11
$772.22

$1,200.00
$2,400.00

NO BID NO BID

$4,000.00
$4,000.00

$18,546.89
$18,546.89

$7,000.00
$7,000.00

NO BID NO BID

$238,850.00 $268,879.01 $218,575.00 NO BID

HADDOCK CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 
INC.

3720 CR 48

FRIENDSWOOD, TX 77549
MARK HADDOCK

281-489-2828

281-489-2888

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

PAGE 25 NOT INCLUDED

NOT INCLUDED

NONE

TEXCOR CONSTRUCTION SERVICES 
INC.

2500 W MAIN STE G3

LEAGUE CITY, TX 77573
BRYAN CARLETON

281-557-8989

281-554-8965

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

DID NOT INCL ALL PAGES OF SPECIAL 
REQUIREMENTS 
DID NOT INCL STANDARD TERMS & 
CONDITIONS

EMCO CONTRACTING INC.

22557 ALDINE WESTFIELD RD #102

SPRING, TX 77383
MAC DELAROSA

281-907-0034

281-907-0343

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

NONE

INCLUDED

NONE

W.T. BYLER

15203 LILLJA ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77060
BILL BYLER

281-445-2070

281-445-4356

NO BID

NO BID

VENDOR DID NOT SUBMIT REVISED BID 
OFFER SHEET

BID NOT ACCEPTED

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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10:00 A.M., C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER

 

Included Revised Bid Offer Sheet

STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION - QTY 1 EA

TOTAL BID PRICE

Bonds Included

REMOVAL OF OSSF SYSTEM - QTY 2 EA

REMOVAL OF WATER WELLS - QTY 2 EA

Additional Information

Addendum Included

Exceptions to Terms & Conditions

ITB#09-83 CLEARING AND GRUBBING FOR ROADWAY & 
DRAINAGE
 IMPROVEMENTS ALONG CR 58

1.0 CLEARING AND GRUBBING

1.1 SUPPLEMENTAL PRICE 

2.0 FENCING
(6300 linear feet)

PRICE PER ACRE - 55 acres

Fill Dirt - 500 cubic yards

Insurance Included

Price Extended Price Price Extended Price Price Extended Price

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

TERRA DRAGLINE CO

PO BOX 225

DANBURY, TX 77534

979-922-1657

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

MIKE SORRELL TRUCKING & 
MATERIALS

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND
HWY 523

OYSTER CREEK, TX 77541

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

SSCI

17041 El Camino Real
Houston, TX 77058

281-486-1943

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID


