ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING

Page 1 of 12

DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.

M.T.I SERVICES LLC

2150 PANSY STREET

PASADENA, TX 77503

TERRA DRAGLINE CO.

1582 HWY 35

DANBURY, TX 77534

CHERRY MOVING COMPANY, INC. dba CHERRY DEMOLITION

6131 SELINSKY

HOUSTON, TX 77048

MIKE SORRELL TRUCKING & MATERIAL, INC.

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

OYSTER CREEK, TX

CONTACT

SCOTT ERNEST

ROBERT PETERSON

MIKE DOKELL

MIKE SORRELL

TELEPHONE NO.

713-947-1510

979-922-1657

713-209-8311

979-233-6655

FAX NUMBER

713-947-1529

979-922-1669

713-991-6236

979-233-7313

1.0 PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED

$27.50 $19.75 $12.00 $5.75
2.0 PRICE PER MILE
(OVER THE EST. 27 MILES) $025 1.25- 1ST MILE
BASED UPON A MINIMUM 12 CY HAUL $39.75 $0.22 .25 EVERY MILE THEREAFTER
3.0 EMERGENCY PUSH
3.1 PRICE PER HOUR
$463.00 $127.50
Heavy Equipment - Description uoM
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Bucket Truck Hour
Up to 50' Reach
P NO BID NO BID 65' REACH $205.00 - - - -
Bucket Truck Hour
50'- 75
NO BID NO BID - - - - - -
Self Loading Knuckle Boom Truck Hour
25-35 CY bod:
i NO BID NO BID - - - - - -
Self Loading Knuckle Boom Truck Hour
35-45 CY body NO BID NO BID - - - - - -
Haul Vehicles - Description uom
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
o
NO BID NO BID MACK $60.00 - - MACK $50.00
D e
NO BID NO BID KW $65.00 - $71.00 MACK $50.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
30-40 CY Hour
ROLL OFF $110.00 CHEVY $130.00 - $105.00 PETERBILT $91.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
41-50 CY Hour
NO BID NO BID - - - $130.00 PETERBILT $91.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor Hour
51-60 CY
NO BID NO BID - - - $130.00 - -
Trailer Dump w/Tractor Hour
6170 CY NO BID NO BID - - - - - -
Walking Floor Trailer w/Tractor
100 CY Hour
NO BID NO BID - - - - - -




ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING

Page 2 of 12

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.

RESPONDENTS NAME

M.T.I SERVICES LLC

2150 PANSY STREET

PASADENA, TX 77503

TERRA DRAGLINE CO.

1582 HWY 35

DANBURY, TX 77534

CHERRY MOVING COMPANY, INC. dba CHERRY DEMOLITION

6131 SELINSKY

HOUSTON, TX 77048

MIKE SORRELL TRUCKING & MATERIAL, INC.

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

OYSTER CREEK, TX

CONTACT

SCOTT ERNEST

ROBERT PETERSON

MIKE DOKELL

MIKE SORRELL

TELEPHONE NO.

713-947-1510

979-922-1657

713-209-8311

979-233-6655

FAX NUMBER 713-947-1529 979-922-1669 713-991-6236 979-233-7313
Personnel - Description Uom
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Hour SEE EXHIBIT A FOR LABOR
ALL EMPLOYEES LABOR/OPERATORS; RATES & ADTL EQUIPMENT
ALL TOOLS INCLUDED $34.00 LABOR - CLEAN UP $32.50 LABORER $29.00 RATES -
Hour
- - - - OPERATOR / TRUCK DRIVER $37.75 - -
Hour
- - - - SUPERVISOR $49.00 - -
Hour
Hour
Additional He?/vyh.E?ulpment or Haul UOM
enicles DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Hour 25 CY 2-ROLL OFF BOXES - TRUCK SKID STEER LDR 1 CYD TRACKHOE W/GRAPPLE
TRAILER COMBO $92.00 580M CASE BACKHOE $97.50 KOMATSU 1840 $55.00 KOMATSU PC400 $230.00
SKID STEER-GRAPPLE HOOK
Hour TAKEUCHI T1150 (INCL FUEL, DELIVERY KNUCKLY BOOM LDR TRACKHOE W/GRAPPLE
& PICKUP) $70.00 140 32K HYUNDAI TRACKHOE $132.00 SCHEBOGEN $250.00 KOMATSU PC300 $194.00
EXCAVATOR TRACKHOE W/GRAPPLE
- - 85 ASV 60" GRAPPLER AWS $97.50 PC300 $170.00 KOMATSU PC220 $228.00
EXCAVATOR FRONT END LOADER 2.5 CY BUCKET
- - F108 72" GRAPPLER KUBOTA TRACTOR $97.50 PC220 $157.00 KOMATUS $127.00
EXCAVATOR FRONT END LOADER 5CY BUCKET
- - RTV 900 2 MAN RTV $15.00 PC400 $190.00 CASE $210.00
SAWS / MISC TOOLS
28" SAWS - POLE SAW SKIDSTEER W/GRAPPLE
- - HAND CLEAN TOOLS $12.40 - - CATEPILLER $95.00
HAUL TRUCK - MACK TRACTOR DOZER D3
- - TRAILER $90.00 - - CATEPILLER $115.00
DOZER D5
- - PICKUP - 3/4 TON-4DOOR $25.00 - - CATEPILLER $197.00
210 HYUNDAI LONG REACH DOZER D6 W/RAKE
- - 50' BOOM $152.00 - - CATEPILLER $227.00




ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING

Page 3 of 12

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.
CONTACT

DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

M.T.I SERVICES LLC

2150 PANSY STREET

PASADENA, TX 77503

TERRA DRAGLINE CO.

1582 HWY 35

DANBURY, TX 77534

CHERRY MOVING COMPANY, INC. dba CHERRY DEMOLITION
6131 SELINSKY

HOUSTON, TX 77048

MIKE SORRELL TRUCKING & MATERIAL, INC.
2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

OYSTER CREEK, TX

SCOTT ERNEST

ROBERT PETERSON

MIKE DOKELL

MIKE SORRELL

TELEPHONE NO.

713-947-1510

979-922-1657

713-209-8311

979-233-6655

FAX NUMBER

713-947-1529

979-922-1669

713-991-6236

979-233-7313

ADDENDUMS INCLUDED

INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
INSURANCE INCLUDED
INCLUDED INCLUDED NO INCLUDED
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
NONE NONE NONE PRICE SHEET
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS
NONE NONE NONE NONE




ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING
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DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.

RESPONDENTS NAME

RHOTON CONSTRUCTION GROUP, INC.

11013FUQUA #334

HOUSTON, TX 77089

TRF ENTERPRISES, INC.

601 LEANDER DRIVE

LEANDER, TX 78641

US ENVIRONMENTAL RESPONSE MANAGEMENT CORP

515 N. VELASCO

ANGLETON, TX 77515

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

435 COMMERCE STREET

FREEPORT, TX 77531

CONTACT

TOM RHOTON

TIFFANY WILKES

BROOKS BRADFORD

ROSS GARCIA

TELEPHONE NO.

713-213-7716

512-260-3322

713-408-1781

979-233-3366

FAX NUMBER

281-929-5500

512-528-1942

409-945-6022

979-233-6167

1.0 PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED

$60.00 $11.00 $5.00 $5.40
2.0 PRICE PER MILE
OVER THE EST. 27 MILES]
( ) $7.00 $2.00 $3.00 $0.25
3.0 EMERGENCY PUSH
3.1 PRICE PER HOUR
$650.00 $400.00 - -
Heavy Equipment - Description uoM
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Bucket Truck Hour
Up to 50' Reach
P VARIOUS $50.00 - $165.00 VARIOUS $75.00 - -
Bucket Truck
50'- 75' Hour
VARIOUS $75.00 - $185.00 VARIOUS $125.00 - -
Self Loading Knuckle Boom Truck
25-35 CY body Hour STERLING
VARIOUS $30.00 LT-9000 $90.00 VARIOUS $145.00 - -
?;Izlgogslgg:nuckle Boom Truck Hour STERLING
ocy VARIOUS $50.00 LT-9000 $105.00 VARIOUS $165.00 - -
Haul Vehicles - Description uoM
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
e
VARIOUS $75.00 INTERNATIONAL FL100 $60.00 VARIOUS $65.00 MACK $55.00
o
VARIOUS $80.00 INTERNATIONAL FL100 $75.00 VARIOUS $75.00 MACK $80.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
30-40 CY Hour
VARIOUS $69.00 99 MACK RD 600 2000 EAST DUMP $85.00 VARIOUS $35.00 MACK $80.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
41-50 CY Hour 98 PETE 379
VARIOUS $70.00 2002 SUMMITT $90.00 VARIOUS $35.00 MACK $85.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
51-60 CY Hour 98 PETE 379
- - 2002 SUMMITT $100.00 VARIOUS $65.00 MACK $85.00
g""'?'g’g;’mp wiTractor Hour 2003 WESTERN STAR
- - 1995 DORSEY $120.00 VARIOUS $85.00 MACK $100.00
\{\(I)a(l)lkér;/g Floor Trailer w/Tractor Hour 2005 PETE 379
- - 2004 MACK TRAILER $150.00 VARIOUS $125.00 MACK $100.00




ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING

Page 5 of 12

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.

RESPONDENTS NAME

RHOTON CONSTRUCTION GROUP, INC.

11013FUQUA #334

HOUSTON, TX 77089

TRF ENTERPRISES, INC.

601 LEANDER DRIVE

LEANDER, TX 78641

US ENVIRONMENTAL RESPONSE MANAGEMENT CORP

515 N. VELASCO

ANGLETON, TX 77515

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

435 COMMERCE STREET

FREEPORT, TX 77531

CONTACT

TOM RHOTON

TIFFANY WILKES

BROOKS BRADFORD

ROSS GARCIA

TELEPHONE NO.

713-213-7716

512-260-3322

713-408-1781

979-233-3366

FAX NUMBER 281-929-5500 512-528-1942 409-945-6022 979-233-6167
Personnel - Description Uom
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Hour
SUPERVISOR $50.00 FLAG MAN $20.00 LABORER - CHAINSAW $50.00 LABOR - 10 $18.00
Hour LABORER - SM TOOLS, TRAFFIC
FOREMAN $35.00 SAW MAN $35.00 CONTROL, FLAG PERSON $45.00 SUPERVISOR -2 $27.00
Hour
OPERATOR $35.00 LABOR $20.00 FIELD SUPERVISOR $75.00 CHAINSAW LABOR -5 $25.00
Hour
LABORER $19.50 - - - - - -
Hour ALL PERSONNEL OVERTIME
RATE TIME + 1/2 - - - - - -
Additional Hei\a/vyh.E?ulpment or Haul UOM
enicles DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
WHEEL LOADER
Hour L-120 EXCAVATOR W/GRAPPLE - 240
SEE BID RESPONSE - VOLVO L-120 $145.00 GENERATOR & LIGHTING $15.00 KOMASTU-1 $110.00
WHEEL LOADER
Hour L-120 EXCAVATOR W/GRAPPLE - 210
SEE BID RESPONSE - VOLVO L-120 $145.00 GRADER W/12" BLADE $100.00 KOMASTU-3 $100.00
SKID STEER T-300 EXCAVATOR W/GRAPPLE - 130
SEE BID RESPONSE - BOBCAT T-300 $75.00 HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR 1.5 CY $130.00 KOMASTU-1 $80.00
SKID STEER T-300
SEE BID RESPONSE - BOBCAT T-300 $75.00 LOWBOY TRAILER W/TRACTOR $90.00 SKID STEER W/GRAPPLE-1040 CASE -2 $50.00
KNUCKLE BOOM
DOUBLE 110W SKID STEER ON TRACKS-1040
SEE BID RESPONSE - STERLING LT-9000 $185.00 SKID STEER $95.00 CASE -2 $50.00
KNUCKLE BOOM
110CU/YDS RUBBER TIRE FRONT END LOADER 4
SEE BID RESPONSE - STERLING LT-9000 $185.00 CY BUCKET $105.00 LOADER -921 - CASE -1 $110.00
KNUCKLE BOOM
110CU/YDS
SEE BID RESPONSE - STERLING LT-9000 $185.00 DOZER $105.00 LOADER - 621 - CASE -1 $70.00
KNUCKLE BOOM
110CU/YDS
SEE BID RESPONSE - STERLING LT-9000 $185.00 - - BACKHOE - 580 - CASE -2 $75.00
KNUCKLE BOOM
110CU/YDS
SEE BID RESPONSE - STERLING LT-9000 $185.00 - - SHEAR - 240 - KOMATSU -1 $175.00




ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING

Page 6 of 12

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.
CONTACT

DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

RHOTON CONSTRUCTION GROUP, INC.

11013FUQUA #334

HOUSTON, TX 77089

TRF ENTERPRISES, INC.

601 LEANDER DRIVE

LEANDER, TX 78641

US ENVIRONMENTAL RESPONSE MANAGEMENT CORP
515 N. VELASCO

ANGLETON, TX 77515

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
435 COMMERCE STREET

FREEPORT, TX 77531

TOM RHOTON

TIFFANY WILKES

BROOKS BRADFORD

ROSS GARCIA

TELEPHONE NO.

713-213-7716

512-260-3322

713-408-1781

979-233-3366

FAX NUMBER

281-929-5500

512-528-1942

409-945-6022

979-233-6167

RUBBER TIRE EXCAVATOR - 1085B -

CASE - 1 $100.00
ADDENDUMS INCLUDED
INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
INSURANCE INCLUDED
NO INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION ALL EQUIPMENT INCL. FUEL;MAINTENANCE;OPERATOR
NONE EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION SHEET NONE INSURANCE
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS
NONE NONE NONE NONE




ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING

Page 7 of 12

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.

RESPONDENTS NAME

OMNI PINNACLE, LLC

90 GLEN COURT

PEARL RIVER, LA 70452

DISASTER RECOVERY GROUP AND TREE SERVICE INC.

556 LONG SHOALS RD

ARDEN, NC 28704

STORM RECONSTRUCTION SERVICES, INC.

1444 WEST I-65 SERVICE ROAD SOUTH

MOBILE, AL 36693

CERES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES, INC.

9945 WINDFERN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77064

CONTACT

BRAIN REINE

AIXA VAZGUEZ-MCELRATH

CAROL A PATTON

GAIL HANSCOM

TELEPHONE NO.

985-863-2991

828-684-3961

251-445-5500

800-218-4424

FAX NUMBER

985-863-2845

828-681-2946

251-445-5511

866-228-5636

1.0 PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED

$8.00 $7.35 $6.93 $9.98
2.0 PRICE PER MILE
OVER THE EST. 27 MILES]
( ) $0.15 $0.10 $0.08 $0.09
3.0 EMERGENCY PUSH
3.1 PRICE PER HOUR
$1,500.00 $110.00 $210.00 $349.95
Heavy Equipment - Description uoM
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Bucket Truck
Up to 50" Reach Hour
- $140.00 - $74.00 2006 INTERNATIONAL $135.00 - $155.00
Bucket Truck
50'- 75' Hour
- $170.00 - $85.00 2006 INTERNATIONAL $135.00 - $175.00
Self Loading Knuckle Boom Truck Hour
25-35 CY bod:
i - $145.00 - $110.00 2005 INTL PACMAC $125.00 - $150.00
Self Loading Knuckle Boom Truck
35-45 CY body Hour
- $160.00 - $120.00 2005 INTL PACMAC $125.00 - $165.00
Haul Vehicles - Description uoM
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
e
- $60.99 - $50.00 2005 FORD $55.00 - $70.00
o
- $69.46 - $65.00 2005 FORD $55.00 - $90.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
30-40 CY Hour
- $82.43 - $78.00 2005 FORD $60.00 - $105.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
41-50 CY Hour
- $96.50 - $82.00 2006 FORD $65.00 - $125.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
51-60 CY Hour
- $103.22 - $87.00 2005 INTERNATIONAL $75.00 - $160.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
61-70 CY Hour
- $114.62 - $87.00 2005 INTERNATIONAL $105.00 - $185.00
Walking Floor Trailer w/Tractor
100 CY Hour
$135.00 - $87.00 2005 INTERNATIONAL $110.00 - $175.00




ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING
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DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.

RESPONDENTS NAME

OMNI PINNACLE, LLC

90 GLEN COURT

PEARL RIVER, LA 70452

DISASTER RECOVERY GROUP AND TREE SERVICE INC.

556 LONG SHOALS RD

ARDEN, NC 28704

STORM RECONSTRUCTION SERVICES, INC.

1444 WEST 1-65 SERVICE ROAD SOUTH

MOBILE, AL 36693

CERES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES, INC.

9945 WINDFERN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77064

CONTACT

BRAIN REINE

AIXA VAZGUEZ-MCELRATH

CAROL A PATTON

GAIL HANSCOM

TELEPHONE NO.

985-863-2991

828-684-3961

251-445-5500

800-218-4424

FAX NUMBER 985-863-2845 828-681-2946 251-445-5511 866-228-5636
Personnel - Description Uom
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Hour
- - SUPERINTENDENT W/TRUCK $50.00 SUPER W/TRUCK $75.00 EQUIPMENT OPERATOR $47.00
Hour
- - FOREMAN W/TRUCK $35.00 ADMIN - ONSITE $28.00 CHAINSAW AND OPERATOR $35.00
Hour
- - OPERATOR W/CHAINSAW $25.00 FLAGGERS $18.00 CLIMBER WITH GEAR $110.00
Hour
- - TRAFFIC CONTROL $20.00 - - - -
Hour
- - LABORER $18.00 - - - -
Additional Hei\a/vyh.E?ulpment or Haul UOM
enicles DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Hour TRACKHOE LOWBOY - 50 TON WHEEL LOADER - JD544 OR
- - CX130 - CASE $120.00 2006 FORD $125.00 EQUIVALENT $160.00
DOZER
Hour D-41 P6 TRACKHOE - 200LC DOZER - D6 OR
- - KOMATSU $110.00 2001 JOHN DEERE $120.00 EQUIVALENT $155.00
SKIDSTEER WHEEL LOADER
T-300 924-930
- - BOBCAT $55.00 2005 CAT $115.00 - -
EXCAVATOR WHEEL LOADER
CAT 311 528 VERSA HANDLER
- - CAT $120.00 2005 BOBCAT $65.00 - -
TELEHANDLER DOZER - 450 LGP
- - 530 - JCB $65.00 2004 JOHN DEERE $115.00 - -
DOZER - 850
- - - - 2004 CASE $125.00 - -
TRACKHOE 300LC
- - - - 2005 LINKBELT $165.00 - -




ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING

Page 9 of 12

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.
CONTACT

DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

OMNI PINNACLE, LLC

90 GLEN COURT

PEARL RIVER, LA 70452

DISASTER RECOVERY GROUP AND TREE SERVICE INC.
556 LONG SHOALS RD

ARDEN, NC 28704

STORM RECONSTRUCTION SERVICES, INC.

1444 WEST 1-65 SERVICE ROAD SOUTH

MOBILE, AL 36693

CERES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES, INC.
9945 WINDFERN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77064

BRAIN REINE

AIXA VAZGUEZ-MCELRATH

CAROL A PATTON

GAIL HANSCOM

TELEPHONE NO.

985-863-2991

828-684-3961

251-445-5500

800-218-4424

FAX NUMBER

985-863-2845

828-681-2946

251-445-5511

866-228-5636

ADDENDUMS INCLUDED

INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
INSURANCE INCLUDED
INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
BROCHURE EXPERIENCE & PRICE SHEET NONE SEE BID RESPONSE
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS
NONE NONE NONE NONE




ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING

DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.

CROWDER GULF

5435 BUSINESS PARKWAY

THEODORE, AL 36582

ASHBRITT, INC.

480 S ANDREWS AVE STE 103

POMPANO BEACH, FL 33069

CROWDER DISASTER RECOVERY

901 GEDDIE ROAD

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32304

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

800-992-6207

954-545-3535

850-504-1898

FAX NUMBER

1.0 PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED

NO BID NO BID NO BID
2.0 PRICE PER MILE
(OVER THE EST. 27 MILES)
NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.0 EMERGENCY PUSH
3.1 PRICE PER HOUR
NO BID NO BID NO BID
Heavy Equipment - Description uoM
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Bucket Truck Hour
Up to 50' Reach
P NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bucket Truck
50'- 75' Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Self Loading Knuckle Boom Truck Hour
25-35 CY bod:
i NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Self Loading Knuckle Boom Truck
35-45 CY body Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Haul Vehicles - Description uoM
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
e
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
o
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
30-40 CY Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
41-50 CY Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
51-60 CY Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
61-70 CY Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walking Floor Trailer w/Tractor
100 CY Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Page 10 of 12



ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING

DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.

CROWDER GULF

5435 BUSINESS PARKWAY

THEODORE, AL 36582

ASHBRITT, INC.

480 S ANDREWS AVE STE 103

POMPANO BEACH, FL 33069

CROWDER DISASTER RECOVERY

901 GEDDIE ROAD

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32304

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

800-992-6207

954-545-3535

850-504-1898

FAX NUMBER
Personnel - Description Uom
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Additional Hei\a/vyh.E?ulpment or Haul UOM
enicles DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hour
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Page 11 of 12



ITB#09-75 DISASTER AND OR STORM
DEBRIS REMOVAL AND HAULING

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 17, 2009

10:00 AM., C.S.T.

DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

CROWDER GULF

5435 BUSINESS PARKWAY

THEODORE, AL 36582

ASHBRITT, INC.

480 S ANDREWS AVE STE 103

POMPANO BEACH, FL 33069

CROWDER DISASTER RECOVERY

901 GEDDIE ROAD

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32304

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

800-992-6207

954-545-3535

850-504-1898

FAX NUMBER

ADDENDUMS INCLUDED

NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSURANCE INCLUDED
NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS
NO BID NO BID NO BID
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