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1 DR200 BROTHER DRUM, FAX,  REPLACEMENT, BLACK;MFC4350 DRUM FAX BLACK

FOR USE IN INTELIIFAX PPF-
2750,3550,3650,3750.MFC4350,4450,

4550,4550PLUS,4650,6550MC,6650MC,7550MC,7650MC,7750
FACSIMILIES,BROTHER HL-760+,760,730DX +,730DX,730 

+,730,720 PRINTERS EA BRTDR200 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $140.30 496026 EA 2000 $143.05 S5DR200 EA 1 $125.35

2 DR400 BROTHER FAX DRUM, PPF4750 & Intellifax 4750e, 5750; MFC8300, 8500, 8600, 8700 DRUM FAX BLACK

FOR USE IN BROTHER HL1470N,1450,1440.1270N,1250,1240
LASER PRINTERS;INTELIIFAX 

PPF4100;4750,4750E,5750,5750E FAX 
MACHINES;MFC8300,8500,8600,8700,9600,9700,9800,DCP12

00;1400 AND MFCP2500 MULTIFUNTION MACHINES EA BRTDR400 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $119.95 997578 EA
20,000 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $122.29 S5DR400 EA 1 $112.53

3 DR510/DR510P BROTHER REPLACEMENT DRUM FOR HL5140/5150D/5150DLT/5170DN/MFC8220 DRUM FAX BLACK

FOR USE IN BROTHER HL1650/1670M, 
5140/5150D/5150DLT/5170DN,  MFC8220/8420/8020/8820 

SERIES EA BRTDR510 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $119.95 507528 EA
20,000 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $122.29 S1DR510 EA 1 $112.53

4 PC101 BROTHER PRINT CARTRIDGE, FAX, PPF1150/1250/1350M/1450M RIBBON FAX BLACK

FOR USE IN  INTELLIFAX PPF-
1150;1250;1350M;1450MC;1550MC;MFC1750;1850MC;1950M

C;1950+ FAX MACHINES EA BRTPC101 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $32.35 239368 EA 750 $35.01 S5PC101 EA 750 $30.68

5 PC201 BROTHER PRINT CARTRIDGE, FAX, PPF1270, 1170, 1570, MFC1770 TONER FAX BLACK
FOR USE IN  INTELLIFAX PPF-1170;1270;1570MC;MFC-

1780;1870MC;1970MC EA BRTPC201 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $22.56 207779 EA
450 AT 5% 

COVERAGE $23.35 S5PC201 EA 450 $20.46

6 PC301 BROTHER PRINT CARTRIDGE, FAX, PPF 750, 770, 870, MFC970 RIBBON FAX BLACK
THERMAL RIBBONS FOR BROTHER PLAIN PAPER FAX 

970MC,PPF 750;770;870MC EA BRTPC301 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $16.23 330547 EA
250 AT 5% 

COVERAGE $17.56 S5PC301 EA 250 $15.39

7 TN250 BROTHER
TONER CARTRIDGE, PRINTER, DCP1000, Intellifax2800 / 2900 / 3800, 

MFC4800 / 6800 TONER FAX BLACK
REPLACEMENT TONER CARTRIDGE FOR BROTHER 

MULTIFUNCTION FAX MACHINE EA BRTTN250 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $24.45 782211 EA
2200 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $22.27 S5TN250 EA 2200 $23.19

8 TN430 BROTHER TONER CARTRIDGE, PRINTER, HL1240, 1250, 1270N, Intellifax 4750e TONER FAX BLACK
REPLACEMENT TONER CARTRIDGE FOR BROTHER 

MULTIFUNCTION FAX MACHINE EA BRTTN430 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $43.75 997541 EA
3000 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $45.09 S5TN430 EA 3000 $41.49

9 TN460 BROTHER TONER CARTRIDGE, HL1055/MFC8600/ Intellifax 4750e/MFC8300,8500 TONER FAX BLACK

FOR USE IN INTELLIFAX PPF-4750;5750;MFC-
8300;8500;8600;8700;9600;9700;9800;DCP1200 

FACSIMILIES;BROTHER HL-1240;1250;1270N;MFC-
P2500;DCP-1200 EA BRTTN460 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $61.72 997550 EA

6000 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $56.23 S5TN460 EA 6000 $58.54

10 TN570 BROTHER
USE WITH DCP-8040, 8040D, 8040DN, 8045D, MFC8220, 8440 ,8440D, 

8440DN, HL-5150, HL-5150DLT, HL-5170DN TONER FAX BLACK EA BRTTN570 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $66.29 507512 EA
6700 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $70.96 S1TN570 EA 6700 $62.19

11 TN5000PF BROTHER FAX TONER CARTRIDGE, BRTPPF3750, 2750 TONER FAX BLACK

FOR USE IN INTELLIFAX PPF-2750;3550;3650;3750;MFC-
4350;4450;4550;4550+;4650;6550MC;6650MC;7550MC;7650M

C;7750 EA BRTTN5000PF EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $24.45 496307 EA 2200 $26.46 S5TN5000PF EA 2200 $23.19

12 1030 BROTHER

BROTHER AX10, 12, 12M, 15, 15M, 20, 22, 24, 25, 26, 28, 110, 250, 300, 
325, 350, 400, 425, 450, 475, 500, 525, 550, 600, 625, COM300, 300M, 310, 
CORRECTRONIC 140, 145, 300, 300M, 310, 320, 340, 350, 355, 360, 380, 

EM30, EM31, EM31II, GX6000, 6500, 6750, 6 RIBBON TYPEWRITER BLACK EA BRT1030 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $3.53 951103 EA NO RESPONSE $4.12 S21030 EA 1 $2.53

13 1230 BROTHER
BROTHER CORRECTRONIC 320, 340, 360, 380, ALL AX MODELS, WP44, 

EM 30/31, 300/300M, 310/350 RIBBON TYPEWRITER CORRECTION EA BRT1230 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $3.72 399253 PK2 NO RESPONSE $3.57 S21230 PK 2 $2.87

14 3010 BROTHER

BROTHER AX10, 12, 12M, 15, 15M, 20, 22, 24, 25, 26, 28, 110, 250, 300, 
325, 350, 400, 425, 450, 475, 500, 525, 550, 600, 625, COM300, 300M, 310, 
CORRECTRONIC NIC140, 145, 300, 300M, 310, 320, 340, 350, 355, 360, 

380, EM30, EM31, EM31II, GX6000, 6500, 6750 RIBBON TYPEWRITER CORRECTION EA BRT3010 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $1.91 399287 PK2 NO RESPONSE $1.92 S23010 EA 2 $2.28

15  F470731TPK CANON PRINT CARTRIDGE REFILL; BCI21;BLACK;TWIN PACK INK PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN CANON 5100;5000;4550;4400;4300 
SERIES;4200;4100;4000;2100;2000 SERIES;400;MULTIPASS, 

C5500;C5000;C3500;C3000;C2500 PRINTERS EA CANF470731TPK EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $14.23 206231 PK2 200 $4.38 S10954A370 PK 140 $13.00

16 1492A002AA CANON TONER;CANON;E20;ALL IN ONE, BLACK TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN CANON PC-300;400;500 SERIES (E20) EA CAN1492A002 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $82.17 417455 EA 2000 $88.94 S51492A002 EA 2000 $79.10

17
1557A002B     
(H116381) CANON TONER,CARTRIDGE,FACSIMILE;FX3,LC4000 TONER FAX BLACK FOR USE IN CANON LC4000 FX 3 FAX EA CAN1557A002 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $59.96 186585 EA 2700 $56.86 SS1557A002BA EA 2700 $57.76

18 BCI-15 CANON TONER, CARTRIDGE, PIXMA iP90, PHOTO PRINTER, BLACK TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN CANON IMAGECLASS D320 EA CAN8191A003 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $20.53 582589 PK2 350 $5.77 S1890A003 PK 260 $6.14

19 BCI-16 CANON TONER, CARTRIDGE, PIXMA iP90, PHOTO PRINTER, COLOR TONER PRINTER COLOR FOR USE IN CANON IMAGECLASS D320 EA CAN9818A003 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $23.61 851008 EA 250 $22.20 S19818A003 PK 150 $10.24

20
FX-3 /

1557A002 CANON
TONER CARTRIDGE;L200,MULTI PASS L6000;LASERCLASS 

300, 4000 TONER FAX BLACK EA CAN1557A002 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $59.96 186585 EA 2700 $56.86 S51557A002BA EA 2700 $57.76
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21
FX-4 /

1558A002 CANON
TONER CARTRIDGE FOR CANON LASERCLASS 8500, 9000, 

9500, 9800 TONER FAX BLACK EA CAN1558A002 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $66.47 287648 EA 4000 $74.39 S51558A002AA EA 4000 $64.87

22
FX-6 /

1559A002 CANON TONER CARTRIDGE FOR LC3175, LC3170 TONER FAX BLACK EA CAN1559A002 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $88.08 458830 EA 5000 $94.61 S51559002AA EA 5000 $82.49

23
FX-7 / 

7621A001AA CANON TONER, CARTRIDGE, LC710/720/730, BLACK TONER FAX BLACK FOR USE IN CANON IMAGECLASS D320 EA CAN7621A001 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $74.27 908785 EA 4500 $89.82 S57621A001AA EA 4500 $64.84

24 7833A001 CANON TONER, CARTRIDGE, MODEL S35, BLACK TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN CANON IMAGECLASS D320 EA CAN7833A001AA EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $126.69 858673 EA 3500 $114.12 S57833A001AA EA 3500 $102.06

25
310-5401 /      

X5011 DELL TONER CARTRIDGE, LASER PRINTER 1700 / 1700N, 3000 PGS TONER PRINTER BLACK
  FOR USE IN HP

LASER JET II,IID,III,IIID PRINTERS EA DEL3107023 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $95.64 705975 EA 3000 94.99 S13107023 EA 6000 $52.73

26
310-5368 / 

M4640(R5956) DELL 922 ALL IN ONE (PHOTO) PRINTER INK PRINTER BLACK EA DEL3107161 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $22.86 904034 EA NO RESPONSE 25.29 S10M99928 EA 638 $11.40

27
310-5399 /      

U5698 DELL
TONER CARTRIDGE, LASER PRINTER 1700 / 1700N, 3000 PGS, USE & 

RETURN TONER PRINTER BLACK
  FOR USE IN HP

LASER JET II,IID,III,IIID PRINTERS EA DEL3105399 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $66.95 705945 EA 3000 66.49 S13107023 EA 6000 $52.73

28
310-5402 /      

Y5009 DELL TONER CARTRIDGE, LASER PRINTER 1700 / 1700N, 6000 PGS TONER PRINTER BLACK
  FOR USE IN HP

LASER JET II,IID,III,IIID PRINTERS EA DEL3107025 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $124.34 705980 EA 6000 123.49 S13107023 EA 6000 $105.46

29
310-5400 /      

Y5007 DELL
TONER CARTRIDGE, LASER PRINTER 1700 / 1700N, 6000 PGS, USE & 

RETURN TONER PRINTER BLACK
  FOR USE IN HP

LASER JET II,IID,III,IIID PRINTERS EA DEL3105400 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $90.86 705965 EA 6000 85.49 S53105400 EA 6000 $88.09

30
310-5404 /

D4283 DELL PRINT DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR DELL LASER PRINTER 1700/1700n INK PRINTER BLACK EA DEL3105404 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $49.67 NO BID EA NO RESPONSE NO BID S13105404 EA 1 $51.49

31 T034220 EPSON INK CARTRIDGE;STYLUS PHOTO 2200 INK PRINTER CYAN EA EPST034220 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.68 589690 EA 440 $9.18 S1T04220 EA 440 $9.38

32 T034320 EPSON INK CARTRIDGE;STYLUS PHOTO 2200 INK PRINTER MAGENTA EA EPST034320 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.68 589717 EA 440 $9.18 S1T034320 EA 440 $9.38

33 T034420 EPSON INK CARTRIDGE;STYLUS PHOTO 2200 INK PRINTER YELLOW EA EPST034420 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.68 589843 EA 440 $9.18 S1T034420 EA 440 $9.38

34 T034520 EPSON INK CARTRIDGE;STYLUS PHOTO 2200 INK PRINTER LT. CYAN EA EPST034520 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.68 590527 EA 440 $9.18 S1T0344520 EA 440 $9.38

35 T034620 EPSON INK CARTRIDGE;STYLUS PHOTO 2200 INK PRINTER LT. MAGENTA EA EPST034620 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.68 590914 EA 440 $9.18 S1T034620 EA 440 $9.38

36 T034720 EPSON INK CARTRIDGE;STYLUS PHOTO 2200 INK PRINTER LT. BLACK EA EPST034720 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.68 593668 EA 440 $9.18 S1T034720 EA 440 $9.38

37 T034820 EPSON INK CARTRIDGE;STYLUS PHOTO 2200 INK PRINTER
MATTE
BLACK EA EPST034820 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $10.68 593695 EA 440 $9.18 S1T034820 EA 440 $9.30

38 EPS7753 EPSON PRINTER RIBBON, NYLON, EPSON ACTION PRINTER, BLACK RIBBON DOT MATRIX BLACK

FOR USE IN EPSON ACTION PRINTER 
3000;4000;5000;5000+;LQ500;510;570;570+;800;850;870 DOX 

MATRIX EA EPS7753 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $3.70 591644 EA NO RESPONSE $3.71 S27753 EA 1 $2.63

39

S193110   
(S020193 / 
S020110) EPSON COLOR INK CARTRIDGE, STYLUS 700/750/EX INK PRINTER COLOR FOR USE IN STYLUS 700/750/EX SERIES EA EPSS193110 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $17.17 238130 EA 220 $18.89 S1S193110 EA 220 $14.32

40

S187093    
(S020093 / 
S020187) EPSON BLACK INK CARTRIDGE, STYLUS 700/750/EX INK PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN STYLUS 700/750/EX SERIES EA EPSS187093 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $18.15 864264 EA NO RESPONSE $18.82 S1S187093 EA 370 $17.22

41 T009201 EPSON INKJET PRINTER CARTRIDGE, EPSON 1270/1280, COLOR INK PRINTER COLOR FOR USE IN STYLUS PHOTO 1270/1280 SERIES EA EPST009201 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $22.20 444801 EA 220 $15.24 S1T009201 EA 330 $20.82

42 T007201 EPSON INKJET PRINTER CARTRIDGE, EPSON 1270/1280, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN STYLUS PHOTO 1270/1280 SERIES EA EPST007201 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $18.15 444751 EA 378 $18.82 S1T007201 EA 370 $17.22

43 T019201 EPSON
INKJET PRINTER CARTIDGE, EPSON STYLUS COLOR 8 / 880 / 880i, 

BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN STYLUS PHOTO 820 EA EPST019201 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $21.96 569531 EA 630 $22.94 S1T019201 EA 190 20..82

44 T026201 EPSON INKJET PRINTER CARTIDGE, EPSON SP820, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN STYLUS PHOTO 820 EA EPST026201 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $23.77 419428 PK2 378 $19.15 S1T026201 EA 500 $18.76

45 T027201 EPSON INKJET PRINTER CARTRIDGE, EPSON SP820, COLOR INK PRINTER TRICOLOR 5 COLOR FOR USE IN STYLUS PHOTO 820  EA EPST027201 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $20.50 251229 EA 220 $21.59 S1T027201 EA 220 $16.19

46 T048120 EPSON
INKJET PRINTER CARTRIDGE, STYLUS PHOTO RX500 / RX600 / RX620 / 

R200, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK 5 COLOR FOR USE IN STYLUS PHOTO 820  EA EPST048120 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $13.80 907993 EA 450 $14.12 S1TO48120 EA 630 $13.09

47 T048220 EPSON
INKJET PRINTER CARTRIDGE, STYLUS PHOTO RX500 / RX600 / RX620 / 

R200, CYAN INK PRINTER CYAN 5 COLOR FOR USE IN STYLUS PHOTO 820  EA EPST048220 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.11 908452 EA 450 $10.00 S1TO48220 EA 430 $9.48

48 T048320 EPSON
INKJET PRINTER CARTRIDGE, STYLUS PHOTO RX500 / RX600 / RX620 / 

R200, MAGENTA INK PRINTER MAGENTA 5 COLOR FOR USE IN STYLUS PHOTO 820  EA EPST048320 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.11 909046 EA 450 $10.00 S1TO48320 EA 430 $9.48

49 T048420 EPSON
INKJET PRINTER CARTRIDGE, STYLUS PHOTO RX500 / RX600 / RX620 / 

R200, YELLOW INK PRINTER YELLOW 5 COLOR FOR USE IN STYLUS PHOTO 820  EA EPST048420 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.11 909208 EA 450 $10.00 S1T048420 EA 430 $9.48
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50 T048520 EPSON
INKJET PRINTER CARTRIDGE, STYLUS PHOTO RX500 / RX600 / RX620 / 

R200, LIGHT CYAN INK PRINTER LIGHT CYAN 5 COLOR FOR USE IN STYLUS PHOTO 820  EA EPST048520 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.11 910252 EA 450 $10.00 SITO48520 EA 430 $9.48

51 T048620 EPSON
INKJET PRINTER CARTRIDGE, STYLUS PHOTO RX500 / RX600 / RX620 / 

R200, LIGHT MAGENTA INK PRINTER
LIGHT 

MAGENTA 5 COLOR FOR USE IN STYLUS PHOTO 820  EA EPST048620 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.11 910963 EA 450 $10.00 48620 EA 430 $9.48

52 T060120 EPSON INK CARTRIDGE;STYLUS CX3800;3810;4200;4800;WITH DURABRITE INK INK PRINTER BLACK EA EPST060120 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $14.89 721024 EA NO RESPONSE $15.29 60120S EA 380 $14.12

53 T060220 EPSON INK CARTRIDGE;STYLUS CX3800;3810;4200;4800;WITH DURABRITE INK INK PRINTER CYAN EA EPST060220 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.11 721088 EA NO RESPONSE $10.00 60220S EA 400 $9.48

54 T060320 EPSON INK CARTRIDGE;STYLUS CX3800;3810;4200;4800;WITH DURABRITE INK INK PRINTER MAGENTA EA EPST060320 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.11 721120 EA NO RESPONSE $10.00 60320S EA 400 $9.48

55 T060420 EPSON INK CARTRIDGE;STYLUS CX3800;3810;4200;4800;WITH DURABRITE INK INK PRINTER YELLOW EA EPST060420 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $10.11 721128 EA NO RESPONSE $10.00 60420S EA 400 $9.48

56 EPSERC23-B EPSON RIBBON, CASH REGISTER, FABTIC, M250, M260, BLACK RIBBON CASH REG BLACK
FOR USE IN CASH REGISTER MODELS 

250;252;255;257;260;262;267;ERC23;RP-265;267;TM-267;300 EA EPSERC23B EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $1.59 626611 EA NO RESPONSE $6.30 S2ERC23B EA 1 $1.67

57 EPSS020031 EPSON PRINT CARTRIDGE, INKJET, STYLUS 300, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK  EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 577643 EA NO RESPONSE $26.96 S1SO20031 EA 315 $13.29

58 EPSS020089 EPSON PRINT CARTIDGE, STYLUS 400/600/1520/800, TRI-COLOR INK PRINTER TRICOLOR  EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 214890 EA NO RESPONSE $21.53 S1SO20089 EA 300 $12.20

59 EPSS020093 EPSON PRINT CARTRIDGE, INKJET, STYLUS 400/500/600, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK  EA EPSS187093 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $18.15 864264 EA NO RESPONSE $18.82 S1SO20093 EA 540 $13.19

60 EPSS020108 EPSON PRINT CARTRIDGE, INKJET, STYLUS 1520/800, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK  EA EPSS189108 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $20.54 214817 EA NO RESPONSE $21.53 S1SO20108 EA 900 $12.20

61 EPSS020110 EPSON PRINT CARTRIDGE, INKJET, STYLUS PHOTO 700/EX, COLOR INK PRINTER COLOR  EA EPSS193110 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $17.17 238130 EA NO RESPONSE $18.89 S1SO20110 EA 220 $8.85

62 51625A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, HP 25, 3-COLOR INK PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN DESKJET 300, 400, 500 SERIES;              
DESKWRITER C, 300, 500 SERIES EA HEW51625A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $31.61 512806 EA 640 $30.90 S151625A EA 167 $30.31

63 51626A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, HP DESIGNJET 650C/PS, 650C, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN DESIGN JET 
200;220;250C;600;650C;650C/PS;DESKJET 400 
SERIES;DESKJET 500C SERIES;DESKWRITER 

C;DESKWRITER 500 SERIES EA HEW51626A EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $30.55 494930 EA 790 $33.79 S151629A EA 790 $29.61

64 51629A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, JP INKJET 690C/694, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK

DESKWRITER 600;660;680;694 SERIES;DESKJET 
600C;660C;670;680C;690C;OFFICEJET 500;600;700;INKJET 

300 PRINTER/SCANNER/COPIER EA HEW51629A EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $30.10 239301 EA 720 $25.30 S151629A EA 650 $29.16

65 51640A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 40 PRINT CARTRIDGE, DESKJET 1200C, 1200C/PS, 1600C SERIES, 
HP COLOR COPIER 210LX, HP COPYHET AND COPYJET M, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK

DESKWRITER 600;660;680;694 SERIES;DESKJET 
600C;660C;670;680C;690C;OFFICEJET 500;600;700;INKJET 

300 PRINTER/SCANNER/COPIER EA HEW51640A EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $28.53 569624 EA 1100 $31.56 S151640A EA 1122 $27.65

66 51640C
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 40 PRINT CARTRIDGE, DESKJET 1200C, 1200C/PS, 1600C SERIES, 
HP COLOR COPIER 210LX, HP COPYHET AND COPYJET M, CYAN INK PRINTER CYAN

DESKWRITER 600;660;680;694 SERIES;DESKJET 
600C;660C;670;680C;690C;OFFICEJET 500;600;700;INKJET 

300 PRINTER/SCANNER/COPIER EA HEW51640C EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $34.80 569632 EA 1600 $35.03 S151640C EA 1600 $33.51

67 51640M
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 40 PRINT CARTRIDGE, DESKJET 1200C, 1200C/PS, 1600C SERIES, 
HP COLOR COPIER 210LX, HP COPYHET AND COPYJET M, YELLOW INK PRINTER YELLOW

DESKWRITER 600;660;680;694 SERIES;DESKJET 
600C;660C;670;680C;690C;OFFICEJET 500;600;700;INKJET 

300 PRINTER/SCANNER/COPIER EA HEW51640M EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $32.36 569640 EA 1600 $35.03 S151640M EA 1600 $34.44

68 51640Y
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 40 PRINT CARTRIDGE, DESKJET 1200C, 1200C/PS, 1600C SERIES, 
HP COLOR COPIER 210LX, HP COPYHET AND COPYJET M, MAGENTA INK PRINTER BLACK

DESKWRITER 600;660;680;694 SERIES;DESKJET 
600C;660C;670;680C;690C;OFFICEJET 500;600;700;INKJET 

300 PRINTER/SCANNER/COPIER EA HEW51640Y EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $39.08 569657 EA 1600 $35.03 S151640Y EA 1600 $33.51

69 51641A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 41 PRINT CARTRIDGE, DESKJET 820C SERIES, 850C SERIES, 870C 
PROF. SERIES, 1000C SERIES, OFFICEJET PRO 1150C, COLOR 110 

AND 120 INK PRINTER TRICOLOR

DESKWRITER 600;660;680;694 SERIES;DESKJET 
600C;660C;670;680C;690C;OFFICEJET 500;600;700;INKJET 

300 PRINTER/SCANNER/COPIER EA HEW51641A EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $32.14 169789 EA 460 $35.17 S151641A EA 460 $30.81

70 51644C
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, HP 44 DESIGNJET 755CM/750, CYAN INK PRINTER CYAN

FOR USE IN HP DESIGNJET 
755CM;750C+;750C;455CA;450C;350C EA HEW51644C EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $32.06 459768 EA

1500 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $30.35 S151644C EA 365 $30.73

71 51644M
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, HP 44 DESIGNJET 755CM/750, MAGENTA INK PRINTER MAGENTA

FOR USE IN HP DESIGNJET 
755CM;750C+;750C;455CA;450C;350C EA HEW51644M EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $32.06 459776 EA

1500 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $30.35 S151644M EA 365 $30.73

72 51644Y
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, HP 44 DESIGNJET 755CM/750, YELLOW INK PRINTER YELLOW

FOR USE IN HP DESIGNJET 
755CM;750C+;750C;455CA;450C;350C EA HEW51644Y EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $32.06 459750 EA

1500 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $30.35 S151644Y EA 365 $30.73
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73 51645A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINTER CARTRIDGE, HP 710C, R40, 1600C, G55, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK

DESIGN JETSERIES 700;750C PLUS;755CM;DESKJET 1100 
SERIES;1120C;1200C;1200C PS; 

1220;1600;710C;720;820C;830;850C;870C PROF;880;890; 
OFFICEJET G55;G85;G95;K60;K80;PRO 1150C;PRO 1170 

SERIES;PRO1175  SERIES;R40;R60;T45;T65;PHOTOSMART 
P1000;P1100;P1215 INKJET; EA HEW51645A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $28.53 169771 EA 930 $24.87 S151645A048 EA 830 $27.65

74 51649A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, HP 690C, 694, 300/700, TRI-COLOR INK PRINTER TRICOLOR

FOR USE IN DESKJET 690C SERIES;DESKWRITER 694 
PRINTERS;300 SERIES 

PRINTER/SCANNER/COPIER;DESKJET 350C;350CBI 
SERIES PRINTERS;OFFICEJET 700 PRITNERS;DESKJET 

610;612;640;642;648 PRINTERS;DESKWRITER 
600;660;680;DESKJET 600C;660C;670;680C; OFFICEJET 

500;600 S EA HEW51649A EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $31.88 239319 EA 350 $28.53 S151649A EA 350 $30.57

75 92162A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINTER RIBBON, HP 2562C, 2563C, BLACK, 3/PK RIBBON DOT MATRIX BLACK FOR USE IN HP 2562C;2563C;2564C;2608A;2608S  BOX EXP25225 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $24.99 799676 BX3 LOW $81.00 S292162A BX 3 $48.63

76 92295A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD  TONER CARTRIDGE, HP II, IID, III, IIID BLACK TONER PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN HP LASERJET II, IID, III, IIID;                 
ALSO COMPATIBLE WITH NUMEROUS MACHINES EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 392399 EA 4000 $130.94 S192295A EA 4000 $56.25

77 92298A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD TONER CARTRIDGE, HP LASERJET 4/4M/4PLUS, YLDS 6000 TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN HP LASERJET 4;4M;4PLUS;5;5M;5N EA HEW92298A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $98.69 542423 EA 6800 $94.42 S192298A EA 6800 $95.64

78 92298X
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

TONER CARTRIDGE, HP LASERJET 4/4M/4PLUS, ULTRA FINE, MAX. 
CAP. TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN HP LASERJET 4;4M;4PLUS;5;5M;5N EA HEW92298X EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $99.61 190369 EA 8800 $92.73 S192298X EA 8800 $95.51

79 BCB027X
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

CTG,LASER HP4000 
XJMBO INK PRINTER BLACK

REMANUFACTURED LASERJET PRINT 
CARTRIDGE;BCB027A;BCB027X EA HEWC4127X EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $114.95 286934 EA 10000 $104.23 S1BCB027X EA 10000 $39.67

80 C1816A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 16 PRINT CARTRIDGE, DESKJET 610/612 & 690C SERIES, 
DESKWRITER 694, PRINTER*SCANNER*COPIER 300 SERIES, 

OFFICEJET 700 SERIES INK
FAX /       

PRINTER TRICOLOR

MACH;DESKJET 710C;720;830;880;890;1120C;OFFICEJET 
R40;R60;R80,T45;T65;OFFICEJET PRO 1170;1175;COLOR 

COPIERS 140;145;150;155;160;170;260;270;DESKJET EA HEWC1816A EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $31.34 141838 EA 210 $31.19 S1C1816A EA 212 $30.52

81 C1823D
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, 23, HP DESJET 710C/720C, 3-COLOR INK

FAX /       
PRINTER TRICOLOR

FOR USE IN OFFICEJET PRO 1170;1175 FAX 
MACH;DESKJET 710C;720;830;880;890;1120C;OFFICEJET 
R40;R60;R80,T45;T65;OFFICEJET PRO 1170;1175;COLOR 

COPIERS 140;145;150;155;160;170;260;270;DESKJET 
810C;812C PRINTER/SCANNER/COPIER 500 SERIES EA HEWC1823D EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $34.99 167787 EA 620 $29.20 S1C1823D140 EA 640 $33.91

82 C3103A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD LASER TONER CARTRIDGE, HPC3103A, 5, 5M, YELLOW TONER PRINTER YELLOW  EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 239293 EA 3000 $47.52 S1C3103A EA 3000 $31.57

83 C3903A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD TONER CARTRIDGE, HP LASER JET 5P, 5MP, 6P, 6MP TONER PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN HP LJ 6PXI;6MP;6P;6PSE;5P;6;6M;5M +;5MP    
AND CANON LBP PXII EA HEWC3903A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $84.13 239921 EA 4000 $83.05 S1C3903A EA 4000 $81.53

84 C4096A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD TONER CARTRIDGE, HPC4096A, LASERJET 2100 TONER PRINTER BLACK EA HEWC4096A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $89.91 808256 EA 5000 $81.60 S1C4096A EA 5000 $87.13

85 C4127A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD TONER CARTRIDGE, HP LASERJET 4000, LOW YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN HP 4000/4050 SERIES;                     
ALSO LJ 4050TS;LJ 4050TN;LJ 4050 EA HEWC4127A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $89.16 286943 EA 6000 $80.91 S1C4127A EA 6000 $86.40

86 C4127X
HEWLETT 
PACKARD TONER CARTRIDGE, HP LASERJET 4000, HIGH YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN HP 4000/4050 SERIES;                     
ALSO LJ 4050TS;LJ 4050TN;LJ 4050 EA HEWC4127X EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $114.95 286934 EA 10000 $104.23 S1C4127X EA 10000 $111.39

87 C4182X
HEWLETT 
PACKARD TONER CARTRIDGE, HP LASERJET 8100, ULTRA PRECISE TONER PRINTER BLACK  EA HEWC4182X EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $171.25 428274 EA 20000 $158.49 S1C4182X EA 20000 $164.19

88 C4191A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

TONER CARTRIDGE, HP COLOR LASERJET 4500, 4550 SERIES 
PRINTERS TONER PRINTER BLACK  EA HEWC4191A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $84.62 428265 EA 9000 $85.16 S1C4191A EA 9000 $86.92

89 C4192A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

TONER CARTRIDGE, HP COLOR LASERJET 4500, 4550 SERIES 
PRINTERS TONER PRINTER CYAN  EA HEWC4192A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $124.92 428336 EA 6000 $122.12 S1C4192A EA 6000 $126.96

90 C4193A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

TONER CARTRIDGE,  HP COLOR LASERJET 4500, 4550 SERIES 
PRINTERS TONER PRINTER MAGENTA  EA HEWC4193A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $124.92 428345 EA 6000 $122.12 S1C4193A EA 6000 $126.96

91 C4194A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

TONER CARTRIDGE, HP COLOR LASERJET 4500, 4550 SERIES 
PRINTERS TONER PRINTER YELLOW  EA HEWC4194A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $124.92 428256 EA 6000 $116.00 S1C4194A EA 6000 $126.96

92 C4195A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD DRUM KIT FOR HP COLOR LASERJET 4500, 4550 SERIES PRINTERS DRUM PRINTER   EA HEWC4195A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $81.27 172621 EA

25000 BLACK; 6250 
COLOR $81.45 S1C4195A EA 1 $78.75

93 C4810A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 11 PRINTHEAD, DESKJET 2200 / 2250 SERIES, DESIGNJET 500 / 800 
/ 800PS, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN HP BUSINESS INKJET 1100D/1100 DTN, 
2000C/2200/2230/2250/2280/2600 AND 3000 SERIES EA HEWC4810A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $31.02 556051 EA

16000 AT 5% 
COVERGE $34.30 S1C4810A EA 16000 $30.06

94 C4811A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 11 PRINTHEAD, DESKJET 2200 / 2250 SERIES, DESIGNJET 500 / 800 
/ 800PS, CYAN INK PRINTER CYAN

FOR USE IN HP BUSINESS INKJET 1100D/1100 DTN, 
2000C/2200/2230/2250/2280/2600 AND 3000 SERIES EA HEWC4811A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $31.35 556021 EA

24000 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $34.30 S1C4811A EA 24000 $30.06

Page 4 of 10



EQUIPMENT Vendor Part # PKG Yield Unit Price Vendor Part # PKG Yield Unit Price Vendor Part # PKG Yield Unit Price

BRAND PRODUCTBRAND PRODUCT

713-996-3338
281-736-4830
713-937-2626

OfficeMax

6355 Clara Road #100
Houston, TX 77041

Kim Mules

RFQ#09-74 OFFICE SUPPLIES, TONER, AND RELATED PRODUCTS

TELEPHONE NUMBER

Office Depot, Inc.

6225 West by Northwest Blvd.
Houston, TX 77040

Dee Cover
713-996-3379

OPENING DATE:
RESPONDENTS NAME Staples/Corporate Express

BRAND PRODUCT

ADDRESS
CITY, STATE, ZIPTHURSDAY: JULY 30, 2009

2:00 C.S.T.

FAX NUMBER

CONTACT NAME

PKG

*Note:  Vendor must fill in Vendor Part No.,Packaging,Yield,Unit Price:  VENDOR MUST QUOTE OEM BRAND PRODUCT ONLY

MFG DESCRIPTION TYPEITEM # MFG PART # MFG NAME MACHINE COLOR

95 C4812A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 11 PRINTHEAD, DESKJET 2200 / 2250 SERIES, DESIGNJET 500 / 800 
/ 800PS, MAGENTA INK PRINTER MAGENTA

FOR USE IN HP BUSINESS INKJET 1100D/1100 DTN, 
2000C/2200/2230/2250/2280/2600 AND 3000 SERIES EA HEWC4812A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $31.35 555981 EA

24000 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $34.30 S1C4812A EA 24000 $30.06

96 C4813A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 11 PRINTHEAD, DESKJET 2200 / 2250 SERIES, DESIGNJET 500 / 800 
/ 800PS, YELLOW INK PRINTER YELLOW

FOR USE IN HP BUSINESS INKJET 1100D/1100 DTN, 
2000C/2200/2230/2250/2280/2600 AND 3000 SERIES EA HEWC4813A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $31.35 556201 EA

24000 AT 5% 
COVERAGE $34.30 S1C4813A EA 24000 $30.06

97 C4836AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP 11 INK CARTRIDGE, CYAN INK PRINTER CYAN

FOR USE IN HP BUSINESS INKJET 1100D/1100 DTN, 
2000C/2200/2230/2250/2280/2600 AND 3000 SERIES EA HEWC4836A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $30.57 556141 EA 1750 $33.45 S1C4836A EA 2350 $29.31

98 C4837AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP 11 INK CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA INK PRINTER MAGENTA

FOR USE IN HP BUSINESS INKJET 1100D/1100 DTN, 
2000C/2200/2230/2250/2280/2600 AND 3000 SERIES EA HEWC4837A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $30.57 556181 EA 1750 $33.45 S1C4837A EA 2000 $29.31

99 C4838AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP 11 INK CARTRIDGE, YELLOW INK PRINTER YELLOW

FOR USE IN HP BUSINESS INKJET 1100D/1100 DTN, 
2000C/2200/2230/2250/2280/2600 AND 3000 SERIES EA HEWC4838A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $30.57 556091 EA 1750 $33.45 S1C4838A EA 2550 $29.31

100 C4841A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 10 INK CARTRIDGE, CYAN, HP 2000C / 2500C PSCP, DESIGNJET 
COLORPRO GA & CAD INK PRINTER CYAN

FOR USE IN HP BUSINESS INKJET 
2000C/2200/2230/2250/2280/2600 AND 3000 SERIES EA HEWC4841A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $34.34 352844 EA 1650 $33.82 S1C4841A EA 1650 $29.64

101 C4842A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 10 INK CARTRIDGE, YELLOW,  HP 2000C / 2500C PSCP, DESIGNJET 
COLORPRO GA & CAD INK PRINTER YELLOW

FOR USE IN HP BUSINESS INKJET 
2000C/2200/2230/2250/2280/2600 AND 3000 SERIES EA HEWC4842A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $31.25 352862 EA 1650 $33.82 S1C4842A EA 1650 $29.64

102 C4843A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 10 INK CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA, HP 2000C / 2500C PSCP, 
DESIGNJET COLORPRO GA & CAD INK PRINTER MAGENTA

FOR USE IN HP BUSINESS INKJET 1100D/1100 DTN, 
2000C/2200/2230/2250/2280/2600 AND 3000 SERIES EA HEWC4843A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $34.34 352880 EA 1650 $33.82 S1C4843A EA 1650 $29.64

103 C4844A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

HP 10 INK CARTRIDGE, BLACK,  HP 2000C / 2500C PSCP, DESIGNJET 
COLORPRO GA & CAD INK PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN HP BUSINESS INKJET 1100D/1100 DTN, 
2000C/2200/2230/2250/2280/2600 AND 3000 SERIES EA HEWC4844A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $30.57 352871 EA 1750 $27.83 S1C4844A EA 1430 $29.31

104 C5718A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD DATA CARTRIDGE;DDS-4 TAPE(40GB CAPASITY) TAPE N/A N/A EA HEWC5718A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $6.88 707120 EA NO RESPONSE $8.13 S7C5718A EA 1 $3.75

105 C5010AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD TONER CARTRIDGE, HPC5010AN, HP14, CP1160 INK PRINTER TRICOLOR  EA HEWC5010D EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $27.69 850753 EA 470 $24.30 S1C5010D EA 470 $26.55

106 C5011AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD INKJET TONER, HPC5011AN, HP14, CP1160 SRS, BLACK INK PRINTER TRICOLOR  EA HEWC5011D EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $20.32 850762 EA 800 $18.21 S1C5011D EA 830 $19.69

107 C6578AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, HP 78 INKJET, LARGE, TRI-COLOR INK PRINTER CYAN

FOR USE IN INKJET G55;G85;G95;K60;K80;PHOTOSMART 
P1000;P1100;P1215;P1218;COLOR COPIER 180;280 EA HEWC6578AN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $52.22 291951 EA 970 $47.64 S1C6578AN1 EA 1200 $50.06

108 C6578DN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, HP 78 INKJET, G55, K60/80, 3 COLOR INK PRINTER TRICOLOR

FOR USE IN INKJET G55;G85;G95;K60;K80;PHOTOSMART 
P1000;P1100;P1215;P1218;COLOR COPIER 180;280 EA HEW392486 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $31.24 172681 EA 560 $27.03 S1C8578DN EA 560 $29.95

109 C6614DN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP 20 BLACK INKJET PRINT CARTRIDGE INK PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN  HP DESKJET 610;612;640;642;648 INKJET 
PRINTERS EA HEWC6614D EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $29.29 384601 EA 500 $33.65 S1C6614D EA 500 $27.78

110 C6615DN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP 15 INKJET PRINT CARTRIDGE, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN HP DESKJET 810C;812C;840C;;841C;842C;940C EA HEWC6615DN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $26.96 384611 EA 600 $23.72 S1C6615DN0 EA 600 $26.12

111 C6625AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP 17 INKJET PRINT CARTRIDGE, TRI-COLOR INK PRINTER TRICOLOR  FOR USE IN HPDJ 840C;842C;843C EA HEWC6625A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $29.11 325871 EA 410 $26.51 S1C6625A EA 430 $27.91

112 C6648AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, JP INKJET 690C/694, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK

DESKWRITER 600;660;680;694 SERIES;DESKJET 
600C;660C;670;680C;690C;OFFICEJET 500;600;700;INKJET 

300 PRINTER/SCANNER/COPIER EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 566391 PK2 325 $31.69 S1C6648AN PK 1300 $15.39

113 C6650AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD CTG INK HP45A BLK 2/PK INK PRINTER BLACK

SHARP BLK PRINTS;DYE BASED,LIGHT FAST COLOR 
PROVIDES

TRUE COLOR;RESIST SMUDGING AND FADING;VISIBLE 
INK LEVEL INDICATOR-2P/PK EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 169771 EA 930 $24.87 S1C6650AN PK 1670 $30.77

114 C6656AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP 56 INKJET PRINT CARTRIDGE, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN HP DESKJET 450Ci / 450cbi, 5150/5550/5650 
SERIES, PSC 1210/2110/2175 SERIES, PHOTOSMART 

7150/7350/7550 SERIES, OFFICEJET 4110/6110/v40 SERIES 
AND DIGITAL COPIER 310 EA HEWC6656AN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $19.51 419672 EA 520 $17.26 S1C6656AN EA 450 $18.91

115 C6657AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP 57 INKJET PRINT CARTRIDGE, TRI-COLOR INK PRINTER COLOR

FOR USE IN HP DESKJET 450Ci / 450cbi, 5150/5550/5650 
SERIES, PSC 1210/2110/2175 SERIES, PHOTOSMART 

7150/7350/7550 SERIES, OFFICEJET 4110/6110/v40 SERIES 
AND DIGITAL COPIER 310 EA HEWC6657AN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $31.24 154605 500 $27.52 S1C6657AN EA 500 $29.95

116 C6658A 
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP 58 PHOTO INKJET PRINT CARTRIDGE, BLACK INK PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN HP DESKJET 450Ci / 450cbi, 5150/5550/5650 
SERIES, PHOTOSMART 7150/7350/7550 SERIES EA HEWC6658AN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $23.02 419716 140 $25.47 S1C6658AN EA 125 $22.31

117 C7115A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD ULTRA PRECISE TONER CARTRIDGE, BLACK, LOW YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK  FOR USE IN HP LaserJet 1200, 1220 Series Printers EA HEWC7115A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $54.98 727381 2500 $50.96 S1C7115A EA 2500 $53.28

118 C7115X
HEWLETT 
PACKARD ULTRA PRECISE TONER CARTRIDGE, BLACK, HIGH YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN HPLJ 1200,1220, AND 3300 SERIES EA HEWC7115X EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $68.68 869881 3500 $62.98 S1C7115X EA 3500 $66.56

119 C8061A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRECISION TONER, HP 4100N, LOW YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN HP 4000, 4100 AND 4050 SERIES EA HEWC8061A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $89.22 727371 6000 $94.36 S1C8061A EA 6000 $86.46
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120 C8061X
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRECISION TONER, HP 4100N, HIGH YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN HP 4000, 4100 AND 4050 SERIES EA HEWC8061X EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $114.95 727351 10000 $104.23 S1C8061X EA 10000 $111.39

121 C8543X
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

TONER CARTRIDGE, HP LASERJET SMART, MAXIMUM CAPACITY, 
BLACK  TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN HP 9000/9000mfp SERIES EA HEWC8543X EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $247.28 743161 30000 $261.50 S1C8543X EA 30000 $239.63

122 C8727A 
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

CARTRIDGE, HP 27, BLACK,  DESKJET 3845 COLOR THERMAL INKJET 
PRINTER INK PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN HP 9000/9000mfp SERIES EA HEWC8727AN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $16.57 419727 280 $18.33 S1C8727AN EA 220 $16.06

123 C8727AN 
HEWLETT 
PACKARD CARTRIDGE, HP 27, BLACK,  HP FAX 1240 INK FAX BLACK FOR USE IN HP 9000/9000mfp SERIES EA HEWC8727AN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $16.57 419727 280 $18.33 S1C8727AN EA 220 $16.06

124 C8728A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

CARTRIDGE, HP 28, 3-COLOR,  DESKJET 3845 COLOR THERMAL 
INKJET PRINTER INK PRINTER TRICOLOR FOR USE IN HP 9000/9000mfp SERIES EA HEWC8728AN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $20.88 419760 EA 240 $22.85 S1C8728AN EA 190 $20.02

125 C8728AN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD CARTRIDGE, HP 27, 3-COLOR  HP FAX 1240 INK FAX TRICOLOR FOR USE IN HP 9000/9000mfp SERIES EA HEWC8728AN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $20.88 419760 EA 240 $22.85 S1C8728AN EA 190 $20.02

126 C8765WN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP 94 INK CARTRIDGE W/VIVERA INK, BLACK  INK PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN HP 9000/9000mfp SERIES EA HEWC8765WN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $19.51 440288 EA 480 $21.58 S1C8765W EA 450 $18.91

127 C8766WN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP 95 INK CARTRIDGE W/VIVERA INK, 3-COLOR INK PRINTER TRICOLOR FOR USE IN HP 9000/9000mfp SERIES EA HEWC8766WN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $22.63 440480 EA 330 $24.76 S1C8766W EA 260 $21.70

128 C9369WN
HEWLETT 
PACKARD HP99 COLOR PHOTO CARTRIDGE WITH VIVERA INK INK PRINTER TRICOLOR EA HEWC9369WN EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $23.27 440656 EA 130 $25.47 S1C9369W EA 130 $22.31

129 C9700A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, COLOR LJ SMART 2500 SERIES, BLACK TONER PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE IN LASERJET SMART 1500 & 2500 SERIES 
PRINTERS EA HEWC9700A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $74.05 531235 EA 5000 $86.81 S1C9700A EA 5000 $76.07

130 C9701A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD CYAN PRINT CARTRIDGE, LJ SMART 1500/2500 SERIES TONER PRINTER CYAN

FOR USE IN LASERJET SMART 1500 & 2500 SERIES 
PRINTERS EA HEWC9701A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $90.29 531262 EA 4000 $104.72 S1C9701A EA 4000 $91.76

131 C9702A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD YELLOW PRINT CARTRIDGE, LJ SMART 1500/2500 SERIES TONER PRINTER YELLOW

FOR USE IN LASERJET SMART 1500 & 2500 SERIES 
PRINTERS EA HEWC9702A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $90.29 531307 EA 4000 $104.72 S1C9702A EA 4000 $91.76

132 C9703A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD MAGENTA PRINT CARTRIDGE, LJ SMART 1500/2500 SERIES TONER PRINTER MAGENTA

FOR USE IN LASERJET SMART 1500 & 2500 SERIES 
PRINTERS EA HEWC9703A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $90.29 531325 EA 4000 $104.72 S1C9703A EA 4000 $91.76

133 C9704A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD DRUM KIT, LJ SMART 1500/2500 SERIES  **(BLKCIR) DRUM PRINTER

FOR USE IN LASERJET SMART 1500 & 2500 SERIES 
PRINTERS EA HEWC9704A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $158.26 531532 EA

10000 BLACK; 5000 
COLOR $155.58 S1C9704A EA 1 $151.73

134 C9720A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD BLACK PRINT CARTRIDGE, CLJ 4600 SERIES INK PRINTER BLACK  EA HEWC9720A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $139.48 319275 EA 9000 $136.31 S1C9720A EA 9000 $136.16

135 C9721A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD CYAN PRINT CARTRIDGE, CLJ 4600 SERIES TONER PRINTER COLOR  EA HEWC9721A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $190.44 319055 EA 8000 $184.20 S1C9721A EA 8000 $182.59

136 C9722A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD YELLOW PRINT CARTRIDGE, CLJ 4600 SERIES TONER PRINTER COLOR  EA HEWC9722A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $190.44 319209 EA 8000 $184.20 S1C9722A EA 8000 $182.59

137 C9723A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD MAGENTA PRINT CARTRIDGE, CLJ 4600 SERIES TONER PRINTER COLOR  EA HEWC9723A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $190.44 319099 EA 8000 $184.20 S1C9723A EA 8000 $182.59

138 Q1338A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD LASERJET, GNUIN  HP, SMART PRINT CARTRIDGE, LOW YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN LASERJET 4200 SERIES EA HEWQ1338A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $137.91 616906 EA 12000 $128.98 S1Q1338A EA 12000 $133.65

139 Q1339A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD LASERJET, GNUIN  HP, SMART PRINT CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN LASERJET 4300 SERIES EA HEWQ1339A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $182.61 616897 EA 18000 $178.60 S1Q1339A EA 18000 $176.96

140 Q2613A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, LASERJET 1300 SMART, LOW YIELD, BLACK TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN LASERJET SMART 1300 SERIES EA HEWQ2613A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $64.02 432865 EA 2500 $59.91 s1q2613a EA 2500 $62.04

141 Q2613X
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, LASERJET 1300 SMART, HIGH YIELD, BLACK TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN LASERJET SMART 1300 SERIES EA HEWQ2613X EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $80.70 432892 EA 4000 $84.47 s1q2613x EA 4000 $77.37

142 Q5942X
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

TONER CARTRIDGE;NEW DRUM WITH CHIP;LASERJET 4250; 4350; 
HIGH YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK EA HEWQ5942X EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $202.38 975384 EA 20000 $210.84 s1q5942x EA 20000 $196.12

143 Q5949A
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, LASERJET 1160 / 1320 SERIES, LOW YIELD, BLACK TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN LASERJET SMART 1300 SERIES EA HEWQ5949A EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $64.02 776184 EA 2500 $67.69 s1q5949a EA 2500 $62.04

144 Q5949X
HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINT CARTRIDGE, LASERJET 1320 SERIES, HIGH YIELD, BLACK TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN LASERJET SMART 1300 SERIES EA HEWQ5949X EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $117.51 992232 EA 6000 $124.19 S1Q5949X EA 6000 $113.88

145 Q6511X
HEWLETT 
PACKARD

PRINT CARTRIDGE, LASERJET 2400 SERIES WITH SMART PRINT 
TECHNOLOGY INK PRINTER BLACK EA HEWQ6511X EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $186.72 975392 EA 12000 $196.80 S1Q6511X EA 12000 $180.95

146 100-7565 ITHACA RIBBON, ITHACA SERIES 150, 90PLUS, 70, 170 AND 50, BLACK RIBBON
READER 
PRINTER BLACK CORRECTABLE RIBBON FOR IBM WHEELWRITER SERIES EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID SPECIAL ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

147 100-7859 ITHACA RIBBON, ITHACA SERIES 150, 90PLUS AND 50, PURPLE RIBBON
READER 
PRINTER PURPLE CORRECTABLE RIBBON FOR IBM WHEELWRITER SERIES EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID SPECIAL ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

148 KETNR
K&E/ VISUAL 
EDGE/RICOH

TONER CARTRIDGE, K&E / K+E MODELS 3036, 4037, 4038, 6036, 7036, 
8036 TONER COPIER BLACK CORRECTABLE RIBBON FOR IBM WHEELWRITER SERIES EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID SPECIAL ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

149 KETNR2
K&E/ VISUAL 
EDGE/RICOH TONER CARTRIDGE, K&E / K+E MODELS 4039, 4047, 8036M TONER COPIER BLACK CORRECTABLE RIBBON FOR IBM WHEELWRITER SERIES EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID SPECIAL ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER
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150 KETNR
K&E/ VISUAL 
EDGE/RICOH DEVELOPER BOTTLE, K&E / K+E ALL MODELS DEVELOPER COPIER BLACK CORRECTABLE RIBBON FOR IBM WHEELWRITER SERIES EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID SPECIAL ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

SPECIAL 
ORDER

151 11A3550 LEXMARK
COMPATIBLE ONLY WITH THE 2400 SERIES PRINTERS (2480, 2481, 

2490, 2491) RIBBON PRINTER BLACK EA LEX11A3550 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $31.32 637384 EA HIGH $29.67 S211A3550 EA 1 $14.27

152 1380999 LEXMARK RIBN,TYP,COR,FILM,F/WW, BLACK RIBBON TYPEWRITER CORR CORRECTABLE RIBBON FOR IBM WHEELWRITER SERIES EA LEX1380999 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $9.16 166645 EA HIGH $9.99 S21380999 EA 1 $5.91

153 1382100 LEXMARK TONER,CTRG,IBM OPTRA/4049 PAGEPRINTER, LOW YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK  EA LEX1382100 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $289.53 166629 EA 7000 $256.95 S11382100 EA 7000 $236.41

154 1382150 LEXMARK TONER,CTRG,IBM OPTRA/4049 PAGEPRINTER, HIGH YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK  EA LEX1382150 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $387.60 123745 EA 14000 $339.71 S11382150 EA 14000 $312.57

155 12A1970 LEXMARK PRINT CARTRIDGE, INKJET, Z53/31, Z82 FAX, BLACK, 600 PG YIELD INK PRINTER BLACK

FOR USE WITH IBM/LEXMARK MODELS 
Z11;Z31;Z42;Z51;Z52 COLOR JET PRINTERS;COLORJET 

3200;5700;5770;7000;7200;7500 & COMPAQ MODELS 
IJ300;IJ700;IJ750;IJ900 & A1000 EA LEX12A1970 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $30.98 312040 EA 600 $32.35 S115M0922 EA 600 $29.38

156 12A1975 LEXMARK PRINT CARTRIDGE, INKJET, Z53/82/31 BLACK, HIGH YIELD INK PRINTER BLACK

HIGH YIELD FOR SERIES 5700;5770;7000;7200;7200V 
COLOR JETPRINTERS;OPTRA COLOR40;50 

INKJET;Z11;Z31;Z42;Z51;Z53;Z82 MULTI FUNCTION 
FACSIMILIE EA LEX12A1975 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $32.61 165361 EA 1100 $34.71 S112A1975 EA 1100 $30.93

157 12A1980 LEXMARK PRINT CARTRIDGE; FADE RESISTANT INK PRINTER COLOR EA LEX12A1980 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $40.73 312031 EA 275 $36.18 S115M0923 EA 275 $33.25

158 12A6830 LEXMARK TONER CARTRIDGE, OPTRA T520/T522, 7500 PG YIELD TONER PRINTER BLACK   FOR USE IN LEMARK OPTRA T520/T522 LASER PRINTER EA LEX12A6830 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $160.59 101552 EA 7500 $165.53 S112A6830 EA 7500 $152.31

159 13L0034 LEXMARK PRINT RIBBON FOR 4227 & 4227 + SERIES PIRNTERS RIBBON PRINTER BLACK EA LEX13L0034 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $45.14 486361 EA
15000000 

CHARACTER $38.24 S213L0034 EA 15 $32.53

160 140109A LEXMARK LASER TONER, HP LASERJET 5SI, 5SI NX, MOPIER INK PRINTER BLACK  EA SEB791393 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $66.47 367516 EA 15000 $134.41 S1140109A EA 15000 $117.78

161 140109X LEXMARK OPTRA N LASER CTG, LSRJET, HP5S1, HP5S1MX TONER PRINTER BLACK  EA SEB791395 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $70.45 562241 EA 17250 $186.13 S1140109X EA 17250 $123.66

162 140127A LEXMARK CARTRIDGE, PRNT, HP4000 TONER PRINTER BLACK  EA SEB791421 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $45.06 563201 EA 6000 $96.39 S1140127A EA 6000 $70.77

163 140127X LEXMARK
CARTRIDGE,PTR LSRJT

4000 & 4050 SERIES PRINTERS INK PRINTER BLACK  EA SEB791422 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $48.62 563271 EA 10000 $123.84 S1140127X EA 10000 $88.15
164 140195A LEXMARK TONER,PRINT,LSRJT, II / III TONER PRINTER BLACK LINEA PRINT CARTRIDGE FOR HP LASERJET II;IID;III;IIID EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 232827 EA 4000 $81.00 S1140195A EA 4000 $56.26

165 140198A LEXMARK TONER,PRINT,HPLSR TONER PRINTER BLACK
TONER,PRINT,HPLSR,4PLUS;CANON EP-E-

HP;LJ4;4PLUS;4M;4M+;5;5M;5N EA SEB791221 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $34.89 735837 EA 6800 $97.20 S1140198A EA 6800 $69.38

166 140198X LEXMARK LASER TONER CARTRIDGE, LASERJET, 4, 5 TONER PRINTER BLACK
EXTENDED LIFE FOR HP (Max. Capacity Ultra Fine) 

LASERJET 4;4M;4+;4M+;5,5M;5N EA SEB791222 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $43.49 735787 EA 8800 $106.88 S1140198X EA 8800 $75.25

167 15M0120 LEXMARK PRINT CARTRIDGE, INKJET, Z42/43, HIGH YIELD, COLOR INK PRINTER  COLOR
FOR USE IN LEXMARK Z42;Z43;Z51;Z53 COLOR 
JETPRINTERS;Z82 MULTI FUNCTION FACSIMILE EA LEX15M0120 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $36.68 403721 EA 450 $37.06 S115M0985 EA 275 $34.79

168 4161-106 MINOLTA TONER CARTRIDGE, MINOLTA, SP2000 & 3000 TONER
READER 
PRINTER BLACK  EA MNL4161106 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $192.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S54161106 EA 10000 $156.69

169 8910-204 MINOLTA TONER, MINOLTA, RP6052 TONER PRINTER BLACK  EA MNL8910204 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $56.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S18910204 EA 2000 $68.36

170 TS120 MURATA
FAX TONER CARTRIDGE, MURATEC F95, F95e, F98, F100, F120, F150 & 

F160 TONER FAX BLACK  EA MURTS120 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $69.32 211838 EA 5500 $127.19 S5TS120 EA 5500 $65.72

171 DK120 MURATA DRUM KIT, MURATEC F95, F95e, F98, F100, F120, F150 & F160 DRUM FAX BLACK  EA MURDK120 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $99.10 542721 EA 20000 $117.00 S5DK120 EA 1 $72.26

172 DK2030 MURATEC DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR F520 & F560 DRUM FAX BLACK EA MURDK2030 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $79.07 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S5DK2030 EA 30000 $94.04

173 DK40360 MURATEC DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR F320;F360 DRUM  FAX BLACK EA MURDK40360 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $84.23 133194 EA 16000 $112.50 S5DK40360 EA 1 $72.16

174 TS40360 MURATEC TONER CARTRIDGE, FOR F320;F360 TONER FAX BLACK EA MURTS40360 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $159.09 402496 EA 11500 $166.01 S1TS40360 EA 11500 $144.52

175 TS560 MURATEC TONER CARTRIDGE FOR F520 & F560 TONER FAX BLACK EA MURTS560 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $158.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S1TS560 EA 15000 $150.05

176 192LT NU-KOTE INTL
LOW TACK LIFT OFF CORRECTION TAPE F/ COMPATIBLE IBM 

WHEELWRITER SERIES RIBBONS RIBBON TYPERWRITER CORR  EA NUK192LT EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $2.75 915157 EA NO RESPONSE $3.27 S2192LT EA 1 $2.03

177 B156 NU-KOTE INTL
CORRECTABLE FILM RIBBON FOR IBM SPC PERSONAL & COMP. 

SELECTRIC III TYPEWRITERS RIBBON TYPEWRITER CORR  EA NUKB156 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $6.96 999185 EA NO RESPONSE $5.94 S2B156 EA 1 $2.63

Page 7 of 10



EQUIPMENT Vendor Part # PKG Yield Unit Price Vendor Part # PKG Yield Unit Price Vendor Part # PKG Yield Unit Price

BRAND PRODUCTBRAND PRODUCT

713-996-3338
281-736-4830
713-937-2626

OfficeMax

6355 Clara Road #100
Houston, TX 77041

Kim Mules

RFQ#09-74 OFFICE SUPPLIES, TONER, AND RELATED PRODUCTS

TELEPHONE NUMBER

Office Depot, Inc.

6225 West by Northwest Blvd.
Houston, TX 77040

Dee Cover
713-996-3379

OPENING DATE:
RESPONDENTS NAME Staples/Corporate Express

BRAND PRODUCT

ADDRESS
CITY, STATE, ZIPTHURSDAY: JULY 30, 2009

2:00 C.S.T.

FAX NUMBER

CONTACT NAME

PKG

*Note:  Vendor must fill in Vendor Part No.,Packaging,Yield,Unit Price:  VENDOR MUST QUOTE OEM BRAND PRODUCT ONLY

MFG DESCRIPTION TYPEITEM # MFG PART # MFG NAME MACHINE COLOR

178 B167 NU-KOTE INTL CORRECTTION FILM FOR CX880;900X;901D RIBBON TYPERWRITER CORR EA NUKB167 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $2.76 999060 EA NO RESPONSE $2.59 S2B167 EA 1 $1.59

179 B192 / 915389 NU-KOTE INTL
CORRECTION RIBBON FOR WHEELWRITER SERIES;PANASONIC KK-

E3000;7000 SERIES RIBBON TYPERWRITER CORR  EA NUKB192 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $3.65 915157 EA NO RESPONSE $3.27 S2B192 EA 1 $2.59

180 B214 NU-KOTE INTL
CORRECTION FILM RIBBON FOR OLIVETTI,OLYMPIA, NAKAJIMA, 

ROYAL, SWINTEC RIBBON TYPEWRITER CORR EA NUKB214 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $3.25 914432 EA NO RESPONSE $3.30 S2B214 EA 1 $2.41

181 B397 NU-KOTE INTL
PLAIN PAPER THERMAL TRANSFER RIBBON FOR SHARP FAX 

MACHINES RIBBON FAX BLACK

 FOR USE IN MODELS 
FO1450;1460;1470;1650;1660;1850;UX500;510;510A;600M;100

0;1100;1300;1400 EA NUKB397 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $36.95 379157 EA NO RESPONSE $35.00 S5B397 EA 1 $17.25

182 BM188 NU-KOTE INTL
MATRIX NYLON RIBBON FOR COMPATIBLE NCR,OKIDATA,RADIO 

SHACK & T.I. PRINTERS RIBBON PRINTER BLACK  EA NUKBM188 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $4.79 483669 EA
300,000 
CHARACTERS $2.70 S2BM188 EA 1 $3.53

183 BM203 NU-KOTE INTL
PRINTER RIBBON EPSON AP 3000;4000;5000;5000+;LQ-

500;510;570+;800;850;870 HIGH DENSITY RIBBON PRINTER BLACK
FOR USE IN EPSON AP 3000;4000;5000;5000+;LQ-

500;510;570+;800;850;870 EA NUKBM203 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $4.12 914747 EA
300,000 
CHARACTERS $2.07 S2BM203 EA 1 $2.37

184 BM319 NU-KOTE INTL PRINTER RIBBON CARTRIDGE for IBM 2380/2390 RIBBON PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN IBM 2380,2381,2390,2391 SERIES EA NUKBM319 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $6.03 996249 EA
350,000 

CHARACTERS $3.66 S2BM319 EA 1 $5.14

185 BR106N NU-KOTE INTL
BLACK/RED NYLON RIBBON FOR CANON, CASIO AND HERMES 

CALCULATORS RIBBON CALCULATOR RED/BLK  EA NUKBR106N EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $2.78 101949 EA NO RESPONSE $1.68 S2BR106N EA 1 $1.36

186 BR113N NU-KOTE INTL

BLACK/RED NYLON RIBBON FOR NUKOTE 
3100/3200/3400/4300/4500/4600/4700/5700, IBICO 2700/2800 SERIES 3140

& VICTOR CALCULATORS RIBBON CALCULATOR RED/BLK  EA NUKBR113N EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $2.88 479527 EA NO RESPONSE $2.89 S2BR113N EA 1 $1.72

187 BR80C NU-KOTE INTL
CALCULATOR RIBBON, CANON, CASIO,NYLON, FOR POINT OF SALE, 

CASH REGISTER, CALCULATOR AND FINANCIAL RIBBONS RIBBON CALCULATOR RED/BLK  EA NUKBR80C EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $1.67 848598 EA NO RESPONSE $1.14 S2BR80C EA 1 $0.74

188 BR80N NU-KOTE INTL
CALCULATOR RIBBON, 2000/3000/6000 SERIES, S WIND, FOR CASH 

REGISTER AND FINANCIAL RIBBONS RIBBON CALCULATOR RED/BLK  EA EXP25105 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $1.93 848598 EA NO RESPONSE $1.14 S2BR80N EA 1 $0.74

189 NR42 NU-KOTE INTL INK ROLLER,14PD, 87PD, P15D, FR110 BLACK/RED INK CALCULATOR RED/BLK

FOR USE W/CANON, CITIZEN
PANASONIC;RADIO SHACK;ROYAL;TX 

INSTRUMENTS;SHARP & VICTOR MODELS EA NUKNR42 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $1.92 848564 EA NO RESPONSE $1.28 S2NR42 EA 1 $1.51

190 NR74 NU-KOTE INTL INK ROLLER,200DP, 2250DP, 710DP, 114PD, BLACK INK CALCULATOR BLACK

POINT OF SALE,CASH REGISTER,CALCULATOR, 
FINANCIAL RIBBON

USE F/ROYAL 216PD,240PD,SHARP 
EL1196VII,1197III/G/H/S,EL1197G-II,EL2197G-II/III,TEXAS 
INSTRUMENTS 5130/II,5132,5135,5140,5142III,5310,8210 EA NUKNR74 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $2.39 848580 EA NO RESPONSE $2.63 S2NR74 EA 1 $1.88

191 RF94 NU-KOTE INTL CARTRIDGE,CANON,BJC-4000 BCI21 REPLACEMENT INK PRINTER BLACK  EA NUKRF94 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $1.93 753811 EA 200 $2.10 S1RF94 EA 140 $0.89

192 RF95 NU-KOTE INTL CARTRIDGE,CANON,BJC-4000 COLOR REPLACEMENT INK PRINTER TRICOLOR  EA NUKRF95 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $4.82 753831 EA 200 $5.40 S1RF95 EA 200 $4.81

193 400ETN OKIDATA DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR 5400, 5600 SERIES DRUM  PRINTER BLACK EA OKI56116801 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $160.61 373717 EA 15000 86.4 S556116901 EA 1 $172.30

194 40433318 OKIDATA DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR OKIFAX 5700, 5750, 5900, 5950 DRUM FAX BLACK EA OKI40433318 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $200.22 705311 EA 12000 $225.72 S540433318 EA 1 $184.48

195 40815606 OKIDATA TONER CARTRIDGE FOR OKIFAX 5900, 5700, 5950, 5750 TONER FAX BLACK EA OKI40815606 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $27.06 514591 EA 3000 $37.62 S540815606 EA 3000 $27.66

196 42126604 OKIDATA
IMAGE DRUM KIT FOR C5100N;C5150N;C5200N;C5300N;C5400 

SERIES;C5510MFP DRUM PRINTER BLACK EA OKI42126604 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $81.89 373717 EA 15000 $86.40 S142126604 EA 1 $75.24

197 42127401 OKIDATA
TONER CARTRIDGE,  YELLOW, OKIDATA C5100N / C5150N / C5200N / 

C5300N / C5400 SERIES TONER PRINTER YELLOW FOR USE IN OKIDATA MICROLINE 590/591 EA OKI42127401 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $127.10 379927 EA 5000 $128.25 S142127401 EA 5000 $115.15

198 42127402 OKIDATA
TONER CARTRIDGE,  MAGENTA, OKIDATA C5100N / C5150N / C5200N / 

C5300N / C5400 SERIES TONER PRINTER MAGENTA FOR USE IN OKIDATA MICROLINE 590/591 EA OKI42127402 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $127.10 379873 EA 5000 $128.25 S142127402 EA 5000 $115.15

199 42127403 OKIDATA
TONER CARTRIDGE,  CYAN, OKIDATA C5100N / C5150N / C5200N / 

C5300N / C5400 SERIES TONER PRINTER CYAN FOR USE IN OKIDATA MICROLINE 590/591 EA OKI42127403 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $127.10 379864 EA 5000 $128.25 S142127403 EA 5000 $115.15

200 42127404 OKIDATA
TONER CARTRIDGE,  BLACK,  OKIDATA C5100N / C5150N / C5200N / 

C5300N / C5400 SERIES TONER PRINTER BLACK FOR USE IN OKIDATA MICROLINE 590/591 EA OKI42127404 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $47.68 378145 EA 5000 $55.40 S142127404 EA 5000 $43.30
201 52104501 OKIDATA TONER CARTRIDGE FOR 2300, 2100, 2000; OMNIFAX L25 TONER FAX BLACK EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 913947 EA 2500 $50.40 S552104501 EA 2500 $26.41

202 52106001 OKIDATA MATRIX NYLON RIBBON FOR OKIDATA MICROLINE 590/591 SERIES RIBBON DOT MATRIX BLACK FOR USE IN OKIDATA MICROLINE 590/591 EA OKI52106001 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $11.87 900639 EA
400,000 

CHARACTERS $12.24 S252106001 EA 1 $9.17

203 52106701 OKIDATA TONER CARTRIDGE, FOR 5650 TONER PRINTER BLACK EA OKI52106701 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $29.17 841239 EA 2000 $44.10 S552106701 EA 2500 $19.85
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204 52112901 OKIDATA TONER CARTRIDGE FOR 5780 TONER PRINTER BLACK EA OKI52112901 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $37.97 535876 EA 5000 $52.47 S552112901 EA 5000 $33.19

205 56106601 OKIDATA
TYPE 1LASER IMAGE DRUM FOR OKIDATA OL400, 800 SERIES; 

DOC-IT 3000, 4000 DRUM FAX BLACK EA OKI56106601 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $261.26 818377 EA 15000 $273.11 S156106601 EA 1 $190.79

206 56116901 OKIDATA DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR 5650 DRUM PRINTER BLACK EA OKI56116901 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $184.05 925959 EA 20000 $224.10 S556116901 EA 1 $172.30
207 WTL40 OMNI TONER CARTRIDGE FOR OMNIFAX L46 TONER FAX BLACK EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S5WTL40 EA 2900 $76.29

208 ? OMNI DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR OMNIFAX DL6450 DRUM FAX BLACK EA XERWO6450 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $285.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID

209 KXFA55 PANASONIC

TONER INK CARTRIDGE, BLACK, KX-FP80, KX-FP81, KX-FP85, KX-
FP151, KX-FP152, KX-FP155, KX-FPC91, KX-FPC95, KX-FPC161, KX-

FPC165, KX-FPG175, KX-FPG371 INK FAX BLACK  EA PANKXFA55 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $30.56 408881 EA 330 $12.36 S5KXFA55 BX 300 $12.37

210 KXFA65 PANASONIC
REPLACEMENT THERMAL TRANSFER RIBBON FOR 

KXFP101/111/105/121, KXPPC141, KXFA65 FILM FAX BLACK  EA PANKXFA65 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $29.40 188595 EA 330 $24.71 S5KXFA65 EA 330 $24.74

211 KXFA83 PANASONIC TONER CARTRIDGE, NEW & GENUINE, MULTIFUNCTION FAX KX-FL511 TONER FAX BLACK  EA PANKXFA83 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $31.82 442918 EA 2500 $28.82 S5KXFA83 EA 2500 $28.87

212 KXFA93 PANASONIC
FILM CARTRIDGE, NEW & GENUINE,  KX-FHD331, FHD351, FPG371, 

FPG381 FILM FAX BLACK  EA PANKXFA93 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $20.38 319770 EA 225 $18.94 S5KXFA93 EA 225 $18.56

213 KXFA136 PANASONIC

REPLACEMENT FAX FILM CARTRIDGES FOR USE IN KXFM-
205;210;220;280;KX-FMC230;KXFP195,200,250,270 FAX MACHINES. 

2P/BOX FILM FAX BLACK  BOX PANKXFA136 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $41.72 288514 BOX 660 $32.94 S5KXFA136 BX 660 $32.99

214 KXP150 PANASONIC
NYLON RIBBON, 4-COLOR NYLON RIBBON FOR PANASONIC KX-

P2123;P3123;P3124 PRINTER RIBBON PRINTER BLACK  EA PANKXP150 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $14.73 493932 EA NO RESPONSE $13.95 S2KXP150 EA 1 $10.13

215 BCB098A
PLATINUM 

CHOICE REMANUFACTURED LASER TONER FOR HP 4M/5M/EX PRINTERS TONER PRINTER BLACK  EA SEB791221 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $34.89 406061 EA 6800 $32.85 S1BCB098A EA 6800 $22.63

216 BCB095A
PLATINUM 

CHOICE REMANUFACTURED LASER TONER - FOR HP LASERJET II, III TONER PRINTER BLACK  EA DPS0091A EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $66.71 406101 EA 4000 $30.50 S1BCB095A EA 4000 $15.00

217
SCX-

4216D31XAA SAMSUNG
TONER/DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR SAMSUNG SCX-4016, 4116; SF-

560, 565P, & OTHERS TONER PRINTER BLACK EA SASSCX4216D3 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $79.53 162793 EA 3000 $79.99 S1SCX4216D3 EA 3000 $67.13

218

SCX-5312D6    
(formerly        

SF-5100-DE) SAMSUNG TONER CARTRIDGE, BLACK,SF-835P LASER TONER FAX MACHINE TONER FAX BLACK  EA SASSCX5312D6 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $64.38 NO BID EA NO RESPONSE NO BID S1SCX5312D6 EA 6000 $55.99
219 SCX-5312R2      SAMSUNG DRUM UNIT, BLACK, SF-835P LASER TONER FAX MACHINE DRUM FAX BLACK  EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID EA NO RESPONSE NO BID S1SCX5315R2 EA 1 $70.51

220 SF-5100D3 SAMSUNG TONER CARTRIDGE FOR SAMSUNG 5100P TONER PRINTER BLACK EA SASSF5100D3 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $74.11 NO BID EA NO RESPONSE NO BID S1SF5100D3 EA 3000 $67.23

221 TDR510P SAMSUNG TONER/DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR SAMSUNG ML-531P, SF-5100 TONER PRINTER BLACK EA SASSF5100D3 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $74.11 NO BID EA NO RESPONSE NO BID S1TDR510P EA 3000 $43.96

222 NR-78P SHARP INK ROLLER, MODEL EL1192C, BLACK FILM FAX PURPLE  EA NUKNR78P EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $3.10 958983 EA HIGH $3.00 S2NR78P EA 2 $2.23

223 NR-78BR SHARP INK ROLLER, MODEL EL2192C, BLACK FILM FAX
BLACK/       

RED  EA NUKNR78BR EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $2.85 958942 EA HIGH $0.93 S2NR778BR PK 2 $2.23

224 FO15CR SHARP
THERMAL RIBBON/IMAGING FILM FOR FAX MODELS FO-1450/ 1650/ 

1850 FILM FAX BLACK  EA SHRFO15CR EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $18.59 541472 EA 510 $31.50 S1F015CR EA 500 $26.26

225 FO26ND SHARP LASER FAX TONER F/F2700M & FO2600 TONER FAX BLACK  EA SHRFO26ND EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $42.95 176263 EA 2000 $60.30 S5F026ND EA 2000 $40.33

226 FO28DR SHARP DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR SHARP FO2850 PLAIN PAPER FAX MACHINES DRUM FAX BLACK EA SHRFO28DR EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $69.95 541613 EA 20000 $83.70 S5F028DR EA 1 $40.46

227 FO28ND SHARP TONER CARTRIDGE FOR USE IN FO-2850 FAX MACHINE TONER FAX BLACK EA SHRFO28ND EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $50.09 488721 EA 3000 $71.10 S5F028ND EA 3000 $49.97

228 FO29DR SHARP DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR USE IN FO-2950M & FO-3800M DRUM FAX BLACK  EA SHRFO29DR EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $66.89 518561 EA 20000 $105.30 S5F029DR EA 1 $76.73

229 FO29ND SHARP
TONER/DEVELOPER CARTRIDGE FOR MODELS FO-2950;2970;3800;FO-

3800M;FO-2950M TONER FAX BLACK  EA SHRF029ND EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $52.71 518581 EA 3000 $87.30 S5F029ND EA 3750 $41.24

230 FO45ND SHARP
TONER/DEVELOPER CARTRIDGE FOR FO4500, 5500, 5600, 

6500, 6550 TONER FAX BLACK EA SHRFO45ND EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $56.61 785011 EA 5000 $104.40 S5F045ND EA 5600 $55.90

231 FO45DR SHARP
TONER/DEVELOPER CARTRIDGE FOR FO4500, 5500, 5600, 

6500, 6550 TONER FAX BLACK EA SHRFO45DR EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $56.37 319837 EA 20000 $92.70 S5F045DR EA 1 $53.76

232 FO47ND SHARP
TONER/DEVELOPER CARTRIDGE FOR FO4700, 5550, 5700, 

5800 TONER FAX BLACK EA SHRFO47ND EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $63.16 767591 EA 6000 $120.60 S5F047ND EA 6000 $65.91
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233 FO47DR SHARP DRUM UNIT FOR FO-5800, FO-5700, FO-5550, FO-4700 DRUM FAX BLACK EA SHRFO47DR EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $50.47 807871 EA 20000 $92.70 S5F047DR EA 1 $66.23

234 FO48ND SHARP
TONER/DEVELOPER CARTRIDGE FO3450, 3850, 4800, 4810, 

4850, 5400, 5450 TONER FAX BLACK EA SHRFO48ND EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $131.65 756203 EA 15000 $264.83 S5F048ND EA 1 $103.37

235 FO48DR SHARP
DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR FO3450, 3850, 4800, 4810, 4850, 5400, 

5450 DRUM FAX BLACK EA SHRFO48DR EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $137.47 591784 EA 30000 $176.40 S5F048DR EA 1 $144.82

236 UX15CR SHARP

REPLACEMENT THERMAL RIBBON CARTRIDGE FOR SHARP 
UX510A.500,510,

600M,1000,1100,1300,1400 FAX MACHINES RIBBON FAX BLACK EA SHRUX15CR EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $16.45 279292 EA 600 $28.47 S5UX15CR EA 500 $15.41

237 UX3CR SHARP
RIBBON/IMAGING FILM FOR MODELS UX470;460;355;340;310;305;300 

AND FO760 (2 / BOX) RIBBON FAX BLACK EA SHRUX3CR EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $12.57 888133 PK2 200 $13.50 S5UX3CR BX 200 $12.05

238 UX50ND SHARP TONER DEVELOP FOR UX-5000 ONLY TONER FAX BLACK EA SHRUX50ND EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $83.56 156261 EA 5600 $143.99 S5UX50ND EA 5600 $90.08

239 60425 TALLY FABRIC RIBBON FOR T2280/2280C RIBBON DOT MATRIX BLACK
FOR USE IN TALLY T2280/2280C DOT MATRIX 24-PIN 

PRINTERS EA GEC060425 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $15.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S2060425 EA 1 $11.37

240 60097 TALLY FABRIC RIBBON FOR T2265 RIBBON DOT MATRIX BLACK FOR USE IN TALLY T2265 DOT MATRIX 24-PIN PRINTERS EA GEC060097 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $26.83 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S2060097 EA 1 $20.42

241 02-81023-001 TROY
MICR 8100 / 8150 TONER CARTRIDGE;HIGH QUALITY FOR TROY MICR 

8100, HP LASERJET 8100, N, DN SERIES PRITNERS TONER PRINTER BLACK EA TRY0281023001 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $425.73 775121 EA 20000 $71.47 S102810230 EA 20000 $339.70

242 91679 VERBATIM
4049 HIGH YIELD TONER CART FOR IBM/LEXMARK OPTRA R L LX 

SERIES TONER FAX BLACK EA NUKLT104RM EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $99.10 123745 EA 14000 $339.71 S191679 EA 1 $91.93

243 CRM0023-10 VERIFONE
RIBBON CARTRIDGE FOR VERIFONE PRINTER 900 (P900), CREDIT 

CARD MACHINE RIBBON PRINTER RED / BLACK  EA CUYEC894BR EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $51.30 449623 PK6 NO RESPONSE $2.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

244 6R1046 XEROX

TONER CARTRIDGE FOR COUMENT CENTR 535/545/555, 
COPYCENTER C35/C45/C55, WORKCENTER M35/M45/M55, 

WORKCENTER PRO 35/45/55 TONER
COPIER/  
PRINTER BLACK  EA XER6R1046 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $161.23 981846 CT 60000 $195.30 S16R1046 CT 12000 $72.68

245 8R3816 XEROX
IMAGING CARTRIDGE REFILLS, BLACK,  TELECOPIER 7024 FACSIMILE 

TERMINAL TONER FAX BLACK  EA XER8R3816 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $35.70 249045 BX2 1236 $40.27 S58R3816 PK 1350 $22.68

246 101R203 XEROX DRUM CARTRIDGE FOR WORKCENTER PRO 635/645/657  (600 SERIES) DRUM FAX BLACK  EA XER101R203 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $131.11 524571 EA 10000 $206.10 S5101R203 EA 1 $119.95

247 106R365 XEROX TONER FOR WORKCENTER PRO 635/645/657 TONER FAX BLACK  EA XER106R365 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $29.96 489031 EA 3800 $50.40 S5106R365 EA 3800 $27.16

248 106R367 XEROX TONER FOR WORKCENTER PRO 535/545 FAX TONER FAX BLACK  EA XER106R367 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $29.40 489041 BX2 3600 $13.95 S5106R367 PK 3600 $6.99

249 106R402 XEROX TONER CARTRIDGE FOR WORKCENTER PRO 555/575 TONER FAX BLACK EA XER106R402 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $112.77 670494 EA 6000 $130.50 S5106R402 EA 6000 $95.88

250 113R288 XEROX DRUMS FOR WORKCENTER PRO 535/545 MULTIFUNCTION MACHINES DRUM FAX BLACK  EA XER113R288 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $159.64 770761 EA 8000 $198.00 S5113R288 EA 1 $145.44

251 113R457 XEROX DRUM FOR WORKCENTER PRO 555/575 DRUM FAX BLACK EA XER113R457 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $124.92 670615 EA 20000 $183.60 S5113R457 EA 1 $138.67

252 WTLEX XEROX OMNIFAX FAX EXPLORER TONER (TRADITIONAL BLACK) TONER FAX BLACK  EA XERWT5354 EA
STANDARD 

YIELD $156.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S1WTLEX EA 1 $32.99

253

17227591 
(formerly 
YMCKO) ZEBRA / SONY 5 PANEL, PHOTO ID PRINTING RIBBON, P200 SERIES RIBBON PRINTER 5 COLOR FOR USE IN ELTRON PRINTERS EA SON17227591 EA

STANDARD 
YIELD $71.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Q517227591 EA 1 $17.28
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