ITB #09-72 ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES FOR REPAIRS TO SAN LUIS PASS RV PARK [Bidders Name Graybar Elliott Electric Supply
Address 825 Industrial St, Suite E 3222 Manvel Road
DATE OF BID OPENING: Clute, Texas Pearland, TX 77584
Monday, July 13, 2009 at 10:00 A.M. Quoted By Ron Ellis Jason Burkes
Contact Ron Ellis Jason Burkes
Telephone Number 979-265-3100 281-412-7049
Fax Number 979-265-5150 281-412-7314
ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND PART # UOM QTY BRAND PART # UOM PRICE TOTAL PRICE BRAND PART # UOM PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1 [SWITCH FUSIBLE HD 600V 200A 3P NEUTRAL SQUARE D H364NRB EA 6 SQUARE D H364NRB EA $383.80 $2,302.80 CUTLER HAMMER DH364NRR EA $356.19 $2,137.14
2 |FUSETRON DUAL ELEMENT FUSE CLASS RK5 COOPER BUSSMAN FRS-R-200 EA 12 COOPER BUSSMAN FRS-R-200 EA $43.73 $524.76 EDISON ECSR200 EA $36.19 $434.28
3 |XFMR DRY 1PH 25KVA 240X480V-120/240V SQUARE D EE25S3H EA 1 SQUARE D EE25S3H EA $1,110.92 $1,110.92 CUTLER HAMMER S20N11525N EA $2,493.36 $2,493.36
4 |WEATHERSHIELD SQUARE D WS363 EA 1 SQUARE D WS363 EA $67.10 $67.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 |[SWITCH FUSIBLE HD 600V 100A 3P NEMA3R SQUARE D H363RB EA 1 SQUARE D H363RB EA $262.08 $262.08 CUTLER HAMMER DH363NRK EA $2,493.37 $2,493.37
6 |NEUTRAL ASSY INSULATED GRNDABLE CU/AL SQUARE D SN0610 EA 1 SQUARE D SN0610 EA $16.97 $16.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 |FUSETRON DUAL ELEMENT FUSE CLASS RK5 COOPER BUSSMAN FRS-R-100 EA 3 COOPER BUSSMAN FRS-R-100 EA $21.86 $65.58 EDISON ECSR100 EA $18.08 $54.24
8 |LIGHTING CONTRACTOR 600VAC 30AMP L + OPTIO SQUARE D 8903LO20V02 EA 5 SQUARE D 8903L0O20V02 EA $73.58 $367.90 CUTLER HAMMER LIGHTINGCON EA $498.67 $2,493.35
9 [LIGHTING CONTRACTOR 600VAC 60AMP NEMA +OP SQUARE D 8903SPO1V02 EA 1 SQUARE D 8903SPO1V02 EA $158.05 $158.05 CUTLER HAMMER LIGHTINGCON EA $2,493.36 $2,493.36
10 |TRFMR DRY 1PH 15KVA 240X480V-120/240V SQUARE D EE15S3H EA 1 SQUARE D EE15S3H EA $822.15 $822.15 CUTLER HAMMER S20N11S15N EA $2,493.36 $2,493.36
11 |WEATHERSHIELD SQUARE D WS363 EA 1 SQUARE D WS363 EA $67.10 $67.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 |TRFMR DRY 1HP 75KVA 240X480V-120/240V SQUARE D EE75S3H EA 6 SQUARE D EE75S3H EA $2,370.00 $14,220.00 CUTLER HAMMER T20P11E75 EA $415.56 $2,493.36
13 |WEATHERSHIELD SQUARE D WS364 EA 6 SQUARE D WS364 EA $67.10 $402.60 CUTLER HAMMER WS16 EA $34.95 $209.70
14 [SWITCH FUSIBLE HD 600V 200A 3P NEUTRAL SQUARE D H364NRB EA 1 SQUARE D H364NRB EA $383.80 $383.80 CUTLER HAMMER DH364NRK EA $356.19 $356.19
15 |FUSETRON DUAL ELEMENT FUSE CLASS RK5 COOPER BUSSMAN FRS-R-125 EA 3 COOPER BUSSMAN FRS-R-125 EA $43.73 $131.19 EDISON ECSR125 EA $36.19 $108.57
16 |MOLDED CASE CIRCUIT BREAKER 240V 200A SQUARE D QBL22200 EA 1 SQUARE D QBL22200 EA $67.30 $67.30 CUTLER HAMMER BW2200 EA $66.50 $66.50
17 |ENCLOSURE CIRCUIT BREAKER 240V 200A NEMA SQUARE D Q22200NRB EA 1 SQUARE D Q22200NRB EA $58.65 $58.65 CUTLER HAMMER ECB225R EA $61.35 $61.35
18 [SQ D PANEL 3R 200AMB 42CKT SQUARE D 1PH3W EA 1 SQUARE D 1PH3W EA $460.00 $460.00
19 |PANELBOARD ENCL/BOX TYPE3R/12 50H 20W SQUARE D MH50WP EA 1 SQUARE D MH50WP EA $193.70 $193.70 CUTLER HAMMER POWERLINE1A EA $2,493.36 $2,493.36
20 |SQ D PANEL 3R 100A MB 42CKT SQUARE D 1PH3W EA 1 SQUARE D 1PH3W EA $292.55 $292.55
21 |PANELBOARD ENCLOSURE/BOXTY PE 3R/12 38H 2 SQUARE D MH38WP EA 1 SQUARE D MH38WP EA $193.70 $193.70 CUTLER HAMMER POWERLINE1A EA $2,493.36 $2,493.36
22 |SQ D PANEL 3R 400A MB SQUARE D 1PH3W EA 6 SQUARE D 1PH3W EA $1,130.00 $6,780.00
23 |PANELBOARD ENCL/BOX TYPE3R/12 68H 20W SQUARE D MH68WP EA 6 SQUARE D MH68WP EA $193.70 $1,162.20 CUTLER HAMMER POWERLINE1A EA $415.56 $2,493.36
24 |UNITY 121236GRTNK 3R GUTTER UNITY 121236GRTNK EA 6 UNITY 121236GRTNK EA $152.80 $916.80 HOFFMAN A121236RT EA $278.13 $1,668.78
25 |120 V 50/60 HZ. 1800 WATT INTIN SWIVEL M INTERMATIC INC K4221C EA 8 INTERMATIC INC K4221C EA $10.26 $82.08 INTERMATIC K4221C EA $11.47 $91.76
26 |J-BOX W/CVR PVC COND BOX-8X8X6 EA 5 PVC COND BOX-8X8X6 EA $27.20 $136.00 CARLON 8X8X6SC EA $9.66 $48.30
27 |J-BOX W/ICVR PVC COND BOX-12X12X6 EA 1 PVC COND BOX-12X12X6 EA $28.65 $28.65 CARLON E989R EA $78.71 $78.71
28 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-4/0-STR-BLK-CUT REEL]  EA 10,860 | DOMESTIC BRAND [THHN-4/0-STR-BLK-CUT REELl  EA $1.9858 $21,565.79 |AMERICAN INSULATED| THHN40BK1000 EA $1.89201 $20,547.23
29 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-4-STR-BLK-1000R EA 700 DOMESTIC BRAND | THHN-4-STR-BLK-1000R EA $0.4150 $290.50  [AMERICAN INSULATED|  THHN4BK1000 EA $0.40544 $283.81
30 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-2-STR-GRN-CUT REEL|  EA 5,240 | DOMESTIC BRAND [THHN-2-STR-GRN-CUT REEL| EA $0.6440 $3,374.56 |AMERICAN INSULATED| THHN2GN1000 EA $0.62921 $3,297.06
31 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-6-STR-GRN-CUT REEL|  EA 480 DOMESTIC BRAND |THHN-6-STR-GRN-CUT REEL|  EA $0.2630 $126.24  [AMERICAN INSULATED|  THHN6GN1000 EA $0.25700 $123.36
32 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-2-STR-BLK-CUT REEL EA 900 DOMESTIC BRAND | THHN-2-STR-BLK-CUT REEL|  EA $0.6430 $578.70  [AMERICAN INSULATED|  THHN2BK1000 EA $0.62921 $566.29
33 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-8-STR-GRN-CUT REEL|  EA 18,360 | DOMESTIC BRAND |THHN-8-STR-GRN-CUT REEL| EA $0.1770 $3,249.72 [AMERICAN INSULATED|  THHN8GN1000 EA $0.17261 $3,169.12
34 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-6-STR-BLK-CUT REEL EA 36,000 | DOMESTIC BRAND | THHN-6-STR-BLK-CUT REEL| EA $0.2640 $9,504.00 |[AMERICAN INSULATED|  THHN6BK1000 EA $0.25700 $9,252.00
35 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-6-STR-WHT-CUT REEL|  EA 18,000 | DOMESTIC BRAND |THHN-6-STR-WHT-CUT REEL| EA $0.3330 $5,994.00 [AMERICAN INSULATED| THHN6WH1000 EA $0.25700 $4,626.00
36 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-8-STR-BLK-1000R EA 3,000 | DOMESTIC BRAND | THHN-8-STR-BLK-1000R EA $0.1770 $531.00 [AMERICAN INSULATED|  THHN8BK1000 EA $0.17261 $517.83
37 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-8-STR-WHT-CUT REEL|  EA 3,000 | DOMESTIC BRAND [THHN-8-STR-WHT-CUT REEL| EA $0.1770 $531.00 [AMERICAN INSULATED| THHN8WH1000 EA $0.17261 $517.83
38 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-10-STR-GRN-500S EA 3,000 | DOMESTIC BRAND [ THHN-10-STR-GRN-500S EA $0.1030 $309.00 [AMERICAN INSULATED| THHN10ST6N5000 EA $0.09957 $298.71
39 [WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-10-STR-BLK-500S EA 500 DOMESTIC BRAND | THHN-10-STR-BLK-500S EA $0.1030 $51.50 AMERICAN INSULATED| THHN10STBK500 EA $0.09957 $49.79
40 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-10-STR-RED-500S EA 500 DOMESTIC BRAND | THHN-10-STR-RED-500S EA $0.1030 $51.50 AMERICAN INSULATED| THHN10STRD500 EA $0.09957 $49.79
41 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-10-STR-WHT-500S EA 500 DOMESTIC BRAND | THHN-10-STR-WHT-500S EA $0.1030 $51.50 AMERICAN INSULATED| THHNWSTWH500 EA $0.09957 $49.79
42 |WIRE, 19 STRAND 600V 90DEG CU DOMESTIC BRAND THHN-12-STR-GRNT-500S EA 500 DOMESTIC BRAND | THHN-12-STR-GRNT-500S EA $0.0690 $34.50 AMERICAN INSULATED| THHN12STGN500 EA $0.06588 $32.94
43 |3/4 X 10 GALV GRND ROD ERICO PROD 813400 EA 8 ERICO PROD 813400 EA $17.65 $141.20 BMI 813400 EA $16.69 $133.52
44 |3/4 GRND ROD CLAMP THOMAS-BETTS G6 EA 8 THOMAS-BETTS G6 EA $1.50 $12.00 NSI 66 EA $1.88350 $15.07
45 |PEDESTAL MILBANK U5210-XL-75 EA 23 MILBANK U5210-XL-75 EA $278.25 $6,399.75 MILLBANK U5210XL75 EA $143.67 $3,304.41
46 |PEDESTAL PAD KIT MILBANK K5410 EA 23 MILBANK K5410 EA $21.90 $503.70 MILLBANK K5410 EA $14.12 $324.76
47 |440-480V 2HP 3PH 1 1/4" DISCHARGE LIBERTY LSG204M EA 2 LIBERTY LSG204M EA $1,052.50 $2,105.00 MEYERS WGL20433S EA $1,548.91 $3,097.82
48 [208-230V 2HP 1PH 1 1/4" DISCHARGE LIBERTY LSG202M EA 2 LIBERTY LSG202M EA $1,000.00 $2,000.00 MEYERS WGL202335 EA $1,548.91 $3,097.82
49  |440-480V 1HP 3PH 1 1/4" DISCHARGE LIBERTY LE104M2-2 EA 2 LIBERTY LE104M2-2 EA $630.00 $1,260.00 MEYERS WHR1043 EA $1,398.27 $2,796.54
50 |PUMP CONTROL PANEL LIBERTY AE34=4-171 EA 1 LIBERTY AE344171 EA $1,207.00 $1,207.00 MEYERS EP2043DEB EA $2,391.85 $2,391.85
51 |PUMP CONTROL PANEL LIBERTY AE24H=4 EA 1 LIBERTY AE24H4 EA $752.00 $752.00 MEYERS EP2023DEB EA $2,098.37 $2,098.37
52 |PUMP CONTROL PANEL LIBERTY AE34=4-141 EA 1 LIBERTY AE344141 EA $1,208.00 $1,208.00 MEYERS EP1021DEB EA $1,609.24 $1,609.24
TOTAL PRICE $93,106.79 $90,006.71 (Did not bid on all items)
DELIVERY TIME 3-5 WEEKS 7-14 DAYS
Price of wire can change ever Monday. There will be shipping charges for
COMMENTS Price of wire in effect at time of order. material that the vendor has to have shipped in (approximately $25.00).




