BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID # 09-55 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 18,
2009

10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

BIDDERSY]
NAME]

LM TRACTOR INC.

4002 QUAIL RUN DRIVH
PEARLAND, TX 77584

D & N CONTRACTOR INC.

117 CR 735
ANGLETON, TX 77515

JOHNSON LANDSCAPE
SERVICES

21410 PECAN BEND
DAMON, TX 77430

L & W EXCAVATORS, INC.

11136 FM 521
ROSHARON, TX 77583

CONTACT] CHAD THUMANN DANIEL DECKERT ELMER JOHNSON C.J. WALLER, JR.
TELEPHONH]
NUMBER) 281-914-5202 979-849-7214 979-553-3703 281-489-1774
FAX NUMBER 281-489-7708 979-849-7214 979-553-4037 281-595-2295
*3%LBP
LOCAL BIDDERS *3%LBP *3%LBP *3%LBP
DESCRIPTION Comm Code |PREFERRENCE LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE

1.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR

BRAZORIA COUNTY

PRICE PER MILE

PRICE PER MILE

PRICE PER MILE

PRICE PER MILE

$161.50 $249.49 $310.00
1.1 SOUTH SERVICE CENTER 988-75 ($156.65) ($242.01) NO BID ($300.70)
$129.15 $238.48 $127.77 $116.00
1.2 CENTRAL SERVICE CENTER 988-75 ($125.28) ($231.33) ($123.94) ($112.52)
$295.00 $350.00 $320.00
1.3 NORTH SERVICE CENTER 988-75 ($286.15) ($339.50) NO BID ($310.40)
$121.15 $243.49 $125.18 $305.00
1.4 WEST SERVICE CENTER 988-75 ($117.52) ($236.19) ($121.42) ($295.85)

2.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR

BRAZORIA COUNTY

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

$69.49
($67.41)
$109-00 Incl. 1 Tractor;1 Truck;1 Weedeater $130-00

COST PRICE PER EACH HOUR ($105.73) operator - ($126.10)
2.1 HOURLY COST OF 15 FOOT
MOWER WITH OPERATOR AVAILABLE
FOR ASSISNMENT TO THIS $70.00 $39.28 $34.50 $39.50
CONTRACT 988-75 ($67.90) ($38.10) ($33.40) ($38.31)
2.2 HOURLY COST OF 1/2 TON PICKUP
WITH OPERATOR AVAILABLE FOR $30.00 $15.20 $17.10 $27.50
ASSISNMENT TO THIS CONTRACT 988-75 ($29.10) ($14.74) ($16.59) ($26.67)
2.1 HOURLY COST OF WEED EATERS
WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR $9.00 $15.01 $15.10 $23.50
ASSISNMENT TO THIS CONTRACT 988-75 ($8.73) ($14.56) ($14.65) ($22.79)

LIST OTHER EQUIPMENT WITH HOURLY COST

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

TRACTOR/15' MOWER 4 WD TRACTOR W/6'CUTTER &
SLOPE MOWER OPERATOR OPERATOR 90 HP DOZER
$70.00 $45.00 $24.20 $80.00
988-75 ($67.90) ($43.65) ($23.47) ($77.60)
COMMERICIAL LAWN 2WD TRACTOR W/BOOM CUTTER &
MOWER/OPERATOR OPERATOR HUAL TRUCK / SMALL
$55.00 $41.20 $100.00
988-75 ($53.35) ($39.96) ($97.00)
TRUCK/CHAINSAW/
OPERATOR CHAINSAW W/OPERATOR HAUL TRUCK / LARGE
$60.00 $17.10 $165.00
988-75 ($58.20) ($16.59) ($160.05)
SKID STEER/IOPERATOR
(DEBRIS REMOVAL) CHIPPER W/TRUCK & OPERATOR DUMP TRUCK TANDEM
$60.00 $38.20 $48.50
988-75 ($58.20) ($37.05) ($47.04)
TRUCK/32'FLATBED TRAILER TRUCK W/DUMP TRAILER &
OPERATOR OPERATOR LONG STICK TRACK HOE (60')
$50.00 $25.00 +1.00 / MILE $95.00
988-75 ($48.50) ($24.25) ($92.15)
TRACTOR/FRONT END LOADER/
BOXBLADE/OPERATOR JD450HLT DOZER W/OPERATOR TRACK HOE
$50.00 $60.00 490.00
988-75 ($48.50) ($58.20) (8475.30)
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID # 09-55 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

BIDDERSY]

DATE OF BID OPENING NAME}

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 18,
2009

10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

LM TRACTOR INC.

4002 QUAIL RUN DRIVH
PEARLAND, TX 77584

D & N CONTRACTOR INC.

117 CR 735
ANGLETON, TX 77515

JOHNSON LANDSCAPE
SERVICES

21410 PECAN BEND
DAMON, TX 77430

L & W EXCAVATORS, INC.

11136 FM 521
ROSHARON, TX 77583

CONTACT] CHAD THUMANN DANIEL DECKERT ELMER JOHNSON C.J. WALLER, JR.
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER) 281-914-5202 979-849-7214 979-553-3703 281-489-1774
FAX NUMBER 281-489-7708 979-849-7214 979-553-4037 281-595-2295

DESCRIPTION Comm Code

TOTAL NUMBER OF MACHINES
CONTRACTOR WILL HAVE AVAILABLE TO
WORK ON THIS PROJECT SIMULTANEOUSLY

*3%LBP
LOCAL BIDDERS

PREFERRENCE

9 TRACTORS & MOWERS

*3%LBP
LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE

6- TRACTORS/15'MOWERS

*3%LBP
LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE

*Vendor stated will aquire more
equipment if necessary

5-4WD TRACTOR W/15'CUTTER

*3%LBP
LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE

4-15' MOWERS

988-75 5 TRUCKS & WEEDEATERS 1- 8 MOWER 2-4WD TRACTOR W/6' CUTTER 2-1/2 TON PICKUPS
2- SERVICE TRUCKS/ 1-2WD TRACTOR W/BOOM
988-75 WEEDEATERS CUTTER 2-WEEDEATERS
988-75 1-6' MOWER 1-2WD TRACTOR W/6'CUTTER 2-6' MOWERS
Contractor Information:
Number of years in business? 11 6 22 26
Contractor Information:
Will your company subcontract mowing of this
contract? NO NO NO NO
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE
SUBMITTED A NO BID FO NORTH &
ADDITIONAL COMMENTS NONE NONE SOUTH SERVICE CENTERS NONE
BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
INCLUDED ADDENDUM 1 INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED NOTICE INCLUDED
INSURANCE INCLUDED INCLUDED NONE INCLUDED INCLUDED
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID # 09-55 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 18,
2009

10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

BIDDERSY]
NAME]

COASTAL MAINTENANCE

1036 CR 285
ALVIN, TX 77511

DANFORD MAINTENANCE
SERVICE INC.

1516 CR 654E
BRAZORIA, TX 77422

KB TRACTOR & MOWING

23917 DORRINGTON
ESTATE LANE

CONROE, TX 77385

CONTACT] CHRIS MANTEL JASON DANFORD KENNETH BLOW
TELEPHONH]
NUMBER) 281-482-3343 979-798-6098 281-296-2484
FAX NUMBER 281-482-3411 979-798-6181 281-419-4242
*3%LBP *3%LBP
DESCRIPTION Comm Code |LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE

1.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR

BRAZORIA COUNTY

PRICE PER MILE

PRICE PER MILE

PRICE PER MILE

$167.80 $190.00

1.1 SOUTH SERVICE CENTER 988-75 ($162.77) ($184.30) NO BID
$123.90

1.2 CENTRAL SERVICE CENTER 988-75 ($120.18) NO BID $140.00
$149.70

1.3 NORTH SERVICE CENTER 988-75 ($145.21) NO BID NO BID
$215.00 $185.00

1.4 WEST SERVICE CENTER 988-75 ($208.55) ($179.45) $140.00

2.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR

BRAZORIA COUNTY

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

$90.36
COST PRICE PER EACH HOUR ($87.65) - $221.00
2.1 HOURLY COST OF 15 FOOT
MOWER WITH OPERATOR AVAILABLE
FOR ASSISNMENT TO THIS $4l'37 $37'95
CONTRACT 988-75 ($40.13) ($36.81) $100.00
2.2 HOURLY COST OF 1/2 TON PICKUP
WITH OPERATOR AVAILABLE FOR $28.29 $18.70
ASSISNMENT TO THIS CONTRACT 988-75 ($27.44) ($18.14) $28.00
2.1 HOURLY COST OF WEED EATERS
WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR $20.70 $18.70
ASSISNMENT TO THIS CONTRACT 988-75 ($20.88) ($18.14) 8.00 /WEEDEATER

LIST OTHER EQUIPMENT WITH HOURLY COST

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

TRACTOR & 6' MOWER

SLOPE MOWER W/OPERATOR W/OPERATOR
$61.70 $31.00 SLOPE MOWER
988-75 ($59.85) ($30.07) $85.00
6 MOWER W/OPERATOR TRACTOR & 10'MOWER W/OPERATOR
33.12 $35.00
988-75 ($32.13) ($33.95)

40 TON HAUL TRUCK

SLOPE MOWER W/OPERATOR

$120.00 $47.00

988-75 ($116.40) ($45.59)
CASE 580 BACKHOE LABOR

$72.00 $18.65

988-75 ($69.84) ($18.09)

988-75

LAWN TRACTOR W/OPERATOR
$28.50
($27.64)

988-75
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID # 09-55 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

BIDDERSY]

DATE OF BID OPENING NAME}

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 18,
2009

10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

COASTAL MAINTENANCE

1036 CR 285
ALVIN, TX 77511

DANFORD MAINTENANCE
SERVICE INC.

1516 CR 654E
BRAZORIA, TX 77422

KB TRACTOR & MOWING

23917 DORRINGTON
ESTATE LANE

CONROE, TX 77385

TOTAL NUMBER OF MACHINES
CONTRACTOR WILL HAVE AVAILABLE TO
WORK ON THIS PROJECT SIMULTANEOUSLY

30-15' MOWERS

CONTACT] CHRIS MANTEL JASON DANFORD KENNETH BLOW
TELEPHONH]
NUMBER) 281-482-3343 979-798-6098 281-296-2484
FAX NUMBER 281-482-3411 979-798-6181 281-419-4242
*3%LBP *3%LBP
DESCRIPTION Comm Code |LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE

10-TRACTORS

988-75 6-6' MOWERS 10-15' MOWERS 1-SLOPE (IF NEEDED)
988-75 8-SLOPE MOWERS 2-6' MOWERS 2-6'(IF NEEDED)
2-SLOPE MOWERS
6-TRUCKS
988-75 10-TRUCKS 8- WEEDEATERS
Contractor Information:
Number of years in business? 20 12 7
Contractor Information:
Will your company subcontract mowing of this
contract? NO NO NO
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE NONE NONE
ADDITIONAL COMMENTS NONE NONE NONE
BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
INCLUDED ADDENDUM 1 ADDENDUM NOTICE INCLUDED NONE
INSURANCE INCLUDED NONE INCLUDED INCLUDED
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID # 09-55 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERSY]
NAME]

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 18,
2009

10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

TG TRACTOR & MOWING

11942 UPPER HOLLOW
HOUSTON, TX 77067

TRI COUNTRY
CONTRACTORS

PO BOX 2822
ANGLETON, TX 77516

CONTACT] TROY GOODEN JEROME NOVAK
TELEPHONH]
NUMBER) 713-550-2470 281-865-8081
FAX NUMBER - 281-412-0885
*3%LBP
DESCRIPTION Comm Code LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE

1.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR

BRAZORIA COUNTY

PRICE PER MILE

PRICE PER MILE

$259.47
1.1 SOUTH SERVICE CENTER 988-75 NO BID ($251.69)
1.2 CENTRAL SERVICE CENTER 988-75 $145.00 NO BID

$242.47
1.3 NORTH SERVICE CENTER 988-75 NO BID ($235.20)
1.4 WEST SERVICE CENTER 988-75 $135.00 NO BID

2.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR

BRAZORIA COUNTY

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

COST PRICE PER EACH HOUR $305.00 -

2.1 HOURLY COST OF 15 FOOT

MOWER WITH OPERATOR AVAILABLE

FOR ASSISNMENT TO THIS $41.15
CONTRACT 988-75 $140.00 ($39.92)
2.2 HOURLY COST OF 1/2 TON PICKUP

WITH OPERATOR AVAILABLE FOR $18.97
ASSISNMENT TO THIS CONTRACT 988-75 30.00 / OPERATOR ($18.40)
2.1 HOURLY COST OF WEED EATERS

WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR $24.75
ASSISNMENT TO THIS CONTRACT 988-75 10.00 / OPERATOR ($24.01)

LIST OTHER EQUIPMENT WITH HOURLY COST

PRICE PER HOUR

PRICE PER HOUR

988-75

SLOPE MOWER
$125.00

CHAIN SAW & OPERATOR
$25.00
($24.25)

988-75

ADDTL OPERATOR
$18.57
($18.01)

988-75

988-75

988-75

988-75
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID # 09-55 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

BIDDERSY]
DATE OF BID OPENING NAME]

TG TRACTOR & MOWING

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 18,
2009

10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

11942 UPPER HOLLOW
HOUSTON, TX 77067

TRI COUNTRY
CONTRACTORS

PO BOX 2822
ANGLETON, TX 77516

TOTAL NUMBER OF MACHINES
CONTRACTOR WILL HAVE AVAILABLE TO
WORK ON THIS PROJECT SIMULTANEOUSLY

CONTACT] TROY GOODEN JEROME NOVAK
TELEPHONH]
NUMBER) 713-550-2470 281-865-8081
FAX NUMBER - 281-412-0885
*3%LBP
DESCRIPTION Comm Code LOCAL BIDDERS PREFERRENCE

5-MOWERS

988-75

1 SLOPE (IF NEEDED)

2-1/2 TON TRUCKS

988-75

2-6' (IF NEEDED)

3-WEEDEATERS W/OPERATORS

988-75

Contractor Information:

Number of years in business? 3 1
Contractor Information:
Will your company subcontract mowing of this
contract? NO NO
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE NONE
PHYSICAL ADDRESS IN

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS NONE PEARLAND, TX

BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED DID NOT INCL PG 23 & 24 INCLUDED
INCLUDED ADDENDUM 1 NONE NONE
INSURANCE INCLUDED NONE NONE
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