BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION - ESTIMATED QTY ANALYSIS

DATE OF BID OPENING: BIDDERS NAME RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY
Friday, May 1, 2009 8930 LAWNDALE STE B 4211 COLCHESTER CT
10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME HOUSTON, TX 77501 COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842
CONTACT] STAN JONES RICK BENNETT
QUOTED BY| STAN JONES RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONE}
NUMBER] 713-924-6929 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER 713-921-0074 979-690-8369
Person to contact
for placing orders STAN JONES RICK BENNETT
DESCRIPTION Code | County ID
1.0 SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS
Extended Price/gal. Extended
Price/gal. Price Loaded| Extended Loaded Price Loaded| Extended
1.1 ROUNDUP PRO (41% Isopropylamine Loaded Onto | Price/gal. onto Co. Price Onto Co. Price/gal. onto Co. Price
Salt of Glyphosate) UOM Co. Trucks |Delivered Trucks Delivered UOM Trucks Delivered Trucks Delivered
1 gallon size 675-90 824 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 825 GAL $ 39.44 | $ 39.44 | $ 98.60 [ $ 98.60 |GAL $ 3840|$% 38.40 | $ 96.00 | $ 96.00
30 gallon drum 675-90 826 DRUM $ 37.24 | $ 37.24 1% 1,117.20 [ $ 1,117.20 |DRUM $ 3575|$% 35.75|$% 1,072.50 [ $ 1,072.50
Surfactant - NAME 675-55 RED RIVER 90 NONE NEEDED
Surfactant Price Per Gallon $6.70 N/A
State Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL N/A
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5 -
Extended Price/gal. Extended
Price/gal. Price Loaded| Extended Loaded Price Loaded| Extended
Loaded Onto | Price/gal. onto Co. Price Onto Co. Price/gal. onto Co. Price
ALTERNATE FOR ROUNDUP PRO: UOM Co. Trucks |Delivered Trucks Delivered UOM Trucks Delivered Trucks Delivered
List Name RAZOR PRO GLYSTAR PLUS
1 gallon size 675-90 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 GAL $ 24.00 [ $ 24.00 [ $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 JGAL $ 2650 |$ 26.50 [ $ 66.25 [ $ 66.25
30 gallon drum 675-90 DRUM $ 2350 [ $ 2350 [$ 705.00|$  705.00 JDRUM $ 2525|$% 2525 [$ 75750 |$  757.50
Surfactant appropriate for use
with RAZOR PRO NONE NEEDED
Surfactant - NAME 675-55 RED RIVER 90 N/A
Surfactant Price Per Gallon $6.70 N/A
State Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL N/A
Extended Price/gal. Extended
Price/gal. Price Loaded| Extended Loaded Price Loaded| Extended
1.2 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE Loaded Onto | Price/gal. onto Co. Price Onto Co. Price/gal. onto Co. Price
(50.2% Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate) UOM _ [Co. Trucks |Delivered Trucks Delivered UOM _ [Trucks Delivered Trucks Delivered
1 gallon size 675-90 824 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 825 GAL $ 45.00 | $ 45.00 |$ 11250 | $ 112.50 JGAL $ 4375|$% 43.75|%  109.74 | $ 109.38
30 gallon drum 675-90 826 DRUM $ 4440 | $ 44.40 | $ 1,332.00 | $ 1,332.00 |DRUM $ 4325|% 43.25|$% 1,297.50 [ $ 1,297.50
Surfactant - NAME 675-55 RED RIVER 90 INLET 90
Surfactant Price Per Gallon $6.70 $12.00
State Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL 1 QT /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5 5
Extended Price/gal. Extended
Price/gal. Price Loaded| Extended Loaded Price Loaded| Extended
ALTERNATE FOR ROUNDUP PRO Loaded Onto | Price/gal. onto Co. Price Onto Co. Price/gal. onto Co. Price
CONCENTRATE: UOM _ [Co. Trucks |Delivered Trucks Delivered UOM _ [Trucks Delivered Trucks Delivered
List Name ACCORD XRT Il N/A
1 gallon size 675-90 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID JGAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 GAL $31.50 $31.50 $78.75 $78.75 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 gallon drum 675-90 DRUM $31.00 $31.00 $930.00 $930.00 |DRUM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Surfactant appropriate for use
with ACCORD XRT Il N/A
Surfactant - NAME 675-55 RED RIVER 90 INLET 90
Surfactant Price Per Gallon $6.70 $12.00
State Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL 1 QT /100 GAL
Extended Price/gal. Extended
Price/gal. Price Loaded| Extended Loaded Price Loaded| Extended
1.3 RODEO (53.5% Isopropylamine Salt Loaded Onto | Price/gal. onto Co. Price Onto Co. Price/gal. onto Co. Price
of Glyphosate). UOM _ [Co. Trucks |Delivered Trucks Delivered UOM _ [Trucks Delivered Trucks Delivered
1 gallon size 675-90 827 | AL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 828 GAL $ 52.00 | $ 52.00 [$ 130.00 | $ 130.00 JGAL $44.80 $44.80 $112.00 $112.00
30 gallon drum 675-90 829 |prum $ 51.00]|$ 51.00 [ $ 1,530.00 | $ 1,530.00 |DRUM $44.80 $44.80 $1,344.00 | $1,344.00
Surfactant - NAME 675-55 1491 RED RIVER 90 INLET 90
Surfactant Price Per Gallon $6.70 $12.00
State Mixing Rate 2 QTS /100 GAL 1QT /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5 5




BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION - ESTIMATED QTY ANALYSIS

DATE OF BID OPENING: BIDDERS NAME RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY
Friday, May 1, 2009 8930 LAWNDALE STE B 4211 COLCHESTER CT
10:00 A.M., LOCAL TIME HOUSTON, TX 77501 COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842
CONTACT] STAN JONES RICK BENNETT
QUOTED BY| STAN JONES RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONH]
NUMBER] 713-924-6929 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER] 713-921-0074 979-690-8369
Person to contact
for placing orders STAN JONES RICK BENNETT
DESCRIPTION Code County ID
Extended Price/gal. Extended
Price/gal. Price Loaded| Extended Loaded Price Loaded| Extended
Loaded Onto | Price/gal. onto Co. Price Onto Co. Price/gal. onto Co. Price
ALTERNATE FOR RODEO: 675-90 UOoM Co. Trucks |Delivered Trucks Delivered UOM  [Trucks Delivered Trucks Delivered
Name AQUANEAT AQUASTAR
1 gallon size GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2-1/2 gallon size GAL $ 31.00 [ $ 31.00 [ $ 7750 [ $ 77.50 JGAL $30.95 $30.95 $77.38 $77.38
30 gallon drum DRUM $ 20.50 [ $ 30.50 | $ 915.00 [ $ 915.00 |DRUM $30.25 $30.25 $907.50 $907.50
Surfactant appropriate for use with
having TNRCC approval for
aquatic use. 675-55 1491 AQUANEAT AQUASTAR
Surfactant - NAME RED RIVER 90 INLET 90
Surfactant Price Per Gallon $6.70 $12.00
State Mixing Rate 2 QTS /100 GAL 1 QT /100 GAL
Extended Price/gal. Extended
Price/gal. Price Loaded| Extended Loaded Price Loaded| Extended
1.4 GARLON 3A (31.8% Triclopyr Acid, 3 Loaded Onto | Price/gal. onto Co. Price Onto Co. Price/gal. onto Co. Price
Ib./gal.) UOM _ [Co. Trucks |Delivered Trucks Delivered UOM _ [Trucks Delivered Trucks Delivered
1 gallon size 675-90 830 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 831 GAL $ 68.00 [ $ 68.00 [$ 170.00 | $ 170.00 JGAL $ 6650 |$% 6650 [$ 166.25|$ 166.25
30 gallon drum 975-90 832 DRUM $ 67.50 [ $ 67.50 [ $ 2,025.00 [ $ 2,025.00 |DRUM $ 66.50|$ 66.50 [ $ 1,995.00 [ $ 1,995.00
Surfactant - NAME 675-55 RED RIVER 90 INLET 90
Surfactant Price Per Gallon $6.70 $12.00
State Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL 1 QT /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5 5
Extended Price/gal. Extended
1.5 ARSENAL (Pyridine carboxylic acid with Price/gal. Price Loaded| Extended Loaded Price Loaded| Extended
propanamine salt - 27.76%, Inert ingredients - Loaded Onto | Price/gal. onto Co. Price Onto Co. Price/gal. onto Co. Price
72.4%) - Low Usage Item UOM Co. Trucks |Delivered Trucks Delivered UOM Trucks Delivered Trucks Delivered
1 gallon size 675-90 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 833 GAL $ 72.00 [ $ 7200 [$ 180.00 | $ 180.00 JGAL $ 169.80 | $ 169.80 | $ 42450 | $  424.50
15 gallon drum 675-90 DRUM $ 72.00 [ $ 72.00 [$ 1,080.00 [ $ 1,080.00 JDRUM $ 169.80 | $ 169.80 | $ 2,547.00 | $ 2,547.00
30 gallon drum 675-90 DRUM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID DRUM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Surfactant - NAME 675-55 RED RIVER 90 INLET 90
Surfactant Price Per Gallon $6.70 $12.00
State Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL 1 QT /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5 5
1.6 PLATEAU { (+)-2- [4,5-dihydro-4-
methyl-4-(1-methylethy)-5-oxo-1H-imidazol Extended Price/gal. Extended
2-yl]1-5-methyl-3pyridine carboxylic acid} - Price/gal. Price Loaded| Extended Loaded Price Loaded| Extended
not less than 22%. Inert ingredients - Loaded Onto | Price/gal. onto Co. Price Onto Co. Price/gal. onto Co. Price
76.4% - Low Usage Item 675-90 1460 UOM _ [Co. Trucks |Delivered Trucks Delivered UOM _ [Trucks Delivered Trucks Delivered
1 gallon size 675-90 GAL $ 210.00 | $ 21000 {$ 21000 [$  210.00 |GAL $ 19750 | $ 19750 | $ 19750 | $ 197.50
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 GAL $ 210.00 | $ 21000 [$ 52500 [$ 525.00 JGAL $ 19750 | $ 19750 | $ 493.75|$  493.75
15 gallon size 675-90 DRUM $ 205.00|$ 205.00 [ $ 3,075.00 [ $ 3,075.00 |DRUM $ 19750 | $ 19750 | $ 2,962.50 | $ 2,962.50
30 gallon drum 675-90 DRUM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID DRUM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Surfactant - NAME 675-55 RED RIVER 90 INLET 90
Surfactant Price Per Gallon $6.70 $12.00
State Mixing Rate 1-2 QTS /100 GAL 1 QT /100 GAL
DELIVERY: DAYS ARO 5 5




BID 09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION - ESTIMATED QTY ANALYSIS

DATE OF BID OPENING:

BIDDERS NAME]

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

Friday, May 1, 2009

8930 LAWNDALE STE B

4211 COLCHESTER CT

10:00 AM., LOCAL TIME

HOUSTON, TX 77501

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77842

CONTACT] STAN JONES RICK BENNETT
QUOTED BY| STAN JONES RICK BENNETT
TELEPHONE}

NUMBER] 713-924-6929 979-268-5206
FAX NUMBER 713-921-0074 979-690-8369

Person to contact

TOTAL ESTIMATED COST

for placing orders STAN JONES RICK BENNETT
DESCRIPTION Code County ID
1.7 DRIF-TROL 2 Deposition Aid — Drift Extended Price/gal. Extended
Retardant (Polyvinyl Polymer Price/gal. Price Loaded| Extended Loaded Price Loaded| Extended
(Polyacrylamide) 36%; Constituents. Loaded Onto | Price/gal. onto Co. Price Onto Co. Price/gal. onto Co. Price
Ineffective as Spray Adjuvant 64%). UOM Co. Trucks |Delivered Trucks Delivered UOM Trucks Delivered Trucks Delivered
1 quart 675-90 QRT $8.50 $8.50[ $ 8.50 | $ 8.50 JQRT $ 8.90 | $ 8.90 | $ 8.90 | $ 8.90
1 gallon size 675-90 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 gallon drum 675-90 DRUM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID DRUM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
QUOTING SECURE ULTRA DRIFT CONTROL
Extended Price/gal. Extended

Price/gal. Price Loaded| Extended Loaded Price Loaded| Extended
1.8 DYE, HERBICIDE, TURF MARK, Loaded Onto | Price/gal. onto Co. Price Onto Co. Price/gal. onto Co. Price
LOCATE BLUE OR EQUIVALENT. UoM Co. Trucks |Delivered Trucks Delivered UoM Trucks Delivered Trucks Delivered
1 quart 675-90 QT $ 1050 [ $ 10.50 [ $ 10.50 [ $ 10.50 |JQT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 gallon size 675-90 GAL $ 31.00 | $ 31.00 | $ 31.00 | $ 31.00 |GAL $  41.00|$ 41.00 | $ 41.00 | $ 41.00
2-1/2 gallon size 675-90 GAL $ 2850 [ $ 2850 [ $ 71.25($ 71.25 |GAL $ 37.25|$% 37.25|$% 931.25|$ 931.25
30 gallon drum 675-90 DRUM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID DRUM NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID

$14,472.80 $15,607.66




