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BID #09-51HERBICIDES & APPLICATION OF HERBICIDES

ANALYSIS WITH MIXING RATES

DATE OF BID OPENING:

FRIDAY, MAY 1, 2009
10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

 

Price Per 
Qt.

Price Per 
Gal. Quantity

Extended 
Price

Price Per 
Qt.

Price Per 
Gal. Quantity

Extended 
Price

NO BID $37.24 2.5 $93.10 NO BID $35.75 2.5 $89.38

NO BID $67.50 2.5 $168.75 NO BID $66.50 2.5 $166.25

NO BID $6.70 2.5 $16.75 NO BID $12.00 2.5 $30.00

$8.50 NO BID 1.0 NO BID $8.90 NO BID 1.0 NO BID

TOTAL $278.60 TOTAL $285.63

979-690-8369

QUOTED BY

VENDOR INFORMATION VENDOR INFORMATION

RICK BENNETT
979-268-5206TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

COUNTY MIX RATE

Required mixing rate with 500 gallons of water  
(approx. 10 qts)

2.5 gal - Roundup Pro (30 gal drum price)

2.5 gal - Garlon (30 gal drum price)

2.5 gal - Surfactant (gal price)

1 gal - *Drif-trol 2 or Equiv. (qrt or gal price)

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES

CONTACT
COLLEGE STATION, TX 77845

4211 COLCHESTER

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

RICK BENNETT

*Vendor quoted Secure Ultra Drift Control 
*Vendor stated no surfactant needed for Roundup 

Pro; used Intel 90 in analysis

* Note: Angleton Service Center perfers not to use Drift Trol 2.  The prices in the analysis reflect the product bid as identified on the bid 
tabulation.  Red River Specialist is the low bidder in this analysis, which offers Red River 90 as their surfactant.  Helena Chemical offers Intel 90
.  Both vendors ship 5 days ARO.

BIDDERS  NAME

713.921.0074
713.924.6929

Stan Jones
Stan Jones

HOUSTON, TX 77012
8930 LAWNDALE, STE B
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