BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID #09-44 ROAD SAFETY METAL BEAM GUARD RAILING

ROADRUNNER TRAFFIC

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS NAME SUPPLY WYATT RESOURCES INC LONE STAR SAFETY AND SUPPLY
Thursday, May 7, 2009 ADDRESS 3200 MARQUITA DRIVE 5623 FM 359
2:00 P.M., Local Time FORT WORTH, TX 76116 FULSHEAR, TX 77441
CONTRACT TERM CONTACT MARILYN EDLUND JOE COMER Il
TELEPHONE # 800-633-2816 281-346-6100
FAX # 817-244-4819 281-346-0080
PRICE PER PRICE PER
1.0 METAL BEAM GUARD COMM EACH EACH
RAILING CODE |COUNTY ID#|MFG. NAME| MFG# | DELIVERED| MFG. NAME MFG# | DELIVERED NO BID
GUARD RAIL, 5/8" DIAMETER, 1-1/4" 33606
LONG GALVANIZED SPLICE BOLTS TRINITY TRINITY 33406 $0.85 NOBID | NOBID NO BID
WITH NUTS 570-28 1858 IND. H58-014 $0.70
GUARD RAIL, 5/8" DIAMETER, X 10" 35006
LONG WITH POST BOLT WITH NUT & TRINITY TRINITY 33406 $2.25 NOBID [ NOBID NO BID
ROUND WASHER 570-28 1859 IND. H58-10 $2.10
GUARD RAIL, 45 DEGREES RADIUS TRINITY 10456 $150.00 NOBID | NOBID NO BID
CONVEX, 12' 6" LONG 12 GALVANIZED TRINITY
PUNCHED 6' 3" RADIUS STEEL 570-28 1860 IND. 1045G $137.00
GUARD RAIL, 22-1/2 DEGREES RADIUS TRINITY 10226 $150.00 NOBID | NOBID NO BID
CONVEX, 12' 6" LONG 12 GALVANIZED TRINITY
PUNCHED 6' 3" RADIUS STEEL 570-28 1861 IND. 1023G $137.00
GUARD RAIL, 12" 6" LONG 12 TRINITY TRINITY 96 $85.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
GALVANIZED PUNCHED 6'3" 570-28 1862 IND. RG-126 $118.00
GUARD RAIL, 25' LONG 12 TRINITY TRINITY 606 $150.00 NOBID | NOBID NO BID
GALVANIZED PUNCHED 63" 570-28 1863 IND. RG-25 $155.00
GUARD RAIL, 7" DIAMETER X 6' 3" TRINITY TRINITY 41378 $30.00 NOBID | NOBID NO BID
LONG, WOODEN DOME TOP POST 570-28 1864 IND. P6ON $42.50
GUARD RAIL, 25' LONG 12 TRINITY TRINITY 430012IAS| $290.00 NOBID | NOBID NO BID
GALVANIZED TURNDOWN SECTION 570-28 1865 IND. PGOAS $308.00
GUARD RAIL, 90 DEGREE RADIUS TRINITY 10906 $165.00 NOBID | NOBID NO BID
CONVEX, 12' 6" LONG 12 GALVANIZED TRINITY
PUNCHED 6' 3" RADIUS STEEL 570-28 1866 IND. 1486G $161.00
GUARD RAIL, BRIDGE END SHOE WITH TRINITY TRINITY 9756 $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SPLICE BOLTS 570-28 1867 IND. BES $58.25
GUARD RAIL, FLARED END WING WITH TRINITY TRINITY 9016 $35.00 NOBID | NOBID NO BID
SPLICE BOLTS 570-28 1868 IND. FEW $42.75
GUARD RAIL POSTS WITH POST TRINITY TRINITY 430000606 $140.00 NOBID | NOBID NO BID
BOLTS 570-28 532 IND. P-60N $52.60
21-30
*MIN. ORDER 1000 LBS DELIVERED TO
DAYS TO DELIVERY ARO ONE LOCATION 1-2 WEEKS NO BID
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE NONE NO BID
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