BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

ITB# 09-43 ROAD SAFETY, FLASHERS, STROBES & WARNING LIGHTS

DATE OF BID OPENING

VENDOR NAME|

TRANTEX, INC

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST, INC.

ALL AMERICAN SALES CORPORATION

Thursday, May 7, 2009 ADDRESS 3310-D FRICK ROAD 8341 EPICENTER BLVD 1410 COLLEGE AVENUE
10:00 A.M., Local Time HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809 SOUTH HOUSTON, TX 77587
C ONTACT] DAVE POFFENBERGER DAVID VESPA MIKE URBANOVSKY
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE] 281-448-7711 863-984-1385 713-944-8400
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058 713-944-8404
1.0 FLASHERS, STROBE &
WARNING LIGHTS COMM | COUNTY MFG PRICE MFG PRICE MFG PRICE
HEAVY DUTY STROBE CODE ID # COLOR NAME MFG# PER EACH] NAME MFG# PER EACH] NAME MFG# PER EACH
HEAVY DUTY STROBE,
MAGNETIC / SUCTION BASE W/
CIGARETTE LIGHTER PLUG 055-57 3703 AMBER ECCO 6950 AMG $157.50 ECCO 6570AVM $122.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID
HEAVY DUTY STROBE, PERMANENT
MOUNTING HARDWARE 055-57 3704 AMBER ECCO 6950 $153.50 ECCcOo 6570A $91.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
REPLACEMENT FLASH TUBE 055-57 3705 N/A ECCO R6501 FT $17.95 ECCO R6501FT $16.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
COMM [ COUNTY ID PRICEPER | PRICEPER | QTYPER PRICEPER | PRICEPER | QTYPER PRICEPER | PRICEPER | QTYPER
1.2 FLASHER LIGHT BARRICADE CODE # MFG NAME| MFG # EACH CTN CTN MFG NAME| MFG # EACH CTN CTN MFG NAME| MFG # EACH CTN CTN
FLASHER LIGHT TO INCLUDE ALL
HARDWARE, BOLT, WRENCH, TAMPER
RESISTANT HARDWARE 550-96 3691 EMPCO #400 $14.75 $88.50 6 EMPCO | $ 100.00 $15.50 $155.00 10 NO BD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BATTERY 12 VOLT, SPRINGTON 550-96 7205 RAY-O-VAC 5V053 $3.00 $150.00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BATTERY 6 VOLT, TYPE HEAVY DUTY, RAY-O
SPRINGTOP, RAILROAD LANTERNS 550-96 7206 RAY-O-VAC 5V056 $17.75 $887.50 50 VAC 6VHD $3.00 $36.00 12 NO BD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BATTERY, 6VOLT, TYPE GENERAL
PURPOSE, SPRING TOP 550-96 7207 RAY-O-VAC 5V056 $17.75 $887.50 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
REPLACEMENT BULB 550-96 3692 RAY-O-VAC BULB $2.55 $61.50 24 USOMINATURE] 1850 $0.50 $50.00 100 NO BD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COMM [ COUNTY ID
1.3 QUAD FLASH STROBE CODE # COLOR _|[MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION 1TO9 10 + 1TO9 10 + 1TO9 10 +
QUAD FLASH STROBE, MAGNET MOUNT|  055-57 3716 AMBER ECCO 6950 AMG $157.50 $154.50 ECCO 6550MG $98.70 $97.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
QUAD FLASH STROBE, PERMANENT
MOUNT 055-57 3717 AMBER ECCO 6950 A $153.50 $150.50 ECCO 6550 $82.50 $81.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BULB REPLACEMENT 055-57 3718 ECCcO R6501FT $17.95 $17.45 ECco R6501FT $16.50 $15.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
QUAD FLASH STROBE, MAGNET MOUNT 6950 ANG/ 6550MG
WITH WIRE GUARD 055-57 3719 AMBER ECCO NG $187.50 $184.50 ECCO AB050BG $121.05 $120.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
QUAD FLASH STROBE, PERMANENT 6550
MOUNT WITH WIRE GUARD 055-57 3720 AMBER ECCO 6950A/WG $183.50 $180.50 ECCO AB050BG $110.75 $109.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BULB REPLACEMENT 055-57 3721 ECCO R6501FT $17.95 $17.45 ECCO R6501FT $16.50 $15.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING VENDOR NAME] TRANTEX, INC SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST, INC. ALL AMERICAN SALES CORPORATION
Thursday, May 7, 2009 ADDRESS] 3310-D FRICK ROAD 8341 EPICENTER BLVD 1410 COLLEGE AVENUE
10:00 A.M,, Local Time HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809 SOUTH HOUSTON, TX 77587
C ONTACT| DAVE POFFENBERGER DAVID VESPA MIKE URBANOVSKY
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE] 281-448-7711 863-984-1385 713-944-8400
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058 713-944-8404
1.0 FLASHERS, STROBE &
WARNING LIGHTS COMM | COUNTY MFG PRICE MFG PRICE MFG PRICE
HEAVY DUTY STROBE CODE ID # COLOR NAME MFG# PER EACH] NAME MFG# PER EACH] NAME MFG# PER EACH
COMM [ COUNTY ID
1.4 ROTATING BEACON CODE # COLOR || MEG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION 1TO9 10 + 1TO9 10 + 1TO9 10 +
TARGET
ROTATING BEACON 055-57 3675 AMBER TECH 448114-02 $105.50 $103.25 FEDERAL 448124 $76.05 $78.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TARGET
REPLACEMENT BULB 055-57 3676 N/A TECH BP2470/HI $7.95 $7.75 FEDERAL 439231 $15.85 $14.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TARGET 448330
BRANCH GUARD PIPE MOUNT 055-57 3677 N/A TECH 448330 $38.75 $37.50 FEDERAL 448320 $45.50 $44.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TARGET
BRANCH GUARD KIT 055-57 3678 N/A TECH 448330 $38.75 $37.50 FEDERAL 448330 $76.25 $74.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TARGET
MAGNETIC MOUNT KIT 055-57 3679 N/A TECH $ 448,410.00 $40.35 $39.50 FEDERAL 448410 $27.35 $26.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TARGET
VIBRATION MOUNT KIT 055-57 3680 N/A TECH 448310 $43.50 $42.25 FEDERAL 448310 $29.95 $28.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COMM [ COUNTY ID
1.5 MINI LIGHT BAR CODE # COLOR || MEG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION 1TO9 10 + 1TO9 10 + 1TO9 10 +
FEDERAL FEDERAL
MINI LIGHT BAR, PERMANENT MOUNT 055-57 3722 AMBER SIGNAL 450112-02 $157.50 $154.50 FEDERAL 451112 $132.40 $130.95 SIGNAL 450112-02 $107.41 $99.15
MINI LIGHT BAR, MAGNETIC MOUNT FEDERAL FEDERAL
WITH CIGARETTE LIGHTER PLUG 055-57 3723 AMBER SIGNAL 45214202 $168.50 $164.50 FEDERAL 452412 $173.85 $171.70 SIGNAL 452142-02 $123.18 $113.70
EDISON
REPLACEMENT BULBS 055-57 3724 N/A ECCO BP2470/HI $7.95 $7.75 FEDERAL 439238 $19.40 $20.85 CO. N/A $6.00 $5.00
1.6 HIDE AWAY STROBE - COMM [ COUNTY ID
BRAND OR EQUIVALENT CODE # MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH
1TO9 10 + 1TO9 10 + 1TO9 10 +
490HCL
90W 4HEAD
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID WHELEN | se90cccC $319.40 $309.40 CODE3 [KIT $239.50 $225.00
COMM [ COUNTY ID
1.7 LOW PROFILE MINI LIGHT BAR CODE # COLOR || MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION 1TO9 10 + 1TO9 10 + 1TO9 10 +
LOW PROFILE MINI LIGHT BAR,
PERMANENT MOUNT 055-57 3725 AMBER ECCO 5150CAA $275.00 $272.50 ECCO 5135X $124.90 $121.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LOW PROFILE MINI LIGHT BAR,
MAGNETIC MOUNT WITH CIGARETTE
LIGHTER PLUG 055-57 3726 AMBER ECCO 5150CAAVM $305.00 $302.50 ECCO 5135-VM $156.90 $155.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
REPLACEMENT BULBS 055-57 3727 N/A ECCO R6501FT $17.95 $17.45 ECCO R5812BH $11.20 $10.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBIR_ |, ¢4
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DATE OF BID OPENING

VENDOR NAME|

TRANTEX, INC

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST, INC.

ALL AMERICAN SALES CORPORATION

Thursday, May 7, 2009 ADDRESS 3310-D FRICK ROAD 8341 EPICENTER BLVD 1410 COLLEGE AVENUE
10:00 A.M., Local Time HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809 SOUTH HOUSTON, TX 77587
C ONTACT] DAVE POFFENBERGER DAVID VESPA MIKE URBANOVSKY
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE| 281-448-7711 863-984-1385 713-944-8400
FAX NUMBER| 281-591-6827 863-984-0058 713-944-8404
1.0 FLASHERS, STROBE &
WARNING LIGHTS COMM | COUNTY MFG PRICE MFG PRICE MFG PRICE
HEAVY DUTY STROBE CODE ID # COLOR NAME MFEG# PER EACH] NAME MFEG# PER EACH] NAME MFEG# PER EACH
2.0 PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLE LIGHTS COMM [ COUNTY ID
AND SIREN BOX CODE # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION 1705 6 TO 10 1705 6 TO 10 1705 6 TO 10
2.1 LIGHT BAR 055-57 3728 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,895.00 $1,895.00
REPLACEMENT BULBS 055-27 3729 NO BID NO BID $10.37
2.0 PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLE LIGHTS COMM [ COUNTY ID
AND SIREN BOX CODE # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION
BRAND ONLY 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10
2.2 LIGHT BAR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,887.67 $1,793.29
REPLACEMENT BULBS 055-27 NO BID NO BID $10.37
2.0 PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLE LIGHTS COMM [ COUNTY ID
AND SIREN BOX CODE # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION 1705 6 TO 10 1705 6TO 10 1TO5 6TO 10
2.3 SIREN CONTROL BOX 055-16 3730 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $349.69 $333.16
2.0 PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLE LIGHTS COMM [ COUNTY ID
AND SIREN BOX CODE # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION - BRAND ONLY 1705 6 TO 10 1705 6TO 10 1TO5 6TO 10
2.4 SIREN SPEAKER 055-16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $87.55 $83.73
2.0 PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLE LIGHTS COMM [ COUNTY ID
AND SIREN BOX CODE # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION - BRAND ONLY 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10
2.5 WIG WAG PROGRAMMABLE
FLASHER, AMBER, VARIED MULTI-
MODE FLASH PATTER WITH
CONVENTIONAL WIG WAG PATTERN 055-16 7398 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $49.87 $47.38
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DATE OF BID OPENING

VENDOR NAME|

TRANTEX, INC

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST, INC.

ALL AMERICAN SALES CORPORATION

Thursday, May 7, 2009 ADDRESS| 3310-D FRICK ROAD 8341 EPICENTER BLVD 1410 COLLEGE AVENUE
10:00 A.M., Local Time HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809 SOUTH HOUSTON, TX 77587
C ONTACT| DAVE POFFENBERGER DAVID VESPA MIKE URBANOVSKY
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE] 281-448-7711 863-984-1385 713-944-8400
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058 713-944-8404

1.0 FLASHERS, STROBE &
WARNING LIGHTS COMM | COUNTY MFG PRICE MFG PRICE MFG PRICE
HEAVY DUTY STROBE CODE ID # COLOR NAME MEG# PER EACH] NAME MEG# PER EACH] NAME MEG# PER EACH|
2.0 PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLE LIGHTS COMM COUNTY ID
AND SIREN BOX CODE # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION - BRAND ONLY 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10
2.6 REPLACEMENT MODULES FOR
LEDX ASSY (NON OPTIC) AMBER
ARROW 055-16 7399 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.67 $159.10
2.0 PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLE LIGHTS COMM COUNTY ID
AND SIREN BOX CODE # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION - BRAND ONLY 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10
2.7 REPLACEMENT MODULES FOR
LEDX ASSY (NON OPTIC) BLUE
FLASHING 055-16 7400 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $190.87 $171.78
2.0 PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLE LIGHTS COMM COUNTY ID
AND SIREN BOX CODE # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION - BRAND ONLY 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10
2.8 REPLACEMENT MODULES FOR
LEDX ASSY (NON OPTIC) RED
FLASHING 055-16 7401 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $190.87 $171.78
2.0 PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLE LIGHTS COMM COUNTY ID
AND SIREN BOX CODE # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION - BRAND ONLY 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10
2.9 REPLACEMENT MODULES FOR
LEDX ASSY (NON OPTIC) BLUE CORNER|  055-16 7402 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $381.75 $343.58
2.0 PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLE LIGHTS COMM COUNTY ID
AND SIREN BOX CODE # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION - BRAND ONLY 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10 1TO5 6 TO 10
2.10 REPLACEMENT MODULES FOR
LEDX ASSY (NON OPTIC) BLUE CORNER|  055-16 7403 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $381.75 $343.58

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS NONE NONE NONE

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION NONE NONE NONE
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