BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITB# 09-42 ROAD SAFETY, MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME LOVELINE INDUSTRIES, INC. ROADRUNNER TRAFFIC SUPPLY, INC. CENTERLINE SUPPLY LTD STROUD SAFETY APPAREL SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST INC.
[ THURSDAY, MAY 7, 2009 90 DAYTON AVENUE 3200 MARQUITA DRIVE 530 JESSE STREET 414 WEST 4TH STREET 8341 EPICENTER BLVD
at 1000 A.M. PASSAIC, NJ 07055 FORT WORTH, TX 76116 GRAND PRAIRIE, TX 75052 STROUD, OK 74079 LAKELAND, FL 33809
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY MORTON GOLDSTEIN MARILYN EDLUND CHE HUZAREVICH ROB NASH DAVID A VESPA
CONTACT DAN GOLDSTEIN MARILYN EDLUND CHE HUZAREVICH ROB NASH DAVID A VESPA
TELEPHONE 973-928-3427 800-633-2816 972-647-8300 918-968-2827 863-984-1385
FAX NUMBER 973-928-3428 817-244-4819 972-641-1221 918-968-0754 863-984-0058

1.0 AIRPORT WINDSOCKS (Must meet or exceed the following: RiverCity 267C or equivalent: 35mm PVC on polyester
broadloom fabric, 60 inch long, 2 inner leg snaps which form chaps, Unisex front closure snaps, corduroy collar with snaps,
badge holder, cape-vented back, detachable hood, one inside and one outside pocket)

DESCRIPTION

Comm
Code

COLOR PRICE PER EACH

= 10+

PRICE PER EACH
= 10+

PRICE PER EACH
-9 10+

PRICE PER EACH
-9 10+

PRICE PER EACH
-9 10+

County ID SIZE MFG. NAME MFG. #

MFG. NAME MFG. #

MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

[Windsock 035-92 3365 3'x8'x11" Red / Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Windsock 035-92 3366 3'x12'x9"
36" (throat
diameter) x 12"
18" (throat

diameter)x 8'

Red / Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Windsock 035-92 3367 Bright Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Windsock 035-92 3368 Bright Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Windsock Hardware Kit 035-92 7397 N/A

18" (throat
diameter) x 5'

N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Windsock 035-92 Red / Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

36" (throat
diameter)x 8'

Windsock 035-92 Red / Orange NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

2.0 BARRIER FENCE (Must meet or exceed the following: 4' X 100" rolls, mesh size 2" X 3/4", lightweight, 16 Ibs. or less,
color: orange)

A
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Comm
Code

T
DESCRIPTION B B R R RE RRRR R R PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL
MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

PRICE PER ROLL
MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

Fence, Safety 330-55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

*REQ'S MINIMUM
ORDER
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3.0 BARRIER TAPE (Estimated expenditure unknown) S S e

Comm

DESCRIPTION PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL
Code | County ID MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # RIS

$5.10
16 RLS/ CASE

$5.52
16 RLS/CASE

$5.10

16 RLS/CASE
$5.52

16 RLS/CASE
$9.24

8 RLS/CASE
$9.24

8 RLS/CASE

Barrier Tape, Caution Yellow 832-10 3285 3" X 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO

B322Y16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO B322Y16 $2.70

Barrier Tape, Caution Construction Area, Yellow 832-10 3286 3" x 200" NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO

B3222 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO B322Y2 $2.70

Barrier Tape, Caution Do Not Enter, Yellow 832-10 3287 3" x 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO

B3229 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO B322Y9 $2.70

Barrier Tape Yellow, No Writing 832-10 3287 3" x 200" NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO

B322Y NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO B322Y $2.70

Barrier Tape Caution, Yellow 832-10 3282 3"x 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO

B3102Y16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO B3102Y1 $6.80

Barrier Tape, Caution Construction Area, Yellow 832-10 3283 3" x 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO B3102Y2

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO N3102Y2 $6.80

$9.24

8 RLS/CASE
$9.24

8 RLS/CASE

Barier Tape, Caution Do Not Enter, Yellow 832-10 3284 3" x 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO

B3102Y9 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO B3102Y9 $6.80

Barrier Tape Yellow, No Writing 832-10 546 3" x 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO

B3102Y NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO B3102Y $6.80

Barrier Tape Dispenser 832-10 3289

N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO

B42 $4.50 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO N/A $0.70
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DATE OF BID OPENING

[THURSDAY, MAY 7, 2009

BIDDER'S NAME

LOVELINE INDUSTRIES, INC.

ROADRUNNER TRAFFIC SUPPLY, INC.

CENTERLINE SUPPLY LTD

STROUD SAFETY APPAREL

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST INC.

90 DAYTON AVENUE

3200 MARQUITA DRIVE

530 JESSE STREET

414 WEST 4TH STREET

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

at 1000 A.M. PASSAIC, NJ 07055 FORT WORTH, TX 76116 GRAND PRAIRIE, TX 75052 STROUD, OK 74079 LAKELAND, FL 33809
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY MORTON GOLDSTEIN MARILYN EDLUND CHE HUZAREVICH ROB NASH DAVID A VESPA
CONTACT DAN GOLDSTEIN MARILYN EDLUND CHE HUZAREVICH ROB NASH DAVID A VESPA
TELEPHONE 973-928-3427 800-633-2816 972-647-8300 918-968-2827 863-984-1385
FAX NUMBER 973-928-3428 817-244-4819 972-641-1221 918-968-0754 863-984-0058
4.0 RAIN SUIT

4.1 RAIN SUIT (Must meet or exceed the following: yellow with n
35mm PVC on polyester broadloom fabric; River city brand or eq

uuivalent)

0 reflector stripes, 3 piece to include jacket, pants, hood;

DESCRIPTION

Comm
Code

County ID SIZE

Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece

201-65

3381 M

Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece

201-65

3382 L

Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece

201-65

3383

Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece

201-65

3384

Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece

201-65

3385

Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece

201-65

3386

4.2 RAIN SUIT (Must meet or exceed the following: RiverCity 267C or equivalent: 35mm

60 in long; 2 inner leg snaps which form chaps; Unisex front cosure snaps; corduroy collar with snaps; badge holder, cape-

vented hood; one inside and one outside pocket)

i
i
i
i
i
i
i
i
i
i
i
i
i
|| WESTCHESTE
i
i
i
i
i
i
i
i
i
i
i
i

MFG. NAME

PRICE PER EACH

PRICE PER EACH

MFG. # =5

10+

MFG. NAME MFG. # L= 10+

PRICE PER EACH

MFG. NAME MFG. # = 10+

MFG. NAME

PRICE PER EACH

MFG. # =5

10+

MFG. NAME

PRICE PER EACH

MFG. # -

10+

WESTCHESTE
R

4035 $5.50

$5.25

CORDOVA R5353Y $10.95 $10.75

AIR GAS FR2003M $9.44 $8.88

CORDOVA

RS353Y $7.70

$7.50

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

WESTCHESTE
R

4035 $5.50

$5.25

CORDOVA R5353Y $10.95 $10.75

AIR GAS FR2003L $9.44 $8.88

CORDOVA

RS353Y $7.70

$7.50

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

WESTCHESTE
R

4035 $5.50

$5.25

CORDOVA R5353Y $10.95 $10.75

AIR GAS FR2003XL $9.44 $8.88

CORDOVA

RS353Y $7.70

$7.50

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

R

4035 $5.50

$5.25

CORDOVA R5353Y $10.95 $10.75

AIR GAS FR2003X2 $9.91 $9.32

CORDOVA

RS353Y $7.70

$7.50

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

WESTCHESTE
R

CORDOVA R5353Y

AIR GAS FR2003X3

CORDOVA

RS353Y

NO BID

NO BID

WESTCHESTE

s
PVC on polyester broadloom fabricff =5

CORDOVA R5353Y

AIR GAS FR2003X4

CORDOVA

RS353Y

NO BID

NO BID

DESCRIPTION Corn COLOR & PRICE PER EACH COLOR & PRICE PER EACH COLOR & PRICE PER EACH COLOR & PRICE PER EACH COLOR & PRICE PER EACH
Code |County ID SIZE MFG NAME MFG. # 1-9 10+ MFG NAME MFG. # 1-9 10+ MFG NAME MFG. # 1-9 10+ MFG NAME MFG. # 1-9 10+ MFG NAME MFG. # 1-9 10+

WESTCHESTE YELLOW BLACK YELLOW

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3387 S R 4160 $6.60 $6.35 CORDOVA RC35760 $12.75 $12.55 AIRGAS 267CS $10.85 $10.20 CORDOVA RC35Y60 $9.50 $9.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WESTCHESTE YELLOW BLACK YELLOW

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3388 M R 4160 $6.60 $6.35 CORDOVA RC35760 $12.75 $12.55 AIRGAS 267CM $10.86 $10.21 CORDOVA RC35Y60 $9.50 $9.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WESTCHESTE YELLOW BLACK YELLOW

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3389 L R 4160 $6.60 $6.35 CORDOVA RC35760 $12.75 $12.55 AIRGAS 267CL $10.86 $10.21 CORDOVA RC35Y60 $9.50 $9.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WESTCHESTE YELLOW BLACK YELLOW

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3390 XL R 4160 $6.60 $6.35 CORDOVA RC35760 $12.75 $12.55 AIRGAS 267CXL $10.86 $10.21 CORDOVA RC35Y60 $9.50 $9.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WESTCHESTE YELLOW BLACK YELLOW

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3391 2XL R 4160 $6.60 $6.35 CORDOVA RC35760 $12.75 $12.55 AIRGAS 267CX2 $11.38 $10.71 CORDOVA RC35Y60 $9.50 $9.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WESTCHESTE YELLOW BLACK YELLOW

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3392 3XL R 4160 $7.00 $6.80 CORDOVA RC35760 $12.75 $12.55 AIRGAS 267CX3 $11.92 $11.22 CORDOVA RC35Y60 $9.50 $9.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WESTCHESTE BLACK BLACK BLACK

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3393 4XL R 4160 $7.00 $6.80 CORDOVA RC35B60 $13.85 $13.65 AIRGAS 267CX4 $12.47 $11.74 CORDOVA RC35B60 $10.40 $10.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WESTCHESTE BLACK BLACK BLACK

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3394 5XL R 4160 $7.00 $6.80 CORDOVA RC35B60 $13.85 $13.65 AIRGAS 267CX5 $13.01 $12.24 CORDOVA RC35B60 $10.40 $10.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

" o | i i i i
5.0 SAFETY DRUMS WITH BASES (Shall be impact tant lored p - 36"high and aminimum of 18Il il S B S s s

in diameter, with reflectorized striping (two white reflective stripes) meeting MUTCD specifications. (Estimated annual

expenditure $2,800.00) All drums shall meet MUTCD

and shal

| be d or

as follows:

DELIVERY MUST BE MADE WITHIN 48 HOURS AFTER ORDER IS PLACED. All prices shall be per each in the

quantities stated.

DESCRIPTION Comm
Code | County ID|
Safety Drums with bases 36" X 18" diameter 550-43

MFG. NAME

25+

MFG. NAME 25+

PRICE PER EACH

25+

MFG. NAME

25+

MFG. NAME

25+

NO BID

NO BID

$55.00

NO BID

NO BID

6.0 SAFETY FLAGS (Estimated annual expenditure unknown)

Must meet or exceed the following: day glow red/orange

flag; solid vinyl (weighted); flag mounted on 3/4" diameter wood dowel; flag size 18" X 18")
DESCRIPTION Comm I\:;V(I];\'ﬁ!L PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
Code County ID| FLAG SIZE MFG. NAME MFG. # = 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # = 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # =9 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # =9 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # =9 10+
SAFETY
Safety Flag 350-60 554 18" x 18" 24" LOVELINE 118 $3.20 $2.80 IRON HORSE FLG1824 $4.50 $4.40 IH N18 $2.93 $2.64 - - $2.35 $2.25 ZONE SFW182Y $2.80 $2.50
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DATE OF BID OPENING

[THURSDAY, MAY 7, 2009

at 1000 A.M.

CONTRACT TERM

BIDDER'S NAME

LOVELINE INDUSTRIES, INC.

ROADRUNNER TRAFFIC SUPPLY, INC.

CENTERLINE SUPPLY LTD

STROUD SAFETY APPAREL

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST INC.

90 DAYTON AVENUE

3200 MARQUITA DRIVE

530 JESSE STREET

414 WEST 4TH STREET

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

PASSAIC, NJ 07055

FORT WORTH, TX 76116

GRAND PRAIRIE, TX 75052

STROUD, OK 74079

LAKELAND, FL 33809

QUOTED BY MORTON GOLDSTEIN MARILYN EDLUND CHE HUZAREVICH ROB NASH DAVID A VESPA
CONTACT DAN GOLDSTEIN MARILYN EDLUND CHE HUZAREVICH ROB NASH DAVID A VESPA

TELEPHONE 973-928-3427 800-633-2816 972-647-8300 918-968-2827 863-984-1385

FAX NUMBER 973-928-3428 817-244-4819 972-641-1221 918-968-0754 863-984-0058

B B
7.0 SAFETY VESTS (All vests must ve ANSI=ISEA 107-2004. High contrast ANSI breathable mesh surveyor vest, polyestdfi i i il
RoadTech manufacturing #0K-SVOZML or equivalent. (Estimated annual expenditure $2,650.00) Washable polyester;
zipperm, florescent colors, ANSI Class II; 2" 3M Scotchlite ™(7M;

inside, three (3) outside)

) trim; double horizontal stripe; five (5) pockets - two (2)

PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE
0 PSSR BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND)
Comm
Code | county ID SizE VEST 1-9 10-20 19 10-20 1-9 10-20 19 10-20 1-9 10-20 19 10-20 19 10-20 19 10-20 1-9 10-20 19 10-20
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3592 SM MESH NO BID NO BID $19.50 $18.75 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $16.25 $16.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID $18.90 $18.20
Reflective Stripe Size - 3/4" x 96' (26-38")
Vest, Orange with lime reflective siripe, elastic side band 34592 3592 L MESH NO BID NO BID $19.50 $18.75 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $16.25 $16.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID $18.90 $18.20
Reflective Stripe Size - 3/4" x 96' (38 -42")
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3593 XL MESH NO BID NO BID $19.50 $18.75 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $16.25 $16.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID $18.90 $18.20
Reflective Stripe Size - 3/4" x 104 (42-46")
vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastc side band 345-92 3594 X MESH NO BID NO BID $19.50 $18.75 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $16.25 $16.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID $18.90 $18.20
Reflective Stripe Size - 3/4" x 104" (48 - 52")
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3595 XL MESH NO BID NO BID $20.50 $19.75 NO BID NO BID $18.75 $18.25 NO BID NO BID $20.62 $20.31 $16.50 $16.25 $16.50 $16.25 NO BID NO BID $21.70 $20.95
Reflective Stripe Size - 3/4" x 106 (52 - 56")
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3596 L MESH NO BID NO BID $20.50 $19.75 NO BID NO BID $19.00 $18.50 NO BID NO BID $20.94 $19.41 $16.75 $16.50 $16.75 $16.50 NO BID NO BID $21.70 $20.95
Reflective Strip Size - 3/4" x 110" (56 - 64")
Vest, Orange with lime refiective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3613 (505?07_2") MESH NO BID NO BID $20.50 $19.75 NO BID NO BID $19.25 $18.75 NO BID NO BID $21.25 $20.44 $17.00 $16.75 $17.00 $16.75 NO BID NO BID $21.70 $20.95
PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE
REECINE BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND)
7.2 DESCRIPTION STRIPE ) ) ) ) )
SIZE
Comm

CLASS Il - MESH VEST

County

1D

ey

S

NO BID NO BID $19.50 $18.75 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $16.20 $16.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID $18.90 $18.20
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3615 S 2"

NO BID NO BID $19.50 $18.75 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $16.20 $16.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID $18.90 $18.20
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3602 M-L 2"

NO BID NO BID $19.50 $18.75 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $16.20 $16.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID $18.90 $18.20
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3603 XL 2"

NO BID NO BID $19.50 $18.75 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $16.20 $16.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID $18.90 $18.20
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3604 2XL 2"

NO BID NO BID 20.50 19.75 NO BID NO BID 18.75 18.25 NO BID NO BID 20.63 20.31 16.50 16.00 16.50 16.25 NO BID NO BID 21.70 20.95
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3605 3XL 2" S $ $ $ S S $ $ $ $ S S
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345.92 3606 XL o NO BID NO BID 205 19.75 NO BID NO BID $19.00 $18.50 NO BID NO BID $20.93 $20.63 $16.75 $16.50 $16.75 $16.50 NO BID NO BID $21.70 $22.95
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DATE OF BID OPENING

[THURSDAY, MAY 7, 2009

BIDDER'S NAME

LOVELINE INDUSTRIES, INC.

ROADRUNNER TRAFFIC SUPPLY, INC.

CENTERLINE SUPPLY LTD

STROUD SAFETY APPAREL

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST INC.

90 DAYTON AVENUE

3200 MARQUITA DRIVE

530 JESSE STREET

414 WEST 4TH STREET

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

at 1000 AM. PASSAIC, NJ 07055 FORT WORTH, TX 76116 GRAND PRAIRIE, TX 75052 STROUD, OK 74079 LAKELAND, FL 33809
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY MORTON GOLDSTEIN MARILYN EDLUND CHE HUZAREVICH ROB NASH DAVID A VESPA
CONTACT DAN GOLDSTEIN MARILYN EDLUND CHE HUZAREVICH ROB NASH DAVID A VESPA
TELEPHONE 973-928-3427 800-633-2816 972-647-8300 918-068-2827 863-084-1385
FAX NUMBER 973-928-3428 817-244-4819 972-641-1221 918-968-0754 863-084-0058
T seessas PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
S
- . . PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE
DESCRIPTION i H i BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND)
Comm | County |
CLASS Il Code D i 1-9 10-20 19 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 | 3616 s Mesh $23.25 $22.00 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $18.20 $18.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 34592 | 3607 M-L Mesh NO BID NOBID $23.25 $22.00 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $18.20 $18.00 $16.25 $16.00 NOBID NOBID $20.90 $20.60
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 | 3608 XL Mesh NOBID NO BID $23.25 $22.00 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $18.20 $18.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID $20.90 $20.60
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 34592 | 3609 2XL Mesh NO BID NO BID $23.25 $22.00 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $18.20 $18.00 $16.25 $16.00 NOBID NOBID $20.90 $20.60
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 | 3610 3XL Mesh NOBID NO BID $24.25 $23.00 NO BID NO BID $18.75 $18.25 NO BID NO BID $20.63 $20.31 $18.40 $18.20 $16.50 $16.25 NO BID NO BID $23.60 $23.30
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 34592 | 3611 axL Mesh NO BID NO BID $24.25 $23.00 NO BID NO BID $18.75 $18.25 NO BID NO BID $20.63 $20.31 $18.75 $18.50 $16.50 $16.25 NOBID NOBID $23.60 $23.30
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 s Mesh NOBID NO BID $23.25 $22.00 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $18.20 $18.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345.92 M-L Mesh NO BID NOBID $23.25 $22.00 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $18.20 $18.00 $16.25 $16.00 NOBID NOBID $20.90 $20.60
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 XL Mesh NOBID NOBID $23.25 $22.00 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $18.20 $18.00 $16.25 $16.00 NO BID NO BID $20.90 $20.60
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345.92 2XL Mesh NO BID NOBID $23.25 $22.00 NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.00 NO BID NO BID $20.31 $18.82 $18.20 $18.00 $16.25 $16.00 NOBID NOBID $20.90 $20.60
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3XL Mesh NOBID NO BID $24.25 $23.00 NO BID NO BID $18.75 $18.25 NO BID NO BID $20.63 $20.31 $18.40 $18.20 $16.50 $16.25 NO BID NO BID $23.60 $23.30
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 axL Mesh NO BID NO BID $24.25 $23.00 NO BID NO BID $18.75 $18.25 NO BID NO BID $20.63 $2031 $18.75 $18.50 $16.50 $16.25 NO BID NO BID $23.60 $23.30
8.0 STOP / SLOW PADDLE (Estimated annual expenditure unknown)
DESCRIPTION Comm PADDLE | REFLECTIVE | MFG.NAME BRIGHRERIFACH REFLECTIVE | MFG. NAME BRIGHRERIFACH REFLECTIVE | MFG. NAME BRIGHRERIFACH REFLECTIVE | MFG. NAME (FRUCIE [FER EAC REFLECTIVE | MFG. NAME BRIGHRERIFACH
REFLECTIVE SHEETING Code |CountyID| STAFF SIZE siz SHEETING MFG # 1-9 10+ SHEETING MFG # 1-9 10+ SHEETING MFG # 1-9 10+ SHEETING MFG # 1-9 10+ SHEETING MFG # 1-9 10+
ENGINEER | SAFETYZONE
Stop / Slow Paddle, Octagon 350-60 | 1846 6" Wood 18" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GRADE 18SSEGWL |  $34.90 $33.95
ENGINEER | SAFETYZONE
Stop / Slow Paddle, Octagon 350-60 | 3301 12" Wood 18" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GRADE | 18ssews | s27.50 $26.95
72" ENGINEER | SAFETYZONE
Stop / Slow Paddle, Octagon 350-60 | 1847 Aluminum 18" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GRADE 18SSEGM $33.00 $31.85
ENGINEER | SAFETYZONE
Stop / Slow Paddle, Octagon 350-60 | 3302 81" PVC 18" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GRADE | 18SSEGPVC |  $33.00 $31.85
9.0 SURVEY MARKER FLAGS (Estimated annual expenditure unknown)
e PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
B SR S e Comm FLAG PER QTY PER PER QTY PER PER QTY PER PER QTY PER PER QTY PER
Code | County ID SIZE COLOR MFG NAME MEG # BUNDLE BUNDLE MEG NAME MEG # BUNDLE BUNDLE MEG NAME MEG # BUNDLE BUNDLE MEG NAME MEG # BUNDLE BUNDLE MEG NAME MEG # BUNDLE BUNDLE
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3369 | 2-1/2"x3-112" Red NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO 234R $53.04 1000/ BOX PRESCO 2321R $47.25 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO 2321R $6.10 100
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3370 | 2112 x 312" Yellow NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO 2321Y $53.04 1000/ BOX PRESCO 2321Y $47.25 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO 2321Y $6.10 100
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3371 | 212" X312 Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO 23210 $53.04 1000/ BOX PRESCO 23210 $47.25 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO 23210 $6.10 100
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3372 | 212" x 312" Blue NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO 23218 $53.04 1000/ BOX PRESCO 23218 $47.25 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO 23218 $6.10 100
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3373 | 2-1/2"x3-12" White NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO 2321w $53.04 1000/ BOX PRESCO 2321R $47.25 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO 2321w $6.10 100
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3374 | 2-1/2'x3-12 | Assortment NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PRESCO NIA NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING
[THURSDAY, MAY 7, 2009
at 1000 A.M.

CONTRACT TERM

BIDDER'S NAME

LOVELINE INDUSTRIES, INC.

ROADRUNNER TRAFFIC SUPPLY, INC.

CENTERLINE SUPPLY LTD

STROUD SAFETY APPAREL

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST INC.

90 DAYTON AVENUE

3200 MARQUITA DRIVE

530 JESSE STREET

414 WEST 4TH STREET

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

PASSAIC, NJ 07055

FORT WORTH, TX 76116

GRAND PRAIRIE, TX 75052

STROUD, OK 74079

LAKELAND, FL 33809

QUOTED BY MORTON GOLDSTEIN MARILYN EDLUND CHE HUZAREVICH ROB NASH DAVID A VESPA

CONTACT DAN GOLDSTEIN MARILYN EDLUND CHE HUZAREVICH ROB NASH DAVID A VESPA
TELEPHONE 973-928-3427 800-633-2816 972-647-8300 918-968-2827 863-984-1385
FAX NUMBER 973-928-3428

817-244-4819

972-641-1221

918-968-0754

863-984-0058

10.0 TRAFFIC CONES - Shall be bright fluorescent orange flexible PVC with weighted bases, and shall be 28" high.
(Estimated annual expenditure $3,235.00) All cones shall have two (2) white reflective stripes per the specification below|
Al traffic cones shall be engraved, embossed, or permanently stenciled as followsBrazoria County. 1.1 Shall conform to the|
requirements of USDOT Specifications FP-85-1985, Section 718.01, Type II, such as 3M sheeting and / or aproved equal.
Black sheeting shall be 3M #655 or approved equal.

1.2 All colors, lettering, and dimensions shall be accordance with provisions of the Texas Manual on Uniform Traffic Controf
Devices, 2000 or current edition. DELIVERY MUST BE MADE WITHIN 48 HOURS AFTER ORDER IS PLACED . All prices|
shall be per each in the quantities stated.

*OFFERED 28" TRIMLINE 7#
WITH 2CC & STENCILED
MINIMUM: 50 CONES PER ORDER TO ONE LOCATION

PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION Comm

Code County ID MFG NAME MFG # 1-99 100+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-99 100+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-99 100+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-99 100+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-99 100+
Traffic Cones 28" 550-78 567 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID - WAP $ 15.10 [ $ 14.90 PSS 71BS $24.50 $22.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Traffic cones, 28", "pack and pop", collapsible 550-78 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.60 $16.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DID NOT INCLUDE TERMS & CONDITIONS

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTRACT SHEET NOT SIGNED NONE NONE
BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED NO INCLUDED INCLUDED
[ADDENDUM NIUMBER 1 INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION
ITB# 09-42 ROAD SAFETY, MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME TRANTEX, INC. LONE STAR SAFETY AND SUPPLY ALAMO IRON WORKS CPC - CONTROL PRODUCTS CORP GT DISTRIBUTORS
[ THURSDAY, MAY 7, 2009 3310-D FRICK ROAD 2631 FREEWOOD DRIVE 943 AT & T CENTER PKWY PO BOX 54091 PO BOX 16080
at 1000 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 DALLAS, TX 75220 JACKSON, MS 39288 AUSTIN, TX 78761
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON
CONTACT DAVE POFFENBERGER 800-367-1492 800-252-8310
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 214-357-3807 800-292-7817 601-932-7178
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827

1.0 AIRPORT WINDSOCKS (Must meet or exceed the following: RiverCity 267C or equivalent: 35mm PVC on polyester
broadloom fabric, 60 inch long, 2 inner leg snaps which form chaps, Unisex front closure snaps, corduroy collar with snaps,
badge holder, cape-vented back, detachable hood, one inside and one outside pocket)

NO BID

PRICE PER EACH
MFG. # =5 10+

NO BID

PRICE PER EACH
MFG. # =9 10+

NO BID

PRICE PER EACH
MFG. # -9 10+

NO BID

PRICE PER EACH
MFG. # -9 10+

DESCRIPTION Comm

Code County ID SIZE

COLOR

PRICE PER EACH
MFG. # = 10+

MFG. NAME

MFG. NAME

MFG. NAME MFG. NAME MFG. NAME

Windsock 035-92 3365 3'x8'x11" Red / Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Windsock 035-92 3366 3'x12'x9"
36" (throat
diameter) x 12"
18" (throat
diameter)x 8'

Red / Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Windsock 035-92 3367 Bright Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Windsock 035-92 3368 Bright Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Windsock Hardware Kit 035-92 7397 N/A N/A

18" (throat
diameter) x 5'
36" (throat
diameter)x 8'

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Windsock 035-92 Red / Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

[Windsock 035-92 Red / Orange NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2.0 BARRIER FENCE (Must meet or exceed the following: 4' X 100' rolls, mesh size 2" X 3/4", lightweight, 16 Ibs. or less, [
color: orange)

s
s
s
[

L L L
e
e
e
s e L e
Comm R

DESCRIPTION [ PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL
Code |County IDfiiiieiiseie et MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME

B

PRICE PER ROLL
MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

Fence, Safety 33055 | 1124 CORTINA 03-902 $45.50

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3.0 BARRIER TAPE (Estimated expenditure unknown)

Comm

DESCRIPTION Code County ID|

MFG. NAME MFG. # B S ST MFG. NAME FRESFERRELL PRICE PER ROLL

MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # PRICE PER ROLL MFG. NAME MFG. # RS

Barrier Tape, Caution Yellow 832-10 3285 3" X 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Barrier Tape, Caution Construction Area, Yellow 832-10 3286 3" x 200" NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Barrier Tape, Caution Do Not Enter, Yellow 832-10 3287 3" x 200" NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Barrier Tape Yellow, No Writing 832-10 3287 3" x 200" NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Barrier Tape Caution, Yellow 832-10 3282 3"x 1000 CORTINA 03-10-102 $12.50

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Barrier Tape, Caution Construction Area, Yellow 832-10 3283 3" x 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Barier Tape, Caution Do Not Enter, Yellow 832-10 3284 3" x 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Barrier Tape Yellow, No Writing 832-10 546 3" x 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Barrier Tape Dispenser 832-10 3289 N/A

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME TRANTEX, INC. LONE STAR SAFETY AND SUPPLY ALAMO IRON WORKS CPC - CONTROL PRODUCTS CORP GT DISTRIBUTORS

[ THURSDAY, MAY 7, 2009 3310-D FRICK ROAD 2631 FREEWOOD DRIVE 943 AT & T CENTER PKWY PO BOX 54091 PO BOX 16080
at 1000 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 DALLAS, TX 75220 JACKSON, MS 39288 AUSTIN, TX 78761
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON
CONTACT DAVE POFFENBERGER 800-367-1492 800-252-8310
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 214-357-3807 800-292-7817 601-932-7178
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827

4.0 RAIN SUIT

4.1 RAIN SUIT (Must meet or exceed the following: yellow with no reflector stripes, 3 piece to include jacket, pants, hood;
35mm PVC on polyester broadloom fabric; River city brand or equuivalent)

DESCRIPTION

PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH

Comm
Code County ID| SIZE MFG. NAME MFG. # =5 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # L= 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # = 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # =5 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # - 10+

.
S

Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece 201-65 3381 M “'““EEEEEE MAJESTIC 7007 $9.35 $8.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i

i
Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece 201-65 3382 L =======EEEEEE MAJESTIC 7007 $9.35 $8.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

i
Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece 201-65 3383 XL “'““EEEEEE MAJESTIC 7007 $9.35 $8.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i

i
Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece 201-65 3384 2XL =======EEEEEE MAJESTIC 7007 $9.35 $8.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

i
Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece 201-65 3385 3XL “'““EEEEEE MAJESTIC 7007 $9.75 $9.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i

i
Rain Suit, Yellow, 3 piece 201-65 3386 4XL || MAJESTIC 7007 $9.75 $9.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

e e e e
e s el

4.2 RAIN SUIT (Must meet or exceed the following: RiverCity 267C or equivalent: 35mm PVC on polyester broadloom fabriciiiiiisi s isinn s i i i i i s i e
60 in long; 2 inner leg snaps which form chaps; Unisex front cosure snaps; corduroy collar with snaps; badge holder, cape- [ESSSSSSSSREE R il i i i e e e
©d B el

vented hood; one inside and one outside pocket) e e e

DESCRIPTION Comm COLOR & PRICE PER EACH COLOR & PRICE PER EACH COLOR & PRICE PER EACH COLOR & PRICE PER EACH COLOR & PRICE PER EACH
Code |County ID SIZE MFG NAME MFG. # 1-9 10+ MFG NAME MFG. # 1-9 10+ MFG NAME MFG. # 1-9 10+ MFG NAME MFG. # 1-9 10+ MFG NAME MFG. # 1-9 10+
YELLOW
Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3387 S CORDOVA RC35Y60 $13.50 $11.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
YELLOW
Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3388 M CORDOVA RC35Y60 $13.50 $11.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
YELLOW
Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3389 L CORDOVA RC35Y60 $13.50 $11.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
YELLOW
Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3390 XL CORDOVA RC35Y60 $13.50 $11.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
YELLOW
Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3391 2XL CORDOVA RC35Y60 $13.50 $11.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
YELLOW
Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3392 3XL CORDOVA RC35Y60 $13.50 $11.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BLACK
Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3393 4XL CORDOVA RC35B60 $15.00 $13.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BLACK
Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure 201-65 3394 S5XL CORDOVA RC35B60 $15.00 $13.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
T [ . S e S
5.0 SAFETY DRUMS WITH BASES (Shall be impact tant orange-colored p , 36" high and a minimum of 18" [FEERERER SRS IS eI iR R e R s e
R s sl
in diameter, with reflectorized striping (two white reflective stripes) meeting MUTCD specifications. (Estimated annual S B L B
expenditure $2,800.00) All drums shall meet MUTCD ifications, and shall be d or as follows: R s sl
P ,800. g 3 o
N f R s sl
DELIVERY MUST BE MADE WITHIN 48 HOURS AFTER ORDER IS PLACED. All prices shall be per each in the L e e
v R s sl
quantities stated. e e e o s e T 1 EBHE
DESCRIPTION Comm PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
Code MFG. # 1-24 25+ MFG. NAME MFG. # 1-24 25+ MFG. NAME MFG. # 1-24 25+ MFG. NAME MFG. # 1-24 25+ MFG. NAME MFG. # 1-24 25+
Safety Drums with bases 36" X 18" diameter 550-43 36DW/TR $69.50 $66.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6.0 SAFETY FLAGS (Estimated annual expenditure unknown) Must meet or exceed the following: day glow red/orange
flag; solid vinyl (weighted); flag mounted on 3/4" diameter wood dowel; flag size 18" X 18")

DESCRIPTION Comm I\:I)V(Ij;\ﬁ!L PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
Code County ID| FLAG SIZE MFG. NAME MFG. # = 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # = 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # = 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # = 10+ MFG. NAME MFG. # =9 10+
Safety Flag 350-60 554 18" x 18" 24" SAFETY FLAG SF-18-24 $3.50 $2.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

LONE STAR SAFETY AND SUPPLY

ALAMO IRON WORKS

CPC - CONTROL PRODUCTS CORP

GT DISTRIBUTORS

[THURSDAY, MAY 7, 2009

3310-D FRICK ROAD

2631 FREEWOOD DRIVE

943 AT & T CENTER PKWY

PO BOX 54091

PO BOX 16080

at 1000 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 DALLAS, TX 75220 JACKSON, MS 39288 AUSTIN, TX 78761
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON
CONTACT DAVE POFFENBERGER 800-367-1492 800-252-8310
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 214-357-3807 800-292-7817 601-932-7178
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827

T
7.0 SAFETY VESTS (All vests must ve ANSI=ISEA 107-2004. High contrast ANSI breathable mesh surveyor vest, polyestdi =il
RoadTech manufacturing #0K-SVOZML or equivalent. (Estimated annual expenditure $2,650.00) Washable polyester;

zipperm, florescent colors, ANSI Class II; 2" 3M Scotchlite ™(7M;
inside, three (3) outside;

) trim; double horizontal stripe; five (5) pockets - two (2)

PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE
0 PSSR BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND)
Comm
Code | county ID SIZE VEST 1-9 10-20 19 10-20 1-9 10-20 19 10-20 1-9 10-20 19 10-20 1-9 10-20 19 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3592 SM MESH NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Reflective Stripe Size - 3/4" x 96' (26-38")
Vest, Orange with lime reflective siripe, elastic side band 34592 3592 L MESH NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Reflective Stripe Size - 3/4" x 96' (38 - 42")
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3593 XL MESH NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Reflective Stripe Size - 3/4" x 104 (42-46")
vest, Orange wilh lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3594 o MESH NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Reflective Stripe Size - 3/4" x 104" (48 - 52")
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3595 XL MESH NO BID NO BID $25.50 $24.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Reflective Stripe Size - 3/4" x 106 (52 - 56")
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3596 L MESH NO BID NO BID $26.50 $25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Reflective Strip Size - 3/4" x 110" (56 - 64")
Vest, Orange with lime refiective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3613 (605?('7‘2..) MESH NO BID NO BID $27.50 $26.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE
REECINE BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND)
7.2 DESCRIPTION STRIPE ) ) ) ) )
SIZE
Comm

CLASS Il - MESH VEST

County ID

NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3615 S 2"
NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3602 M-L 2"
NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3603 XL 2"
NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3604 2XL 2"
" " . - NO BID NO BID $25.50 $24.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3605 3XL 2"
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 345.92 3606 XL o NO BID NO BID $26.50 $25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME TRANTEX, INC. LONE STAR SAFETY AND SUPPLY ALAMO IRON WORKS CPC - CONTROL PRODUCTS CORP GT DISTRIBUTORS
[THURSDAY, MAY 7, 2009 3310-D FRICK ROAD 2631 FREEWOOD DRIVE 943 AT & T CENTER PKWY PO BOX 54091 PO BOX 16080
at 1000 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 DALLAS, TX 75220 JACKSON, MS 39288 AUSTIN, TX 78761
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON
CONTACT DAVE POFFENBERGER 800-367-1492 800-252-8310
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 214-357-3807 800-292-7817 601-932-7178
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827
e i i 3 PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
e
[ EERA R ERRRR i RERR R R PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE PRICE PER EACH (WITHOUT ELASTIC SIDE
DESCRIPTION - i i BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND) BAND)
Comm o Couny JEe
CLASS Il Code D i 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20 1-9 10-20
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 34592 | 3616 s Mesh NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 34592 | 3607 M-L Mesh NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 34592 | 3608 XL Mesh NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 34592 | 3609 2XL Mesh NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 34592 | 3610 3XL Mesh NO BID NO BID $25.50 $24.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Orange with lime reflective stripe, elastic side band 34592 | 3611 aXL Mesh NO BID NO BID $26.50 $25.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 s Mesh NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 M-L Mesh NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 XL Mesh NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 2XL Mesh NO BID NO BID $24.50 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 3XL Mesh NO BID NO BID $25.50 $24.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vest, Lime with white reflective stripe, elastic side band 345-92 aXL Mesh NO BID NO BID $26.50 $25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8.0 STOP /SLOW PADDLE (Estimated annual expenditure unknown)
DESCRIPTION Comm PADDLE | REFLECTIVE | MFG.NAME BRIGHRERIFACH REFLECTIVE | MFG. NAME BRIGHRERIFACH REFLECTIVE | MFG. NAME BRIGHEFEIFECE REFLECTIVE | MFG. NAME BRIGHEFEIFECh REFLECTIVE | MFG. NAME BRIGHEFEIFECE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING Code |CountyID| STAFF SIZE siz SHEETING MFG # 1-9 10+ SHEETING MFG # 1-9 10+ SHEETING MFG # 1-9 10+ SHEETING MFG # 1-9 10+ SHEETING MFG # 1-9 10+
ENGINEER | SAFETYFLAG
Stop / Slow Paddle, Octagon 350-60 | 1846 6" Wood 18" GRADE SSPEW $39.50 $37.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENGINEER | SAFETYFLAG
Stop / Slow Paddle, Octagon 350-60 3301 12" Wood 18" GRADE SSP12W $39.50 $37.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
72" ENGINEER | SAFETYFLAG
Stop / Slow Paddle, Octagon 350-60 1847 Aluminum 18" GRADE SSP72A $43.50 $41.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENGINEER | SAFETYFLAG
Stop / Slow Paddle, Octagon 350-60 | 3302 81" PVC 18" GRADE SSP81A $49.50 $47.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9.0 SURVEY MARKER FLAGS (Estimated annual expenditure unknown)
DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
WIRE STAFF SIZE - 21" Comm FLAG PER QTY PER PER QTY PER PER QTY PER PER QTY PER PER QTY PER
Code | County ID; SIZE COLOR MFG NAME MFG # BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # BUNDLE BUNDLE
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3369 2-1/2" X 3-1/2" Red SAFETY FLAG|  MFS-21 $7.95 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3370 2-1/2" X 3-1/2" Yellow SAFETY FLAG MFS-21 $7.95 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3371 2-1/2" X 3-1/2" Orange || SAFETY FLAG|  MFS-21 $7.95 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3372 2-1/2" X 3-1/2" Blue SAFETY FLAG|  MFS-21 $7.95 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3373 2-1/2" X 3-1/2" White SAFETY FLAG|  MFS-21 $7.95 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Survey Marker Flag 550-29 3374 2-1/2" X 3-1/2" Assortment || SAFETY FLAG MFS-21 $7.95 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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TRANTEX, INC.

LONE STAR SAFETY AND SUPPLY

ALAMO IRON WORKS

CPC - CONTROL PRODUCTS CORP

GT DISTRIBUTORS

3310-D FRICK ROAD

2631 FREEWOOD DRIVE

943 AT & T CENTER PKWY

PO BOX 54091

PO BOX 16080

HOUSTON, TX 77086

DALLAS, TX 75220

JACKSON, MS 39288

AUSTIN, TX 78761

H.STEVEN NELSON

DAVE POFFENBERGER

800-367-1492

800-252-8310

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME
[ THURSDAY, MAY 7, 2009
at 1000 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY
CONTACT
TELEPHONE
FAX NUMBER

281-448-7711

214-357-3807

800-292-7817

601-932-7178

281-591-6827

10.0 TRAFFIC CONES - Shall be bright fluorescent orange flexible PVC with weighted bases, and shall be 28" high.

(Estimated annual expenditure $3,235.00) All cones shall have two (2) white reflective stripes per the specification below|

Al traffic cones shall be engraved, embossed, or permanently stenciled as followsBrazoria County. 1.1 Shall conform to the|
; oatioRe-ER-8E 0SS es R80T -ao-hchost o "

LSBT “

Black sheeting shall be 3M #655 or approved equal.
1.2 All colors, lettering, and dimensions shall be accordance with provisions of the Texas Manual on Uniform Traffic Controf
Devices, 2000 or current edition. DELIVERY MUST BE MADE WITHIN 48 HOURS AFTER ORDER IS PLACED . All prices|

shall be per each in the quantities stated.

PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION Comm

Code | County ID MFG NAME MFG # 1-99 100+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-99 100+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-99 100+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-99 100+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-99 100+
Traffic Cones 28" 550-78 567 JBC 2BC-2W $17.20 $15.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Traffic cones, 28", "pack and pop”, collapsible 550-78 TRAFFIX 28C-POP $31.75 $30.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE
BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
ADDENDUM NIUMBER 1 INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
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