BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID # 09-41 ROAD SAFETY BARRICADES AND SHEETING

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, MAY 7, 2009

BIDDERS NAME:

TRANTEX INC.

3M COMPANY

10:00 A.M.

BIDDERS ADDRESS

3310-D FRICK ROAD

3M CENTER, BLDG 235-3A-09

HOUSTON, TX 77086

ST. PAUL, MN 55144-1000

CONTACT PERSON

DAVE POFFENBERGER

ROBERT J. SCHOUVELLER

TELEPHONE NUMBER

281-448-7711

800-553-1380

FAX NUMBER

281-591-6827

888-246-9793

PERSON TO CONTACTLFOR PLACING ORDERS

DAVE POFFENBERGER

AMY SCHOENECKER

1.0 BARRICADES

Page 1 of 3

COMM ORDER # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH ORDER # PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION SIZE COUNTY ID# CODE MFG NAME MFG # ENG GRADE HIGH INTENSITY MFG NAME MFG # ENG GRADE HIGH INTENSITY
Verticalcades, stackable, with carry 3958
handle, low density polyethylene, VBAR
orange & white reflective sheeting 8X 24 550-78 TRANTEX 8X24 $30.75 $44.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Verticalcades, stackable, with carry 3959
handle, low density polyethylene,
orange & white reflective sheeting VBAR
8 X 36 550-78 TRANTEX 8X36 $44.50 $49.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Uprights (T-Legs) - wooden 3956 T-LEG
N/A 550-78 TRANTEX WOOD $39.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Uprights (T-Legs) - plastic 3957
T-LEG
N/A 550-78 TRANTEX PLASTIC $39.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type | - 24” Width, Right or Left, . 3872/3873
plastic, orange & white or red &white 24"/ 2FT.
N . TYPE I/ BAR-TYI-
reflective sheeting PLASTIC 550.78 TRANTEX 24P $52.50 $59.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type | - 24" Width, Right or Left, 24" [2FT 387413875
wood, orange & white or red & white TYPE1/ BAR-TYI-
reflective sheeting WOOD 550-78 TRANTEX 24W $57.50 $64.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type | - 36” Width, Right or Left, wood, . 3876 /3877
orange & white or red & white reflective ?I'GY F/’ S'T; BAR-TYI
sheeting chrE
WOOD 550-78 TRANTEX 36W $70.45 $81.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type |1 - 24” Width, Right or Left, 24" 12 FT 38783879
plastic, orange & white or red & white TYPE 11/ BAR-TVII-
reflective sheeting PLASTIC 550-78 TRANTEX 24P $63.50 $71.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type |1 - 24” Width, Right or Left, o 2FT 3880/ 3881
wood, orange & white or red & white TYPE I/ BAR-TYII-
reflective sheeting WOOD 550-78 TRANTEX 24W $70.50 $78.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type |1 - 36" Width, Right or Left, 36" 13 ET 3882 /3883
wood, orange & white or red & white TYPE Il / BAR-TYII-
reflective sheeting WOOD 550-78 TRANTEX 36W $87.75 $96.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type Il - 48” Width, Right, Left or End 48" | 4FT 3884 /3885 /
of Road, plastic, orange & white or red TYPE 11/ 3886 BAR-TYIII-
& white reflective sheeting PLASTIC 550-78 TRANTEX 48-p $265.00 $295.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type 111 - 48” Width, Right, Left or End 48" | 4FT 3887 /3888 /
of Road, wot_)d, orange & white or red & TYPE I/ 3889 BAR-TYIII-
white reflective sheeting WOOoD 550-78 TRANTEX 48-W $265.00 $295.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type Il - 72” Width, Right, Left or End 7216 FT 3890/3891/
9 PLASTIC 550-78 TRANTEX 72-P $325.00 $365.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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Type 111 - 72” Width, Right, Left or End 3893/3894/
of Road, wood, orange & white or red & | 72"/ 6FT 3895
white reflective sheeting TYPE I/ BAR-TYIII-
WOOD 550-78 ITRANTEX 72-W $325.00 $365.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type 111 - 96” Width, Right, Left or End of 3896 /3897 /
Road, plastic rails 8” x 96”, orange & white 3898
or red & white reflective sheeting, 14 Gauge
tubing, 5° plastic supports 96" /8 FT
TYPE 111/ BAR-TYIII-
PLASTIC 550-78 ITRANTEX 96-P $385.00 $435.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type 111 — 96” Width, Right, Left or End 3899/3900/
of Road, wood rails, orange & white or 3901
red & white reflective sheeting, metal
skids & supports, 4 X 4 posts 96"/ 8 ft. Type BAR-TYIII-
111 / Wood 550-78 ITRANTEX 96-W $385.00 $435.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type 111 — 120" Width, Right, Left or 3902/3903/
End of Road, plastic rails, orange & 3904
white or red & white reflective sheeting 120" /10 ft.
Type Il / BAR-TYIII-
Plastic 550-78 [TRANTEX 120-P $445.00 $495.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type 111 — 120" Width, Right, Left or 3905 /3906 /
End of Road, wood rails, orange & white 3907
or red & white reflective sheeting
1207/ 10 ft. BAR-TYIII-
Type 111/ Wood 550-78 [TRANTEX 120-W $445.00 $495.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type 111 — 144” Width, Right, Left or 3908/3909 /
End of Road, plastic rails, orange & 3910
white or red & white reflective sheeting 1447/ 121t
Type I/ BAR-TYIII-
Plastic 550-78 [TRANTEX 144-P $510.00 $575.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type 111 — 144” Width, Right, Left or 3911/3912/
End of Road, wood rails, orange & white 3913
or red & white reflective sheeting
1447 [ 12 ft. BAR-TYIII-
Type 111 / Wood 550-78 ITRANTEX 144W $510.00 $575.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2.0 BARRICADE TAPE PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
COUNTY MFG MFG
DESCRIPTION ITEM ID # COMM CODE NAME MFG# 12" 24" 36" 72" 96" 50 YRDS NAME MFG# 12" 24" 36" 72" 96" 50 YRDS
NIPPON CN $0.90 $1.77 $2.65 $5.30 $7.07 $195.00
AMBER / WHITE, LEFT, 6" STRIPE 550-45 CARBIDE 15017LG p/piece p/piece p/piece p/piece p/piece p/roll 3M 3336L $208.50 $417.00 $625.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NIPPON CN $0.90 $1.77 $2.65 $5.30 $7.07 $795.00
AMBER / WHITE, RIGHT, 6" STRIPE 550-45 CARBIDE 15017R6 p/piece p/piece p/piece p/piece p/piece p/roll 3M 3336R $208.50 $417.00 $625.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
$2.35 $4.70 $7.05 $14.10 $18.80 $355.00
RED / WHITE, LEFT, 6" STRIPE 550-45 3M 336 L p/piece p/piece p/piece p/piece p/piece p/roll NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
$2.35 $4.70 $7.05 $14.10 $18.80 $355.00
RED / WHITE, RIGHT, 6" STRIPE 550-45 3M 336 R p/piece p/piece p/piece p/piece p/piece p/roll NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS NONE NONE
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