
BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION
ITB# 09-40ROAD SAFETY TRAFFIC PAINT & BEADS

Comm Code County ID
MFG. 
NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

White per WPT-8-H

5 gal. container 630-66 1869
ENNIS 
PAINT 987061 NO BID NO BID

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM5630 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 3773
ENNIS 
PAINT 987061 NO BID NO BID

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM5630 NO BID NO BID

Yellow, per YPT-8-H

5 gal. container 630-66 3771
ENNIS 
PAINT 987067 NO BID NO BID

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM5653 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 3774
ENNIS 
PAINT 987067 NO BID NO BID

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM5653 NO BID NO BID

Black

5 gal. container 630-66 3772
ENNIS 
PAINT 985193 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 7276
ENNIS 
PAINT 985193 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Blue

5 gal. container 630-66 7277
ENNIS 
PAINT 985195 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 7278
ENNIS 
PAINT 985195 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Red

5 gal. container 630-66 7279
ENNIS 
PAINT 985194 NO BID NO BID

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM5128 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 7280
ENNIS 
PAINT 985194 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Comm Code County ID MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

White 

5 gal. container 630-66 3779
ENNIS 
PAINT 985301 ALLSTATES ALT-505

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2320 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 3780
ENNIS 
PAINT 985301 ALLSTATES ALT-505

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2320 NO BID NO BID

Yellow

5 gal. container 630-66 3781
ENNIS 
PAINT 985302 ALLSTATES ALT-506

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2321 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 6782
ENNIS 
PAINT 985302 ALLSTATES ALT-506

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2321 NO BID NO BID

Black

5 gal. container 630-66 3783
ENNIS 
PAINT 985203 ALLSTATES ALT-509

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2221 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 3784
ENNIS 
PAINT 985203 ALLSTATES ALT-509

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2221 NO BID NO BID

1.2 LATEX TRAFFIC PAINT WATER BASED - REGULAR DRY

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

254-562-7601

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

SWARCO REFLEX, INC.
 900 N. DENTON
MEXIA, TX 76667

JON SPROUL
LAURA MITCHELL

254-562-9879

$8.60 $8.60

$9.25 $9.25

$8.18 $8.18

$7.15 $7.15

$7.35 $7.35

$7.94 $7.94

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$10.81 $10.81

NO BID

NO BID

$11.69

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$11.69

NO BID

NO BID

$10.50

$10.49

Price per gallon
delivered

$10.50

$10.50

$10.50

$10.50

$10.50

$10.50

$10.50

$10.49

NO BID NO BID

FAX 800-555-0217

Price per gallon
at plant

DESCRIPTION
1.1 Fast dry traffic paint with 
chlorinated rubber.

1.0 TRAFFIC PAINTS  - NOTE:  DELIVERY IS REQUIRED WITHIN ONE
(1) WEEK ON ALL PAINT PRODUCTS.  Orders may be in quantities of 
55 gallons or more.  Delivered price shall be delivered to any point in 
Brazoria County.

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT STACY SALIK
TELEPHONE 800-331-8118

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY STACY SALIK

ENNIS, TX 75119

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME ENNIS PAINT INC.
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009 1509 S KAUFMAN

DESCRIPTION Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

$8.93 $8.93

$8.53 $8.53

$9.16 $9.16

$8.70 $8.70

$9.23 $9.23

$9.64 $9.64

NO BID NO BID

$9.78 $9.78

$11.66 $11.66

$10.79 $10.79

$8.88 $8.88

706-846-2224

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

THE SHERWIN-WILLIAMS COMPANY
1001 NEBULA ROAD

MANCHESTER, GA 31816
WAYNE SEYMOUR

BRANDY REED
866-883-6226

$6.00 $7.20

$5.74 $6.94

$5.74 $6.94

$6.00 $7.20

$6.00 $7.20

$5.74 $6.94

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

903-845-5626

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID

ALL STATES COATINGS COMPANY
100 N LEE DRIVE

GLADEWATER, TX 75647
TRACEY A CHARLSON
TRACEY A CHARLSON

903-845-6436

NO BID

NO BID NO BID
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254-562-7601

SWARCO REFLEX, INC.
 900 N. DENTON
MEXIA, TX 76667

JON SPROUL
LAURA MITCHELL

254-562-9879
FAX 800-555-0217

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT STACY SALIK
TELEPHONE 800-331-8118

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY STACY SALIK

ENNIS, TX 75119

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME ENNIS PAINT INC.
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009 1509 S KAUFMAN

706-846-2224

THE SHERWIN-WILLIAMS COMPANY
1001 NEBULA ROAD

MANCHESTER, GA 31816
WAYNE SEYMOUR

BRANDY REED
866-883-6226

903-845-5626

ALL STATES COATINGS COMPANY
100 N LEE DRIVE

GLADEWATER, TX 75647
TRACEY A CHARLSON
TRACEY A CHARLSON

903-845-6436

Comm Code County ID MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

Blue

5 gal. container 630-66 7281
ENNIS 
PAINT 985205 ALLSTATES ALT-507

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2224 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 7282
ENNIS 
PAINT 985205 ALLSTATES ALT-507

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2224 NO BID NO BID

Red

5 gal. container 630-66 7283
ENNIS 
PAINT 985204 ALLSTATES ALT-508

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2222 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 7284
ENNIS 
PAINT 985204 ALLSTATES ALT-508

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2222 NO BID NO BID

Comm Code County ID MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

5 gal. container 630-66 3761
ENNIS 
PAINT 985151 NO BID NO BID

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM5648 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 3762
ENNIS 
PAINT 985151 NO BID NO BID

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM5648 NO BID NO BID

5 gal. container 630-66 3763
ENNIS 
PAINT 985152 NO BID NO BID

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM5705 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 3764
ENNIS 
PAINT 985152 NO BID NO BID

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM5705 NO BID NO BID

5 gal. container 630-66
ENNIS 
PAINT 985153 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66
ENNIS 
PAINT 985153 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 gal. container 630-66
ENNIS 
PAINT 985155 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66
ENNIS 
PAINT 985155 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 gal. container 630-66
ENNIS 
PAINT 985154 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66
ENNIS 
PAINT 985154 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Comm Code County ID MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

5 gal. container 630-66 912
ENNIS 
PAINT 984351 ALLSTATES ALT-632

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2314 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 913
ENNIS 
PAINT 984351 ALLSTATES ALT-632

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2314 NO BID NO BID

1.2 LATEX TRAFFIC PAINT WATER BASED - REGULAR DRY

DESCRIPTION Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

1.3 FAST DRY LOW V.O.C. ACRYLIC SOLVENT-BORNE TRAFFIC 
PAINT

1.4 FAST DRY WATERBORNE TRAFFIC PAINT

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

$10.16 $10.16

$10.45 $10.45

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

$9.84 $9.84

$9.40 $9.40

$9.15 $9.15

$9.60 $9.60

$9.70 $9.70

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

$10.85 $10.85

$10.85 $10.85

$9.70 $9.70

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

$10.17

$10.04 $10.04

$10.17

NO BID NO BID

$12.29 $12.29

DESCRIPTION Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

White, having 80% minimum 
reflectance

$10.63 $10.63

$11.02 $11.02

Yellow, having 50% minimum 
reflectance

$11.19 $11.19

$11.58 $11.58

Black

$9.85 $9.85

$9.54 $9.54

Blue

$10.72 $10.72

$10.41 $10.41

Red

$11.60 $11.60

$11.29 $11.29

DESCRIPTION Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

White, per TxDot, Item 666.2, WPT-
10

$8.32 $8.32

$8.70 $8.70 $6.06 $7.26

$6.35 $7.55

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$8.40 $9.60

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

$8.70 $9.90

$7.05 $8.25

$6.75 $7.95

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

Page 2 of 8



254-562-7601

SWARCO REFLEX, INC.
 900 N. DENTON
MEXIA, TX 76667

JON SPROUL
LAURA MITCHELL

254-562-9879
FAX 800-555-0217

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT STACY SALIK
TELEPHONE 800-331-8118

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY STACY SALIK

ENNIS, TX 75119

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME ENNIS PAINT INC.
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009 1509 S KAUFMAN

706-846-2224

THE SHERWIN-WILLIAMS COMPANY
1001 NEBULA ROAD

MANCHESTER, GA 31816
WAYNE SEYMOUR

BRANDY REED
866-883-6226

903-845-5626

ALL STATES COATINGS COMPANY
100 N LEE DRIVE

GLADEWATER, TX 75647
TRACEY A CHARLSON
TRACEY A CHARLSON

903-845-6436

Comm Code County ID MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

5 gal. container 630-66 907
ENNIS 
PAINT 984352 ALLSTATES ALT-633

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TN2315 NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 908
ENNIS 
PAINT 984352 ALLSTATES ALT-633

SHERWIN-
WILLIAMS TM2315 NO BID NO BID

5 gal. container 630-66 7285
ENNIS 
PAINT 985203 ALLSTATES ALT-631 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 7286
ENNIS 
PAINT 985203 ALLSTATES ALT-631 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 gal. container 630-66 7287
ENNIS 
PAINT 985205 ALLSTATES ALT-634 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 7288
ENNIS 
PAINT 985205 ALLSTATES ALT-634 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 gal. container 630-66 7289
ENNIS 
PAINT 985204 ALLSTATES ALT-628 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

55 gal. container 630-66 7290
ENNIS 
PAINT - ALLSTATES ALT-628 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION COLOR
COMM
CODE COUNTY ID SIZE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE 
PER CAN

PRICE 
PER CTN

QTY PER 
CTN SIZE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE 
PER CAN

PRICE 
PER CTN

QTY PER 
CTN SIZE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE 
PER CAN

PRICE 
PER CTN

QTY PER 
CTN SIZE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE 
PER CAN

PRICE 
PER CTN

QTY PER 
CTN

Pavement Marking 
Paint Blazing Red 630-66 3574 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pavement Marking 
Paint

Cloud 
White 630-66 3575 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Pavement Marking 
Paint Orange 630-66 914 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Pavement Marking 
Paint Black 630-66 3576 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Pavement Marking Paint 
(for correction 
purposes), Aerosol can Black 630-66 6601 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION
COMM
CODE

COUNTY 
ID#

PRICE PER
GALLON (TON) 
AT PLANT

PRICE PER
GALLON 
(TON) 
DELIVERED

PRICE PER
GALLON (TON) 
AT PLANT

PRICE PER
GALLON 
(TON) 
DELIVERED

PRICE PER
GALLON (TON) 
AT PLANT

PRICE PER
GALLON 
(TON) 
DELIVERED

PRICE PER
GALLON (TON) 
AT PLANT

PRICE PER
GALLON 
(TON) 
DELIVERED

Thinner, 1 gal. container 630-90 909 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Thinner, 5 gal. container 630-90 910 $9.00 $9.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

1.5 PAVEMENT MARKING PAINT (UPSIDE DOWN MARKING PAINT)

NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG #

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG #

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$10.89 $10.89

$10.60 $10.60

Yellow, per TxDot Item 666.2, YPT-
10

$9.26 $9.26

1.4 FAST DRY WATERBORNE TRAFFIC PAINT

DESCRIPTION Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

$8.83 $8.83

Black, per TxDot Item 666.2, 
BPT-10

$9.23 $9.23

$9.64 $9.64

Blue, per TxDot Item 666.2,________

$10.17 $10.17

$10.04 $10.04

Red, per TxDot Item 
666.2,____________

$12.29 $12.29

NO BID NO BID

2.0 THINNER

MFG. NAME MFG #

NO BID

ENNIS PAINT 980200

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG #

NO BID NO BID

$9.04 $10.24

$9.34 $10.54

$8.15 $9.35

$7.93 $9.13

$6.06 $7.26

$6.35 $7.55

$6.54 $7.74

$6.29 $7.49

Page 3 of 8



254-562-7601

SWARCO REFLEX, INC.
 900 N. DENTON
MEXIA, TX 76667

JON SPROUL
LAURA MITCHELL

254-562-9879
FAX 800-555-0217

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT STACY SALIK
TELEPHONE 800-331-8118

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY STACY SALIK

ENNIS, TX 75119

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME ENNIS PAINT INC.
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009 1509 S KAUFMAN

706-846-2224

THE SHERWIN-WILLIAMS COMPANY
1001 NEBULA ROAD

MANCHESTER, GA 31816
WAYNE SEYMOUR

BRANDY REED
866-883-6226

903-845-5626

ALL STATES COATINGS COMPANY
100 N LEE DRIVE

GLADEWATER, TX 75647
TRACEY A CHARLSON
TRACEY A CHARLSON

903-845-6436

DESCRIPTION
COMM
CODE

COUNTY 
ID#

Beads, Type II TxDot 
item 666.2 Coated 
Highway 1 ton = 50lb 
bags 550-04 911

Beads, Type I TTB-1325 
Spec uncoated Airport 
Runway (FAA Approved) 
1 ton = 40 50 lb bags 550-04 3307

DESCRIPTION
COMM
CODE

COUNTY 
ID#

Inlet Strainer, Pump, 
Stainless Steel 635-50 3573

NO BID

INCLUDED

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

MATERIAL PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT LABOR PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

NO BID NO BID

- - NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH

SWARCO  TEXAS TYPE II $710.00

SWARCO TTB, TYPE I $700.00

MFG. NAME MFG #
PRICE PER TON 

DELIVERED

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

MATERIAL PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT LABOR PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH

POTTERS TXSPEC TYPE II $963.60

POTTERS TTB1325C $1,029.60

MFG. NAME MFG #
PRICE PER TON 

DELIVERED

Delivery time: NO BID

NON

3.0 BEADS

NO BID NO BID

PRICE PER TON 
DELIVERED

NO BID

NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG #

NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH

4.0 INLET STRAINERS, PUMP

NO BID NO BID NO BID

A. 4 - Inch Solid or Broken White Line

DESCRIPTION MATERIAL PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT LABOR PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

5.0 APPLICATION OF REFLECTORIZED PAVEMENT MARKINGS

B. 4 - Inch Solid or Broken Yellow Line
C. 8 - Inch Solid White Line
D. 24 Inch Solid White Line
E. White Arrow
F. Railroad Crossing

NO BID NO BID

Move - in charge if less than _______ feet. Charge________

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

MATERIAL PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT LABOR PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG #
PRICE PER TON 

DELIVERED

Bid Documents Included INCLUDED
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION
ITB# 09-40ROAD SAFETY TRAFFIC PAINT & BEADS

Comm Code County ID

White per WPT-8-H

5 gal. container 630-66 1869

55 gal. container 630-66 3773

Yellow, per YPT-8-H

5 gal. container 630-66 3771

55 gal. container 630-66 3774

Black

5 gal. container 630-66 3772

55 gal. container 630-66 7276

Blue

5 gal. container 630-66 7277

55 gal. container 630-66 7278

Red

5 gal. container 630-66 7279

55 gal. container 630-66 7280

Comm Code County ID

White 

5 gal. container 630-66 3779

55 gal. container 630-66 3780

Yellow

5 gal. container 630-66 3781

55 gal. container 630-66 6782

Black

5 gal. container 630-66 3783

55 gal. container 630-66 3784

1.2 LATEX TRAFFIC PAINT WATER BASED - REGULAR DRY

FAX

DESCRIPTION
1.1 Fast dry traffic paint with 
chlorinated rubber.

1.0 TRAFFIC PAINTS  - NOTE:  DELIVERY IS REQUIRED WITHIN ONE
(1) WEEK ON ALL PAINT PRODUCTS.  Orders may be in quantities of 
55 gallons or more.  Delivered price shall be delivered to any point in 
Brazoria County.

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT
TELEPHONE

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

DESCRIPTION

MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

AEXCEL 12W-D110 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 12Y-D243 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 12A-D030 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 12L-D004 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 12R-D053 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

AEXCEL 72W-A036 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 72W-A036 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 72Y-A029 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 72Y-A029 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 22A-A007 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 22A-A007 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)
PO BOX 1850

FOLEY, AL 36536

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.
8341 EPICENTER BLVD
LAKELAND, FL 33809

DAVID VESPA
DAVID VESPA
863-934-1385
863-984-0058

$8.90 $9.30

$8.00

$9.30 $9.70

TRANTEX, INC
3310-D FRICK ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77086
H.STEVEN NELSON

DAVE POFFENBERGER
281-448-7711
281-591-6827

Price per gallon
at plant

$10.95

 NO BID

$11.15

 NO BID

Price per gallon
delivered

$11.35

NO BID

$11.55

NO BID

$12.50 $12.90

 NO BID NO BID

$13.90 $14.30

 NO BID NO BID

$15.50 $15.90

 NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

$7.80 $8.20

$7.60 $8.00

$7.80 $8.20

$7.60
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FAX

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT
TELEPHONE

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

Comm Code County ID

Blue

5 gal. container 630-66 7281

55 gal. container 630-66 7282

Red

5 gal. container 630-66 7283

55 gal. container 630-66 7284

Comm Code County ID

5 gal. container 630-66 3761

55 gal. container 630-66 3762

5 gal. container 630-66 3763

55 gal. container 630-66 3764

5 gal. container 630-66

55 gal. container 630-66

5 gal. container 630-66

55 gal. container 630-66

5 gal. container 630-66

55 gal. container 630-66

Comm Code County ID

5 gal. container 630-66 912

55 gal. container 630-66 913

1.2 LATEX TRAFFIC PAINT WATER BASED - REGULAR DRY

DESCRIPTION

1.3 FAST DRY LOW V.O.C. ACRYLIC SOLVENT-BORNE TRAFFIC 
PAINT

1.4 FAST DRY WATERBORNE TRAFFIC PAINT

DESCRIPTION

White, having 80% minimum 
reflectance

Yellow, having 50% minimum 
reflectance

Black

Blue

Red

DESCRIPTION

White, per TxDot, Item 666.2, WPT-
10

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)
PO BOX 1850

FOLEY, AL 36536

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.
8341 EPICENTER BLVD
LAKELAND, FL 33809

DAVID VESPA
DAVID VESPA
863-934-1385
863-984-0058

TRANTEX, INC
3310-D FRICK ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77086
H.STEVEN NELSON

DAVE POFFENBERGER
281-448-7711
281-591-6827

MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

AEXCEL 72L-A002 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 72L-A002 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 72R-A002 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 72R-A002 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

AEXCEL 12W-A037 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 12W-A037 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$9.50 $9.90

Price per gallon
delivered

$9.70 $10.10

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

$12.20 $12.60

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

$12.40 $12.80

$10.50 $10.90

$10.20 $10.60

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered
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FAX

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT
TELEPHONE

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

Comm Code County ID

5 gal. container 630-66 907

55 gal. container 630-66 908

5 gal. container 630-66 7285

55 gal. container 630-66 7286

5 gal. container 630-66 7287

55 gal. container 630-66 7288

5 gal. container 630-66 7289

55 gal. container 630-66 7290

DESCRIPTION COLOR
COMM
CODE COUNTY ID

Pavement Marking 
Paint Blazing Red 630-66 3574
Pavement Marking 
Paint

Cloud 
White 630-66 3575

Pavement Marking 
Paint Orange 630-66 914

Pavement Marking 
Paint Black 630-66 3576

Pavement Marking Paint 
(for correction 
purposes), Aerosol can Black 630-66 6601

DESCRIPTION
COMM
CODE

COUNTY 
ID#

Thinner, 1 gal. container 630-90 909

Thinner, 5 gal. container 630-90 910

1.5 PAVEMENT MARKING PAINT (UPSIDE DOWN MARKING PAINT)

Yellow, per TxDot Item 666.2, YPT-
10

1.4 FAST DRY WATERBORNE TRAFFIC PAINT

DESCRIPTION

Black, per TxDot Item 666.2, 
BPT-10

Blue, per TxDot Item 666.2,________

Red, per TxDot Item 
666.2,____________

2.0 THINNER

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)
PO BOX 1850

FOLEY, AL 36536

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.
8341 EPICENTER BLVD
LAKELAND, FL 33809

DAVID VESPA
DAVID VESPA
863-934-1385
863-984-0058

TRANTEX, INC
3310-D FRICK ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77086
H.STEVEN NELSON

DAVE POFFENBERGER
281-448-7711
281-591-6827

MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

AEXCEL 12Y-A044 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 12Y-A044 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 22A-A007 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 22A-A007 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 72L-A002 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 72L-A002 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 72R-A002 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AEXCEL 72R-A002 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SIZE MFG NAME MFG #
PRICE 

PER CAN
PRICE 

PER CTN
QTY PER 

CTN SIZE MFG NAME MFG #
PRICE 

PER CAN
PRICE 

PER CTN
QTY PER 

CTN SIZE MFG NAME MFG #
PRICE 

PER CAN
PRICE 

PER CTN
QTY PER 

CTN

17OZ SEYMOUR 20-954 $3.35 $35.40 12 20 SEYMORE 20-971 $2.65 $31.80 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

17OZ SEYMOUR 20-952 $3.35 $34.40 12 20 SEYMORE 20-952 $2.65 $31.80 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

17OZ SEYMOUR 20-957 $3.35 $35.40 12 20 SEYMORE 20-957 $2.65 $31.80 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

17OZ SEYMOUR 20-663 $3.95 $42.60 12 20 SEYMORE

*20-663
WATER

BASE ONLY $2.65 $31.80 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

17OZ SEYMOUR 20-663 $3.95 $42.60 12 20 SEYMORE

*20-663
WATER

BASE ONLY $2.65 $31.80 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PRICE PER
GALLON (TON) 
AT PLANT

PRICE PER
GALLON 
(TON) 
DELIVERED

PRICE PER
GALLON (TON) 
AT PLANT

PRICE PER
GALLON 
(TON) 
DELIVERED

PRICE PER
GALLON (TON) 
AT PLANT

PRICE PER
GALLON 
(TON) 
DELIVERED

$23.10 $23.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$19.35 $19.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG #

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG #

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

TRANTEX  TOULENE

MFG. NAME MFG #

TRANTEX  TOULENE

$12.20 $12.60

$12.40 $12.80

$10.50 $10.90

$10.20 $10.60

$8.90 $9.30

$9.30 $9.70

$10.00 $10.25

$9.85 $10.05

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered

Price per gallon
at plant

Price per gallon
delivered
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FAX

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT
TELEPHONE

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDER'S NAME
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

DESCRIPTION
COMM
CODE

COUNTY 
ID#

Beads, Type II TxDot 
item 666.2 Coated 
Highway 1 ton = 50lb 
bags 550-04 911

Beads, Type I TTB-1325 
Spec uncoated Airport 
Runway (FAA Approved) 
1 ton = 40 50 lb bags 550-04 3307

DESCRIPTION
COMM
CODE

COUNTY 
ID#

Inlet Strainer, Pump, 
Stainless Steel 635-50 3573

Delivery time:

3.0 BEADS

4.0 INLET STRAINERS, PUMP

A. 4 - Inch Solid or Broken White Line

DESCRIPTION

5.0 APPLICATION OF REFLECTORIZED PAVEMENT MARKINGS

B. 4 - Inch Solid or Broken Yellow Line
C. 8 - Inch Solid White Line
D. 24 Inch Solid White Line
E. White Arrow
F. Railroad Crossing

Move - in charge if less than _______ feet. Charge________

Bid Documents Included

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)
PO BOX 1850

FOLEY, AL 36536

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.
8341 EPICENTER BLVD
LAKELAND, FL 33809

DAVID VESPA
DAVID VESPA
863-934-1385
863-984-0058

TRANTEX, INC
3310-D FRICK ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77086
H.STEVEN NELSON

DAVE POFFENBERGER
281-448-7711
281-591-6827

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

MATERIAL PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT LABOR PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG #
PRICE PER TON 

DELIVERED

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

MATERIAL PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT LABOR PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG #
PRICE PER TON 

DELIVERED

NO BID

INCLUDED

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

MATERIAL PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT LABOR PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT

NO BID NO BID

GRACO 191-635 NO BID

MFG. NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH

POTTERS M-247 $728.00

POTTERS TT-B-1325 TYPE I $728.00

MFG. NAME MFG #
PRICE PER TON 

DELIVERED

Page 8 of 8


