BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID #09-39 ROAD SAFETY REFLECTIVE SHEETING

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

ROCAL, INC.

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

3186 CR 550

9875 YUCCA ROAD

408 EAST BERRY AVENUE

10:00 A.M. FRANKFORT, OH 45628 ADELANTO, CA 92301 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON JAMES E. STEWART, JR
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON DAVID B. BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 740-998-2122 800-637-7233 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 740-998-2073 760-246-5512 251-943-1544
ALTERNATE -AVERY DENNISON
T-9500
3M PRODUCT (APPROVED BY TxDOT) 3M PRODUCT ALTERNATE 3M PRODUCT ALTERNATE
DESCRIPTION DIAMOND GRADE DIAMOND GRADE DIAMOND GRADE DIAMOND GRADE DIAMOND GRADE DIAMOND GRADE
1.0 REFLECTIVE SHEETING,
CLASS 1, WITH PRESSURE LENGTH OF LENGTH OF LENGTH OF LENGTH OF LENGTH OF LENGTH OF
SENSITIVE ADHESIVE BACKING COMM CODE ITEM ID PRICE PER ROLL ROLL PRICE PER ROLL ROLL PRICE PER ROLL ROLL PRICE PER ROLL ROLL PRICE PER ROLL ROLL PRICE PER ROLL ROLL
GREEN 801-49 7228 NO BID NO BID $1,629.00 50 YARDS $2,125.00 36" X 50 YRD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
YELLOW 801-49 7229 NO BID NO BID $1,629.00 50 YARDS $2,125.00 36" X 50 YRD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
RED 801-49 7230 NO BID NO BID $1,629.00 50 YARDS $2,125.00 36" X 50 YRD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WHITE 801-49 7231 NO BID NO BID $1,629.00 50 YARDS $2,125.00 36" X 50 YRD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BLACK 801-49 7232 NO BID NO BID $1,629.00 50 YARDS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BLUE 801-49 NO BID NO BID $1,629.00 50 YARDS $2,125.00 36" X 50 YRD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 14 DAYS 21 DAYS NO BID

1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

COMME COUNTY ID#
SIZE / DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
12 x 6 4 way 801-49 $2.20 $2.09 $3.45 $3.40 $2.55 $2.51
12 x 18 Chevron Alignment 801-49 $6.59 $6.26 $7.95 $7.90 $7.64 $7.53
12 x 18 No Parking Anytime 801-49 $6.59 $6.26 $7.95 $7.90 $7.64 $7.53
12 x 36 Bridge Marker R 801-49 $13.02 $12.33 $14.70 $14.65 $15.27 $15.05




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

ROCAL, INC.

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

3186 CR 550

9875 YUCCA ROAD

408 EAST BERRY AVENUE

10:00 A.M. FRANKFORT, OH 45628 ADELANTO, CA 92301 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON JAMES E. STEWART, JR
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON DAVID B. BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 740-998-2122 800-637-7233 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 740-998-2073 760-246-5512 251-943-1544

1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

COMME COUNTY ID#
SIZE /| DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
12 x 36 Bridge Marker L 801-49 $13.02 $12.33 $14.70 $14.65 $15.27 $15.05
18 x 18 Advisory Speed Plate (Blank)

MPH 801-49 $9.88 $9.38 $11.33 $11.28 $11.45 $11.28

18 x 18 Advisory Speed Plate (with
numbers) MPH 801-49 $9.88 $9.38 $11.33 $11.28 $11.45 $11.28

18 x 18 Brazoria County Road

Number 801-49 $9.97 $9.45 $11.33 $11.28 $12.65 $12.46
18 x 24 Chevron Alignment 801-49 $13.02 $12.33 $14.70 $14.65 $15.27 $15.05
24 STOP 801-49 4396 $17.36 $16.44 $19.60 $19.40 $20.36 $20.06
24 x 8 Blank Face 801-49 $5.57 $5.29 $7.20 $7.15 $6.79 $6.69

24 X 8 School (Florescent Yellow
Green) 801-49 4397 $5.84 $5.55 $7.47 $7.42 $7.10 $6.99
24 x 18 County Maintenance Begins 801-49 4398 $13.02 $12.33 $14.70 $14.65 $15.27 $15.05
24 x 18 County Maintenance Ends 801-49 4399 $13.02 $12.33 $14.70 $14.65 $15.27 $15.05
24 x 18 End Detour 801-49 4402 $13.02 $12.33 $14.70 $14.65 $15.27 $15.05
24 x 24 No Trucks 801-49 4403 $17.48 $16.60 $19.60 $19.40 $20.83 $20.52
24 x 24 Double Arrow 801-49 4404 $17.36 $16.44 $19.60 $19.40 $20.36 $20.06
24 x 24 Fresh Oil 5 MPH 801-49 4405 $17.36 $16.44 $19.60 $19.40 $20.36 $20.06
24 x 24 High Water 801-49 4406 $17.36 $16.44 $19.60 $19.40 $20.36 $20.06
24 x 30 Speed Limit (blank) MPH 801-49 4409 $21.70 $20.55 $24.50 $24.25 $25.45 $25.07




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

ROCAL, INC.

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

3186 CR 550

9875 YUCCA ROAD

408 EAST BERRY AVENUE

10:00 A.M. FRANKFORT, OH 45628 ADELANTO, CA 92301 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON JAMES E. STEWART, JR
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON DAVID B. BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 740-998-2122 800-637-7233 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 740-998-2073 760-246-5512 251-943-1544

1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

COMME COUNTY ID#
SIZE /| DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
24 x 30 Speed Limit (with numbers)
MPH 801-49 4410 $21.70 $20.55 $24.50 $24.25 $25.45 $25.07
24 x 30 Reduced Speed Ahead 801-49 4411 $21.70 $20.55 $24.50 $24.25 $25.45 $25.07
24 x 30 Speed Zone Ahead 801-49 4412 $21.70 $20.55 $24.50 $24.25 $25.45 $25.07
24 x 30 No Parking 801-49 4413 $21.70 $20.55 $24.50 $24.25 $25.45 $25.07
24 x 30 Weight Limit (blank) Tons 801-49 4414 $21.70 $20.55 $24.50 $24.25 $25.45 $25.07
24 x 30 Weight Limit (with numbers)
Tons 801-49 4415 $21.70 $20.55 $24.50 $24.25 $25.45 $25.07
24 x 30 No Dumping Allowed 801-49 4416 $21.70 $20.55 $24.50 $24.25 $25.45 $25.07
24 x 30 Do Not Pass 801-49 4417 $21.70 $20.55 $24.50 $24.25 $25.45 $25.07
24 x 36 Weight Limit - Axle or
Tandem (blank) LBS 801-49 4418 $26.04 $24.66 $29.40 $29.10 $30.54 $30.08
24 x 36 Weight Limit - Tandem Axle
(blank) LBS 801-49 4419 $26.04 $24.66 $29.40 $29.10 $30.54 $30.08
30 STOP 801-49 4420 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 Yield (measures 24" wide) 801-49 $11.90 $11.30 $30.63 $30.31 $16.18 $15.94
30" Hinged Sign Yellow with Black
Message - Water Over Road / Drive
Friendly 801-49 $27.75 $26.31 $30.63 $30.31 NO BID NO BID
30 x 24 Detour 801-49 4421 $21.70 $20.55 $24.50 $24.25 $25.45 $25.07
30 x 30 Right - Left Turn 801-49 4422 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Right - Left Curve 801-49 4423 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

ROCAL, INC.

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

3186 CR 550

9875 YUCCA ROAD

408 EAST BERRY AVENUE

10:00 A.M. FRANKFORT, OH 45628 ADELANTO, CA 92301 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON JAMES E. STEWART, JR
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON DAVID B. BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 740-998-2122 800-637-7233 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 740-998-2073 760-246-5512 251-943-1544

1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

COMME COUNTY ID#

SIZE / DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
30 x 30 Right - Left Reverse Turn 801-49 4424 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Right-Left Reverse Curve 801-49 4425 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Right-Left Winding Road 801-49 4426 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33

30 x 30 Cross Road 801-49 4427 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Side Road 801-49 4428 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 T Symbol 801-49 4429 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Y Symbol 801-49 4430 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33

30 x 30 Bump 801-49 4431 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33

30 x 30 Dip 801-49 4432 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33

30 x 30 Soft Shoulder 801-49 4433 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Narrow Bridge 801-49 4434 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Pavement Ends 801-49 4435 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Water Over Road 801-49 4436 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Dead End 801-49 4437 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33

30 x 30 Church 801-49 4438 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33

30 x 30 Cattle Guard 801-49 4439 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

ROCAL, INC.

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

3186 CR 550

9875 YUCCA ROAD

408 EAST BERRY AVENUE

10:00 A.M. FRANKFORT, OH 45628 ADELANTO, CA 92301 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON JAMES E. STEWART, JR
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON DAVID B. BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 740-998-2122 800-637-7233 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 740-998-2073 760-246-5512 251-943-1544

1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

COMME COUNTY ID#
SIZE /| DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +

30 x 30 Slow Down on Wet Road 801-49 4440 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Fresh Oil 5 MPH 801-49 4441 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 High Water 801-49 4442 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Mowers Ahead 801-49 4443 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Workers Ahead 801-49 4445 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33

30 x 30 Arrow (Orange for
construction zone) 801-49 4446 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 School Bus Stop Ahead 801-49 4447 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33

30 x 30 Railroad Advance Warning
(for parallel roads) 801-49 4448 $27.13 $25.69 $30.63 $30.31 $31.81 $31.33
30 x 30 Stop Ahead 801-49 4449 $28.63 $27.13 $30.63 $30.31 $32.75 $32.26
30 x 30 Yield Ahead 801-49 4450 $28.63 $27.13 $30.63 $30.31 $32.75 $32.26
36 STOP 801-49 4451 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $45.81 $45.12
36 Yield (measures 30" wide) 801-49 4452 $19.43 $18.53 $44.10 $43.65 $20.03 $19.73
36 Round 801-49 4453 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $45.81 $45.12
36 Railroad Advance Warning 801-49 4454 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $45.81 $45.12
36 School Advance Sign (Florescent

Yellow Green) 801-49 4455 $44.46 $42.21 $45.90 $45.45 $45.32 $44.64
36 School Crossing Sign 801-49 4456 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $43.29 $42.64




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

ROCAL, INC.

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

3186 CR 550

9875 YUCCA ROAD

408 EAST BERRY AVENUE

10:00 A.M. FRANKFORT, OH 45628 ADELANTO, CA 92301 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON JAMES E. STEWART, JR
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON DAVID B. BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 740-998-2122 800-637-7233 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 740-998-2073 760-246-5512 251-943-1544

1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

COMME COUNTY ID#

SIZE /| DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
36 x 36 Stop Ahead 801-49 4457 $41.22 $39.06 $44.10 $43.65 $46.74 $46.04
36 x 36 Yield Ahead 801-49 4458 $41.22 $39.06 $44.10 $43.65 $46.74 $46.04
36 x 36 One Lane Bridge 801-49 4459 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $45.81 $45.12
36 x 36 Load Zoned Bridge 801-49 4460 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $45.81 $45.12
36 x 36 Road Narrows 801-49 4461 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $45.81 $45.12
36 x 36 Truck Advance Crossing 801-49 4462 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $45.81 $45.12
36 x 36 Fire Truck Advance Crossing 801-49 4463 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $45.81 $45.12
36 x 36 Playground Sign 801-49 4464 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $45.81 $45.12
36 x 36 Road Work Ahead 801-49 4465 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $45.81 $45.12
36 x 36 Workers Ahead 801-49 4466 $39.06 $36.99 $44.10 $43.65 $45.81 $45.12
48 x 24 Large Arrow 801-49 4467 $37.42 $32.88 $39.20 $38.80 $40.72 $40.11
48 x 30 Road Closed 801-49 4468 $43.40 $41.10 $49.00 $48.50 $50.90 $50.14
48 x 48 Road Construction Ahead 801-49 4469 $69.44 $65.76 $78.40 $77.60 $81.44 $80.22
48 x 48 Detour (blank) Feet 801-49 4470/ 4474 $69.44 $65.76 $78.40 $77.60 $81.44 $80.22
48 x 48 Road Closed Ahead 801-49 4471 $69.44 $65.76 $78.40 $77.60 $81.44 $80.22
48 x 48 Flagger Ahead 801-49 4472 $69.44 $65.76 $78.40 $77.60 $81.44 $80.22




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

ROCAL, INC.

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

3186 CR 550

9875 YUCCA ROAD

408 EAST BERRY AVENUE

10:00 AM. FRANKFORT, OH 45628 ADELANTO, CA 92301 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON JAMES E. STEWART, JR
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON DAVID B. BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 740-998-2122 800-637-7233 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 740-998-2073 760-246-5512 251-943-1544
1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN || PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
COMME | COUNTY ID#
SIZE / DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
48 STOP 801-49 4473 $69.44 $65.76 $78.40 $77.60 $81.44 $80.22
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 30-45 DAYS 21-30 DAYS 30-45 DAYS
MFG NAME: 3M MFG NAME: 3M MFG NAME: ALTERNATE MFG NAME: 3M MFG NAME: ALTERNATE
PRODUCT# MFG NAME: ALTERNATE PRODUCT# PRODUCT# PRODUCT# PRODUCT#
TAC LEVEL PRODUCT#PRE-MASK TAC LEVEL TAC LEVEL TAC LEVEL TAC LEVEL
2.0 APPLICATION TAPE (PRE- COMM | COUNTY ID#| TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC APPLICATION TAPE TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC
MASK) CODE EG UOM: UOM:ROLL UOM: uoMm: uoMm: UOM:
1INCH 832-69 3398 NO BID $3.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 INCH 832-69 3399 NO BID $6.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 INCH 832-69 3400 NO BID $10.41 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 INCH 832-69 3401 NO BID $13.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 INCH 832-69 3402 NO BID $17.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 INCH 832-69 3403 NO BID $20.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 INCH 832-69 3404 NO BID $24.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 INCH 832-69 3405 NO BID $27.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 INCH 832-69 3406 NO BID $34.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 INCH 832-69 3407 NO BID $41.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 INCH 832-69 3408 NO BID $52.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

ROCAL, INC.

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

3186 CR 550

9875 YUCCA ROAD

408 EAST BERRY AVENUE

10:00 A.M. FRANKFORT, OH 45628 ADELANTO, CA 92301 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON JAMES E. STEWART, JR
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT ALAN CHRISTOPHER MARK JOHNSON DAVID B. BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 740-998-2122 800-637-7233 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 740-998-2073 760-246-5512 251-943-1544
MFG NAME: 3M MFG NAME: 3M MFG NAME: ALTERNATE MFG NAME: 3M MFG NAME: ALTERNATE
PRODUCT# MFG NAME: ALTERNATE PRODUCT# PRODUCT# PRODUCT# PRODUCT#
TAC LEVEL PRODUCT#PRE-MASK TAC LEVEL TAC LEVEL TAC LEVEL TAC LEVEL
2.0 APPLICATION TAPE (PRE- COMM COUNTY ID# TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC APPLICATION TAPE TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC
MASK) CODE EG UOM: UOM:ROLL UOM: UOM: UOM: UOM:
18 INCH 832-69 3409 NO BID $62.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 INCH 832-69 3410 NO BID $69.41 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 INCH 832-69 3411 NO BID $76.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 INCH 832-69 3412 NO BID $83.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 INCH 832-69 3413 NO BID $104.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 INCH 832-69 3414 NO BID $124.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 14 DAYS NO BID
EXCEPTIONS: 3.1 OPTION TO EXTEND MAY BE EXCERISED ONLY]
UPON MUTUAL AGREEMENT OF BOTH VULCAN SIGNS &
BRAZORIA COUNTY
4.6.1 WE TAKE EXCEPTION TO INSIDE DELIVERY. WE SHIP
COMMON CARRIER WHICH DOESNOT INCLUDE INSIDE
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS NONE DELIVERY
INCLUDED ALL BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

ANY ADDITIONAL COMMENTS OR INFORMATION

NONE




BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID #09-39 ROAD SAFETY REFLECTIVE SHEETING

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP.

3M COMPANY

1120 FLAOWOOD DRIVE

3M CENTER, BLDG 235-3A-09

10:00 A.M. JACKSON, MS 39232 ST. PAUL, MN 55144-1000
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY HEIDI MCGEE ROBERT J. SCHOUVELLER
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT HEIDI MCGEE AMY SCHOENECKER
TELEPHONE 800-367-1492 800-553-1380
FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 888-246-9793
ALTERNATE
3M PRODUCT DIAMOND GRADE
3M PRODUCT ALTERNATE DIAMOND GRADE *HIGH INTENSITY GRADE
DESCRIPTION DIAMOND GRADE DIAMOND GRADE **3M SERIES 4000 3M SERIES 3930
1.0 REFLECTIVE SHEETING,
CLASS 1, WITH PRESSURE LENGTH OF LENGTH OF LENGTH OF LENGTH OF
SENSITIVE ADHESIVE BACKING COMM CODE ITEM ID PRICE PER ROLL ROLL PRICE PER ROLL ROLL PRICE PER ROLL ROLL PRICE PER ROLL ROLL
GREEN 801-49 7228 $2,014.29 50 YARDS NO BID NO BID $1,791.00 50 YARDS $625.50 50 YARDS
YELLOW 801-49 7229 $2,014.29 50 YARDS NO BID NO BID $1,791.00 50 YARDS $625.50 50 YARDS
RED 801-49 7230 $2,014.29 50 YARDS NO BID NO BID $1,791.00 50 YARDS $625.50 50 YARDS
WHITE 801-49 7231 $2,014.29 50 YARDS NO BID NO BID $1,791.00 50 YARDS $625.50 50 YARDS
BLACK 801-49 7232 NO BID 50 YARDS NO BID NO BID $335.52 50 YARDS $335.52 50 YARDS
BLUE 801-49 $2,014.29 50 YARDS NO BID NO BID $1,791.00 50 YARDS $625.50 50 YARDS
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 12 DAYS 5-10 ARO

1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

COMME COUNTY ID#
SIZE /| DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
12 x 6 4 way 801-49 $3.11 $3.04 NO BID NO BID
12 x 18 Chevron Alignment 801-49 $7.97 $7.91 NO BID NO BID
12 x 18 No Parking Anytime 801-49 $7.97 $7.91 NO BID NO BID
12 x 36 Bridge Marker R 801-49 $15.58 $15.51 NO BID NO BID




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP.

3M COMPANY

1120 FLAOWOOD DRIVE

3M CENTER, BLDG 235-3A-09

10:00 A.M. JACKSON, MS 39232 ST. PAUL, MN 55144-1000
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY HEIDI MCGEE ROBERT J. SCHOUVELLER
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT HEIDI MCGEE AMY SCHOENECKER
TELEPHONE 800-367-1492 800-553-1380
FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 888-246-9793
1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
COMME COUNTY ID#
SIZE /| DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
12 x 36 Bridge Marker L 801-49 $15.58 $15.51 NO BID NO BID
18 x 18 Advisory Speed Plate (Blank)
MPH 801-49 $11.94 $11.89 NO BID NO BID
18 x 18 Advisory Speed Plate (with
numbers) MPH 801-49 $11.94 $11.89 NO BID NO BID
18 x 18 Brazoria County Road
Number 801-49 $18.36 $18.32 NO BID NO BID
18 x 24 Chevron Alignment 801-49 $15.58 $15.51 NO BID NO BID
24 STOP 801-49 4396 $20.60 $20.53 NO BID NO BID
24 x 8 Blank Face 801-49 $7.07 $7.01 NO BID NO BID
24 X 8 School (Florescent Yellow
Green) 801-49 4397 $7.41 $7.35 NO BID NO BID
24 x 18 County Maintenance Begins 801-49 4398 $15.58 $15.51 NO BID NO BID
24 x 18 County Maintenance Ends 801-49 4399 $15.58 $15.51 NO BID NO BID
24 x 18 End Detour 801-49 4402 $11.59 $11.54 NO BID NO BID
24 x 24 No Trucks 801-49 4403 $21.36 $21.28 NO BID NO BID
24 x 24 Double Arrow 801-49 4404 $20.77 $20.70 NO BID NO BID
24 x 24 Fresh Oil 5 MPH 801-49 4405 $15.46 $15.40 NO BID NO BID
24 x 24 High Water 801-49 4406 $20.77 $20.70 NO BID NO BID
24 x 30 Speed Limit (blank) MPH 801-49 4409 $25.95 $25.87 NO BID NO BID




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP.

3M COMPANY

1120 FLAOWOOD DRIVE

3M CENTER, BLDG 235-3A-09

10:00 A.M. JACKSON, MS 39232 ST. PAUL, MN 55144-1000
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY HEIDI MCGEE ROBERT J. SCHOUVELLER
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT HEIDI MCGEE AMY SCHOENECKER
TELEPHONE 800-367-1492 800-553-1380
FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 888-246-9793
1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
COMME COUNTY ID#
SIZE /| DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
24 x 30 Speed Limit (with numbers)
MPH 801-49 4410 $25.95 $25.87 NO BID NO BID
24 x 30 Reduced Speed Ahead 801-49 4411 $25.95 $25.87 NO BID NO BID
24 x 30 Speed Zone Ahead 801-49 4412 $25.95 $25.87 NO BID NO BID
24 x 30 No Parking 801-49 4413 $25.95 $25.87 NO BID NO BID
24 x 30 Weight Limit (blank) Tons 801-49 4414 $26.67 $26.60 NO BID NO BID
24 x 30 Weight Limit (with numbers)
Tons 801-49 4415 $26.67 $26.60 NO BID NO BID
24 x 30 No Dumping Allowed 801-49 4416 $25.95 $25.87 NO BID NO BID
24 x 30 Do Not Pass 801-49 4417 $25.95 $25.87 NO BID NO BID
24 x 36 Weight Limit - Axle or
Tandem (blank) LBS 801-49 4418 $30.91 $30.83 NO BID NO BID
24 x 36 Weight Limit - Tandem Axle
(blank) LBS 801-49 4419 $30.91 $30.83 NO BID NO BID
30 STOP 801-49 4420 $31.93 $31.85 NO BID NO BID
30 Yield (measures 24" wide) 801-49 $16.62 $16.55 NO BID NO BID
30" Hinged Sign Yellow with Black *$32.27 *$32.19
Message - Water Over Road / Drive PER VENDOR - QUOTING JUST|| PER VENDOR - QUOTING JUST
Friendly 801-49 SIGN FACE - NO HINGE SIGN FACE - NO HINGE NO BID NO BID
30 x 24 Detour 801-49 4421 $19.30 $19.24 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Right - Left Turn 801-49 4422 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Right - Left Curve 801-49 4423 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP.

3M COMPANY

1120 FLAOWOOD DRIVE

3M CENTER, BLDG 235-3A-09

10:00 A.M. JACKSON, MS 39232 ST. PAUL, MN 55144-1000
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY HEIDI MCGEE ROBERT J. SCHOUVELLER
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT HEIDI MCGEE AMY SCHOENECKER
TELEPHONE 800-367-1492 800-553-1380
FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 888-246-9793

1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

COMME COUNTY ID#

SIZE / DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
30 x 30 Right - Left Reverse Turn 801-49 4424 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Right-Left Reverse Curve 801-49 4425 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Right-Left Winding Road 801-49 4426 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID

30 x 30 Cross Road 801-49 4427 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Side Road 801-49 4428 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 T Symbol 801-49 4429 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Y Symbol 801-49 4430 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID

30 x 30 Bump 801-49 4431 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID

30 x 30 Dip 801-49 4432 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID

30 x 30 Soft Shoulder 801-49 4433 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Narrow Bridge 801-49 4434 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Pavement Ends 801-49 4435 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Water Over Road 801-49 4436 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Dead End 801-49 4437 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID

30 x 30 Church 801-49 4438 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID

30 x 30 Cattle Guard 801-49 4439 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP.

3M COMPANY

1120 FLAOWOOD DRIVE

3M CENTER, BLDG 235-3A-09

10:00 A.M. JACKSON, MS 39232 ST. PAUL, MN 55144-1000
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY HEIDI MCGEE ROBERT J. SCHOUVELLER
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT HEIDI MCGEE AMY SCHOENECKER
TELEPHONE 800-367-1492 800-553-1380
FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 888-246-9793

1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

COMME COUNTY ID#
SIZE /| DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +

30 x 30 Slow Down on Wet Road 801-49 4440 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Fresh Oil 5 MPH 801-49 4441 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 High Water 801-49 4442 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Mowers Ahead 801-49 4443 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Workers Ahead 801-49 4445 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID

30 x 30 Arrow (Orange for
construction zone) 801-49 4446 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 School Bus Stop Ahead 801-49 4447 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID

30 x 30 Railroad Advance Warning
(for parallel roads) 801-49 4448 $32.27 $32.19 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Stop Ahead 801-49 4449 $40.42 $40.33 NO BID NO BID
30 x 30 Yield Ahead 801-49 4450 $40.42 $40.33 NO BID NO BID
36 STOP 801-49 4451 $45.76 $45.67 NO BID NO BID
36 Yield (measures 30" wide) 801-49 4452 $21.29 $21.22 NO BID NO BID
36 Round 801-49 4453 $46.25 $46.16 NO BID NO BID
36 Railroad Advance Warning 801-49 4454 $46.25 $46.16 NO BID NO BID
36 School Advance Sign (Florescent

Yellow Green) 801-49 4455 $48.53 $48.44 NO BID NO BID
36 School Crossing Sign 801-49 4456 $46.25 $46.16 NO BID NO BID




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP.

3M COMPANY

1120 FLAOWOOD DRIVE

3M CENTER, BLDG 235-3A-09

10:00 A.M. JACKSON, MS 39232 ST. PAUL, MN 55144-1000
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY HEIDI MCGEE ROBERT J. SCHOUVELLER
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT HEIDI MCGEE AMY SCHOENECKER
TELEPHONE 800-367-1492 800-553-1380
FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 888-246-9793

1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN

COMME COUNTY ID#

SIZE / DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
36 x 36 Stop Ahead 801-49 4457 $57.98 $57.89 NO BID NO BID
36 x 36 Yield Ahead 801-49 4458 $57.98 $57.89 NO BID NO BID
36 x 36 One Lane Bridge 801-49 4459 $46.25 $46.16 NO BID NO BID
36 x 36 Load Zoned Bridge 801-49 4460 $46.25 $46.16 NO BID NO BID
36 x 36 Road Narrows 801-49 4461 $46.25 $46.16 NO BID NO BID
36 x 36 Truck Advance Crossing 801-49 4462 $46.25 $46.16 NO BID NO BID
36 x 36 Fire Truck Advance Crossing 801-49 4463 $46.25 $46.16 NO BID NO BID
36 x 36 Playground Sign 801-49 4464 $46.25 $46.16 NO BID NO BID
36 x 36 Road Work Ahead 801-49 4465 $34.27 $34.21 NO BID NO BID
36 x 36 Workers Ahead 801-49 4466 $34.27 $34.21 NO BID NO BID
48 x 24 Large Arrow 801-49 4467 $41.31 $41.22 NO BID NO BID
48 x 30 Road Closed 801-49 4468 $51.39 $51.29 NO BID NO BID
48 x 48 Road Construction Ahead 801-49 4469 $60.72 $60.64 NO BID NO BID
48 x 48 Detour (blank) Feet 801-49 4470/ 4474 $60.72 $60.64 NO BID NO BID
48 x 48 Road Closed Ahead 801-49 4471 $60.72 $60.64 NO BID NO BID
48 x 48 Flagger Ahead 801-49 4472 $60.72 $60.64 NO BID NO BID




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP.

3M COMPANY

1120 FLAOWOOD DRIVE

3M CENTER, BLDG 235-3A-09

10:00 A.M. JACKSON, MS 39232 ST. PAUL, MN 55144-1000
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY HEIDI MCGEE ROBERT J. SCHOUVELLER
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT HEIDI MCGEE AMY SCHOENECKER
TELEPHONE 800-367-1492 800-553-1380
FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 888-246-9793
1.2 PRESSURE SENSITIVE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, SIGN
FACES PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN PRICES EACH WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
COMME COUNTY ID#
SIZE / DESCRIPTION CODE DG 1-50 51 + 1-50 51 +
48 STOP 801-49 4473 $81.36 $81.23 NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID
MFG NAME: 3M MFG NAME: ALTERNATE MFG NAME: 3M MFG NAME: ALTERNATE
PRODUCT# TPM5 PRODUCT# R-TAPE PRODUCT#SCPM-3 PRODUCT#
TAC LEVEL TAC LEVEL TAC LEVEL:MEDIUM TAC LEVEL
2.0 APPLICATION TAPE (PRE- COMM COUNTY ID# TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC
MASK) CODE EG UOM:100 YARDS UOM:100 YARDS UOM: UOM:
1INCH 832-69 3398 $10.12 *$3.20 (1.25") NO BID NO BID
2 INCH 832-69 3399 $20.23 *$5.77 (2.25") NO BID NO BID
3 INCH 832-69 3400 $30.34 *$8.34 (3.25") NO BID NO BID
4 INCH 832-69 3401 $40.45 $10.91 (4.25") $13.09 NO BID
5 INCH 832-69 3402 $52.01 *$13.48 (5.25") NO BID NO BID
6 INCH 832-69 3403 $60.67 $16.69 (65") $19.64 NO BID
7 INCH 832-69 3404 $72.81 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 INCH 832-69 3405 $91.02 *$21.83 (85") $26.18 NO BID
10 INCH 832-69 3406 $121.35 *$26.96 (10.5") NO BID NO BID
12 INCH 832-69 3407 $121.31 $30.81 $39.27 NO BID
15 INCH 832-69 3408 $182.03 *$38.51 $49.09 NO BID




DATE OF BID OPENING CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP. 3M COMPANY
THURSDAY,JUNE 4, 2009 1120 FLAOWOOD DRIVE 3M CENTER, BLDG 235-3A-09
10:00 A.M. JACKSON, MS 39232 ST. PAUL, MN 55144-1000
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY HEIDI MCGEE ROBERT J. SCHOUVELLER
JULY 8, 2009-JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT HEIDI MCGEE AMY SCHOENECKER
TELEPHONE 800-367-1492 800-553-1380
FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 888-246-9793
MFG NAME: 3M MFG NAME: ALTERNATE MFG NAME: 3M MFG NAME: ALTERNATE
PRODUCT# TPM5 PRODUCT# R-TAPE PRODUCT#SCPM-3 PRODUCT#
TAC LEVEL TAC LEVEL TAC LEVEL:MEDIUM TAC LEVEL
2.0 APPLICATION TAPE (PRE- COMM COUNTY ID# TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC TYPE: PAPER / PLASTIC
MASK) CODE EG UOM:100 YARDS UOM:100 YARDS UOM: UOM:
18 INCH 832-69 3409 $182.02 46.22 $58.91 NO BID
20 INCH 832-69 3410 $364.04 *$51.35 NO BID NO BID
22 INCH 832-69 3411 $364.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 INCH 832-69 3412 $242.70 58.07 $78.54 NO BID
30 INCH 832-69 3413 $303.37 72.59 $98.17 NO BID
36 INCH 832-69 3414 $364.04 87.11 $117.81 NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 30 OR SOONER 5-10 ARO
*FREIGHT CARRIER'S DELIVER TO DOCK ONLY; DRIVERS DO
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS NOT UNLOAD NONE
INCLUDED ALL BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED

ANY ADDITIONAL COMMENTS OR INFORMATION

EXCEPTIONS: SECTION 2.0 APPLICATION TAPE

Per vendor, a lot of the sizes requested are non standard for the TPM5 3M product.
Therefore, the non standard sizes require a $100.00 slit fee per order and per size.
Also, a full web must be ordered. A full web is 36", so if ordering a 2" must order in
increments of (18). If you take 18x2=36 which gives you a full web. Non standard
sizes are marked on price sheet with an (*). If number does not divide equally then
round up. Example, 36 divide by 5 (5") roll = 7.2 round up to 8. Means 8 rolls must b|
ordered to get full web.

Section 2.0 Alternate: Minimum Order required on the following sizes: 1.25"-(36),
2.25"-(20),3.25"-(12), 5.25"(8),10.5"-(4),15"-(4), 18"-(2),20"-(2). Must order in the
increments listed above.

NONE




