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Printed 6/19/2009BID #09-38ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS

BID TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.

CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID # 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 +

6" x 12" 801-09 1054 $1.17 $1.10 $1.08 $1.44 $1.44 $1.44 $1.12 $1.12 $1.12 $2.28 $2.23 $2.18 $1.05 $1.04 $1.02

6" X 18" 801-09 7208 $1.80 $1.69 $1.66 $1.71 $1.71 $1.71 $1.62 $1.62 $1.62 $2.79 $2.74 $2.69 $1.58 $1.55 $1.53

6" X 24" 801-09 7209 $2.28 $2.14 $2.10 $2.14 $2.14 $2.14 $2.12 $2.12 $2.12 $3.30 $3.25 $3.20 $2.10 $2.07 $2.04

6" X 30" 801-09 7210 $2.84 $2.68 $2.63 $2.57 $2.57 $2.57 $2.65 $2.65 $2.65 $3.81 $3.76 $3.71 $2.63 $2.59 $2.55

6" X 36" 801-09 7211 $3.06 $2.93 $2.90 $3.06 $3.06 $3.06 $3.18 $3.18 $3.18 $4.33 $4.28 $4.23 $3.15 $3.11 $3.06

9" X 12" 801-09 $1.80 $1.69 $1.66 $1.86 $1.86 $1.86 $1.66 $1.66 $1.66 $2.79 $2.74 $2.69 $1.58 $1.55 $1.53

12" x 18" 801-09 837 $2.98 $2.85 $2.83 $2.77 $2.77 $2.77 $3.21 $3.21 $3.21 $4.33 $4.28 $4.23 $3.15 $3.11 $3.06

12" x 36" 801-09 2261 $5.64 $5.44 $5.40 $5.69 $5.69 $5.69 $6.21 $6.21 $6.21 $7.40 $7.35 $7.30 $6.12 $6.06 $5.94

18" x 18" 801-09 838 $4.37 $4.19 $4.15 $4.28 $4.28 $4.28 $4.82 $4.82 $4.82 $5.86 $5.81 $5.76 $4.73 $4.66 $4.59

18" x 24" 801-09 839 $5.64 $5.44 $5.40 $5.42 $5.42 $5.42 $6.31 $6.31 $6.31 $7.40 $7.35 $7.30 $6.12 $6.06 $5.94

24" x 8" 801-09 840 $2.65 $2.54 $2.51 $2.75 $2.75 $2.75 $2.81 $2.81 $2.81 $3.98 $3.93 $3.88 $2.79 $2.75 $2.71

24" x 24" 801-09 841 $7.52 $7.25 $7.19 $7.15 $7.15 $7.15 $8.35 $8.35 $8.35 $9.60 $9.40 $9.40 $8.16 $8.08 $7.92

24" x 30" 801-09 1654 $9.33 $8.99 $8.92 $8.89 $8.89 $8.89 $10.34 $10.34 $10.34 $12.00 $11.75 $11.75 $10.20 $10.10 $9.90

24" x 36" 801-09 2191 $11.20 $10.79 $10.70 $10.97 $10.97 $10.97 $12.33 $12.33 $12.33 $14.40 $14.10 $14.10 $12.24 $12.12 $11.88

24" x 48" 801-09 3277 $14.93 $14.39 $14.27 $14.57 $14.57 $14.57 $16.76 $16.76 $16.76 $19.20 $18.80 $18.80 $16.32 $16.16 $15.84

24" Octagon 801-09 842 $6.63 $6.59 $6.59 $6.77 $6.77 $6.77 $7.53 $7.53 $7.53 $9.60 $9.40 $9.40 $8.16 $8.08 $7.92

30" x 30" 801-09 843 $11.66 $11.24 $11.15 $11.06 $11.06 $11.06 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $15.00 $14.69 $14.69 $12.75 $12.63 $12.38

30" Octagon 801-09 844 $10.43 $10.06 $9.98 $9.33 $9.33 $9.33 $11.72 $11.72 $11.72 $15.00 $14.69 $14.69 $12.75 $12.63 $12.38

30" Round 801-09 846 $10.43 $10.06 $9.98 $11.26 $11.26 $11.26 $19.10 $19.10 $19.10 $15.00 $14.69 $14.69 $14.44 $14.31 $14.06

36" x 36" 801-09 847 $16.79 $16.19 $16.05 $16.25 $16.25 $16.25 $18.48 $18.48 $18.48 $21.60 $21.15 $21.15 $18.36 $18.18 $17.82

ROCAL, INC.

3186 CR 550
FRANKFORT, OH 45628

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

MARK JOHNSON

800-637-7233

760-246-5512

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

740-998-2122

740-998-2073

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

9875 YUCCA ROAD
APPLEVALLEY, CA 92301

MARK JOHNSONJENNI KALBFLEISCH

BLOOMINGTON, IN 47404
4495 W. VERNAL PIKE

HALL SIGNS, INC.

DAVID BEVIACQUA

FOLEY, AL 36535
408 EAST BERRY

VULCAN, INC. (d.b.a. VULCAN SIGNS)

251-943-1544

800-633-6845

DAVID BEVIACQUA

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

888-329-7446

800-284-7446

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

TELEPHONE NO.

FAX NUMBER

DESCRIPTION: 1.0 ALUMINUM SIGN BLANKS

QUOTED BY

CONTACT PERSON

BIDDERS  NAME

JACKSON, MS 39232
1120 FLOWOOD DR

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

800-206-3444

800-367-1492

HEIDI MCGEE

HEIDI MCGEE
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Printed 6/19/2009

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.

CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID # 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 +

ROCAL, INC.

3186 CR 550
FRANKFORT, OH 45628

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

MARK JOHNSON

800-637-7233

760-246-5512

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

740-998-2122

740-998-2073

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

9875 YUCCA ROAD
APPLEVALLEY, CA 92301

MARK JOHNSONJENNI KALBFLEISCH

BLOOMINGTON, IN 47404
4495 W. VERNAL PIKE

HALL SIGNS, INC.

DAVID BEVIACQUA

FOLEY, AL 36535
408 EAST BERRY

VULCAN, INC. (d.b.a. VULCAN SIGNS)

251-943-1544

800-633-6845

DAVID BEVIACQUA

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

888-329-7446

800-284-7446

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

TELEPHONE NO.

FAX NUMBER

DESCRIPTION: 1.0 ALUMINUM SIGN BLANKS

QUOTED BY

CONTACT PERSON

BIDDERS  NAME

JACKSON, MS 39232
1120 FLOWOOD DR

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

800-206-3444

800-367-1492

HEIDI MCGEE

HEIDI MCGEE

36 " Octagon 801-09 878 $15.03 $14.52 $14.41 $15.08 $15.08 $15.08 $16.64 $16.64 $16.64 $21.60 $21.15 $21.15 $18.36 $18.18 $17.82

36" Yield (measures 30" wide) 801-09 849 $9.14 $8.84 $8.77 $8.25 $8.25 $8.25 $9.32 $9.32 $9.32 $21.60 $21.15 $21.15 $9.67 $9.56 $9.40

36" Round 801-09 850 $15.03 $14.52 $14.41 $14.91 $14.91 $14.91 $28.77 $28.77 $28.77 $21.60 $21.15 $21.15 $20.07 $19.80 $19.53
30-45 DAYS

*500 LB MINIMUM PER ORDER - MAY BE 
COMBINED WITH SECTION 2.0

**FREIGHT CARRIERS DO NOT UNLOAD - 
PRICES ARE FOR DELIVERY TO DOCK 30-45 DAYS21-30 DAYS30 DAYS30 DAYS

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS

Days to deliver 

ADDENDUMS INCLUDED
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BID TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.

CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

6" x 12" 801-09 1054

6" X 18" 801-09 7208

6" X 24" 801-09 7209

6" X 30" 801-09 7210

6" X 36" 801-09 7211

9" X 12" 801-09

12" x 18" 801-09 837

12" x 36" 801-09 2261

18" x 18" 801-09 838

18" x 24" 801-09 839

24" x 8" 801-09 840

24" x 24" 801-09 841

24" x 30" 801-09 1654

24" x 36" 801-09 2191

24" x 48" 801-09 3277

24" Octagon 801-09 842

30" x 30" 801-09 843

30" Octagon 801-09 844

30" Round 801-09 846

36" x 36" 801-09 847

TELEPHONE NO.

FAX NUMBER

DESCRIPTION: 1.0 ALUMINUM SIGN BLANKS

QUOTED BY

CONTACT PERSON

BIDDERS  NAME

1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 +

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

JOHN GRAVES

888-571-9525

870-438-6140

AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS

1000 WEST MAIN
GREEN FOREST, AR 72638

JOHN GRAVES

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

800-352-2092 877-696-2701

JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO

800-547-0874 800-882-5543

SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 HARVEY, IL 60426

JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF 
TEXAS, INC ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT CORP

4435 HUNTER ROAD 16100 S LATHROP AVE

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.

8341 EPICENTER BLVD
LAKELAND, FL 33809

DAVID A VESPA

DAVID A VESPA

863-984-1385

863-984-0058

281-448-7711

281-591-6827

H.STEVEN NELSON

TRANTEX, INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77086

H.STEVEN NELSON
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DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.

CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

TELEPHONE NO.

FAX NUMBER

DESCRIPTION: 1.0 ALUMINUM SIGN BLANKS

QUOTED BY

CONTACT PERSON

BIDDERS  NAME

36 " Octagon 801-09 878

36" Yield (measures 30" wide) 801-09 849

36" Round 801-09 850

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS

Days to deliver 

ADDENDUMS INCLUDED

1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 +

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

JOHN GRAVES

888-571-9525

870-438-6140

AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS

1000 WEST MAIN
GREEN FOREST, AR 72638

JOHN GRAVES

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

800-352-2092 877-696-2701

JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO

800-547-0874 800-882-5543

SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 HARVEY, IL 60426

JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF 
TEXAS, INC ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT CORP

4435 HUNTER ROAD 16100 S LATHROP AVE

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN 
QUANTITIES SHOWN

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.

8341 EPICENTER BLVD
LAKELAND, FL 33809

DAVID A VESPA

DAVID A VESPA

863-984-1385

863-984-0058

281-448-7711

281-591-6827

H.STEVEN NELSON

TRANTEX, INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77086

H.STEVEN NELSON

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BIDNO BID NO BIDNO BIDNO BID


