BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID #09-38 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS NAME PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT CORP CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP VULCAN , INC (dba VULCAN SIGNS)
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009 4435 HUNTER ROAD 16100 S LATHROP AVE 1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE 408 EAST BERRY
10:00 A.M. SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 HARVEY, IL 60426 JACKSON, MS 39232 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 800-547-0874 800-882-5543 800-367-1492 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 800-206-3444 251-943-1544
**QUOTED 50' ROLLS
QUOTING .250 MILL INSTEAD
PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL OF .150 MIL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL
COMM COUNTY ID
8.0 RUMBLE STRIPS CODE # COLOR MFG NAME  [MFG # 1-25 25+ MFG NAME  [MFG # 1-25 25+ MFG NAME  [MFG # 1-25 25+ MFG NAME  [MFG # 1-25 25+
RUMBLE STRIPS 550-79 3350 ORANGE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ATM VARIES 256.77 $242.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
RUMBLE STRIPS 550-79 3351 BLACK NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ATM VARIES 256.77 $242.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
RUMBLE STRIPS 550-79 3352 WHITE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ATM VARIES 256.77 $242.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9.0 SIGN POSTS
COMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.1 COLOR COATED CODE # LENGTH  [[MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 891 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ALLIED - $22.62 $836.94 37 cpPC VARIES 35.49 1265.77 37 - - $25.87 $957.19 37
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3846 10' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ALLIED - $22.62 $836.94 37 cpPC VARIES 33.35 1189.92 37 - - $25.31 $936.47 37
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 892 12' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ALLIED - $26.14 $967.18 37 cpPC VARIES 4213 1501.83 37 - - $31.04 $1,148.48 37
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3847 12' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ALLIED - $26.14 $967.18 37 CPC VARIES 39.57 1410.81 37 - - $30.37 $1,123.69 37
COMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.2 GALVANIZED CODE # LENGTH  [[MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 893 10 ALLIED . $16.79 $621.23 37 ALLIED - $16.62 $614.94 37 cpPC RPOR010 $14.93 $531.32 37 - - $15.64 $578.68 37
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3848 10' ALLIED - $16.79 $621.23 37 ALLIED - $16.62 $614.94 37 cpPC RPORG1017 $20.02 $715.58 37 - - $15.00 $558.33 37
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 894 12' ALLIED . $10.98 $739.26 37 ALLIED - $18.94 $700.78 37 cpPC RPORG12 $17.92 $637.51 37 - - $18.78 $694.86 37
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3849 12' ALLIED - $19.98 $739.26 37 ALLIED - $19.84 $700.78 37 CPC RPORG1217 $23.57 $841.75 37 - - $18.10 $669.70 37
CcOoMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.3 U-CHANNEL CODE # LENGTH  [[MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
U-CHANNEL, 2 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 901 10' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ALLIED - $17.81 $890.50 50 cpPC RPOCG102 $15.53 $747.00 50 - - $14.33 $716.50 50
U-CHANNEL,1.12 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 3851 10' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ALLIED - $9.86 $986.00 100 cpPC RPOCG101 $11.18 $1,000.00 100 - - $9.67 $483.50 50
U-CHANNEL,2 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 902 12' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ALLIED - $21.38 $1,069.00 50 cpPC RPOCG122 $18.63 $896.00 50 - - $17.20 $860.00 50
U-CHANNEL, 1.12 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 3852 12' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ALLIED - $11.83 $1,183.00 100 CPC RPOCG121 $13.32 $1,200.00 100 - - $11.48 $574.00 50
CcOoMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.4 SOCKETS & WEDGES CODE # MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
POZLOC
POZ-LOC SOCKETS 801-30 1045 ALLIED - $8.98 $332.26 37 ALLIED - $7.29 $269.73 37 cPC SOCKET $12.93 $313.00 25 - - $9.46 $236.50 25
POZLOC
WEDGES FOR POZ-LOC SOCKETS 801-30 3850 ALLIED - $3.33 $123.21 37 ALLIED - $2.36 $87.32 37 CPC WEDGE $5.77 $140.75 25 - - $3.19 $79.75 25
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 17 - 28 DAYS 30-45 DAYS 35-45 DAYS; SOONER IF IN STOCK 30-60 DAYS

1of9




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

4435 HUNTER ROAD

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT CORP
16100 S LATHROP AVE

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP
1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

VULCAN , INC (dba VULCAN SIGNS)
408 EAST BERRY

10:00 A.M. SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 HARVEY, IL 60426 JACKSON, MS 39232 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 800-547-0874 800-882-5543 800-367-1492 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 800-206-3444 251-943-1544
**QUOTED 50' ROLLS
QUOTING .250 MILL INSTEAD
PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL OF .150 MIL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL
10.0 SLOW MOVING VEHICLE PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM
CcoMM
CODE cout COLOR MFG NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + MFG NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + MFG NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + MFG NAME MFG # 1-9 10 +
SIGN WITH MOUNTING BRACKET, 16" X BRACKET +
14" 801-83 2567 RED / ORANGE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID cPC RSMVIO 16.15 $15.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN ONLY, 16" X 14" 8010-83 3306 RED / ORANGE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID cpPC RSMVIO 6.15 $5.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID 30 DAYS NO BID
COMM COUNTY ID PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTY IN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN
11.0 SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES CODE # MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 19 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 19 10 + BOX BOX
SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, FLAT 801-12 2041 MD $4.00 $3.90 $185.00 50 - $4.09 $4.09 cpPC $4.26 $4.06 $203.00 50 - $5.85 $5.65 $282.50 50
SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, EXTRUDED 801-12 2042 MD $4.00 $3.90 $185.00 50 - $4.09 $4.09 cpPC $4.26 $4.06 $203.00 50 - $5.85 $5.65 $282.50 50
SIGN, CAP, 2-/38" ROUND, RAIN, FLAT
ToP 801-12 2043 MD $2.50 $2.25 $97.00 50 - $3.00 $3.00 cPC $3.13 $2.98 $298.00 100 - $4.51 $4.31 $215.50 50
SIGN, CAP, 2-/38" ROUND, RAIN, DOME
ToP 801-12 2044 MD $2.50 $2.25 $97.00 50 - $3.00 $3.00 cPC $2.10 $1.40 $140.00 100 - $1.68 $1.62 $81.00 50
SIGN, MOUNTING BRACKET SET,
2-3/8", 7238 801-12 2045 VULCAN $5.30 $4.90 $140.00 50 - $4.30 $4.30 cPC $3.73 $3.50 $350.00 100 - $2.15 $2.15 $107.50 50
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE
FLAT 801-12 2046 MD $4.00 $3.90 $185.00 50 - $3.90 $3.90 cPC $4.06 $3.87 $193.50 50 - $5.15 $4.98 $249.00 50
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE,
EXTRUDED 801-12 2047 MD $4.00 $3.90 $185.00 50 - $3.90 $3.90 cPC $4.06 $3.87 $193.50 50 - $5.15 $4.98 $249.00 50
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE,
FLAT 801-12 2048 MD $4.00 $3.90 $185.00 50 - $3.90 $3.90 cPC $4.06 $3.87 $193.50 50 - $5.15 $4.98 $249.00 50
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE,
EXTRUDED 801-12 2049 MD $4.00 $3.90 $185.00 50 - $3.90 $3.90 CPC $4.06 $3.87 $193.50 50 - $5.15 $4.98 $249.00 50
COMM COUNTY ID PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTY IN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTY IN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN
11.0 SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES CODE # MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX
SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, FLAT 801-12 2050 MD $4.00 $3.90 $180.00 50 - $3.96 $3.96 cPC $4.13 $3.93 $196.50 50 - $5.15 $4.98 $249.00 50
SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, EXTRUDED 801-12 2051 MD $4.00 $3.90 $180.00 50 - $3.96 $3.96 cPC $4.13 $3.93 $196.50 50 - $5.15 $4.98 $249.00 50
BRACKET, 7238 ALUMINUM INTER LOCK |  8010-12 6658 VULCAN $1.60 $1.50 $70.00 50 - $2.15 $2.15 cPC $3.73 $3.50 $350.00 100 - $1.08 $1.08 $108.00 100
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 10-14 DAYS 30-45 DAYS 30 DAYS 14-30 DAYS
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC
4435 HUNTER ROAD

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT CORP
16100 S LATHROP AVE
HARVEY, IL 60426

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP
1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE
JACKSON, MS 39232

VULCAN , INC (dba VULCAN SIGNS)
408 EAST BERRY
FOLEY, AL 36535

10:00 A.M. SAN MARCOS, TX 78666
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 800-547-0874 800-882-5543 800-367-1492 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 800-206-3444 251-943-1544

PRICE PER ROLL

PRICE PER ROLL

**QUOTED 50' ROLLS
QUOTING .250 MILL INSTEAD
OF .150 MIL PRICE PER ROLL

PRICE PER ROLL

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

10-14 DAYS

30-45 DAYS

**SECTION 9.1 ALL POSTS MUST BE ORDERED IN BUNDLES OF (37)
IDENTICAL POST

***SECTION 9.2 THE 10'17 GA AND 12' 17 GA MUST BE ORDERED IN BUNDLES]

OF (37) IDENTICAL POSTS

EXCEPTIONS:

**+SECTION 9.3 THE 1.12LB U CHANNEL POST MUST BE ORDERED IN FULL ||3.1 THE RENEWAL CLAUSE MAY BE EXERCISED ONLY UPON MUTUAL

BUNDLES OF IDENTICAL POSTS

IAGREEMENT OF BOTH VULCAN SIGNS AND BRAZORIA COUNTY

*++SECTION 11 QUOTING 5-1/2 " SLOT FOR BRACKETS, NOT SPECIFIED  (4.6.1 WE TAKE EXCEPTION TO INSIDE DELIVERY. WE SHIP COMMON

FREIGHT CARRIER'S DELIVER TO DOCK ONLY - DRIVERS DO NOT UNLOAD

ICARRIER WHICH DOES NOT INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY

30of9




BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID #09-38 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS NAME AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS HALL SIGNS, INC. SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY ROCAL, INC.
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009 1000 WEST MAIN 4495 W VERNAL PIKE 9875 YUCCA ROAD 3186 CR 550
10:00 A.M. GREEN FOREST, AR 72638 BLOOMINGTON, IN 47404 APPLEVALLEY, CA 92301 FRANKFORT, OH 45628
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
TELEPHONE 888-571-9525 800-284-7446 800-637-7233 740-998-2122
FAX NUMBER 870-438-6140 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL
COMM COUNTY ID
8.0 RUMBLE STRIPS CODE # COLOR MFG NAME  [MFG # 1-25 25+ MFG NAME  [MFG # 1-25 25+ MFG NAME  [MFG # 1-25 25+ MFG NAME  [MFG # 1-25 25+
RUMBLE STRIPS 550-79 3350 ORANGE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
RUMBLE STRIPS 550-79 3351 BLACK NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
RUMBLE STRIPS 550-79 3352 WHITE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9.0 SIGN POSTS
COMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.1 COLOR COATED CODE # LENGTH  |[MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 891 10' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3846 10' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 892 12' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3847 12' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.2 GALVANIZED CODE # LENGTH  |[MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 893 10' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3848 10' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 894 12' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3849 12' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CcoMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.3 U-CHANNEL CODE # LENGTH  [[MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
U-CHANNEL, 2 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 901 10' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID FRANKLIN PFGALV $22.68 $2,268.00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
U-CHANNEL,1.12 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 3851 10' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID FRANKLIN | PFGALVDEL $10.40 $1,040.00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
U-CHANNEL,2 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 902 12' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID FRANKLIN PFGALV $21.73 $2,173.00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
U-CHANNEL,1.12 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 3852 12' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COoMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.4 SOCKETS & WEDGES CODE # MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
POZ-LOC SOCKETS 801-30 1045 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WEDGES FOR POZ-LOC SOCKETS 801-30 3850 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30-45 DAYS ARO-NON STOCK POSTS MAY TAKE UP TO 90 DAYS
SECTION 9.3 MIN OF 100 POSTS PER ORDER
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID 10' 1.12 LB MUST BE ORDERED IN MULTIPLES OF 100 NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS
1000 WEST MAIN

HALL SIGNS, INC.

4495 W VERNAL PIKE

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY
9875 YUCCA ROAD

ROCAL, INC.
3186 CR 550

10:00 A.M. GREEN FOREST, AR 72638 BLOOMINGTON, IN 47404 APPLEVALLEY, CA 92301 FRANKFORT, OH 45628
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
TELEPHONE 888-571-9525 800-284-7446 800-637-7233 740-998-2122
FAX NUMBER 870-438-6140 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL
10.0 SLOW MOVING VEHICLE PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM
CcoMM
CODE cout COLOR MFG NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + MFG NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + MFG NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + MFG NAME MFG # 1-9 10 +
SIGN WITH MOUNTING BRACKET, 16" X
14" 801-83 2567 RED / ORANGE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN ONLY, 16" X 14" 8010-83 3306 RED / ORANGE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COoMM COUNTY ID PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTY IN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN
11.0 SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES CODE # MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 19 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 19 10 + BOX BOX
HALL SIGNS $3.86 $3.78 $189.00 50
SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, FLAT 801-12 2041 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Hs1 12" $10.33 $9.50 $237.50 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HALL SIGNS $3.86 $3.78 $189.00 50
SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, EXTRUDED 801-12 2042 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Hs1 12" $10.33 $9.50 $237.50 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, 2-/38" ROUND, RAIN, FLAT
ToP 801-12 2043 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID HALL SIGNS $7.25 $5.27 $263.50 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, 2-/38" ROUND, RAIN, DOME
ToP 801-12 2044 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID HALL SIGNS $2.29 $1.58 $79.00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, MOUNTING BRACKET SET,
2-3/8", 7238 801-12 2045 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID HALL SIGNS $3.61 $3.43 $343.00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE HALL SIGNS $3.86 $3.78 $189.00 50
FLAT 801-12 2046 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Hs1 12" $10.33 $9.50 $237.50 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE, HALL SIGNS $3.86 $3.78 $189.00 50
EXTRUDED 801-12 2047 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Hs1 12" $10.33 $9.50 $237.50 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE, HALL SIGNS $3.86 $3.78 $189.00 50
FLAT 801-12 2048 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Hs1 12" $10.33 $9.50 $237.50 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE, HALL SIGNS $3.86 $3.78 $189.00 50
EXTRUDED 801-12 2049 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Hs1 12" $10.33 $9.50 $237.50 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COMM COUNTY ID PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTY IN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTY IN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN
11.0 SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES CODE # MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX
HALL SIGNS $3.86 $3.78 $189.00 50
SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, FLAT 801-12 2050 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Hs1 12" $10.33 $9.50 $237.50 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HALL SIGNS $3.86 $3.78 $189.00 50
SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, EXTRUDED 801-12 2051 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Hs1 12" $10.33 $9.50 $237.50 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BRACKET, 7238 ALUMINUM INTER LOCK | 8010-12 6658 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID HALL SIGNS $1.82 $1.73 $346.00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30-45 DAYS ARO
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID “ALTERNATE PRICING FOR 12" BRACKETS LISTED ON BOTTOM NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT
TELEPHONE
FAX NUMBER

AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS
1000 WEST MAIN
GREEN FOREST, AR 72638
JOHN GRAVES
JOHN GRAVES
888-571-9525
870-438-6140

HALL SIGNS, INC.
4495 W VERNAL PIKE
BLOOMINGTON, IN 47404
JENNI KALBFLEISCH
JENNI KALBFLEISCH
800-284-7446
888-329-7446

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY
9875 YUCCA ROAD
APPLEVALLEY, CA 92301
MARK JOHNSON
MARK JOHNSON
800-637-7233
760-246-5512

ROCAL, INC.

3186 CR 550
FRANKFORT, OH 45628
ALAN CHRISTOPHER
ALAN CHRISTOPHER
740-998-2122
740-998-2073

PRICE PER ROLL

PRICE PER ROLL

PRICE PER ROLL

PRICE PER ROLL

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

INCLUDED CATALOG & COVER LETTER

NONE

6 0of 9




BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID #09-38 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX,INC.
3310-D FRICK ROAD

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST, INC.
8341 EPICENTER BLVD

10:00 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON DAVID VESPA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT DAVE POFFENGBERGER DAVID VESPA
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 863-984-1385
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058
PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL
COMM COUNTY ID
8.0 RUMBLE STRIPS CODE # COLOR MFG NAME  [MFG # 1-25 25+ MFG NAME  [MFG # 1-25 25+
FLINT
RUMBLE STRIPS 550-79 3350 ORANGE 60' PKG RSO 240 $225.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLINT
RUMBLE STRIPS 550-79 3351 BLACK 60' PKG RSB 250 $235.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLINT
RUMBLE STRIPS 550-79 3352 WHITE 60' PKG RSW 280 $265.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9.0 SIGN POSTS
COMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.1 COLOR COATED CODE # LENGTH  |[MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 891 10 NW PIPE Y16-10 $31.00 $1,147.00 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3846 10' NW PIPE Y17-10 $29.80 $1,102.60 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 892 12' NW PIPE Y16-12 $37.20 $1,376.40 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COLOR COATED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3847 12' NW PIPE Y17-12 $35.76 $1,323.12 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO
COMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.2 GALVANIZED CODE # LENGTH  |[MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 893 10 NW PIPE G16-10 $16.50 $610.50 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3848 10' NW PIPE G17-10 $15.20 $562.40 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 894 12' NW PIPE G16-12 $19.80 $732.60 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 17 GA 801-30 3849 12' NW PIPE G17-12 $18.24 $674.88 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CcoMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.3 U-CHANNEL CODE # LENGTH  [[MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
U-CHANNEL, 2 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 901 10' TRANTEX 2HG10 $26.50 $962.00 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
U-CHANNEL,1.12 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 3851 10' TRANTEX 1HG10 $24.50 $888.00 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
U-CHANNEL,2 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 902 12' TRANTEX 2HG12 $31.80 $1,158.10 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
U-CHANNEL,1.12 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 3852 12" TRANTEX 1HG12 $29.80 $1,084.10 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COoMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF PRICE PER |PRICE PER | SIZE OF
9.4 SOCKETS & WEDGES CODE # MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG # POST  |BUNDLE BUNDLE
POZ-LOC SOCKETS 801-30 1045 NW PIPE PLS $9.25 - N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WEDGES FOR POZ-LOC SOCKETS 801-30 3850 NW PIPE PLW $2.60 . N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 30 DAYS NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX,INC.
3310-D FRICK ROAD

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST, INC.
8341 EPICENTER BLVD

10:00 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON DAVID VESPA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT DAVE POFFENGBERGER DAVID VESPA
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 863-984-1385
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058
PRICE PER ROLL PRICE PER ROLL
10.0 SLOW MOVING VEHICLE PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM
CcoMM
CODE cout COLOR MFG NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + MFG NAME MFG # 1-9 10 +
SIGN WITH MOUNTING BRACKET, 16" X SAFETY
14" 801-83 2567 RED / ORANGE FLAG 7330 12.75 $12.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SAFETY
SIGN ONLY, 16" X 14" 8010-83 3306 RED / ORANGE FLAG 7332 11.75 $11.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 7-10 DAYS NO BID
COoMM COUNTY ID PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN
11.0 SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES CODE # MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 19 10 + BOX BOX
SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, FLAT 801-12 2041 TRANTEX $8.90 $8.75 $437.50 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, EXTRUDED 801-12 2042 TRANTEX $8.90 $8.75 $437.50 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, 2-/38" ROUND, RAIN, FLAT
ToP 801-12 2043 TRANTEX $6.90 $6.75 $337.50 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, 2-/38" ROUND, RAIN, DOME
ToP 801-12 2044 TRANTEX $2.65 $2.55 $127.50 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, MOUNTING BRACKET SET,
2-3/8", 7238 801-12 2045 TRANTEX $3.35 $3.15 $157.50 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE
FLAT 801-12 2046 TRANTEX $7.85 $7.70 $385.00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE,
EXTRUDED 801-12 2047 TRANTEX $7.85 $7.70 $385.00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE,
FLAT 801-12 2048 TRANTEX $7.85 $7.70 $385.00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE,
EXTRUDED 801-12 2049 TRANTEX $7.85 $7.70 $385.00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COMM COUNTY ID PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTY IN PRICE PRICE PRICE PER QTYIN
11.0 SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES CODE # MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX MFG # 1-9 10 + BOX BOX
SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, FLAT 801-12 2050 TRANTEX $7.85 $7.70 $385.00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, EXTRUDED 801-12 2051 TRANTEX $7.85 $7.70 $385.00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BRACKET, 7238 ALUMINUM INTER LOCK | 8010-12 6658 TRANTEX $1.80 $1.75 $175.00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 21-30 DAYS NO BID
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TRANTEX,INC.

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST, INC.

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

3310-D FRICK ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77086

8341 EPICENTER BLVD
LAKELAND, FL 33809

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON DAVID VESPA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT DAVE POFFENGBERGER DAVID VESPA
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 863-984-1385
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058
PRICE PER ROLL

PRICE PER ROLL

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
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