BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID # 09-38 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

4435 HUNTER ROAD

16100 S LATHROP AVE

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

408 EAST BERRY

10:00 A.M. SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 HARVEY, IL 60426 JACKSON, MS 39232 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 800-547-0874 800-882-5543 800-367-1492 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 800-206-3444 251-943-1544
PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES
QUANTITIES SHOWN QUANTITIES SHOWN QUANTITIES SHOWN SHOWN
PER PER PER PER PER PER PRICE PER | PRICE PER
COMM COUNTY ID MFG EACH EACH MFG EACH EACH MFG EACH EACH MEG EACH EACH
3.0 CUSTOM FABRICATED SIGN  |CODE # NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ NAME MFG # 1-50 51+
SIGN, REGULAR SHEETING CALOBOVWH
(VINYL) 801-83 3324 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC 1824G1 $8.46 $8.47 VULCAN - $10.57 $10.41
SIGN, ENGINEER GRADE $1824CUST
SHEETING 801-83 837 NO BID NO BID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID | NOBID | NOBID CPC EA $8.46 $8.47 VULCAN - $11.09 $10.92
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID 30 DAYS 30 - 45 DAYS
COMM COUNTY ID
4.0 STREET SIGNS CODE # PRICE PER QTY PRICE PER QTY PRICE PER QTY PRICE PER QTY
Street Name Sign Blanks with Engineer Grade
Green Sheeting Only 1-9 10-24 25-99 100+ 1-9 10-24 25-99 100+ 1-9 10-24 25-99 100+ 1-9 10-24 25-99 100+
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 3337 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NO BID $8.15 $7.87 $7.53 $7.21 $7.45 $7.30 $7.19 $7.12
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 3338 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID $9.51 $9.18 $8.79 $8.41 $8.84 $8.67 $8.54 $8.45
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 3339 NO BID NO BID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID | NOBID | NOBID $10.88 $10.48 $10.05 $9.62 $10.10 $9.90 $9.75 $9.65
Street Name Sign Blanks with Diamond Grade
Sheeting Only
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 6638 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID $21.68 $20.95 $20.25 $19.55 $20.02 $19.63 $19.34 $19.14
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 6639 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID $25.30 $24.44 $23.63 $22.81 $23.50 $23.04 $22.69 $22.46
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 6640 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID $28.92 $27.92 $27.00 $26.07 $26.86 $26.33 $25.95 $25.67
Street Name Sign Blanks with Engineer Grade ** VENDOR QUOTED DIAMOND GRADE
Sheeting and Diamond Grade Street Names ON DIAMOND GRADE SHEETING
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 3340 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.70 $34.83 $33.95 $33.87 $29.62 $29.04 $28.60 $28.31
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 3341 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID $42.77 $41.73 $40.68 $40.60 $34.71 $34.03 $33.52 $33.18
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 3342 NO BID NO BID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID | NOBID | NOBID $49.83 $48.63 $47.41 $47.31 $40.87 $38.92 $38.34 $37.95
Street Name Sign Blanks with Diamond Grade
Sheeting and Diamond Grade Street Names 1-9 10-24 25-99 100+ 1-9 10-24 25-99 100+ 1-9 10-24 25-99 100+ 1-9 10-24 25-99 100+
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 6641 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID $35.70 $34.83 $33.95 $33.87 $27.44 $26.90 $26.50 $26.25
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 6642 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID $42.77 $41.73 $40.68 $40.60 $32.20 $31.56 $31.09 $30.78
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 6643 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID $49.83 $48.63 $47.41 $47.31 $36.77 $36.05 $35.51 $35.15
30-45
*DIAMOND GRADE SHEETING NAME SIGNS WITH
DIAMOND GRADE NAMES. WE BID DIAMOND GRADE
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID 30 DAYS CUBED SHEETING BOTH SIDES WITH EC FILM
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

4435 HUNTER ROAD

16100 S LATHROP AVE

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

408 EAST BERRY

10:00 A.M. SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 HARVEY, IL 60426 JACKSON, MS 39232 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 800-547-0874 800-882-5543 800-367-1492 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 800-206-3444 251-943-1544
5.0 ROLL UP CONSTRUCTION SIGNS &
STANDS
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG MFG MFG
5.1 ROLL UP CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CODE # NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # 1-9 10 +
PATH
36" X 36" ROADWORK AHEAD 801-60 3617 MARK N/A $34.00 [ $ 34.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $25.38 $23.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
48" X 48" ROADWORK AHEAD 801-60 3618 MARK N/A $39.00 [ $ 39.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $26.92 $25.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
36" X 36" MEN WORKING 801-60 3619 MARK N/A $34.00 [ $ 34.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $25.38 $23.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
48" X 48" MEN WORKING 801-60 3620 MARK N/A $39.00 [ $ 39.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $26.92 $25.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
36" X 36" ROADWORK 5 MPH 801-60 3621 MARK N/A $34.00 [ $ 34.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $43.08 $40.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
48" X 48" ROADWORK 5 MPH 801-60 3622 MARK N/A $39.00 [ $ 39.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $57.69 $53.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
36" X 36" FLAGGER AHEAD 801-60 3623 MARK N/A $34.00 [ $ 34.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $25.38 $23.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
48" X 48" FLAGGER AHEAD 801-60 3624 MARK N/A $39.00 [ $ 39.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $26.92 $25.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
36" X 36" LOOSE GRAVEL 801-60 3625 MARK N/A $34.00 [ $ 34.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $43.08 $40.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
48" X 48" LOOSE GRAVEL 801-60 3626 MARK N/A $39.00 [ $ 39.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $57.69 $53.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
36" X 36" YIELD 801-60 3627 MARK N/A $34.00 [ $ 34.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $43.08 $40.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
48" X 48" YIELD 801-60 3628 MARK N/A $39.00 [ $ 39.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $57.69 $53.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
36" X 36" SLIPPERY WHEN WET 801-60 3629 MARK N/A $34.00 [ $ 34.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $43.08 $40.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
48" X 48" SLIPPERY WHEN WET 801-60 3630 MARK N/A $39.00 [ $ 39.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $57.69 $53.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
36" X 36" CUSTOM SIGN 801-60 3631 MARK N/A $36.00 [ $ 36.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $43.08 $40.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
48" X 48" CUSTOM SIGN 801-60 3632 MARK N/A $39.00 [ $ 39.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC VARIES | $57.69 $53.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 14-17 DAYS NO BID 30 DAYS NO BID
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG MFG MFG
5.2 ROLL UP SIGN STAND CODE # NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # 1-9 10 +
PATH
36" X 36" STAND 801-60 3653 MARK N/A $96.00 | $ 96.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID TRAFFIX [ 22000-USH| $127.11 | $124.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
36" X 36" SIGN HOLDER 801-60 6634 MARK N/A $96.00 [ $ 96.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID TRAFFIX | 22000-USH | $127.11 | $124.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
36" 36" RIBS FOR SIGN 801-60 3654 MARK N/A $12.00 [ $ 12.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC RMSR36 $6.92 $6.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
48" X 48" STAND 801-60 3655 MARK N/A $96.00 [ $ 96.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID TRAFFIX | 22000-USH | $127.11 | $124.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
48" X 48" SIGN HOLDER 801-60 6902 MARK N/A $96.00 | $ 96.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID TRAFFIX [ 22000-USH| $127.11 | $124.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATH
48" X 48" RIBS FOR SIGN 801-60 3656 MARK N/A $15.00 [ $ 15.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC RMSR48 | $10.15 $9.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 DAYS
**VENDOR QUOTED EQUIVALENT TO TRAFFIX
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 14-17 DAYS NO BID STAND #22000-USH NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM:
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

4435 HUNTER ROAD

16100 S LATHROP AVE

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

408 EAST BERRY

SAN MARCOS, TX 78666

HARVEY, IL 60426

JACKSON, MS 39232

FOLEY, AL 36535

[QUOTED BY

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L PINEDO

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

CONTACT

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L PINEDO

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

TELEPHONE

800-547-0874

800-882-5543

800-367-1492

800-633-6845

FAX NUMBER

800-352-2092

877-696-2701

800-206-3444

251-943-1544

PRICE EACH POST
WHEN ORDERED IN
QTY'S AS SHOWN

6.0 DELINEATORS

COMM COUNTY ID
#

CODE

MFG

NAME MFG # 1-50 51+

PRICE EACH POST
WHEN ORDERED IN
QTY'S AS SHOWN

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3"

550-41

3859

SAFE SAFE

HIT

HIT $23.95 $23.25

MFG
NAME

MFG #

1-50 51 +

PRICE EACH POST
WHEN ORDERED IN
QTY'S AS SHOWN

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP,
[AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3860

SAFE SAFE

HIT

HIT $23.95 $23.25

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

MFG
NAME

MFG #

1-50 51 +

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3'

550-41

3861

SAFE SAFE

HIT

HIT $24.95 $24.25

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP,
[AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3862

SAFE SAFE

HIT

HIT $26.95 $26.25

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NOBID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 1 SIDED, DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3863

SAFE SAFE

HIT

HIT $20.45 $19.95

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NOBID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 2 SIDED, DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3864

SAFE SAFE

HIT

HIT $21.95 $21.35

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
SURFACE MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND
GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3'

550-41

3865

SAFE SAFE

HIT

HIT $23.95 $23.25

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
SURFACE MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND
(GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3866

SAFE SAFE

HIT

HIT $23.95 $23.25

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NOBID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
SURFACE MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND
GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3'

550-41

3867

SAFE SAFE

HIT

HIT $24.95 $24.25

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NOBID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
SURFACE MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND
(GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3868

- $26.95 $26.25

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NOBID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 1 SIDED, DIAMNOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3869

- $20.45 $19.95

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NOBID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 2 SIDED, DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4'

550-41

3870

- $21.95 $21.35

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

2 PART POXY FOR SURFACE MOUNT
SHALL INCLUDE ONE (1) GALLON
EPOXY AND ONE (1) GALLON
CATALLIST

550-41

3871

INDUSTR
COATIN

IAL
G 10302 $70.00 $68.00

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NOBID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NOBID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID | NO BID

PRICE EACH POST WHEN
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS
SHOWN

MFG NAME

MFG # 1-50 51+

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

4435 HUNTER ROAD

16100 S LATHROP AVE

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

408 EAST BERRY

10:00 A.M. SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 HARVEY, IL 60426 JACKSON, MS 39232 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 800-547-0874 800-882-5543 800-367-1492 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 800-206-3444 251-943-1544
PRICE EACH POST PRICE EACH POST PRICE EACH POST
WHEN ORDERED IN WHEN ORDERED IN WHEN ORDERED IN AL i
QTY'S AS SHOWN QTY'S AS SHOWN QTY'S AS SHOWN SHOWN
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG MFG

6.0 DELINEATORS CODE # NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-50 51+
CARSONITE POST, FLAT, DRIVABLE, 1
SIDED DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE
SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER
COLOR;LENGTH 62" 550-41 3853 NO BID |NO BID NOBID | NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CARSONITE POST, CONCAVE,
DRIVABLE, 1 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 62"  |550-41 3855 NO BID |NO BID NOBID | NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CARSONITE POST, FLAT, DRIVABLE, 2
SIDED DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE
SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER
COLOR; LENGTH 62" 550-41 3854 NO BID |NO BID NOBID | NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CARSONITE POST, CONCAVE,
DRIVABLE, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 62"  |550-41 3856 NO BID |NO BID NOBID | NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STUB, ANCHOR FOR FLAT POST 550-41 3857 NO BID [NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STUB, ANCHOR FOR CONCAVE POST |550-41 3858 NO BID [NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 14-17 DAYS NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
7.0 PAVEMENT MARKERS PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM

COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG MFG MFG
7.1 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS CODE # NAME |MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + NAME |MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + NAME |MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +
TYPE 1-C (SINGLE RELFECTIVE FACE,
WHITE) 550-30 917 APEX 10101 EA - $1.29 $1.25 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID 3M 290W 1 1 $1.31 $1.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE II-A-A (TWO REFLECTIVE
FACES, BOTH AMBER) 550-30 918 APEX 10103 EA - $1.29 $1.25 NO BID NOBID [ NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID 3M 290YY 1 1 $1.31 $1.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE II-C-R (TWO REFLECTIVE
FACES; WHITE APPROACHING, RED
TRAILING) 550-30 919 APEX 10108 EA - $1.29 $1.25 NO BID NOBID [ NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID 3M 290RW 1 1 $1.31 $1.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE II-C-C (TWO REFLECTIVE
FACES; BOTH WHITE) 550-30 3310 APEX 10104 EA - $1.29 $1.25 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID 3M 290WwW 1 1 $1.31 $1.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

30 DAYS

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 10-14 DAYS NO BID **ADHESIVE IS NOT INCLUDED NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS NAME

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

VULCAN, INC. (dba VULCAN SIGNS)

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

4435 HUNTER ROAD

16100 S LATHROP AVE

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

408 EAST BERRY

10:00 A.M. SAN MARCOS, TX 78666 HARVEY, IL 60426 JACKSON, MS 39232 FOLEY, AL 36535
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOSE PEREZ TERI L PINEDO HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA
TELEPHONE 800-547-0874 800-882-5543 800-367-1492 800-633-6845
FAX NUMBER 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 800-206-3444 251-943-1544
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG MFG MFG
7.2 TEMPORARY MARKERS CODE # NAME |MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + NAME |MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + NAME |MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + INAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +
TEMPORARY MARKER,
POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP
SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND
ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: YELLOW
#932-2Y 550-34 6329 DAVIDSON 10126 PKG 500 $190.00 | $185.00 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC RPMCY2 PKG 500 $290.00 | $270.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TEMPORARY MARKER,
POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP
SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND
/ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: WHITE #932-
2w 550-34 7036 DAVIDSON 10124 PKG 500 $190.00 | $185.00 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC RPMCW2 PKG 500 $290.00 | $270.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 10-14 DAYS NO BID 30 DAYS NO BID
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG MFG MFG
7.3 END OF ROAD MARKER CODE # NAME MFG # 1-25 25+ NAME MFG # 1-25 25+ NAME MFG # 1-25 25+ NAME MFG # 1-9 10 +
PATH 518180M
RED ON RED 9, BUTTON, 18 X 18 801-83 3299 MARK - 22 $20.00 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC 41DA $24.00 | $23.72 VULCAN | EOR-18RR | $27.80 $27.80
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 10-14 DAYS NO BID 30 DAYS 30-45 DAYS
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG MFG MFG
7.4 OBJECT MARKERS CODE # NAME MFG # 1-25 25+ NAME MFG # 1-25 25+ NAME MFG # 1-25 25+ INAME MFG # 1-25 25+
PATH 506120M22
YELLOW ENGINEER GRADE, 6 X 12 801-83 3296 MARK - $3.95 $3.75 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC EA $2.06 $2.00 VULCAN | OM2-RSAY $1.92 $1.85
'YELLOW ON YELLOW, 3 BUTTON, 6" X PATH 506120M21
15 801-83 3297 MARK - $7.95 $7.25 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC EA $8.86 $8.79 VULCAN | OM2-615YY|  $6.50 $6.38
PATH 512360M3X
'YELLOW ENGINEER GRADE, 12 X 36 801-83 3298 MARK - $16.95 $16.25 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID CPC EA $8.46 $8.47 VULCAN RSAYOS $9.74 $9.39
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 10-14 DAYS NO BID 30 DAYS 30-45 DAYS
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION 10-14 DAYS NO BID 30 DAYS 30-45 DAYS
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DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS NAME AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS HALL SIGNS, INC. SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY ROCAL, INC.
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009 1000 WEST MAIN 4495 W. VERNAL PIKE 9875 YUCCA ROAD 3186 CR 550
10:00 A.M. GREEN FOREST, AR 72638 BLOOMINGTON, IN 47404 APPLEVALLEY, CA 92301 FRANKFORT, OH 45628
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
TELEPHONE 888-571-9525 800-284-7446 800-637-7233 740-998-2122
FAX NUMBER 870-438-6140 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES] PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES] PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES] PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES]
SHOWN SHOWN SHOWN SHOWN
PRICE PER | PRICE PER PRICE PER | PRICE PER PRICE PER | PRICE PER PRICE PER | PRICE PER
COMM COUNTY ID MFG EACH EACH MFG EACH EACH MFG EACH EACH MFG EACH EACH
3.0 CUSTOM FABRICATED SIGN  |CODE # NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ NAME MFG # 1-50 51+
SIGN, REGULAR SHEETING
(VINYL) 801-83 3324 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID HALL SIGNS | SS18X24V $22.90 $12.65 - - $13.70 $11.72 ROCAL, INC.| SPECIAL $10.74 $10.59
SIGN, ENGINEER GRADE
SHEETING 801-83 837 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID HALL SIGNS | SS18X24V $23.70 $13.45 - - $13.70 $11.72 ROCAL, INC. | SPECIAL $9.84 $9.69
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID 30-45 DAYS 21-30 DAYS 30-45 DAYS
COMM COUNTY ID PRICE PER QTY
4.0 STREET SIGNS CODE # PRICE PER QTY *500 LB MINIMUM PER ORDER PRICE PER QTY PRICE PER QTY
Street Name Sign Blanks with Engineer Grade
Green Sheeting Only 1-9 10-24 25-99 100+ 1-9 10-24 25-99 100+ 19 10-24 25-99 100+ 19 10-24 25-99 100+
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 3337 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.21 $7.21 $7.21 $7.21 $7.48 $7.23 $6.98 $6.98 $5.33 $5.04 $4.95 $4.95
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 3338 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.45 $8.45 $8.45 $8.45 $8.39 $8.14 $7.89 $7.89 $6.21 $5.88 $5.78 $5.78
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 3339 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.62 $9.62 $9.62 $9.62 $9.30 $9.05 $8.80 $8.80 $7.10 $6.72 $6.60 $6.60
Street Name Sign Blanks with Diamond Grade
Sheeting Only
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 6638 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.11 $19.11 $19.11 $19.11 $17.68 $17.43 $17.18 $17.18 $9.33 $9.05 $8.96 $8.96
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 6639 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.33 $22.33 $22.33 $22.33 $20.29 $20.04 $19.79 $19.79 $10.89 $10.55 $10.45 $10.45
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 6640 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.48 $25.48 $25.48 $25.48 $22.90 $22.65 $22.40 $22.40 $12.44 $12.06 $11.94 $11.94
Street Name Sign Blanks with Engineer Grade
Sheeting and Diamond Grade Street Names
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 3340 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.48 $20.48 $20.48 $20.48 $11.67 $11.39 $11.30 $11.30
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 3341 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.39 $21.39 $21.39 $21.39 $13.62 $13.28 $13.18 $13.18
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 3342 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.30 $22.30 $22.30 $22.30 $15.56 $15.18 $15.06 $15.06
Street Name Sign Blanks with Diamond Grade
Sheeting and Diamond Grade Street Names 19 10-24 25-99 100+
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 6641 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.60 $26.60 $26.60 $26.60 $30.68 $30.68 $30.68 $30.68 $15.69 $15.41 $15.32 $15.32
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 6642 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.33 $30.33 $30.33 $30.33 $33.29 $33.29 $33.29 $33.29 $18.31 $17.97 $17.87 $17.87
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 6643 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.32 $35.32 $35.32 $35.32 $35.90 $35.90 $35.90 $35.90 $20.92 $20.54 $20.42 $20.42
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID 30-45 DAYS 21-30 DAYS 30-45 DAYS
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DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS NAME AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS HALL SIGNS, INC. SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY ROCAL, INC.
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009 1000 WEST MAIN 4495 W. VERNAL PIKE 9875 YUCCA ROAD 3186 CR 550
10:00 A.M. GREEN FOREST, AR 72638 BLOOMINGTON, IN 47404 APPLEVALLEY, CA 92301 FRANKFORT, OH 45628
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
TELEPHONE 888-571-9525 800-284-7446 800-637-7233 740-998-2122
FAX NUMBER 870-438-6140 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
5.0 ROLL UP CONSTRUCTION SIGNS &
STANDS
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG MFG MFG
5.1 ROLL UP CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CODE # NAME MFG # 1-9 10+ NAME MFG # 1-9 10+ NAME MFG # 1-9 10+ NAME MFG # 1-9 10+
36" X 36" ROADWORK AHEAD 801-60 3617 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" ROADWORK AHEAD 801-60 3618 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36" X 36" MEN WORKING 801-60 3619 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" MEN WORKING 801-60 3620 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36" X 36" ROADWORK 5 MPH 801-60 3621 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" ROADWORK 5 MPH 801-60 3622 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36" X 36" FLAGGER AHEAD 801-60 3623 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" FLAGGER AHEAD 801-60 3624 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36" X 36" LOOSE GRAVEL 801-60 3625 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" LOOSE GRAVEL 801-60 3626 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36" X 36" YIELD 801-60 3627 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" YIELD 801-60 3628 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36" X 36" SLIPPERY WHEN WET 801-60 3629 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" SLIPPERY WHEN WET 801-60 3630 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36" X 36" CUSTOM SIGN 801-60 3631 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" CUSTOM SIGN 801-60 3632 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG MFG MFG
5.2 ROLL UP SIGN STAND CODE # NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # 1-9 10 +
36" X 36" STAND 801-60 3653 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36" X 36" SIGN HOLDER 801-60 6634 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36" 36" RIBS FOR SIGN 801-60 3654 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" STAND 801-60 3655 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" SIGN HOLDER 801-60 6902 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" RIBS FOR SIGN 801-60 3656 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS

HALL SIGNS, INC.

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

ROCAL, INC.

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM:
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

1000 WEST MAIN

4495 W. VERNAL PIKE

9875 YUCCA ROAD

3186 CR 550

GREEN FOREST, AR 72638

BLOOMINGTON, IN 47404

APPLEVALLEY, CA 92301

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

[QUOTED BY

JOHN GRAVES

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

CONTACT

JOHN GRAVES

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

TELEPHONE

888-571-9525

800-284-7446

800-637-7233

740-998-2122

FAX NUMBER

870-438-6140

888-329-7446

760-246-5512

740-998-2073

PRICE EACH POST WHEN
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS
SHOWN

6.0 DELINEATORS

COMM COUNTY ID
#

CODE

MFG NAME

MFG #

1-50 51+

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3"

550-41

3859

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3860

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3'

550-41

3861

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3862

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 1 SIDED, DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3863

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 2 SIDED, DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3864

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
SURFACE MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND
GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3'

550-41

3865

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
SURFACE MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND
(GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3866

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
SURFACE MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND
GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3'

550-41

3867

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
SURFACE MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND
(GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3868

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 1 SIDED, DIAMNOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4

550-41

3869

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 2 SIDED, DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP,
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4'

550-41

3870

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

2 PART POXY FOR SURFACE MOUNT
SHALL INCLUDE ONE (1) GALLON
EPOXY AND ONE (1) GALLON
CATALLIST

550-41

3871

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

PRICE EACH POST WHEN
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS
SHOWN

MFG NAME

MFG #

1-50 51+

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

PRICE EACH POST WHEN
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS
SHOWN

MFG NAME

MFG #

1-50 51+

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

PRICE EACH POST WHEN
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS
SHOWN

MFG NAME

MFG #

1-50 51+

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS NAME AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS HALL SIGNS, INC. SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY ROCAL, INC.
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009 1000 WEST MAIN 4495 W. VERNAL PIKE 9875 YUCCA ROAD 3186 CR 550
10:00 A.M. GREEN FOREST, AR 72638 BLOOMINGTON, IN 47404 APPLEVALLEY, CA 92301 FRANKFORT, OH 45628
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
TELEPHONE 888-571-9525 800-284-7446 800-637-7233 740-998-2122
FAX NUMBER 870-438-6140 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
PRICE EACH POST WHEN PRICE EACH POST WHEN PRICE EACH POST WHEN PRICE EACH POST WHEN
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS ORDERED IN QTY'S AS ORDERED IN QTY'S AS ORDERED IN QTY'S AS
SHOWN SHOWN SHOWN SHOWN
COMM COUNTY ID
6.0 DELINEATORS CODE # MFG NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ MFG NAME MFG # 1-50 51+
CARSONITE POST, FLAT, DRIVABLE, 1
SIDED DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE
SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER
COLOR;LENGTH 62" 550-41 3853 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CARSONITE POST, CONCAVE,
DRIVABLE, 1 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 62"  |550-41 3855 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CARSONITE POST, FLAT, DRIVABLE, 2
SIDED DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE
SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER
COLOR; LENGTH 62" 550-41 3854 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CARSONITE POST, CONCAVE,
DRIVABLE, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 62"  |550-41 3856 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STUB, ANCHOR FOR FLAT POST 550-41 3857 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STUB, ANCHOR FOR CONCAVE POST |550-41 3858 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7.0 PAVEMENT MARKERS PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM
COMM COUNTY ID ||MFG MFG MFG MFG
7.1 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS  |CODE # NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + INAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + INAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +
TYPE 1-C (SINGLE RELFECTIVE FACE,
\WHITE) 550-30 917 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE II-A-A (TWO REFLECTIVE
FACES, BOTH AMBER) 550-30 918 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE II-C-R (TWO REFLECTIVE
FACES; WHITE APPROACHING, RED
TRAILING) 550-30 919 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE 1I-C-C (TWO REFLECTIVE
FACES; BOTH WHITE) 550-30 3310 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS NAME AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS HALL SIGNS, INC. SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY ROCAL, INC.
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009 1000 WEST MAIN 4495 W. VERNAL PIKE 9875 YUCCA ROAD 3186 CR 550
10:00 A.M. GREEN FOREST, AR 72638 BLOOMINGTON, IN 47404 APPLEVALLEY, CA 92301 FRANKFORT, OH 45628
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT JOHN GRAVES JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
TELEPHONE 888-571-9525 800-284-7446 800-637-7233 740-998-2122
FAX NUMBER 870-438-6140 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
COMM COUNTY ID [[MFG MFG MFG MFG
7.2 TEMPORARY MARKERS CODE # INAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + INAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + INAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + INAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +
TEMPORARY MARKER,
POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP
SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND
ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: YELLOW
#932-2Y 550-34 6329 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TEMPORARY MARKER,
POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP
SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND
ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: WHITE #932-
2w 550-34 7036 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COMM COUNTY ID [[MFG MFG MFG MFG
7.3 END OF ROAD MARKER CODE # INAME MFG # 1-9 10 + INAME MFG # PKG 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # 1-9 10+ NAME MFG # 1-9 10+
RED ON RED 9, BUTTON, 18 X 18 801-83 3299 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID NO BID - - $10.88 $10.83 ROCAL, INC| 18 X 18 27.79 $26.56
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID 21-30 DAYS 30-45 DAYS
COMM COUNTY ID [MFG MFG MFG MFG
7.4 OBJECT MARKERS CODE # INAME MFG # 1-25 25+ INAME MFG # 1-25 25+ NAME MFG # 1-25 25+ NAME MFG # 1-25 25+
'YELLOW ENGINEER GRADE, 6 X 12 801-83 3296 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID - - $2.63 $2.58 - - $1.75 $1.66
YELLOW ON YELLOW, 3 BUTTON, 6" X
15 801-83 3297 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID - - $4.33 $4.28 - - $2.20 $2.09
YELLOW ENGINEER GRADE, 12 X 36 801-83 3298 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BD NO BID - - $9.75 $9.70 - - $10.47 $9.93
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID 21-30 DAYS 30-45 DAYS
*FREIGHT CARRIERS DO NOT UNLOAD - PRICES
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION NO BID ARE FOR DELIVER TO DOCK ONLY -




BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID # 09-38 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC

3310 -D FRICK ROAD

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

10:00 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON DAVID VESPA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT DAVE POFFENBERGER DAVID VESPA
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 863-984-1385
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058
PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES] PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES]
SHOWN SHOWN
PRICE PER| PRICE PER PRICE PER| PRICE PER
COMM COUNTY ID MFG EACH EACH MFG EACH EACH
3.0 CUSTOM FABRICATED SIGN CODE # NAME MFG # 1-50 51+ NAME MFG # 1-50 51+
SIGN, REGULAR SHEETING
(VINYL) 801-83 3324 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGN, ENGINEER GRADE
SHEETING 801-83 837 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID
COMM COUNTY ID
4.0 STREET SIGNS CODE # PRICE PER QTY PRICE PER QTY
Street Name Sign Blanks with Engineer Grade
Green Sheeting Only 19 10-24 25-99 100+ 1-9 10-24 25-99 100+
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 3337 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 3338 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 3339 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Street Name Sign Blanks with Diamond Grade
Sheeting Only
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 6638 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 6639 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 6640 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Street Name Sign Blanks with Engineer Grade
Sheeting and Diamond Grade Street Names
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 3340 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 3341 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 3342 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Street Name Sign Blanks with Diamond Grade
Sheeting and Diamond Grade Street Names
FLAT BLADE UP TO 36" LONG 801-83 6641 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLAT BLADE UP TO 42" LONG 801-83 6642 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLAT BLADE UP TO 48" LONG 801-83 6643 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC

3310 -D FRICK ROAD

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

10:00 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON DAVID VESPA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT DAVE POFFENBERGER DAVID VESPA
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 863-984-1385
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058
5.0 ROLL UP CONSTRUCTION SIGNS &
STANDS
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG
5.1 ROLL UP CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CODE # NAME MFG # 19 10 + NAME MFG # 19 10 +
36" X 36" ROADWORK AHEAD 801-60 3617 TRANTEX 36 RU $49.50 $44.50 DICKE RU 36-200 $64.55 $64.05
48" X 48" ROADWORK AHEAD 801-60 3618 TRANTEX 48 RU $56.50 $51.50 DICKE RU 48-200 $93.00 $92.50
36" X 36" MEN WORKING 801-60 3619 [TRANTEX 36 RU $49.50 $44.50 DICKE RU 36-200 $64.55 $64.05
48" X 48" MEN WORKING 801-60 3620 [TRANTEX 48 RU $56.50 $51.50 DICKE RU 48-200 $93.00 $92.50
36" X 36" ROADWORK 5 MPH 801-60 3621 [TRANTEX 36 RU $49.50 $44.50 DICKE RU 36-200 $68.55 $68.05
48" X 48" ROADWORK 5 MPH 801-60 3622 [TRANTEX 48 RU $56.50 $51.50 DICKE RU 48-200 $97.00 $96.50
36" X 36" FLAGGER AHEAD 801-60 3623 [TRANTEX 36 RU $49.50 $44.50 DICKE RU 36-200 $64.55 $64.05
48" X 48" FLAGGER AHEAD 801-60 3624 [TRANTEX 48 RU $56.50 $51.50 DICKE RU 48-200 $93.00 $92.50
36" X 36" LOOSE GRAVEL 801-60 3625 [TRANTEX 36 RU $49.50 $44.50 DICKE RU 36-200 $64.55 $64.05
48" X 48" LOOSE GRAVEL 801-60 3626 [TRANTEX 48 RU $56.50 $51.50 DICKE RU 48-200 $93.00 $92.50
36" X 36" YIELD 801-60 3627 [TRANTEX 36 RU $49.50 $44.50 DICKE RU 36-200 $64.55 $64.05
48" X 48" YIELD 801-60 3628 [TRANTEX 48 RU $56.50 $51.50 DICKE RU 48-200 $93.00 $92.50
36" X 36" SLIPPERY WHEN WET 801-60 3629 [TRANTEX 36 RU $49.50 $44.50 DICKE RU 36-200 $68.55 $68.05
48" X 48" SLIPPERY WHEN WET 801-60 3630 ITRANTEX 48 RU $56.50 $51.50 DICKE RU 48-200 $97.00 $96.50
36" X 36" CUSTOM SIGN 801-60 3631 [TRANTEX 36 RU $49.50 $44.50 DICKE RU 36-200 $74.50 $74.00
48" X 48" CUSTOM SIGN 801-60 3632 [TRANTEX 48 RU $56.50 $51.50 DICKE RU 48-200 $103.00 $102.50
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 30 DAYS 12 DAYS
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG

5.2 ROLL UP SIGN STAND CODE # NAME MFG # 19 10 + NAME MFG # 19 10 +
36" X 36" STAND 801-60 3653 TRANTEX DL1003W $99.50 $94.50 DICKE DL 1003W $87.45 $86.95
36" X 36" SIGN HOLDER 801-60 6634 TRANTEX B3630 $15.00 $13.00 DICKE B 3650 $23.00 $22.00
36" 36" RIBS FOR SIGN 801-60 3654 TRANTEX RR200-36 $13.00 $11.50 DICKE RR 200-36 $8.45 $8.20
48" X 48" STAND 801-60 3655 TRANTEX DL1003W $17.00 $15.00 DICKE DL 1003W $87.45 $86.95
48" X 48" SIGN HOLDER 801-60 6902 TRANTEX B4850 $17.00 $15.00 DICKE B 4850 $23.00 $22.00
48" X 48" RIBS FOR SIGN 801-60 3656 TRANTEX RR200-48 $15.00 $13.50 DICKE RR 200-48 $14.75 $14.45
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 30 DAYS 12 DAYS
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC

3310 -D FRICK ROAD

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

10:00 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON DAVID VESPA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT DAVE POFFENBERGER DAVID VESPA
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 863-984-1385
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058
PRICE EACH POST WHEN PRICE EACH POST WHEN
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS ORDERED IN QTY'S AS
SHOWN SHOWN
COMM COUNTY ID
6.0 DELINEATORS CODE # MFG NAME |  MFG # 1-50 51+ MFG NAME |  MFG # 1-50 51+
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE 522040W-
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, SH236SMA 12
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3' 550-41 3859 SAFE-HIT WAIZDG $26.50 $24.50 3D DG $20.65 $19.90
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, SH248SMA 522222W-
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4' 550-41 3860 SAFE-HIT WAIZDG $27.25 $25.25 3D 12DG $21.60 $20.80
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, SH236SMA 522066W-
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3' 550-41 3861 SAFE-HIT | WAA12DG $28.00 $26.00 3D 12DG $23.70 $22.80
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SURFACE
MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, SH248SMA 522261W-
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4' 550-41 3862 SAFE-HIT | WAA12DG $29.00 $27.00 3D 12DG $24.75 $25.85
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 1 SIDED, DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP, SH248GP3 551751W-
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4' 550-41 3863 SAFE-HIT | WA12DG $23.85 $21.85 3D 12DG $22.20 $21.35
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITH BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 2 SIDED, DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP, SH248GP3 551777W-
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4' 550-41 3864 SAFE-HIT | WAA12DG $25.00 $23.00 3D 12DG $25.60 $24.70
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
SURFACE MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND
GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH SH236SMR 521585W-
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3' 550-41 3865 SAFE-HIT | WA12DG $23.50 $21.50 3D 12DG $9.20 $8.90
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
'SURFACE MOUNT, 1 SIDED DIAMOND
GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH SH248SMR 521780W-
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4' 550-41 3866 SAFE-HIT | WA12DG $24.50 $22.50 3D 12DG $10.30 $9.95
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
SURFACE MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND
GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH SH236SMR 521611W-
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 3' 550-41 3867 SAFE-HIT | WAA12DG $24.95 $22.95 3D 12DG $12.85 $12.40
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES,
'SURFACE MOUNT, 2 SIDED DIAMOND
GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH SH248SMR 521806W-
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4' 550-41 3868 SAFE-HIT (WAA12DG $25.95 $23.95 3D 12DG $13.95 $13.45
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 1 SIDED, DIAMNOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP, SH248GPR 551075W-
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4' 550-41 3869 SAFE-HIT |WA12DG $21.85 $19.85 3D 12DG $14.55 $14.05
SAFE-HIT POSTS WITHOUT BASES, SOIL
MOUNT, 2 SIDED, DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 12 INCH STRIP, SH248GPR 551101W-
AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 4' 550-41 3870 SAFE-HIT |WAA12DG $22.95 $20.95 3D 12DG $18.10 $17.45
2 PART POXY FOR SURFACE MOUNT
SHALL INCLUDE ONE (1) GALLON
EPOXY AND ONE (1) GALLON INDUSTIAL
CATALLIST 550-41 3871 COATING B-22 $72.00 $69.00 EBOND |1240/1241| $92.75 $90.10
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC

3310 -D FRICK ROAD

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

10:00 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON DAVID VESPA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT DAVE POFFENBERGER DAVID VESPA
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 863-984-1385
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058
PRICE EACH POST WHEN PRICE EACH POST WHEN
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS ORDERED IN QTY'S AS
SHOWN SHOWN
COoMM COUNTY ID
6.0 DELINEATORS CODE # MFG NAME |  MFG # 1-50 51+ MFG NAME | MFG # 1-50 51+
CARSONITE POST, FLAT, DRIVABLE, 1
SIDED DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE
SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER FGA462A12
COLOR;LENGTH 62" 550-41 3853 DAVIDSON DG $18.40 $17.90 GLASFORM | DUALFLEX |  $19.00 $18.80
CARSONITE POST, CONCAVE,
DRIVABLE, 1 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH FG562A12 556092W-
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 62"  |550-41 3855 DAVIDSON DG $18.40 $17.90 3D 12YDG $16.70 $16.15
CARSONITE POST, FLAT, DRIVABLE, 2
SIDED DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE
SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER FGA462AA12
COLOR; LENGTH 62" 550-41 3854 DAVIDSON DG $21.90 $21.50 GLASFORM | DUALFLEX |  $21.50 $21.35
CARSONITE POST, CONCAVE,
DRIVABLE, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH FA562AA12 556105W-
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 62"  |550-41 3856 DAVIDSON DG $21.90 $21.50 3D 12YDG $20.25 $19.60
STUB, ANCHOR FOR FLAT POST 550-41 3857 DAVIDSON FG 96 $5.40 $5.10 GLASFORM| ANCHOR $1.70 $1.55
STUB, ANCHOR FOR CONCAVE POST |550-41 3858 DAVIDSON FG 96 $5.40 $5.10 3D 556602 $6.50 $6.00
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 30 DAYS 14 DAYS
7.0 PAVEMENT MARKERS PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG
7.1 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS CODE # NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +
TYPE 1-C (SINGLE RELFECTIVE FACE,
WHITE) 550-30 917 RAM-O-LITE IC 1BOX 50/BOX $49.50 $48.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE II-A-A (TWO REFLECTIVE
FACES, BOTH AMBER) 550-30 918 RAM-O-LITE[ 11 AA 1BOX 50/BOX $50.50 $49.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE II-C-R (TWO REFLECTIVE
FACES; WHITE APPROACHING, RED
TRAILING) 550-30 919 RAM-O-LITE[  IICR 1BOX 50/BOX $51.00 $50.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE II-C-C (TWO REFLECTIVE
FACES; BOTH WHITE) 550-30 3310 RAM-O-LITE lcc 1BOX 50/BOX $51.00 $50.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

7-10 DAYS

NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

3310 -D FRICK ROAD

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

10:00 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809
CONTRACT TERM: QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON DAVID VESPA
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT DAVE POFFENBERGER DAVID VESPA
TELEPHONE 281-448-7711 863-984-1385
FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG
7.2 TEMPORARY MARKERS CODE # NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10+ NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10+
TEMPORARY MARKER,
POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP
SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND
ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: YELLOW
#932-2Y 550-34 6329 DAVIDSON Y-2 BOX 500 $230.00 $220.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TEMPORARY MARKER,
POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP
SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND
ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: WHITE #932-
2w 550-34 7036 DAVIDSON W-2 BOX 500 $230.00 $220.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 7-10 DAYS NO BID
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG
7.3 END OF ROAD MARKER CODE # NAME MFG # 1-9 10 + NAME MFG # 1-9 10 +
RED ON RED 9, BUTTON, 18 X 18 801-83 3299 TRANTEX | EOR913 26.5 $24.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 30 DAYS NO BID
COMM COUNTY ID MFG MFG
7.4 OBJECT MARKERS CODE # NAME MFG # 1-25 25+ NAME MFG # 1-25 25+
'YELLOW ENGINEER GRADE, 6 X 12 801-83 3296 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
'YELLOW ON YELLOW, 3 BUTTON, 6" X
15 801-83 3297 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
YELLOW ENGINEER GRADE, 12 X 36 801-83 3298 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: NO BID NO BID
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
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