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BID #09-38Road Safety Signs & Posts

BID TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

BIDDERS NAME

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

JACKSON, MS 39232

VULCAN, INC (dba VULCAN
SIGNS)

408 EAST BERRY

FOLEY, AL 36535

HALL SIGNS, INC.

4495 W. VERNAL PIKE

BLOOMINGTON, IN 47402

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

9875 YUCCA ROAD

APPLEVALLE, CA 92301

ROCAL, INC.

3186 CR 550

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

QUOTED BY

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

CONTACT PERSON

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

TELEPHONE NO.

800-367-1492

800-633-6845

800-284-7446

800-637-7233

740-998-2122

FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 251-943-1544 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED|] PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN ] IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.

1 12 X6 4-Way 4475 $4.27 $4.19 $4.21 $4.15 $4.18 $4.18 $4.38 $4.33 $3.11 $2.98
2 12 X 18 Chevron Alignment 4477 $11.08 $11.05 $10.94 $10.78 $11.49 $11.49 $10.63 $10.58 $9.33 $8.93
3 12 X 18 No Parking Anytime 4478 $11.08 $11.05 $10.94 $10.78 $11.49 $11.49 $10.63 $10.58 $9.33 $8.93
4 12 X 36 Bridge Marker R 7213 $21.36 $21.31 $20.88 $20.57 $22.35 $22.35 $20.10 $19.95 $18.51 $17.70
5 12 X 36 Bridge Marker L 7215 $21.36 $21.31 $20.88 $20.57 $22.35 $22.35 $20.10 $19.95 $18.51 $17.70

18 X 18 Advisory Speed Plate (Blank)
6 MPH 4479 $16.60 $16.57 $16.41 $16.16 $17.05 $17.05 $15.31 $15.26 $14.00 $13.39

18 X 18 Advisory Speed Plate (with
7 Numbers) MPH 4480 $16.60 $16.57 $16.41 $16.16 $17.05 $17.05 $15.31 $15.26 $14.00 $13.39
8 18 X 18 Brazoria County Road Number 4481 $19.44 $19.40 $17.11 $16.85 $27.85 $27.85 $15.31 $15.26 $15.73 $15.12
9 18 X 24 Chevron Alignment 4484 $21.36 $21.31 $20.88 $20.57 $22.44 $22.44 $20.10 $19.95 $18.51 $17.70
10 24 STOP 4485 $28.12 $28.06 $27.29 $26.88 $29.17 $29.17 $26.80 $26.60 $24.56 $23.60
11 24 X 8 School (Florescent Yellow Green) S4-3 4486 $10.19 $10.16 $10.12 $9.97 $10.44 $10.44 $9.85 $9.80 $8.61 $8.25
12 24 X 18 County Maintenance Begins 4487 $21.36 $21.31 $20.88 $20.57 $22.44 $22.44 $20.10 $19.95 $18.51 $17.70
13 24 X 18 County Maintenance Ends 4488 $21.36 $21.31 $20.88 $20.57 $22.44 $22.44 $20.10 $19.95 $18.51 $17.70
14 24 X 18 End Detour 4491 $17.83 $17.83 $20.88 $20.57 $22.44 $22.44 $20.10 $19.95 $18.51 $17.70




Dngr\ 2.af 12

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

BIDDERS NAME

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

JACKSON, MS 39232

VULCAN, INC (dba VULCAN
SIGNS)

408 EAST BERRY

FOLEY, AL 36535

HALL SIGNS, INC.

4495 W. VERNAL PIKE

BLOOMINGTON, IN 47402

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

9875 YUCCA ROAD

APPLEVALLE, CA 92301

ROCAL, INC.

3186 CR 550

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

QUOTED BY

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

CONTACT PERSON

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

TELEPHONE NO.

800-367-1492

800-633-6845

800-284-7446

800-637-7233

740-998-2122

FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 251-943-1544 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED| PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.
15 24 X 24 No Trucks 4492 $29.40 $29.34 $28.52 $28.09 $32.97 $32.97 $26.80 $26.60 $24.80 $23.72
16 24 X 24 Double Arrow 4493 $28.48 $28.43 $27.84 $27.42 $29.67 $29.67 $26.80 $26.60 $24.68 $23.60
17 24 X 24 Fresh Oil 5 MPH 4494 $23.79 $23.79 $27.84 $27.42 $29.67 $29.67 $26.80 $26.60 $24.68 $23.60
18 24 X 24 High Water 4495 $28.48 $28.43 $27.84 $27.42 $29.67 $29.67 $26.80 $26.60 $24.68 $23.60
19 24 X 30 Speed Limit (Blank) MPH 4498 $35.55 $35.48 $34.80 $34.28 $36.90 $36.90 $33.50 $33.25 $30.85 $29.50
24 X 30 Speed Limit (with Numbers)
20 MPH 4499 $35.55 $35.48 $34.80 $34.28 $36.90 $36.90 $33.50 $33.25 $30.85 $29.50
21 24 X 30 Reduced Speed Ahead 4500 $35.55 $35.48 $34.80 $34.28 $36.90 $36.90 $33.50 $33.25 $30.85 $29.50
22 24 X 30 Speed Zone Ahead 4501 $35.55 $35.48 $34.80 $34.28 $36.90 $36.90 $33.50 $33.25 $30.85 $29.50
23 24 X 30 No Parking 4502 $35.55 $35.48 $35.14 $35.68 $36.90 $36.90 $33.50 $33.25 $30.85 $29.50
24 24 X 30 Weight Limit (Blank) Tons 4503 $36.32 $36.24 $34.80 $34.28 $36.90 $36.90 $33.50 $33.25 $32.50 $31.15
24 X 30 Weight Limit ( with Numbers)
25 Tons 4504 $36.32 $36.24 $34.80 $34.28 $36.90 $36.90 $33.50 $33.25 $32.50 $31.15
26 24 X 30 No Dumping Allowed 4505 $35.55 $35.48 $34.80 $34.28 $36.90 $36.90 $33.50 $33.25 $32.50 $31.15
27 24 X 30 Do Not Pass 4506 $35.55 $35.48 $34.80 $34.28 $36.90 $36.90 $33.50 $33.25 $30.85 $29.50
24 X 36 Weight Limit - Axle or Tandem
28 (Blank) LBS 4507 $42.07 $41.98 $41.76 $41.13 $44.15 $44.15 $40.20 $39.90 $37.02 $35.40
24 X 36 Weight Limit - Tandem Axle
29 (Blank) LBS 4508 $42.07 $41.98 $41.76 $41.13 $44.15 $44.15 $40.20 $39.90 $37.02 $35.40
30 30 STOP 4509 $43.22 $43.15 $42.13 $41.50 $45.12 $45.12 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88




Dngr\ 2.afl12

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

BIDDERS NAME

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

JACKSON, MS 39232

VULCAN, INC (dba VULCAN
SIGNS)

408 EAST BERRY

FOLEY, AL 36535

HALL SIGNS, INC.

4495 W. VERNAL PIKE

BLOOMINGTON, IN 47402

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

9875 YUCCA ROAD

APPLEVALLE, CA 92301

ROCAL, INC.

3186 CR 550

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

QUOTED BY

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

CONTACT PERSON

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

TELEPHONE NO.

800-367-1492

800-633-6845

800-284-7446

800-637-7233

740-998-2122

FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 251-943-1544 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED|] PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.

31 30 Yield (Measures 24" wide) R1-2 7217 $22.58 $22.52 $21.52 $21.20 $23.73 $23.73 $26.13 $25.94 $18.51 $17.78

30" Hinged Sign Yellow with Black

Message - Water Over Road / Drive
32 Friendly 7219 $61.72 $60.77 $81.28 $80.06 $86.04 $86.04 $51.88 $51.56 $63.56 $61.88
33 30 X 24 Detour 4510 $29.67 $29.69 $34.80 $24.28 $36.90 $36.90 $33.50 $33.25 $30.85 $29.50
34 30 X 30 Right - Left Turn 4511 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
35 30 X 30 Right - Left Curve 4512 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
36 30 X 30 Right - Left Reverse Turn 4513 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
37 30 X 30 Right - Left Reverse Curve 4514 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
38 30 X 30 Right - Left Winding Road 4515 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
39 30 X 30 Cross Road 4516 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
40 30 X 30 Side Road 4517 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
41 30 X 30 T Symbol 4518 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
42 30 X 30 Y Symbol 4519 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
43 30 X 30 Bump 4520 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
44 30 X 30 Dip 4521 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
45 30 X 30 Soft Shoulder 4522 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
46 30 X 30 Narrow Bridge 4523 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88




Dngr\ LaflD

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

BIDDERS NAME

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

JACKSON, MS 39232

VULCAN, INC (dba VULCAN
SIGNS)

408 EAST BERRY

FOLEY, AL 36535

HALL SIGNS, INC.

4495 W. VERNAL PIKE

BLOOMINGTON, IN 47402

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

9875 YUCCA ROAD

APPLEVALLE, CA 92301

ROCAL, INC.

3186 CR 550

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

QUOTED BY

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

CONTACT PERSON

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

TELEPHONE NO.

800-367-1492

800-633-6845

800-284-7446

800-637-7233

740-998-2122

FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 251-943-1544 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED|] PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.
47 30 X 30 Pavement Ends 4524 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
48 30 X 30 Water Over Road 4525 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
49 30 X 30 Dead End 4526 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
50 30 X 30 Church 4527 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
51 30 X 30 Cattle Guard 4528 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
52 30 X 30 Slow Down on Wet Road 4529 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
53 30 X 30 Fresh Oil 5 MPH 4530 $36.58 $35.63 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
54 30 X 30 High Water 4531 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
55 30 X 30 Mowers Ahead 4532 $36.58 $35.63 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
56 30 X 30 Workers Ahead 4534 $36.58 $35.63 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
30 X 30 Arrow (Orange, for Construction
57 Zone) 4535 $36.58 $35.63 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
58 30 X 30 School Bus Stop Ahead 4536 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
30 X 30 Railroad Advance Warning (for
59 parallel roads) 4537 $43.94 $43.40 $43.50 $42.85 $46.04 $46.04 $41.88 $41.56 $38.56 $36.88
30 X 30 Stop Ahead (SYMBOL
60 ONLY) 4538 $52.69 $52.67 $44.74 $44.07 $54.16 $54.16 $41.88 $41.56 $42.44 $40.69
61 |30 X 30 Stop Ahead (Words Only) 7340 $43.36 $43.36 - - - - $38.06 $36.31




Dngr\ bafl2

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

BIDDERS NAME

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

JACKSON, MS 39232

VULCAN, INC (dba VULCAN
SIGNS)

408 EAST BERRY

FOLEY, AL 36535

HALL SIGNS, INC.

4495 W. VERNAL PIKE

BLOOMINGTON, IN 47402

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

9875 YUCCA ROAD

APPLEVALLE, CA 92301

ROCAL, INC.

3186 CR 550

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

QUOTED BY

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

CONTACT PERSON

HEIDI MCGEE

DAVID BEVIACQUA

JENNI KALBFLEISCH

MARK JOHNSON

ALAN CHRISTOPHER

TELEPHONE NO.

800-367-1492

800-633-6845

800-284-7446

800-637-7233

740-998-2122

FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 251-943-1544 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED|] PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.
$44.74 $42.44 $40.69
$43.36 $44.07 $38.06 $36.31
62 |30 X 30 Yield Ahead 4539 $52.69 $52.67 (WORDS) | $43.36 (WORDS) $54.16 $54.16 $41.88 $41.56 (WORDS) (WORDS)
63 36 STOP 4540 $61.78 $61.69 $60.76 $59.85 $64.63 $64.63 $60.30 $59.85 $55.53 $53.10
64 36 YIELD (measures 30" wide) 4541 $28.83 $28.76 $28.49 $28.06 $34.70 $34.70 $60.30 $59.85 $25.70 $24.65
65 36 ROUND 4542 $62.92 $62.78 $61.63 $60.71 $76.36 $76.36 $60.30 $59.85 $60.39 $57.96
66 36 Railroad Advance Warning 4543 $62.92 $62.78 $62.64 $61.70 $76.36 $76.36 $60.30 $59.85 $55.53 $53.10
36 School Advance Sign (Florescent
67 Yellow Green) SI-2 4544 $65.20 $65.06 $60.35 $59.44 $66.26 $66.26 $62.10 $61.65 $59.31 $59.94
68 36 School Crossing Sign S2-1 4545 $62.92 $62.78 $58.43 $57.55 $64.86 $64.86 $60.30 $59.85 $59.31 $59.94
$62.72 $61.78
69 36 x 36 Stop Ahead 4546 $75.44 $75.39 $61.61(WORDS) | $61.61(WORDS) $77.64 $77.64 $60.30 $59.85 $64.35 $61.83
$62.72 $61.78
70 36 x 36 Yield Ahead 4547 $75.44 $75.39 $61.61(WORDS) | $61.61(WORDS) $77.64 $77.64 $60.30 $59.85 $64.35 $61.83
71 36 x 36 One Lane Bridge 4548 $62.92 $62.78 $62.64 $61.70 $65.99 $65.99 $60.30 $59.85 $55.53 $53.10
72 36 x 36 Load Zoned Bridge 4549 $62.92 $62.78 $62.64 $61.70 $65.99 $65.99 $60.30 $59.85 $55.53 $53.10
73 36 x 36 Road Narrows 4550 $62.92 $62.78 $62.64 $61.70 $65.99 $65.99 $60.30 $59.85 $55.53 $53.10
74 36 x 36 Truck Advance Crossing 4551 $62.92 $62.78 $62.64 $61.70 $65.99 $65.99 $60.30 $59.85 $55.53 $53.10
75 36 x 36  Fire Truck Advance Crossing 4552 $62.92 $62.78 $62.64 $61.70 $65.99 $65.99 $60.30 $59.85 $55.53 $53.10




Dngr\ il

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

VULCAN, INC (dba VULCAN
SIGNS)

408 EAST BERRY

HALL SIGNS, INC.

4495 W. VERNAL PIKE

SAFEWAY SIGN COMPANY

9875 YUCCA ROAD

ROCAL, INC.

3186 CR 550

10:00 A.M. JACKSON, MS 39232 FOLEY, AL 36535 BLOOMINGTON, IN 47402 APPLEVALLE, CA 92301 FRANKFORT, OH 45628
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT PERSON HEIDI MCGEE DAVID BEVIACQUA JENNI KALBFLEISCH MARK JOHNSON ALAN CHRISTOPHER

TELEPHONE NO.

800-367-1492

800-633-6845

800-284-7446

800-637-7233

740-998-2122

FAX NUMBER 800-206-3444 251-943-1544 888-329-7446 760-246-5512 740-998-2073
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED| PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.
76 36 x 36 Playground Sign 4553 $62.92 $62.78 $62.64 $61.70 $65.99 $65.99 $60.30 $59.85 $55.53 $53.10
77 36 x 36 Road Work Ahead 4554 $52.44 $52.36 $62.64 $61.70 $65.99 $65.99 $60.30 $59.85 $55.53 $53.10
78 36 x 36  Workers Ahead 4555 $52.44 $52.36 $62.64 $61.70 $65.99 $65.99 $60.30 $59.85 $55.53 $53.10
79 48 x 24 Large Arrow 4556 $56.25 $55.56 $55.68 $54.85 $59.31 $59.31 $53.60 $53.20 $49.36 $47.20
80 48 X 24 Double Headed Arrow 7414 $56.25 $55.56 $55.68 $54.85 $59.31 $59.31 $53.60 $53.20 $49.36 $47.20
81 48 x 30 Road Closed 4557 $69.91 $69.76 $69.60 $68.56 $74.41 $74.41 $67.00 $66.50 $61.70 $59.00
82 48 x 48 Road Construction Ahead 4558 $92.69 $92.57 $111.36 $109.69 $120.14 $120.14 $107.20 $106.40 $98.72 $94.40
83 48 x 48 Detour (Blank) Feet 4559 / 5563 $92.69 $92.57 $111.36 $109.69 $120.14 $120.14 $107.20 $106.40 $98.72 $94.40
84 48 x 48 Road Closed Ahead 4560 $92.69 $92.57 $111.36 $109.69 $120.14 $120.14 $107.20 $106.40 $98.72 $94.40
85 48 x 48 Flagger Ahead 4561 $92.69 $92.57 $111.36 $109.69 $120.14 $120.14 $107.20 $106.40 $98.72 $94.40
86 48 STOP 4562 $109.83 $109.73 $107.90 $106.28 $119.55 $119.55 $107.20 $106.40 $98.72 $94.40
30-45 DAYS
*FREIGHT CARRIERS DO NOT
UNLOAD - PRICES ARE FOR
Days to deliver ARO 30 DAYS DELIVERY TO DOCK ONLY 21-30 DAYS 30-45 DAYS




Page 7 of 12
BID #09-38Road Safety Signs & Posts

BID TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33809

PATHMARK TRAFFIC
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

4435 HUNTER ROAD

SAN MARCQOS, TX 78666

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT
CORP

16100 S LATHROP AVE

HARVEY, IL 60426

AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS

1000 WEST MAIN

GREEN FOREST, AR 72638

QUOTED BY

H.STEVEN NELSON

DAVID VESPA

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L. PINIDO

JOHN GRAVES

CONTACT PERSON

DAVE POFFENBERGER

DAVID VESPA

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L. PINIDO

JOHN GRAVES

TELEPHONE NO.

281-448-7711

863-984-1385

800-547-0874

800-882-5543

888-571-9525

FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 870-438-6140
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED|] PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.

1 12 X6 4-Way 4475 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 12 X 18 Chevron Alignment 4477 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 12 X 18 No Parking Anytime 4478 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 12 X 36 Bridge Marker R 7213 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 12 X 36 Bridge Marker L 7215 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18 X 18 Advisory Speed Plate (Blank)
6 MPH 4479 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18 X 18 Advisory Speed Plate (with
7 Numbers) MPH 4480 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 18 X 18 Brazoria County Road Number 4481 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 18 X 24 Chevron Alignment 4484 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 24 STOP 4485 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 24 X 8 School (Florescent Yellow Green) S4-3 4486 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 24 X 18 County Maintenance Begins 4487 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 24 X 18 County Maintenance Ends 4488 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14 24 X 18 End Detour 4491 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Dngr\ Qafl

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33809

PATHMARK TRAFFIC
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

4435 HUNTER ROAD

SAN MARCOQOS, TX 78666

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT
CORP

16100 S LATHROP AVE

HARVEY, IL 60426

AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS

1000 WEST MAIN

GREEN FOREST, AR 72638

QUOTED BY

H.STEVEN NELSON

DAVID VESPA

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L. PINIDO

JOHN GRAVES

CONTACT PERSON

DAVE POFFENBERGER

DAVID VESPA

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L. PINIDO

JOHN GRAVES

TELEPHONE NO.

281-448-7711

863-984-1385

800-547-0874

800-882-5543

888-571-9525

FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 870-438-6140
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED| PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN ] IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.
15 24 X 24 No Trucks 4492 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 24 X 24 Double Arrow 4493 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 24 X 24 Fresh Oil 5 MPH 4494 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 24 X 24 High Water 4495 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
19 24 X 30 Speed Limit (Blank) MPH 4498 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 X 30 Speed Limit (with Numbers)
20 MPH 4499 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 24 X 30 Reduced Speed Ahead 4500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 24 X 30 Speed Zone Ahead 4501 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 24 X 30 No Parking 4502 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 24 X 30 Weight Limit (Blank) Tons 4503 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 X 30 Weight Limit ( with Numbers)
25 Tons 4504 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
26 24 X 30 No Dumping Allowed 4505 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 24 X 30 Do Not Pass 4506 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 X 36 Weight Limit - Axle or Tandem
28 (Blank) LBS 4507 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 X 36 Weight Limit - Tandem Axle
29 (Blank) LBS 4508 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 30 STOP 4509 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Dngr\ Qafl12

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33809

PATHMARK TRAFFIC
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

4435 HUNTER ROAD

SAN MARCOQOS, TX 78666

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT
CORP

16100 S LATHROP AVE

HARVEY, IL 60426

AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS

1000 WEST MAIN

GREEN FOREST, AR 72638

QUOTED BY

H.STEVEN NELSON

DAVID VESPA

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L. PINIDO

JOHN GRAVES

CONTACT PERSON

DAVE POFFENBERGER

DAVID VESPA

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L. PINIDO

JOHN GRAVES

TELEPHONE NO.

281-448-7711

863-984-1385

800-547-0874

800-882-5543

888-571-9525

FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 870-438-6140
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED|] PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN ] IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.

31 30 Yield (Measures 24" wide) R1-2 7217 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

30" Hinged Sign Yellow with Black

Message - Water Over Road / Drive
32 Friendly 7219 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 30 X 24 Detour 4510 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 30 X 30 Right - Left Turn 4511 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 30 X 30 Right - Left Curve 4512 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 30 X 30 Right - Left Reverse Turn 4513 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
37 30 X 30 Right - Left Reverse Curve 4514 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
38 30 X 30 Right - Left Winding Road 4515 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 30 X 30 Cross Road 4516 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 30 X 30 Side Road 4517 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 30 X 30 T Symbol 4518 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
42 30 X 30 Y Symbol 4519 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
43 30 X 30 Bump 4520 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
44 30 X 30 Dip 4521 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 30 X 30 Soft Shoulder 4522 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
46 30 X 30 Narrow Bridge 4523 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Dngr\ 10 af 10

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33809

PATHMARK TRAFFIC

PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

4435 HUNTER ROAD

SAN MARCOQOS, TX 78666

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT
CORP

16100 S LATHROP AVE

HARVEY, IL 60426

AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS

1000 WEST MAIN

GREEN FOREST, AR 72638

QUOTED BY

H.STEVEN NELSON

DAVID VESPA

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L. PINIDO

JOHN GRAVES

CONTACT PERSON

DAVE POFFENBERGER

DAVID VESPA

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L. PINIDO

JOHN GRAVES

TELEPHONE NO.

281-448-7711

863-984-1385

800-547-0874

800-882-5543

888-571-9525

FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 870-438-6140
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED|] PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN ] IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.
47 30 X 30 Pavement Ends 4524 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 30 X 30 Water Over Road 4525 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
49 30 X 30 Dead End 4526 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 30 X 30 Church 4527 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 30 X 30 Cattle Guard 4528 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
52 30 X 30 Slow Down on Wet Road 4529 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
53 30 X 30 Fresh Oil 5 MPH 4530 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 30 X 30 High Water 4531 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 30 X 30 Mowers Ahead 4532 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
56 30 X 30 Workers Ahead 4534 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 X 30 Arrow (Orange, for Construction
57 Zone) 4535 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
58 30 X 30 School Bus Stop Ahead 4536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 X 30 Railroad Advance Warning (for
59 parallel roads) 4537 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 X 30 Stop Ahead (SYMBOL
60 ONLY) 4538 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
61 30 X 30 Stop Ahead (Words Only) 7340 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Dngr\ 1l af 10

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

10:00 A.M.
CONTRACT TERM

JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33809

PATHMARK TRAFFIC
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

4435 HUNTER ROAD

SAN MARCOQOS, TX 78666

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT
CORP

16100 S LATHROP AVE

HARVEY, IL 60426

AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS

1000 WEST MAIN

GREEN FOREST, AR 72638

QUOTED BY

H.STEVEN NELSON

DAVID VESPA

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L. PINIDO

JOHN GRAVES

CONTACT PERSON

DAVE POFFENBERGER

DAVID VESPA

JOSE PEREZ

TERI L. PINIDO

JOHN GRAVES

TELEPHONE NO.

281-448-7711

863-984-1385

800-547-0874

800-882-5543

888-571-9525

FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 870-438-6140
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED| PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN ] IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.
62 30 X 30 Yield Ahead 4539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
63 36 STOP 4540 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
64 36 YIELD (measures 30" wide) 4541 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
65 36 ROUND 4542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
66 |36 Railroad Advance Warning 4543 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 School Advance Sign (Florescent
67 Yellow Green) SI-2 4544 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
68 36 School Crossing Sign S2-1 4545 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
69 36 x 36 Stop Ahead 4546 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
70 36 x 36 Yield Ahead 4547 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
71 36 x 36 One Lane Bridge 4548 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
72 36 x 36 Load Zoned Bridge 4549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
73 36 x 36 Road Narrows 4550 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
74 36 x 36 Truck Advance Crossing 4551 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
75 36 x 36 Fire Truck Advance Crossing 4552 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Dngr\ 12 af 10

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JUNE 4, 2009

BIDDERS NAME

TRANTEX, INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

PATHMARK TRAFFIC
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC

4435 HUNTER ROAD

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT
CORP

16100 S LATHROP AVE

AMERICAN SIGN BRACKETS

1000 WEST MAIN

10:00 A.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 LAKELAND, FL 33809 SAN MARCOQOS, TX 78666 HARVEY, IL 60426 GREEN FOREST, AR 72638
CONTRACT TERM QUOTED BY H.STEVEN NELSON DAVID VESPA JOSE PEREZ TERI L. PINIDO JOHN GRAVES
JULY 8, 2009 - JULY 7, 2010 CONTACT PERSON DAVE POFFENBERGER DAVID VESPA JOSE PEREZ TERI L. PINIDO JOHN GRAVES

TELEPHONE NO.

281-448-7711

863-984-1385

800-547-0874

800-882-5543

888-571-9525

FAX NUMBER 281-591-6827 863-984-0058 800-352-2092 877-696-2701 870-438-6140
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED| PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED | PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN | IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#
DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+
ITEM NO.
76 136 x 36__Playground Sign 4553 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
77 |36 x 36 Road Work Ahead 4554 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
78 |36 x 36 Workers Ahead 4555 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
79 |48x24 Large Arrow 4556 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
80 |48 X 24 Double Headed Arrow 7414 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
81  ]48x30 Road Closed 4557 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
82 |48 x48 Road Construction Ahead 4558 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
83 |48 x48 Detour (Blank) Feet 4559 / 5563 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
84  |48x48 Road Closed Ahead 4560 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
85 |48 x 48 Flagger Ahead 4561 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
86 |48 STOP 4562 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Days to deliver ARO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




