
BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

# 09-37ROAD MATERIALS - POLYMER MODIFIED COLD ASPHALT

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, APRIL 16, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

3.0 Polymer Modified Cold Asphalt Price per Ton Price per Ton

3.2.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded 
onto County trucks 745-14 6778 82.50 

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport $0.00 $0.00 Airport 92 $92.00 $174.50 

Alvin Svc Ctr $0.00 $0.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 80 $80.00 $162.50 

Angleton Svc Ctr $0.00 $0.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 91 $91.00 $173.50 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $0.00 $0.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 105 $105.00 $187.50 

Camp Mohawk $0.00 $0.00 Camp Mohawk 81 $81.00 $163.50 

Clute Svc Ctr $0.00 $0.00 Clute Svc Ctr 102 $102.00 $184.50 

Hanson Park $0.00 $0.00 Hanson Park 95 $95.00 $177.50 

Manvel Svc Ctr $0.00 $0.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 69 $69.00 $151.50 

Mosquito Control $0.00 $0.00 Mosquito Control 92 $92.00 $174.50 

Quintana Cty Park $0.00 $0.00 Quintana Cty Park 110 $110.00 $192.50 

Resoft Park $0.00 $0.00 Resoft Park 95 $95.00 $177.50 

San Luis Cty Park $0.00 $0.00 San Luis Cty Park 110 $110.00 $192.50 

W. Columbia Svc $0.00 $0.00 W. Columbia Svc 95 $95.00 $177.50 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

3.2.2 Price per ton as delivered to County Facility 
at: 745-14 6778

Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile

3.2.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 745-14 6778 NO BID  NO BID $82.50  NO BID 
3.2.4   State Minimum if required

3.2.5 Price per 35# bag 745-14 6778
State Minimum if required

3.2.6 Price per 50# bag 745-14 6778
State Minimum if required

BID DOCUMENTS INLCUDED

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

FAX NUMBER

TELEPHONE NUMBER

HOPE LICOR
305-663-3090
305-663-0832

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

The EZ STREET COMPANY

1786 NW 82ND AVENUE
MIAMI, FL 33126

HOPE LICOR

HOPE LICOR
DAVID AMEIR

 

Plant Location

NO BID

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport NO BID
Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID
Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID
Camp Mohawk NO BID

N/A
$9.07 P/BAG DELIVERED

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID
Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID

Hauling first mile

 NO BID 

PROLINE MATERIALS, INC.

22010 FAIRGROUND ROAD

BRADFORD BRYANT

BRADFORD BRYANT

HEMPTSTEAD, TX 77445
BRADFORD BRYANT

896 BAGS = 16 PALLETS

INCLUDED

Resoft Park NO BID
San Luis Cty Park NO BID

1120 BAGS = 16 PALLETS
$9.34 / BAG DELIVERED

BRADFORD BRYANT / ASHLI GEICH

 

979-826-7075
979-826-6007

22010 FAIRGROUND RD
HEMPSTEAD, TX

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Plant Location

Alvin Svc Ctr $96.50 
Airport $96.50 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $96.50 
Angleton Svc Ctr $96.50 

Clute Svc Ctr $96.50 
Camp Mohawk $98.50 

Manvel Svc Ctr $94.50 
Hanson Park $105.00 

Quintana Cty Park $105.00 
Mosquito Control $96.50 

San Luis Cty Park $125.00 
Resoft Park $105.00 

Hauling first mile

 NO BID 

W. Columbia Svc $95.50 

25
NO BID

N/A
$10.50

50

NONE
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