BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID # 09-34 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS NAME]

KB TRACTOR MOWING
23917 DORRINGTON

L & W EXCAVATORS INC.

D & N CONTRACTOR INC.

TRI COUNTY
CONTRACTORS

COASTAL MAINTENANCE

JOHNSON LANDSCAPE
SERVICES

THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2009 ESTATES LANE 20701 HWY 6 117 CR 735 3709 TRENT COVE LANE 1036 CR 285 21410 PECAN BEND
10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME CONROE, TX 77385 MA NVEL, TX 77578 ANGLETON, TX 77516 PEARLAND, TX 77584 ALVIN, TX 77511 DAMON, TX 77430-8616
CONTACT| KENNETH BLOW C.J. WALLER DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK CHRIS MANTELL ELMER JOHNSON
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER] 832-217-6130 281-489-1774 979-848-7214 281-865-8081 281-482-3343 979-553-3703
FAX NUMBER 281-296-0329 281-489-7017 979-849-7214 281-412-0885 281-482-3411 979-553-4034
Person to contact for scheduling service KENNETH BLOW C.J. WALLER DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK TRAVIS MANTEL ELMER JOHNSON
Person to contact for billing issues KENNETH BLOW J.J. MOLOCK DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK TORI RATCLIFF BEA JOHNSON
DESCRIPTION Comm Code
**3% LOCAL BIDDER'S
1.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR PREFERENCE
BRAZORIA COUNTY $275.48
COST PRICE PER EACH MILE $75.00 NO BID $284.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS
WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR
ASSIGNMENT 988-75 8 NO BID 6 (Tractors/mowers/op) NO BID NO BID NO BID
1.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE 988-75 2 NO BID 2 (Trucks/op) NO BID NO BID NO BID
1.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT 988-75 4 NO BID 2 (weedeater/op) NO BID NO BID NO BID
**3% LOCAL BIDDER'S
2.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR PREFERENCE
SOUTH SERVICE CENTER (PCT 1) $533.50
COST PRICE PER EACH MILE $75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $550.00 NO BID
2.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS
WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR
ASSIGNMENT 988-75 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID
2.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE 988-75 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID
2.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT 988-75 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID # 09-34 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

TRI COUNTY JOHNSON LANDSCAPE
DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS NAME| KB TRACTOR MOWING L & W EXCAVATORS INC. | D & N CONTRACTOR INC. CONTRACTORS COASTAL MAINTENANCE SERVICES
23917 DORRINGTON
THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2009 ESTATES LANE 20701 HWY 6 117 CR 735 3709 TRENT COVE LANE 1036 CR 285 21410 PECAN BEND
10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME CONROE, TX 77385 MA NVEL, TX 77578 ANGLETON, TX 77516 PEARLAND, TX 77584 ALVIN, TX 77511 DAMON, TX 77430-8616
CONTACT| KENNETH BLOW C.J. WALLER DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK CHRIS MANTELL ELMER JOHNSON
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER] 832-217-6130 281-489-1774 979-848-7214 281-865-8081 281-482-3343 979-553-3703
FAX NUMBER 281-296-0329 281-489-7017 979-849-7214 281-412-0885 281-482-3411 979-553-4034
Person to contact for scheduling service KENNETH BLOW C.J. WALLER DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK TRAVIS MANTEL ELMER JOHNSON
Person to contact for billing issues KENNETH BLOW J.J. MOLOCK DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK TORI RATCLIFF BEA JOHNSON
DESCRIPTION Comm Code
**3% LOCAL BIDDER'S **3% LOCAL BIDDER'S **3% LOCAL BIDDER'S
3.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR PREFERENCE PREFERENCE PREFERENCE
CENTRAL SERVICE CENTER (PCT 2) $266.75 $242.01 $460.75
COST PRICE PER EACH MILE $75.00 $275.00 $249.49 NO BID $475.00 NO BID
3.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS
WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR
ASSIGNMENT 988-75 4 4 6(Tractors/mowers/op) NO BID 4 NO BID
3.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE 988-75 1 2 2 (trucks/operators) NO BID 2 NO BID
3.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT 988-75 2 2 2(weedeaters/operators) NO BID 2 NO BID
4.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR
NORTH SERVICE CENTER (PCT 3)
COST PRICE PER EACH MILE NO BID NO BID NO BID $251.00 $249.00 NO BID
3.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS
WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR
ASSIGNMENT 988-75 NO BID NO BID NO BID 4 5 NO BID
3.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE 988-75 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2 2 NO BID
3.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT 988-75 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2 2 NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID # 09-34 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS NAME]

KB TRACTOR MOWING
23917 DORRINGTON

L & W EXCAVATORS INC.

D & N CONTRACTOR INC.

TRI COUNTY
CONTRACTORS

COASTAL MAINTENANCE

JOHNSON LANDSCAPE
SERVICES

THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2009 ESTATES LANE 20701 HWY 6 117 CR 735 3709 TRENT COVE LANE 1036 CR 285 21410 PECAN BEND
10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME CONROE, TX 77385 MA NVEL, TX 77578 ANGLETON, TX 77516 PEARLAND, TX 77584 ALVIN, TX 77511 DAMON, TX 77430-8616
CONTACT| KENNETH BLOW C.J. WALLER DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK CHRIS MANTELL ELMER JOHNSON
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER 832-217-6130 281-489-1774 979-848-7214 281-865-8081 281-482-3343 979-553-3703
FAX NUMBER 281-296-0329 281-489-7017 979-849-7214 281-412-0885 281-482-3411 979-553-4034
Person to contact for scheduling service KENNETH BLOW C.J. WALLER DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK TRAVIS MANTEL ELMER JOHNSON
Person to contact for billing issues KENNETH BLOW J.J. MOLOCK DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK TORI RATCLIFF BEA JOHNSON
DESCRIPTION Comm Code
**3% LOCAL BIDDER'S **3% LOCAL BIDDER'S
5.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR PREFERENCE PREFERENCE
WEST SERVICE CENTER (PCT 4) $256.56 $582.00
COST PRICE PER EACH MILE NO BID NO BID $264.49 NO BID $600.00 $195.00
3.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS
WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR
ASSIGNMENT 988-75 NO BID NO BID 6 (tractor/mowers/operators) NO BID 4 5
3.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE 988-75 NO BID NO BID 2 (trucks/operators) NO BID 2 3
3.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT 988-75 NO BID NO BID 2 (weedeaters/operators) NO BID 2 4
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID # 09-34 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS NAME]

KB TRACTOR MOWING
23917 DORRINGTON

L & W EXCAVATORS INC.

D & N CONTRACTOR INC.

TRI COUNTY
CONTRACTORS

COASTAL MAINTENANCE

JOHNSON LANDSCAPE
SERVICES

THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2009 ESTATES LANE 20701 HWY 6 117 CR 735 3709 TRENT COVE LANE 1036 CR 285 21410 PECAN BEND
10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME CONROE, TX 77385 MA NVEL, TX 77578 ANGLETON, TX 77516 PEARLAND, TX 77584 ALVIN, TX 77511 DAMON, TX 77430-8616
CONTACT| KENNETH BLOW C.J. WALLER DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK CHRIS MANTELL ELMER JOHNSON
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER] 832-217-6130 281-489-1774 979-848-7214 281-865-8081 281-482-3343 979-553-3703
FAX NUMBER 281-296-0329 281-489-7017 979-849-7214 281-412-0885 281-482-3411 979-553-4034
Person to contact for scheduling service KENNETH BLOW C.J. WALLER DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK TRAVIS MANTEL ELMER JOHNSON
Person to contact for billing issues KENNETH BLOW J.J. MOLOCK DANIEL DECKERT JEROME NOVAK TORI RATCLIFF BEA JOHNSON
DESCRIPTION Comm Code
**3% LOCAL BIDDER'S
6.0 PROPOSED PRICE FOR ADDITIONAL PREFERENCE
BRAZORIA COUNTY LOCATIONS AS NEEDED $315.25
COST PRICE PER MILE 988-75 NO BID $325.00 70.00 / hour NO BID NO BID $195.00
6.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS
WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR
ASSIGNMENT 988-75 NO BID NO BID 2 (tractor/mowers/operators) NO BID NO BID -
6.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE 988-75 NO BID NO BID 1 (truck/operator) NO BID NO BID -
6.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT 988-75 NO BID NO BID 1 (weedeater/operator) NO BID NO BID -
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE
ADDITIONAL COMMENTS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE SEE BID PACKAGE
DID NOT USE THE DID NOT USE THE DID NOT USE THE
REVISED BID OFFER REVISED BID OFFER REVISED BID OFFER
BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED SHEET SHEET SHEET INCLUDED
INCLUDED ADDENDUMS 1 - 3 INCLUDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID # 09-34 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS NAME]

THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2009
10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

DANFORD MAINTENANCE
SERVICE INC.

1516 CR 645E
BRAZORIA, TX 77422

CONTACT| JASON DANFORD
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER] 979-798-6098
FAX NUMBER 979-798-6181
Person to contact for scheduling service JASON DANFORD
Person to contact for billing issues BECKY DANFORD
DESCRIPTION Comm Code

1.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR

BRAZORIA COUNTY

COST PRICE PER EACH MILE NO BID
1.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS

WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR

ASSIGNMENT 988-75 NO BID
1.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH

OPERATORS AVAILABLE 988-75 NO BID
1.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH

OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT 988-75 NO BID

**3% LOCAL BIDDER'S

2.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR PREFERENCE
SOUTH SERVICE CENTER (PCT 1) $339.50
COST PRICE PER EACH MILE $350.00
2.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS

WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR

ASSIGNMENT 988-75 4

2.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH

OPERATORS AVAILABLE 988-75 2

2.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH

OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT 988-75 2
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID # 09-34 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS NAME]

THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2009
10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

DANFORD MAINTENANCE
SERVICE INC.

1516 CR 645E
BRAZORIA, TX 77422

CONTACT| JASON DANFORD
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER] 979-798-6098
FAX NUMBER 979-798-6181
Person to contact for scheduling service JASON DANFORD
Person to contact for billing issues BECKY DANFORD
DESCRIPTION Comm Code

3.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR
CENTRAL SERVICE CENTER (PCT 2)

COST PRICE PER EACH MILE

NO BID

3.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS
WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR
ASSIGNMENT

988-75

NO BID

3.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE

988-75

NO BID

3.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT

988-75

NO BID

4.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR

NORTH SERVICE CENTER (PCT 3)

COST PRICE PER EACH MILE

NO BID

3.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS
WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR
ASSIGNMENT

988-75

NO BID

3.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE

988-75

NO BID

3.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH

OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT

988-75

NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID # 09-34 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS NAME]

THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2009
10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

DANFORD MAINTENANCE
SERVICE INC.

1516 CR 645E
BRAZORIA, TX 77422

CONTACT| JASON DANFORD
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER] 979-798-6098
FAX NUMBER 979-798-6181
Person to contact for scheduling service JASON DANFORD
Person to contact for billing issues BECKY DANFORD
DESCRIPTION Comm Code

**3% LOCAL BIDDER'S

5.0 COST TO PROVIDE FLEET MOWING FOR PREFERENCE
WEST SERVICE CENTER (PCT 4) $339.50
COST PRICE PER EACH MILE $350.00
3.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS

WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR

ASSIGNMENT 988-75 4

3.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH

OPERATORS AVAILABLE 988-75 2

3.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH

OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT 988-75 4
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID # 09-34 FLEET MOWING SERVICES

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS NAME]

THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2009
10:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

DANFORD MAINTENANCE

SERVICE INC.

1516 CR 645E
BRAZORIA, TX 77422

CONTACT| JASON DANFORD
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER] 979-798-6098
FAX NUMBER 979-798-6181
Person to contact for scheduling service JASON DANFORD
Person to contact for billing issues BECKY DANFORD
DESCRIPTION Comm Code
**3% LOCAL BIDDER'S
6.0 PROPOSED PRICE FOR ADDITIONAL PREFERENCE
BRAZORIA COUNTY LOCATIONS AS NEEDED $339.50
COST PRICE PER MILE 988-75 $350.00
6.1 TOTAL NUMBER OF 15' FOOT MOWERS
WITH OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR
ASSIGNMENT 988-75 -
6.2 TOTAL NUMBER OF 1/2 TON PICKUPS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE 988-75 -
6.3 TOTAL NUMBER OF WEED-EATERS WITH
OPERATORS AVAILABLE FOR ASSIGNMENT 988-75 -
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS

SEE BID PACKAGE

BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED ADDENDUMS 1 - 3

INCLUDED
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