ATTACHMENT A: SECTION 1.0 PURCHASING PRICE FOR SPECIFIED TIRES

ITB #09-30 TIRES

DATE OF BID OPENING:
THURSDAY, FEB 12,
2009, 2:00 CST

*Note: Vendor must fill in Manufacturer, Vendor Part #, UOM, Price.

Bidders Name

AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS

SOUTHERN TIRE MART

A TO ZTIRE & BATTERY, INC.

STROUHAL TIRE

Address

201 N RUPERT STREET

5051 SHARP STREET

812 WEST 4TH STREET

9252 WALLISVILLE ROAD

FORT WORTH, TX 76107

DALLAS, TX 75247

AMARILLO, TX 79101-1216

HOUSTON, TX 77013

Quoted By

ROGER WEBSTER

BOBBY HARMS

PHILIP NUSSBAUM

PERRY E. BELINOWSKI

Contact

ROGER WEBSTER

BOBBY HARMS

PHILIP NUSSBAUM

PERRY E. BELINOWSKI

Telephone
Number

800-792-8749

877-786-4681

806-373-2592

832-731-3754

Vendor must bid Brand specified . Fax Number 817-877-5018 214-389-7111 806-373-6504 713-672-1847
EST
COMM | COUNTY YRLY VENDOR
ITEM | CODE D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME _[MFR PART #| UOM[ QTY VENDOR P/N | VENDOR PRICE TOTAL VENDOR P/N PRICE TOTAL VENDOR P/N | VENDOR PRICE TOTAL VENDOR P/N | VENDOR PRICE TOTAL
1 86300 7345 |P225/60R18, 99V, FIREHAWK GT PURSUIT FIRESTONE 77342 EA 4 077342 $100.47 401.88 077-342 $99.00 $396.00 15474650000 112.00 448.00 077-342 99.75 399.00
2 | 86300 | 7346 |225/75-15, FR380, 1025 FIRESTONE 98353 EA 2 098353 $59.90 119.80 098-353 $58.00 $116.00 16332575 54.00 108.00 098-353 77.82 155.64
3 86300 7347  |P215/70R16, DUELER H/T BRIDGESTONE 106216 EA 4 106216 $82.08 328.32 106-216 $83.00 $332.00 21534171 76.00 304.00 106-216 104.36 417.44
4 86300 7348  |225/70R19.5 BS R250F 12 PLY BRIDGESTONE 153028 EA 2 153028 $162.01 324.02 153-028 $164.50 $329.00 66128015 120.00 240.00 153-028 176.00 352.00
NPN223589
5 86300 7349  |LT265/75R16 DESTINATION M/T, 10 PLY, OWL FIRESTONE 155551 EA 4 155551 (DISC) $152.94 611.76 197-130 $116.00 $464.00 706829 126.00 504.00 197-130 118.84 475.36
6 86300 7350  [LT235/85R16/E DUELER A/T REVO BRIDGESTONE 156191 EA 5 156191 $117.49 587.45 156-191 $118.50 $592.50 709850 77.00 385.00 156-191 152.00 760.00
7 86300 7351 |LT245/75R16 DUELER A/T REVO BRIDGESTONE 156221 EA 2 156221 $112.34 224.68 156-221 $113.40 $226.80 709852 79.00 158.00 156-221 145.00 290.00
8 86300 7352  |LT265/75R16 DUELER A/T REVO BRIDGESTONE 156256 EA 4 156256 $143.94 575.76 156-256 $145.00 $580.00 709853 88.00 88.00 156-256 153.00 612.00
9 86300 7353  |LT265/75R16/E DUELER A/T REVO BRIDGESTONE 156302 EA 6 156302 $129.79 778.74 156-302 $131.00 $786.00 709853 88.00 528.00 156-302 168.00 1,008.00
10 86300 7354 |11R22.5 FS-560, 14 PLY, STEEL RADIAL FIRESTONE 156531 EA 36 156531 $209.99 7,559.64 156-531 $212.50 $7,650.00 61188035 189.00 6,804.00 156-531 230.14 8,285.04
11 86300 7355 |11R22.5 FD690 PLUSRAD ST FIRESTONE 158676 EA 16 158676 $247.99 3,967.84 158-626 $250.50 $4,008.00 61107506 195.00 3,120.00 158-676 330.00 5,280.00
NPN186318
11R22.5 16 PLY V STEEL LUG L320 BRIDGESTONE 186-318 EA 8 186-318 (DISC) $276.49 2,211.92 186-318 $279.00 $2,232.00 700218 $210.00 $1,680.00 186-318 $470.00 3,760.00
LT215/85R16 TRANSFORCE AT FIRESTONE 189-565 EA 189565 $92.24 368.96 189-563 $93.90 $375.60 23555510 $69.00 $276.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 86300 7356 |LT215/85R16 TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 189684 EA 3 18,\:;":‘8:;8?;&10) $86.70 260.10 189-701 $88.00 $264.00 21299101 70.00 210.00 189-701 88.00 264.00
13 86300 7357  |LT235/85R16E TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 189718 EA 11 189718 $79.99 879.89 189-718 $78.40 $862.40 21299103 78.00 858.00 189-718 83.00 913.00
14 86300 7358  |LT245/75R16 TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 189769 EA 6 189769 $82.34 494.04 189-769 $83.40 $500.40 21299105 79.00 474.00 189-769 93.00 558.00
15 86300 7359  |LT235/75R15, TRANSFORCE H/T FIRESTONE 189837 EA 3 189837 $78.94 236.82 189-837 $80.00 $240.00 21585250 84.00 252.00 189-837 80.00 240.00
16 86300 7360 |LT265/70R17, DESTNATION M/T WITH UNI-OWL FIRESTONE 190296 EA 4 190296 $117.49 469.96 190-296 $119.00 $476.00 36130 205.00 820.00 190-296 123.00 492.00
17 86300 7361 |LT245/70R17, TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 191316 EA 4 . Plr\%féges $95.14 380.56 191-316 $96.20 $384.80 21533235 118.00 472.00 191-316 100.00 400.00
18 86300 7362 |255/70R22.5, R250, 16 PLY BRIDGESTONE 192608 EA 5 92-608 (DISC) $209.99 1,049.95 216-568 $212.50 $1,062.50 61188065 150.00 750.00 216-568 351.00 1,755.00
NPN223589
19 86300 7363 |LT265/75R16, DESTINATION M/T, UNI-T FIRESTONE 197130 EA 4 197-130 (DISC) $152.94 611.76 197-130 $116.50 $466.00 706829 127.00 508.00 223-589 155.00 620.00
NPN211733 $134.04 88.00 168.00
20 86300 7364 |LT265/75R16, DUELER A/T BRIDGESTONE 200139 EA 4 200-139 (DISC) 536.16 211.733 $135.10 $540.40 709853 352.00 156-302 672.00
21 | 86300 | 7365 |LT265/70R17, 10 PLY, TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 200156 EA 4 200156 $103.51 414.04 200-156 $104.50 $418.00 782040 135.00 540.00 200-156 108.00 432.00
22 | 86300 | 7366 |LT265/70R17 TRANSFORCE ALL TERRAIN FIRESTONE 200190 EA 4 200190 $105.69 422.76 200-190 $106.75 $427.00 782115 136.00 544.00 200-190 110.00 440.00
23 | 86300 | 7367 [LT245/75R17, TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 207483 EA 4 207483 $97.66 390.64 207-483 $98.75 $395.00 362620 131.00 524.00 207-483 102.00 408.00
24 | 86300 | 7368 [11R22.5, M711, STEEL RADIAL BRIDGESTONE 265225 EA 16 265225 $244.99 3,919.84 265-225 $247.50 $3,960.00 61188882 209.00 3,344.00 265-225 264.00 4,224.00
NPN299839 $168.45 130.00 248.00
25 86300 7369  |225/70R19.5 BSA M724LP, 12PLY BRIDGESTONE 272876 EA 4 272-876 (DISC) 673.80 299-839 $171.00 $684.00 62150225 520.00 272-876 992.00
26 | 86300 | 7370 [11R22.5 FD663, 14 PLY, TL FIRESTONE 281042 EA 20 281042 $222.43 4,448.60 281-041 $225.00 $4,500.00 700218 210.00 4,200.00 281-042 236.00 4,720.00
27 | 86300 | 7371 |385/65R22.518 PLY BRIDGESTONE 287938 EA 4 287938 $329.75 1,319.00 281-938 $332.50 $1,330.00 62112385 295.00 1,180.00 287-938 313.00 1,252.00
30 86300 7374 |10.00 R20, 16 PLY, T819 FIRESTONE 294497 EA 2 294497 $239.99 479.98 294-497 $242.00 $484.00 61281026 221.00 442.00 294-497 251.00 502.00
7373 |385/65R22.5 T839 WIDEBASE FIRESTONE 284-586 EA 1 294586 $307.99 307.99 294586 $310.50 $310.50 62112385 295.00 295.00 294-586 335.00 335.00
31 86300 7375[10.00 R20, T546 PSD RAD ST FIRESTONE 294721 EA 8 294721 $235.72 1,885.76 294-721 $239.00 $1,912.00 61211026 209.00 1,672.00 294-721 258.00 2,064.00
32 86300 7376|11R24.5 FS507 14PLY TL FIRESTONE 297038 EA 2 297038 $259.37 518.74 297-038 $261.90 $523.80 61188040 215.00 430.00 297-038 325.00 650.00
33 86300 7377|LT245/75R16 DUELER A/T BRIDGESTONE 298565 EA 4 2218}3-2162;(32?:) $116.45 465.80 211-716 $117.50 $470.00 709852 79.00 316.00 156-221 145.00 580.00
34 86300 7378|LT265/75R16, SUMMIT MUD DAWG, LOAD RANGE D SUMMIT 302123 EA 4 3(;\‘2}?1’\‘2232(35290) $152.94 611.76 197-130 $116.00 $464.00 706829 126.00 504.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 86300 7379(23.1 x 26 NON SKID TRACTOR, 12 PLY FIRESTONE 323527 EA 2 323527 $971.65 1,943.30 323-527 $1,125.00 $2,250.00 140398 1,000.00 2,000.00 323-527 972.00 1,944.00
36 86300 7380|11L-16 12 PLY TUBELESS INDUSTRIAL FIRESTONE 326089 EA 4 326089 $187.77 751.08 FT-47 $138.00 $552.00 4.85325E+11 100.00 400.00 326-089 181.00 724.00
37 86300 7381(12.4/24 6 PLY RI TUBELESS, TRACTOR FIRESTONE 338400 EA 6 338400 $257.11 1,542.66 ES5515 $220.00 $1,320.00 708502 180.00 1,080.00 338-400 249.00 1,494.00
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EST
COMM | COUNTY YRLY VENDOR
ITEM | CODE D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME _[MFR PART #| UOM[ QTY VENDOR P/N | VENDOR PRICE TOTAL VENDOR P/N PRICE TOTAL VENDOR P/N | VENDOR PRICE TOTAL VENDOR P/N | VENDOR PRICE TOTAL
38 86300 7382(23.1 X 26, 12 PLY, TUBELESS FIRESTONE 344052 EA 1 344052 $980.00 980.00 BKT5830 $990.00 $990.00 140398 1,000.00 1,000.00 344-052 952.00 952.00
39 86300 7383[LT245/70R17, SUMITT MUD DAWG SUMMIT 372000 EA 8 NPN190279 $110.96 887.68 190-279 $113.00 $904.00 301160 130.00 1,040.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 86300 7384|LT265/70R17 SUMMIT MUD DAWG SUMMIT 373080 EA 4 NPN190296 $117.49 469.96 190-206 $119.00 $476.00 360130 207.00 828.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
750/15 6 PLY, TUBELESS COMPACTOR GALAXY 380-124 EA 3 58R256 $101.85 305.55 592C $84.00 $252.00 841263 120.00 360.00 380-124 179.00 537.00
41 86300 7385[1400-24 F SUPER GROUND GRIP G2 12PLY FIRESTONE 425214 EA 6 425214 $416.50 2,499.00 425-214 $370.00 $2,220.00 817355011221 320.00 1,920.00 425-214 401.00 2,406.00
TOTALS didn't quote on
48,217.95 $47,726.70 42,478.00 all
COMMENTS 1-2 DAYS ARO 1-10 day delivery time DID NOT BID ON BRAND SPECIFIED within 2 weeks
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