BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID ITB #09-26 ASPHALTS, OILS AND EMULSIONS

DATE OF BID OPENING

FRIDAY, DECEMBER 12 2008

BIDDERS NAME

P2 EMULSION PLANTS, LLC

CLEVELAND ASPHALT PRODUCTS

PERFORMANCE GRADE ASPHALT
LLC

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

516 S MCLENNAN LOOP

100 ASPHALT LANE

5320 FM 2004

PO BOX 57

10:00 A.M. ELM MOTT, TX 76640 SHEPHERD, TX 77371 HITCHCOCK, TX 77563 BAYTOWN, TX 77522
QUOIMED S PAUL LEADABRAND CRAIG C. MOORE CLARK DUBOSE
CNPACE PAUL LEADABRAND CRAIG C. MOORE CLARK DUBOSE
TELEPHONE NUMBER 972-822-1372 800-334-0177 409-986-7740 281-421-2621
FAX NUMBER 254-829-0337 936-628-6602 409-986-7590
RENEE MILLS FREIDA D ORTIZ
PERSON TO CONTACT FOR 979-417-5808 (CELL) OR MICHELLE GRIFFIN
PLACING ORDERS 254-829-0330 (OFFICE) 800-334-0177 CLARK DUBOSE
DESCRIPTION Comm Code County ID
Location of bidder's pIant ELM MOTT, TX 76640 SHEPHERD, TX 77371 HITCHCOCK, TX 77563 NO B ID
1.0 ASPHALTS
1.1 CUTBACK ASPHALT
1.1.1 RC-250 745-06 807 NO BID $3.3998 NO BID NO BID
1.1.2 MC-30 745-06 808 NO BID $3.3998 $2.95 NO BID
4000+ gallons= add .05/gal
3000-3999 gallons= add .10/gal
For Partial Loads, add per gallon 745-06 2743 NO BID 2000-2999+gallons =add .22/gal $0.10 NO BID
Demurrage Rate: per hour
after hr 745-06 2744 NO BID $80.00 P/HR AFTER 2 HRS 40.00/HR AFTER 2 HRS NO BID
Location of bidder's plant NO BID SHEPHERD, TX 77371 HITCHCOCK, TX NO BID
Number of days to deliver ARO: NO BID 1-2DAYS 1-2 DAYS NO B | D
1.2 EMULSIFIED ASPHALT
1.2.1 CRS-2 74508 809 NO BID $2.1498 $1.60 NO BID
1.2.2CMs-1 745-08 810 NO BID $2.2998 $1.65 NO BID
1.2.3CMS-2 745-08 811 NO BID $2.2998 $1.65 NO BID
1.2.4CSS-1 745-08 812 NO BID $1.9998 $1.65 NO BID
1.2.5CSS-1h 745-08 2753 NO BID $1.9998 $1.65 NO BID
1.2.6 AEP 745-08 2756 NO BID $2.7498 $2.10 NO BID
1.2.7 COS-50 745-08 2759 2.67 (ROC) 1.9998 $1.95 NO BID
1.2.8 CWE-2 745-08 6662 $2.62 2.1498 $1.85 NO BID
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10:00 A.M. ELM MOTT, TX 76640 SHEPHERD, TX 77371 HITCHCOCK, TX 77563 BAYTOWN, TX 77522
QUOIMED S PAUL LEADABRAND CRAIG C. MOORE CLARK DUBOSE
COITAETT PAUL LEADABRAND CRAIG C. MOORE CLARK DUBOSE
TELEPHONE NUMBER 972-822-1372 800-334-0177 409-986-7740 281-421-2621
FAX NUMBER 254-829-0337 936-628-6602 409-986-7590
RENEE MILLS FREIDA D ORTIZ
PERSON TO CONTACT FOR 979-417-5808 (CELL) OR MICHELLE GRIFFIN
PLACING ORDERS 254-829-0330 (OFFICE) 800-334-0177 CLARK DUBOSE
DESCRIPTION Comm Code | County ID
Location of bidder's pIant ELM MOTT, TX 76640 SHEPHERD, TX 77371 HITCHCOCK, TX 77563 NO B ID
4000+ gallons= add .05/gal
3000-3999 gallons= add .10/gal
For Partial Loads, add per gallon 745-08 6663 0.25 (UNDER 5000 GAL) 2000-2999+gallons =add.22/gal $0.10 NO BID
Demurrage Rate: per hour
after___hr 745-08 6664 $70.00 P/HR AFTER 2 HRS $80.00 P/HR AFTER 2 HRS 40.00/HR AFTER 2 HRS NO BID
Location of bidder's plant ELM MOTT, TX 76640 SHEPHERD, TX 77371 HITCHCOCK, TX 77563 NO BID
Number of days to deliver ARO: 2 DAYS 1-2 DAYS 1-2 DAYS NO B I D
1.3 ASPHALT RECYCLING EMULSION
1.3.1 ARE-68 745-08 2761 2.52 (Rejuvinator) 2.0998 NO BID NO BID
1.3.2 PER TxDOT ITEM 300.2(12) 745-08 2763 $2.52 $2.10 $2.00 NO BID
4000+ gallons= add .05/gal
3000-3999 gallons= add .10/gal
For Partial Loads, add per gallon 745-08 2764 0.25 (UNDER 5000 GAL) 2000-2999+gallons =add.22/gal $0.10 NO BID
Demurrage Rate: per hour
after___hr 745-08 5375 $70.00 P/HR AFTER 2 HRS 80.00 P/HR AFTER 2 HRS 40.00/HR AFTER 2 HRS NO BID
Location of bidder's plant ELM MOTT, TX 76640 SHEPHERD, TX 77371 HITCHCOCK, TX 77563 NO BID
Number of days to deliver ARO: 2 DAYS 1-2 DAYS 1-2 DAYS NO B | D
1.4 ASPHALT BASE STABILIZER
1.4.1 ABS-65 745-08 2765 2.48 (STABILIZER) 1.9998 $2.00 NO BID
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10:00 A.M. ELM MOTT, TX 76640 SHEPHERD, TX 77371 HITCHCOCK, TX 77563 BAYTOWN, TX 77522
QUOIMED S PAUL LEADABRAND CRAIG C. MOORE CLARK DUBOSE
COITAETT PAUL LEADABRAND CRAIG C. MOORE CLARK DUBOSE
TELEPHONE NUMBER 972-822-1372 800-334-0177 409-986-7740 281-421-2621
FAX NUMBER 254-829-0337 936-628-6602 409-986-7590
RENEE MILLS FREIDA D ORTIZ
PERSON TO CONTACT FOR 979-417-5808 (CELL) OR MICHELLE GRIFFIN
PLACING ORDERS 254-829-0330 (OFFICE) 800-334-0177 CLARK DUBOSE
DESCRIPTION Comm Code | County ID
Location of bidder's pIant ELM MOTT, TX 76640 SHEPHERD, TX 77371 HITCHCOCK, TX 77563 NO B ID
4000+ gallons= add .05/gal
3000-3999 gallons= add .10/gal
For Partial Loads, add per gallon 745-08 2766 0.25 (UNDER 5000 GAL) 2000-2999+gallons = add.22/gal $0.10 NO BID
Demurrage Rate: per hour
after___hr 74508 5376 70.00 P/HR AFTER 2 HRS 80.00 P/HR AFTER 2 HRS 40.00/HR AFTER 2 HRS NO BID
Location of bidder's plant ELM MOTT, TX 76640 SHEPHERD, TX 77371 HITCHCOCK, TX 77563 NO BID
Number of days to deliver ARO: 2 DAYS 1-2 DAYS 1-2 DAYS NO B | D
Exceptions to T&C? NONE NONE NONE NO BID
Additional T&C? NONE NONE NONE NO BID
Insurance Included? NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED NO BID
Attachment D Included NOT INCLUDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED NO BID
Additional Comments NONE NONE NO BID
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