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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS  NAME

MONDAY, DECEMBER 8, 2008

2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME
QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact for placing 
orders & telephone

Person to contact for billing 
issues & telephone

UOM UOM UOM

yard truck yard cuyd

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

mileage * 
multiplier

Airport 15 $15.00 $17.00 yard Airport 15 $15.00 $19.00 truck yard Airport 6.1 $6.10 $8.96 cuyd

Alvin JP Office 32 $32.00 $34.00 yard Alvin JP Office 41 $41.00 $45.00 truck yard Alvin JP Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr 33 $33.00 $35.00 yard Alvin Svc Ctr 40 $40.00 $44.00 truck yard Alvin Svc Ctr 24.5 $24.50 $27.36 cuyd

AngleYard Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $16.00 yard AngleYard Svc Ctr 13 $13.00 $17.00 truck yard AngleYard Svc Ctr 6 $6.00 $8.86 cuyd

Brazoria Cty Courthouse 13 $13.00 $15.00 yard Brazoria Cty Courthouse 12 $12.00 $16.00 truck yard Brazoria Cty Courthouse NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDy
Juvenile Detention 
Center 20 $20.00 $22.00 yard

y
Juvenile Detention 
Center 13 $13.00 $17.00 truck yard

y
Juvenile Detention 
Center 6 $6.00 $8.86 cuyd

Brazoria Svc Ctr 20 $20.00 $22.00 yard Brazoria Svc Ctr 20 $20.00 $24.00 truck yard Brazoria Svc Ctr 13.9 $13.90 $16.76 cuyd

Camp Mohawk 28 $28.00 $30.00 yard Camp Mohawk 33 $33.00 $37.00 truck yard Camp Mohawk 16.8 $16.80 $19.66 cuyd

Clute Svc Ctr 7 $7.00 $9.00 yard Clute Svc Ctr 3.5 $3.50 $7.50 truck yard Clute Svc Ctr 15.1 $15.10 $17.96 cuyd

Hanson Park 28 $28.00 $30.00 yard Hanson Park 34 $34.00 $38.00 truck yard Hanson Park 17.3 $17.30 $20.16 cuyd

Manvel R&B Service 
Center / Manvel Annex 40 $40.00 $42.00 yard

Manvel R&B Service 
Center / Manvel Annex 41 $41.00 $45.00 truck yard

Manvel R&B Service 
Center / Manvel Annex NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manvel JP Office 41 $41.00 $43.00 yard Manvel JP Office 42 $42.00 $46.00 truck yard Manvel JP Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Mosquito Control 12 $12.00 $14.00 yard Mosquito Control 12 $12.00 $16.00 truck yard Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Pearland JP Office 50 $50.00 $52.00 yard Pearland JP Office 52 $52.00 $56.00 truck yard Pearland JP Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Quintana Cty Park 10 $10.00 $12.00 yard Quintana Cty Park 8 $8.00 $12.00 truck yard Quintana Cty Park 29.1 $29.10 $31.96 cuyd

Resoft Park 37 $37.00 $39.00 yard Resoft Park 42 $42.00 $46.00 truck yard Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

San Luis Cty Park 19 $19.00 $21.00 yard San Luis Cty Park 18 $18.00 $22.00 truck yard San Luis Cty Park 38.6 $38.60 $41.46 cuyd

Sheriff's Office 20 $20.00 $22.00 yard Sheriff's Office 17 $17.00 $21.00 truck yard Sheriff's Office 8 $8.00 $10.86 cuyd

W. Columbia Svc 26 $26.00 $28.00 yard W. Columbia Svc 32 $32.00 $36.00 truck yard W. Columbia Svc 12.8 $12.80 $15.66 cuyd

1.00 1.00 1.00 

UOM UOM UOM

yard truck yard cuyd

yard truck yard NO BIDAlvin Svc Ctr NO BID

Low bid multiplier

County Facility Price/Yard Delivered

Airport $5.70 

CR44 Angleton $2.86

Plant Location Material cost

Angleton Sand Company

P.O. Box 225

Danbury, TX 77534

Roger Kroschel III

Oyster Creek $4.00

Material cost

Mike Sorrell Trucking & Materials, Inc.

P.O. Box 2049

Freeport, TX 77541

Earl Cadenhead

Airport $8.90 

Alvin Svc Ctr $15.15 

Low bid multiplier

County Facility Price/Yard Delivered

1.0 TOPSOIL / DIRT 
1.1. Fill Dirt

Price/Yard DeliveredCounty Facility

Low bid multiplier

Plant Location Material cost

1.1.2. Price as delivered to County Facilities

BID #09-23 DIRT

DESCRIPTION

P.O. Box 967

Vernor Material and Equipment Co, Inc.

Mike Damian

Clute, TX 77531

Plant Location

3908 FM 523, Oyster Ck1.1.1. Price at bidder's plant/siding loaded onto County Trucks $2.00

Airport $6.80 

Alvin Svc Ctr $10.20 
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS  NAME

MONDAY, DECEMBER 8, 2008

2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME
QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact for placing 
orders & telephone

Person to contact for billing 
issues & telephone

Angleton Sand Company

P.O. Box 225

Danbury, TX 77534

Roger Kroschel III

Mike Sorrell Trucking & Materials, Inc.

P.O. Box 2049

Freeport, TX 77541

Earl Cadenhead

BID #09-23 DIRT

DESCRIPTION

P.O. Box 967

Vernor Material and Equipment Co, Inc.

Mike Damian

Clute, TX 77531

yard truck yard cuyd

yard truck yard NO BID

yard truck yard cuyd

yard truck yard cuyd

yard truck yard cuyd

yard truck yard cuyd

yard truck yard cuyd

yard truck yard NO BID

yard truck yard NO BID

yard truck yard NO BID

yard truck yard NO BID

yard truck yard NO BID

yard truck yard cuyd

yard truck yard NO BID

yard truck yard cuyd

yard truck yard cuyd

yard truck yard cuyd

Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile UOM Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile UOM Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile UOM

$2.00 $0.20 yard $4.00 $0.25 truck yard

UOM UOM UOM

NO BID truck yard NO BID

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport 15 $15.00 $23.25 truck yard Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alvin JP Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin JP Office 41 $0.00 $0.00 truck yard Alvin JP Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Plant Location Material cost

W. Columbia Svc $6.78 

Hauling first mile

NO BID

San Luis Cty Park $11.43 

Sheriff's Office $5.70 

Resoft Park NO BID

Pearland Justice of the Peace NO BID

Quintana Cty Park $9.98 

Manvel Justice of the Peace NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID

Manvel Annex NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr $7.14 

Hanson Park $7.14 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $6.80 

Camp Mohawk $7.14 

Brazoria County Courthouse NO BID
Brazoria County Juvenile Detention 

Center $5.70 

AngleYard Svc Ctr $5.70 

next day

Plant Location Material cost

San Luis Cty Park $7.60 

$5.80 

$13.80 

Resoft Park $11.20 

Mosquito Control

Material costPlant Location

2 business days/weather permitting

12 yards

NO BIDNO BID

Hauling first mile

$1.40

Oyster Creek $8.25

12 truck yards

Sheriff's Office $9.40 

W. Columbia Svc $13.15 

Resoft Park $15.65 

San Luis Cty Park $9.65 

Quintana Cty Park $7.15 

Mosquito Control $8.15 

Pearland Justice of the Peace $18.15 

Manvel Svc Ctr $15.40 

Manvel Justice of the Peace $15.65 

Hanson Park $13.65 

Manvel Annex $15.40 

Camp Mohawk $13.40 

Clute Svc Ctr $6.03 

Brazoria County Juvenile Detention 
Center $8.40 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $10.15 

AngleYard Svc Ctr $8.40 

Brazoria County Courthouse $8.15 

2.0. Top Soil, Fertile Sandy Loam, Screened, Grade 1 (23-52% Sand, 28-
50% Silt, and 7-27% Clay)

2.1.1.Price at bidder's plant/siding loaded onto County Trucks

1.1.4.  State Minimum truckload if required

1.1.5. Days to Deliver ARO

1.1.3. Price as delivered to jobsite

Sheriff's Office $7.80 

W. Columbia Svc $9.00 

Hauling first mile

$6.20 

Manvel Annex $11.80 

Manvel Svc Ctr $11.40 

$12.00 

$5.20 

Brazoria County Juvenile Detention 
Center $7.80 

Camp Mohawk $9.40 

Manvel Justice of the Peace

Brazoria County Courthouse

Pearland Justice of the Peace

AngleYard Svc Ctr $6.60 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $7.80 

$6.40 

Hanson Park $9.40 

Clute Svc Ctr

$2.00

Quintana Cty Park
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS  NAME

MONDAY, DECEMBER 8, 2008

2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME
QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact for placing 
orders & telephone

Person to contact for billing 
issues & telephone

Angleton Sand Company

P.O. Box 225

Danbury, TX 77534

Roger Kroschel III

Mike Sorrell Trucking & Materials, Inc.

P.O. Box 2049

Freeport, TX 77541

Earl Cadenhead

BID #09-23 DIRT

DESCRIPTION

P.O. Box 967

Vernor Material and Equipment Co, Inc.

Mike Damian

Clute, TX 77531

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 40 $40.00 $48.25 truck yard Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AngleYard Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID AngleYard Svc Ctr 13 $13.00 $21.25 truck yard AngleYard Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brazoria Cty Courthouse NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Cty Courthouse 12 $12.00 $20.25 truck yard Brazoria Cty Courthouse NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDy
Juvenile Detention 
Center NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

y
Juvenile Detention 
Center 13 $13.00 $21.25 truck yard

y
Juvenile Detention 
Center NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 20 $20.00 $28.25 truck yard Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk 33 $33.00 $41.25 truck yard Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 3.5 $3.50 $11.75 truck yard Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park 34 $34.00 $42.25 truck yard Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manvel R&B Service 
Center / Manvel Annex NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manvel R&B Service 
Center / Manvel Annex 41 $41.00 $49.25 truck yard

Manvel R&B Service 
Center / Manvel Annex NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manvel JP Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel JP Office 42 $42.00 $50.25 truck yard Manvel JP Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control 12 $12.00 $20.25 truck yard Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Pearland JP Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Pearland JP Office 52 $52.00 $60.25 truck yard Pearland JP Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

mileage * 
multiplier

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park 8 $8.00 $16.25 truck yard Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park 42 $42.00 $50.25 truck yard Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park 18 $18.00 $26.25 truck yard San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sheriff's Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Sheriff's Office 17 $17.00 $25.25 truck yard Sheriff's Office NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc 32 $32.00 $40.25 truck yard W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.00 1.00 1.00 

UOM UOM UOM

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BIDBrazoria Svc Ctr NO BID

Brazoria County Courthouse NO BID
Brazoria County Juvenile Detention 

Center NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID

AngleYard Svc Ctr NO BID

Low bid multiplier

County Facility Price/Yard Delivered

Airport NO BID

Brazoria County Juvenile Detention 
Center $12.65 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $14.40 

AngleYard Svc Ctr $12.65 

Brazoria County Courthouse $12.40 

Airport $13.15 

Alvin Svc Ctr $19.40 

Low bid multiplier

County Facility Price/Yard Delivered

Brazoria County Juvenile Detention 
Center NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID

NO BID

AngleYard Svc Ctr NO BID

Brazoria County Courthouse NO BID

2.2.2.  Price as delivered to County Facilities County Facility Price/Yard Delivered

Airport NO BID

Low bid multiplier

Alvin Svc Ctr
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS  NAME

MONDAY, DECEMBER 8, 2008

2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME
QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact for placing 
orders & telephone

Person to contact for billing 
issues & telephone

Angleton Sand Company

P.O. Box 225

Danbury, TX 77534

Roger Kroschel III

Mike Sorrell Trucking & Materials, Inc.

P.O. Box 2049

Freeport, TX 77541

Earl Cadenhead

BID #09-23 DIRT

DESCRIPTION

P.O. Box 967

Vernor Material and Equipment Co, Inc.

Mike Damian

Clute, TX 77531

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

NO BID truck yard NO BID

Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile UOM Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile UOM Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile UOM

$8.25 $0.25 truck yard

NONE

NO BID

NO BID

CONTRACT SHEET, BIDDER AFFIRMATION, AND SDN/BLOCKED 
OERSONS AFFIRMATION NOT SIGNED.  ATTACHMENT D NOT INITIALED

NONE

West Columbia Service Center NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID

Sheriff's Office NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID

Pearland Justice of the Peace NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID

Manvel Justice of the Peace NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID

Manvel Annex NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Hauling first mile

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID

Manvel Justice of the Peace NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID

Manvel Annex

NO BID

Mosquito Control

NO BIDSheriff's Office

NO BID

NO BID

Camp Mohawk

NONENONE

NONE

INCLUDED

2.2.3. Price as delivered to jobsite

Pearland Justice of the Peace

next day

ATTACHMENT D NOT INCLUDED

NONE

12 truck yards

$13.90 

Sheriff's Office $13.65 

Hauling first mile

West Columbia Service Ctr $17.40 

San Luis Cty Park

Resoft Park $19.90 

Quintana Cty Park $16.90 

Mosquito Control $12.40 

Pearland Justice of the Peace $22.40 

Manvel Svc Ctr $19.65 

Manvel Justice of the Peace $19.90 

Hanson Park $17.90 

Manvel Annex $19.65 

Camp Mohawk $17.65 

Clute Svc Ctr $12.40 

3.2.5. Days to Deliver ARO

3.2.4.  State Minimum truckload if required

Quintana Cty Park NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID

NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID

San Luis Cty Park

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS

BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED

$1.40

NO BIDWest Columbia Service Ctr

NO BID

Printed 12/10/2008


