
BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET ITB # 09-17 ROAD MATERIALS - SURFACE COURSES

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton

3.1.1 Price per ton bidder's 
plant/siding loaded onto County 
trucks 745-87 6779 $41.00 $55.00 NO BID $42.50

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport 28 $28.00 $69.00 Airport 6 $6.00 $61.00 Airport NO BID NO BID  NO BID Airport 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $16.00 $57.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 23 $23.00 $78.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $26.00 $67.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 3 $3.00 $58.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $32.00 $73.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $69.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Camp Mohawk 20 $20.00 $61.00 Camp Mohawk 23 $23.00 $78.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID  NO BID Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Clute Svc Ctr 39 $39.00 $80.00 Clute Svc Ctr 10 $10.00 $65.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $76.00 Hanson Park 14 $14.00 $69.00 Hanson Park 35 NO BID  NO BID Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $77.50 

Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $9.00 $50.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 24 $24.00 $79.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 34 NO BID  NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 34 $34.00 $76.50 

Mosquito Control 27 $27.00 $68.00 Mosquito Control 3 $3.00 $58.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID  NO BID Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Quintana Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 Quintana Cty Park 22 $22.00 $77.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Resoft Park 18 $18.00 $59.00 Resoft Park 23 $23.00 $78.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

San Luis Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 San Luis Cty Park 30 $30.00 $85.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $76.00 W. Columbia Svc 14 $14.00 $69.00 W. Columbia Svc 35 NO BID  NO BID W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $77.50 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

3.1.2 Price per ton as delivered to 
jobsite 745-87 6779 Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile

$41.00 $0.15 $55.00 $0.20 NO BID NO BID $42.50 $0.25

3.1.3 Price per ton in place 745-87 6779 Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID $75.00 $0.20 $67.50 $0.03 NO BID  NO BID
3.1.4 State Minimum truckload if 
required

ERIC SUAREZ

10126 CASH ROAD
STAFFORD, TX 77477

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

NO BID

Hauling first mile

14 TONS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES ANN LINDSEY - 713-292-2875
DESCRIPTION

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988
FAX #

JERRY L. BERRYRICHARD GREER

SILVA CONTRACTING CO., INC.

281-342-9314

RICHMOND, TX 77469
6130 FM 2218

HOUSTON, TX 77011

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

Plant Location

500 TON 

$2.50

ROSENBERG, TX

$2.50

Hauling first mile

Hauling first mile

Plant Location
5730 OLD ALVIN ROAD

ROSHARON, TX 77583 OR
9519 OLD GALVESTON ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77034

Hauling first mile

Hauling first mile

$2.50

713-292-2885
713-292-2875

 

NO BID 

RICHARD GREER

LEE ANN THUMAN - 281-342-9314
ERIC SUAREZ - 281-342-9314

AMERICAN MATERIALS

JERRY L. BERRY
281-499-1551
281-499-1525

JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551
JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551

281-342-2878

ERIC SUAREZ

  

14 TONS

$2.50

Plant Location
500 WARD ST

ANGLETON, TX  OR
2122 HWY 90A

MISSOURI CITY, TX

Hauling first mile

939 SH 36

TARMAC MATERIALS, INC

ROSENBERG, TX 77471
ERIC SUAREZ
ERIC SUAREZ
281-342-9314
281-342-2878

RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314
RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

 

Plant Location

ROSENBERG, TX

Hauling first mile

$2.50

Hauling first mile

NO BID

12 TONS

3.1 ASPHALT STABILIZED BASE
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET ITB # 09-17 ROAD MATERIALS - SURFACE COURSES

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

ERIC SUAREZ

10126 CASH ROAD
STAFFORD, TX 77477

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES ANN LINDSEY - 713-292-2875
DESCRIPTION

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988
FAX #

JERRY L. BERRYRICHARD GREER

SILVA CONTRACTING CO., INC.

281-342-9314

RICHMOND, TX 77469
6130 FM 2218

HOUSTON, TX 77011

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

713-292-2885
713-292-2875

 

RICHARD GREER

LEE ANN THUMAN - 281-342-9314
ERIC SUAREZ - 281-342-9314

AMERICAN MATERIALS

JERRY L. BERRY
281-499-1551
281-499-1525

JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551
JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551

281-342-2878

ERIC SUAREZ

  

939 SH 36

TARMAC MATERIALS, INC

ROSENBERG, TX 77471
ERIC SUAREZ
ERIC SUAREZ
281-342-9314
281-342-2878

RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314
RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

 

3.2.1 TxDot Item 340, Type D, 
mixed with AC-20 Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton

3.2.1.1 Price per ton bidder's plant 
/ siding loaded onto County trucks 745-68 6780 $41.00 $55.00 NO BID $45.50

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport 28 $28.00 $69.00 Airport 6 $6.00 $61.00 Airport NO BID NO BID  NO BID Airport 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $16.00 $57.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 23 $23.00 $78.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $26.00 $67.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 3 $3.00 $58.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $32.00 $73.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $69.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Camp Mohawk 20 $20.00 $61.00 Camp Mohawk 23 $23.00 $78.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID  NO BID Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Clute Svc Ctr 39 $39.00 $80.00 Clute Svc Ctr 10 $10.00 $65.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $76.00 Hanson Park 14 $14.00 $69.00 Hanson Park 35 NO BID  NO BID Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $80.50 

Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $9.00 $50.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 24 $24.00 $79.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 34 NO BID  NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 34 $34.00 $79.50 

Mosquito Control 27 $27.00 $68.00 Mosquito Control 3 $3.00 $58.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID  NO BID Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Quintana Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 Quintana Cty Park 22 $22.00 $77.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Resoft Park 18 $18.00 $59.00 Resoft Park 23 $23.00 $78.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

San Luis Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 San Luis Cty Park 30 $30.00 $85.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $76.00 W. Columbia Svc 14 $14.00 $69.00 W. Columbia Svc 35 NO BID  NO BID W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $80.50 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

3.2.1.2 Price per ton as delivered 
to jobsite 745-68 6780 Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile

$41.00 $0.15 $55.00 $0.20 NO BID NO BID $45.50 $0.25

ROSENBERG, TX

Plant Location

Hauling first mile

NO BID

Plant Location
500 WARD ST

ANGLETON, TX  OR
2122 HWY 90A

MISSOURI CITY, TX

Plant Location
5730 OLD ALVIN ROAD

ROSHARON, TX 77583 OR
9519 OLD GALVESTON ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77034

Hauling first mile

$2.50

Hauling first mile

$2.50

Plant Location

ROSENBERG, TX

Hauling first mile

$2.50

3.2 RECYCLED ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT 
RACP)
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET ITB # 09-17 ROAD MATERIALS - SURFACE COURSES

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

ERIC SUAREZ

10126 CASH ROAD
STAFFORD, TX 77477

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES ANN LINDSEY - 713-292-2875
DESCRIPTION

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988
FAX #

JERRY L. BERRYRICHARD GREER

SILVA CONTRACTING CO., INC.

281-342-9314

RICHMOND, TX 77469
6130 FM 2218

HOUSTON, TX 77011

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

713-292-2885
713-292-2875

 

RICHARD GREER

LEE ANN THUMAN - 281-342-9314
ERIC SUAREZ - 281-342-9314

AMERICAN MATERIALS

JERRY L. BERRY
281-499-1551
281-499-1525

JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551
JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551

281-342-2878

ERIC SUAREZ

  

939 SH 36

TARMAC MATERIALS, INC

ROSENBERG, TX 77471
ERIC SUAREZ
ERIC SUAREZ
281-342-9314
281-342-2878

RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314
RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

 

3.2.1.3 Price per ton in place 745-68 6780 Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID $75.00 $0.20 $70.50 $0.25 NO BID NO BID
3.2.1.4 State mininum truckload if 
required

3.3.1 TxDot Item 340, Type B, 
mixed with AC-20 Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton

3.3.1.1 Price per ton bidder's 
plant/siding loaded onto County 
trucks 745-68 6781 $41.00 $55.00 NO BID $45.50

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport 28 $28.00 $69.00 Airport 6 $6.00 $61.00 Airport NO BID NO BID  NO BID Airport 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $16.00 $57.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 23 $23.00 $78.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $26.00 $67.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 3 $3.00 $58.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $32.00 $73.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $69.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Camp Mohawk 20 $20.00 $61.00 Camp Mohawk 23 $23.00 $78.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID  NO BID Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Clute Svc Ctr 39 $39.00 $80.00 Clute Svc Ctr 10 $10.00 $65.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $76.00 Hanson Park 14 $14.00 $69.00 Hanson Park 35 NO BID  NO BID Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $80.50 

Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $9.00 $50.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 24 $24.00 $79.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 34 NO BID  NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 34 $34.00 $79.50 

Mosquito Control 27 $27.00 $68.00 Mosquito Control 3 $3.00 $58.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID  NO BID Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Quintana Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 Quintana Cty Park 22 $22.00 $77.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Resoft Park 18 $18.00 $59.00 Resoft Park 23 $23.00 $78.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

San Luis Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 San Luis Cty Park 30 $30.00 $85.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $76.00 W. Columbia Svc 14 $14.00 $69.00 W. Columbia Svc 35 NO BID  NO BID W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $80.50 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

500 TON

Plant Location

$2.50

Hauling first mile

Plant Location

14 TONS

Plant Location

ROSENBERG, TX

5730 OLD ALVIN ROAD
ROSHARON, TX 77583 OR

9519 OLD GALVESTON ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77034

500 WARD ST
ANGLETON, TX  OR

2122 HWY 90A
MISSOURI CITY, TX

Hauling first mile

NO BID

14 TONS

Hauling first mile

$2.50

12 TONS

Hauling first mile

 NO BID

Plant Location

ROSENBERG, TX

3.3 RECYCLED ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT 
(RACP)
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET ITB # 09-17 ROAD MATERIALS - SURFACE COURSES

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

ERIC SUAREZ

10126 CASH ROAD
STAFFORD, TX 77477

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES ANN LINDSEY - 713-292-2875
DESCRIPTION

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988
FAX #

JERRY L. BERRYRICHARD GREER

SILVA CONTRACTING CO., INC.

281-342-9314

RICHMOND, TX 77469
6130 FM 2218

HOUSTON, TX 77011

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

713-292-2885
713-292-2875

 

RICHARD GREER

LEE ANN THUMAN - 281-342-9314
ERIC SUAREZ - 281-342-9314

AMERICAN MATERIALS

JERRY L. BERRY
281-499-1551
281-499-1525

JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551
JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551

281-342-2878

ERIC SUAREZ

  

939 SH 36

TARMAC MATERIALS, INC

ROSENBERG, TX 77471
ERIC SUAREZ
ERIC SUAREZ
281-342-9314
281-342-2878

RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314
RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

 

3.3.1.2 Price per ton as delivered 
to jobsite: 745-68 6781 Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile

$41.00 $0.15 $55.00 $0.20 NO BID NO BID $45.50 $0.25

3.3.1.3 Price per ton in place 745-68 6781 Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID  NO BID $75.00 $0.20 $70.50 $0.25 NO BID  NO BID
3.3.1.4 State Minimum truckload if 
required

3.4.1 Fine Mix for Heavy Roads

3.4.1.1 Price per ton bidder's plant 
/ siding loaded onto County trucks 745-21 6782 Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton

$41.00 $55.00 NO BID $45.50

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport 28 $28.00 $69.00 Airport 6 $6.00 $61.00 Airport NO BID NO BID  NO BID Airport 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $16.00 $57.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 23 $23.00 $78.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $26.00 $67.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 3 $3.00 $58.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $32.00 $73.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $69.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Camp Mohawk 20 $20.00 $61.00 Camp Mohawk 23 $23.00 $78.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID  NO BID Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Clute Svc Ctr 39 $39.00 $80.00 Clute Svc Ctr 10 $10.00 $65.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $76.00 Hanson Park 14 $14.00 $69.00 Hanson Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $80.50 

Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $9.00 $50.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 24 $24.00 $79.00 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 34 $34.00 $79.50 

Mosquito Control 27 $27.00 $68.00 Mosquito Control 3 $3.00 $58.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID  NO BID Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Quintana Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 Quintana Cty Park 22 $22.00 $77.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Resoft Park 18 $18.00 $59.00 Resoft Park 23 $23.00 $78.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

San Luis Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 San Luis Cty Park 30 $30.00 $85.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $76.00 W. Columbia Svc 14 $14.00 $69.00 W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID  NO BID W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $0.00 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

Hauling first mile

14 TONS

Plant Location Plant Location

NO BID

$2.50

500 TON

Hauling first mile

Hauling first mile

$2.50

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID

Hauling first mile

Hauling first mile

$2.50

Plant Location
500 WARD ST

ANGLETON, TX  OR
2122 HWY 90A

MISSOURI CITY, TX

5730 OLD ALVIN ROAD
ROSHARON, TX 77583 OR

9519 OLD GALVESTON ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77034

$2.50

14 TONS

Hauling first mile

$2.50

Hauling first mile

NO BID

12 TONS

Plant Location

ROSENBERG, TX

3.4 HOT MIX APAHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT

PAGE 4 OF 14



BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET ITB # 09-17 ROAD MATERIALS - SURFACE COURSES

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

ERIC SUAREZ

10126 CASH ROAD
STAFFORD, TX 77477

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES ANN LINDSEY - 713-292-2875
DESCRIPTION

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988
FAX #

JERRY L. BERRYRICHARD GREER

SILVA CONTRACTING CO., INC.

281-342-9314

RICHMOND, TX 77469
6130 FM 2218

HOUSTON, TX 77011

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

713-292-2885
713-292-2875

 

RICHARD GREER

LEE ANN THUMAN - 281-342-9314
ERIC SUAREZ - 281-342-9314

AMERICAN MATERIALS

JERRY L. BERRY
281-499-1551
281-499-1525

JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551
JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551

281-342-2878

ERIC SUAREZ

  

939 SH 36

TARMAC MATERIALS, INC

ROSENBERG, TX 77471
ERIC SUAREZ
ERIC SUAREZ
281-342-9314
281-342-2878

RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314
RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

 

3.4.1.2 Price per ton as delivered 
to jobsite 745-21 6782 Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile

$41.00 $0.15 $55.00 $0.20 NO BID NO BID $45.50 $0.25
3.4.1.3 State Minimum truckload if 
required

3.4.2.1 Price per ton bidder's plant 
/ siding loaded onto County trucks 6783 Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton

$41.00 $55.00 NO BID $45.50

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport 28 $28.00 $69.00 Airport 6 $6.00 $61.00 Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport 0 $0.00 $45.50 

Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $16.00 $57.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 23 $23.00 $78.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $45.50 

Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $26.00 $67.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 3 $3.00 $58.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $45.50 

Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $32.00 $73.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $69.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $45.50 

Camp Mohawk 20 $20.00 $61.00 Camp Mohawk 23 $23.00 $78.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $45.50 

Clute Svc Ctr 39 $39.00 $80.00 Clute Svc Ctr 10 $10.00 $65.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $45.50 

Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $76.00 Hanson Park 14 $14.00 $69.00 Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $80.50 

Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $9.00 $50.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 24 $24.00 $79.00 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 34 $34.00 $79.50 

Mosquito Control 27 $27.00 $68.00 Mosquito Control 3 $3.00 $58.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $45.50 

Quintana Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 Quintana Cty Park 22 $22.00 $77.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $45.50 

Resoft Park 18 $18.00 $59.00 Resoft Park 23 $23.00 $78.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $45.50 

San Luis Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 San Luis Cty Park 30 $30.00 $85.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $45.50 

W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $76.00 W. Columbia Svc 14 $14.00 $69.00 W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $80.50 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00
3.4.2.2 Price per ton as deliverd to 
jobsite 745-21 6783 Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile

$41.00 $0.15 $55.00 $0.20 NO BID NO BID $45.50 $0.25
3.4.2.3 State Minimum truckload if 
required

14 TONS

Plant Location

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID

500 WARD ST
ANGLETON, TX  OR

2122 HWY 90A
MISSOURI CITY, TX

Hauling first mileHauling first mile

NO BID$2.50

NO BID

Plant Location

Hauling first mile

5730 OLD ALVIN ROAD
ROSHARON, TX 77583 OR

9519 OLD GALVESTON ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77034

$2.50

Plant Location

Hauling first mile

14 TONS

$2.50

14 TONS 14 TONS NO BID

Hauling first mile

$2.50

Hauling first mile

$2.50

12 TONS

Plant Location

ROSENBERG, TX

Hauling first mile

$2.50

12 TONS

3.4.2 Fine Mix for Light Duty Roads
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET ITB # 09-17 ROAD MATERIALS - SURFACE COURSES

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

ERIC SUAREZ

10126 CASH ROAD
STAFFORD, TX 77477

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES ANN LINDSEY - 713-292-2875
DESCRIPTION

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988
FAX #

JERRY L. BERRYRICHARD GREER

SILVA CONTRACTING CO., INC.

281-342-9314

RICHMOND, TX 77469
6130 FM 2218

HOUSTON, TX 77011

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

713-292-2885
713-292-2875

 

RICHARD GREER

LEE ANN THUMAN - 281-342-9314
ERIC SUAREZ - 281-342-9314

AMERICAN MATERIALS

JERRY L. BERRY
281-499-1551
281-499-1525

JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551
JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551

281-342-2878

ERIC SUAREZ

  

939 SH 36

TARMAC MATERIALS, INC

ROSENBERG, TX 77471
ERIC SUAREZ
ERIC SUAREZ
281-342-9314
281-342-2878

RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314
RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

 

3.4.3 Coarse mix for Heavy Duty 
roads

3.4.3.1 Price per ton bidder's plant 
/ siding loaded onto County trucks 6784 Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton

$41.00 $55.00 NO BID $45.50

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport 28 $28.00 $69.00 Airport 6 $6.00 $61.00 Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $16.00 $57.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 23 $23.00 $78.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $26.00 $67.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 3 $3.00 $58.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $32.00 $73.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $69.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Camp Mohawk 20 $20.00 $61.00 Camp Mohawk 23 $23.00 $78.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Clute Svc Ctr 39 $39.00 $80.00 Clute Svc Ctr 10 $10.00 $65.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $76.00 Hanson Park 14 $14.00 $69.00 Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $80.50 

Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $9.00 $50.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 24 $24.00 $79.00 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 34 $34.00 $79.50 

Mosquito Control 27 $27.00 $68.00 Mosquito Control 3 $3.00 $58.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Quintana Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 Quintana Cty Park 22 $22.00 $77.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Resoft Park 18 $18.00 $59.00 Resoft Park 23 $23.00 $78.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

San Luis Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 San Luis Cty Park 30 $30.00 $85.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $76.00 W. Columbia Svc 14 $14.00 $69.00 W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $80.50 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

3.4.3.2 Price per ton as deliverd to 
jobsite 745-21 6784 Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile

$41.00 $0.15 $55.00 $0.20 NO BID NO BID $45.50 $0.25
3.4.3.3 State minimum truckload if 
required NO BID

Plant Location

NO BID$2.50

Plant Location

14 TONS

$2.50

500 WARD ST
ANGLETON, TX  OR

2122 HWY 90A
MISSOURI CITY, TX

Hauling first mile

NO BID

Hauling first mile

5730 OLD ALVIN ROAD
ROSHARON, TX 77583 OR

9519 OLD GALVESTON ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77034

Hauling first mile

Plant Location

14 TONS

Plant Location

ROSENBERG, TX

Hauling first mile

$2.50

12 TONS
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET ITB # 09-17 ROAD MATERIALS - SURFACE COURSES

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

ERIC SUAREZ

10126 CASH ROAD
STAFFORD, TX 77477

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES ANN LINDSEY - 713-292-2875
DESCRIPTION

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988
FAX #

JERRY L. BERRYRICHARD GREER

SILVA CONTRACTING CO., INC.

281-342-9314

RICHMOND, TX 77469
6130 FM 2218

HOUSTON, TX 77011

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

713-292-2885
713-292-2875

 

RICHARD GREER

LEE ANN THUMAN - 281-342-9314
ERIC SUAREZ - 281-342-9314

AMERICAN MATERIALS

JERRY L. BERRY
281-499-1551
281-499-1525

JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551
JERRY L. BERRY - 281-499-1551

281-342-2878

ERIC SUAREZ

  

939 SH 36

TARMAC MATERIALS, INC

ROSENBERG, TX 77471
ERIC SUAREZ
ERIC SUAREZ
281-342-9314
281-342-2878

RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314
RHODA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

 

3.4.4 Coarse mix for light duty 
roads

3.4.4.1 Price per ton bidder's plant 
/ siding loaded onto County trucks 6785 Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton

$41.00 $55.00 NO BID $45.50

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport 28 $28.00 $69.00 Airport 6 $6.00 $61.00 Airport NO BID NO BID  NO BID Airport 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $16.00 $57.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 23 $23.00 $78.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $26.00 $67.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 3 $3.00 $58.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $32.00 $73.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $69.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Camp Mohawk 20 $20.00 $61.00 Camp Mohawk 23 $23.00 $78.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID  NO BID Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Clute Svc Ctr 39 $39.00 $80.00 Clute Svc Ctr 10 $10.00 $65.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $76.00 Hanson Park 14 $14.00 $69.00 Hanson Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $80.50 

Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $9.00 $50.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 24 $24.00 $79.00 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID  NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 34 $34.00 $79.50 

Mosquito Control 27 $27.00 $68.00 Mosquito Control 3 $3.00 $58.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID  NO BID Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Quintana Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 Quintana Cty Park 22 $22.00 $77.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Resoft Park 18 $18.00 $59.00 Resoft Park 23 $23.00 $78.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

San Luis Cty Park 42 $42.00 $83.00 San Luis Cty Park 30 $30.00 $85.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID  NO BID San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 

W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $76.00 W. Columbia Svc 14 $14.00 $69.00 W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID  NO BID W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $80.50 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

3.4.4.2 Price per ton as delivered 
to jobsite 6785 Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile

$41.00 $0.15 $55.00 $0.20 NO BID NO BID $45.50 $0.25
3.4.4.3  State minimum truckload if 
required

NONEEXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE

INCLUDED INCLUDED

NONE

BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED INCLUDED

$2.50 NO BID

Plant Location

5730 OLD ALVIN ROAD
ROSHARON, TX 77583 OR

9519 OLD GALVESTON ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77034

Hauling first mile

Plant Location

NO BID

$2.50
Hauling first mile

14 TONS 14 TONS NO BID

Plant Location

500 WARD ST
ANGLETON, TX  OR

2122 HWY 90A
MISSOURI CITY, TX

Hauling first mile

Plant Location

ROSENBERG, TX

Hauling first mile

$2.50

NONE

12 TONS

INCLUDED
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABU

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

3.1.1 Price per ton bidder's 
plant/siding loaded onto County 
trucks 745-87 6779

3.1.2 Price per ton as delivered to 
jobsite 745-87 6779

3.1.3 Price per ton in place 745-87 6779

3.1.4 State Minimum truckload if 
required

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES
DESCRIPTION

FAX #

3.1 ASPHALT STABILIZED BASE Price per ton

NO BID

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID

Low bid mutiplier 1.00

Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID

Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID

P.O. BOX 967

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

CLUTE, TX 77531

 

NO BID
Plant Location

NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABU

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES
DESCRIPTION

FAX #

3.2.1 TxDot Item 340, Type D, 
mixed with AC-20

3.2.1.1 Price per ton bidder's plant 
/ siding loaded onto County trucks 745-68 6780

3.2.1.2 Price per ton as delivered 
to jobsite 745-68 6780

3.2 RECYCLED ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT 
RACP)

P.O. BOX 967

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

CLUTE, TX 77531

 

NO BID

Price per ton

NO BID

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID

Low bid mutiplier 1.00

Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID

Plant Location

NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABU

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES
DESCRIPTION

FAX #

3.2.1.3 Price per ton in place 745-68 6780

3.2.1.4 State mininum truckload if 
required

3.3.1 TxDot Item 340, Type B, 
mixed with AC-20

3.3.1.1 Price per ton bidder's 
plant/siding loaded onto County 
trucks 745-68 6781

3.3 RECYCLED ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT 
(RACP)

P.O. BOX 967

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

CLUTE, TX 77531

 

NO BID

Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID

Price per ton

NO BID

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID

Low bid mutiplier 1.00

NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID

Plant Location

NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABU

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES
DESCRIPTION

FAX #

3.3.1.2 Price per ton as delivered 
to jobsite: 745-68 6781

3.3.1.3 Price per ton in place 745-68 6781

3.3.1.4 State Minimum truckload if 
required

3.4.1 Fine Mix for Heavy Roads

3.4.1.1 Price per ton bidder's plant 
/ siding loaded onto County trucks 745-21 6782

3.4 HOT MIX APAHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT

P.O. BOX 967

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

CLUTE, TX 77531

 

NO BID

Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID

Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID

Price per ton

NO BID

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID

Low bid mutiplier 1.00

Hauling first mile

NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID

Plant Location

NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABU

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES
DESCRIPTION

FAX #

3.4.1.2 Price per ton as delivered 
to jobsite 745-21 6782

3.4.1.3 State Minimum truckload if 
required

3.4.2.1 Price per ton bidder's plant 
/ siding loaded onto County trucks 6783

3.4.2.2 Price per ton as deliverd to 
jobsite 745-21 6783

3.4.2.3 State Minimum truckload if 
required

3.4.2 Fine Mix for Light Duty Roads

P.O. BOX 967

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

CLUTE, TX 77531

 

NO BID
Material cost

Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID

Price per ton

NO BID

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID

Low bid mutiplier 1.00

Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID

Plant Location

NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABU

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES
DESCRIPTION

FAX #

3.4.3 Coarse mix for Heavy Duty 
roads

3.4.3.1 Price per ton bidder's plant 
/ siding loaded onto County trucks 6784

3.4.3.2 Price per ton as deliverd to 
jobsite 745-21 6784

3.4.3.3 State minimum truckload if 
required

P.O. BOX 967

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

CLUTE, TX 77531

 

NO BID

Price per ton

NO BID

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID

Low bid mutiplier 1.00

Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID

Plant Location

NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABU

DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

April 1, 2009 - March 31, 2010
One (1) six (6) month renewal

3.0 SURFACE COURSES
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID #

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES
DESCRIPTION

FAX #

3.4.4 Coarse mix for light duty 
roads

3.4.4.1 Price per ton bidder's plant 
/ siding loaded onto County trucks 6785

3.4.4.2 Price per ton as delivered 
to jobsite 6785

3.4.4.3  State minimum truckload if 
required

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS

BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED

P.O. BOX 967

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

CLUTE, TX 77531

 

NO BID

Price per ton

NO BID

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID

Low bid mutiplier 1.00

Material cost
Hauling ea 
add'l mile

NO BID NO BID

Plant Location

NO BID

NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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