BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

#09-16 ROAD MATERIALS - PATCHING MATERIALS

BIDDERS NAME

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2009
10:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM
APRIL 1, 2008 - MARCH 31, 2010

One (1) six (6) month renewal

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

TARMAC MATERIALS LLC

ADDRESS|

QUOTED BY]

CONTACT|

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD 939 SH 36
HOUSTON, TX 77515 ROSENBERG, TX 77471
RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ

TELEPHONE NUMBER]

713-292-2875

281-342-9314

FAX NUMBER]

713-292-2885

281-342-2878

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988

RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES]

ANN LINDSEY - 713-292-2875

RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

DESCRIPTION

COMM
CODE |COUNTY ID #

3.0 PATCHING MATERIAL

3.1. Hot Mix-Cold Laid Asphaltic Concrete Pavement

3.1.1. Price per ton-bidder's plant / siding loaded onto
ounty trucks

Ce

745-14 6777

3.1.2 Price per ton as deliverd to County Facility at: 745-14 6777

Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location
5730 OLD ALVIN ROAD
$67.00 ROSHARON, TX 77583 $70.00 ROSENBERG, TX
Price/ton + Price/ton +
X * X i *

County Facility mileage |multiplier multiplier [County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier
Airport 28 $28.00 $95.00 Airport 0 $0.00 $70.00
Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $16.00 $83.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00
Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $26.00 $93.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00
Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $32.00 $99.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00
Camp Mohawk 20 $20.00 $87.00 [Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $0.00
Clute Svc Ctr 39 $39.00 $106.00 Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00
Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $102.00 Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $105.00
Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $9.00 $76.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 34 $34.00 $104.00
Mosquito Control 27 $27.00 $94.00 Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $0.00
Quintana Cty Park 42 $42.00 $109.00 Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00
Resoft Park 18 $18.00 $85.00 Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $0.00
San Luis Cty Park 42 $42.00 $109.00 San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00
W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $102.00 W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $105.00
Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

County Facility Price/ton Delivered County Facility Price/ton Delivered
D e $74.00 aipor NO BID
o e o ol  l Linsear $72.00 vin sve cir NO BID
_-_ Angleton Svc Ctr $73.75 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID
——— Brazoria Svc Ctr $75.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID
_—_ Camp Mohawk $73.25 Camp Mohawk NO BID
- L Joweswer $76.00 Ciute sve i NO BID
_-_ Hanson Park $73.25 Hanson Park $81.00
_ - Manvel Svc Ctr $71.00 Manvel Svc Ctr $80.75
_-_ Mosquito Control $73.95 Mosquito Control NO BID
— —— Quintana Cty Park $77.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID
b fhestpa $72.75 Resoft Park NO BID
. b e iscypa $76.50 San Luis Cy Park NO BID
_-_ W. Columbia Svc $73.25 W. Columbia Sve $81.00
Material cost Hauling first mile add'l mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile

3.1.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 745-14 6777 $67.00 $2.50 $0.15 $70.00 $2.50 $0.25
3.1.4 State Minimum if required 22 TONS

12 TONS
[
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

#09-16 ROAD MATERIALS - PATCHING MATERIALS

BIDDERS NAME

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

TARMAC MATERIALS LLC

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD 939 SH 36
HOUSTON, TX 77515 ROSENBERG, TX 77471
RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ

713-292-2875

281-342-9314

DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS

THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2009
. QUOTED BY|

10:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTACT]
CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2008 - MARCH 31, 2010 TELEPHONE NUMBER|
One (1) six (6) month renewal FAX NUMBER]

713-292-2885

281-342-2878

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988

RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES]

ANN LINDSEY - 713-292-2875

RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

COMM

DESCRIPTION CODE |COUNTY ID #

3.2 Polymer Modified Cold Asphalt

3.2.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto
ounty trucks

=

745-14

Ce

745-14

3.2.2 Price per ton as delivered to County Facility at 6778

Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location
5730 OLD ALVIN ROAD
87.00 ROSHARON, TX 77583 NO BID NO BID
Price/ton + Price/ton +
X * X i *
County Facility mileage |multiplier multiplier [County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier
Airport 28 $0.00 $87.00 Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID
Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $0.00 $87.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
[Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $0.00 $87.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $0.00 $87.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Camp Mohawk 20 $0.00 $87.00 [Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID
Clute Svc Ctr 39 $0.00 $87.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hanson Park 35 $0.00 $87.00 Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $0.00 $87.00 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Mosquito Control 27 $0.00 $87.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID
Quintana Cty Park 42 $0.00 $87.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
Resoft Park 18 $0.00 $87.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
San Luis Cty Park 42 $0.00 $87.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
W. Columbia Svc 35 $0.00 $87.00 \W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID
Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

P - - - L Jaipen $94.00 irpor NO BID

e | |aviswor $92.00 atvin Sve i NO BID

— _ Angleton Svc Ctr $93.75 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID

_ _ Brazoria Svc Ctr $96.00 Brazoria Svc Cir NO BID

_ _ Camp Mohawk $93.25 Camp Mohawk NO BID

e | loweswar $96.00 Ciute sve i NO BID

_ _ Hanson Park $93.25 Hanson Park NO BID

_ _ Manvel Svc Ctr $91.00 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID

— _ Mosquito Control $93.95 Mosquito Control NO BID

_ _ Quintana Cty Park $97.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID

_ _ Resoft Park $92.75 Resoft Park NO BID

— _ San Luis Cty Park $96.50 San Luis Cty Park NO BID

_ _ W. Columbia Sve $93.25 W. Columbia Sve NO BID
Material cost Hauling first mile add'l mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile

3.2.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 745-14 6778 $87.00 $ 215( $ 0.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID

3.2.4 State Minimum if required 22 TONS NO BID

3.2.5 Price per 35# bag 745-14 6778 NO BID NO BID

State Minimum if required NONE NO BID

3.2.6 Price per 50# bag 745-14 6778 $15.00 NO BID

State Minimum if required 2 PALLETS - 56 / PALLET NO BID

BID DOCUMENTS INLCUDED INCLUDED

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

#09-16 ROAD MATERIALS - PATCHING MATERIALS

BIDDERS NAME

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2008 - MARCH 31, 2010

One (1) six (6) month renewal

ADDRESS|

QUOTED BY]

CONTACT|

TELEPHONE NUMBER]
FAX NUMBER]

THE EZ STREET COMPANY

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMEN

1786 N.W. 82ND AVENUE PO BOX 967
MIAMI, FL 33126 CLUTE, TX 77531
HOPE LICOR
HOPE LICOR

305-663-3090

305-663-0832

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

HOPE LICOR - 305-663-3090

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES]

DAVID AMEIR - 305-663-3090

DESCRIPTION

COMM

CODE |COUNTY ID #

3.0 PATCHING MATERIAL

3.1. Hot Mix-Cold Laid Asphaltic Concrete Pavement

3.1.1. Price per ton-bidder's plant / siding loaded onto
ounty trucks

Ce

3.1.2 Price per ton as deliverd to County Facility at: 745-14

745-14

6777
|
|
.
i
L
i
|
i
£
i
£
i
|
|

6777

Price per Ton

Plant Location

Price per Ton

NO BID

Plant Locatic

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price/ton +
X * mileage x
County Facility mileage |multiplier multiplier [County Facility mileage [multiplier
Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport NO BID NO BID
Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID
Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID
Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID
Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID [Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID
Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID
Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID
Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID
Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID
Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID
Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID
San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID
W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID \W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID
Low bid 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00
County Facility Price/ton Delivered County Facility Price/ton
Airport NO BID Airport NO
Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID Alvin Sve Ctr NG
Angleton Svc Cir NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO
Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NC
Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO
Clute Sve Ctr NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NG
Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NC
Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NC
Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO
Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO
Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NC
San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO
W. Columbia Svc NO BID W. Columbia Svc NC

Hauling ea add'l

Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile
3.1.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 745-14 6777 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.1.4 State Minimum if required NO BID NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

#09-16 ROAD MATERIALS - PATCHING MATERIALS

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2009
10:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM
APRIL 1, 2008 - MARCH 31, 2010

One (1) six (6) month renewal

BIDDERS NAME

THE EZ STREET COMPANY

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMEN

ADDRESS|

QUOTED BY]

CONTACT|

1786 N.W. 82ND AVENUE PO BOX 967
MIAMI, FL 33126 CLUTE, TX 77531
HOPE LICOR
HOPE LICOR

TELEPHONE NUMBER]

305-663-3090

FAX NUMBER]

305-663-0832

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

HOPE LICOR - 305-663-3090

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES]

DAVID AMEIR - 305-663-3090

DESCRIPTION %?)"I;’é‘ COUNTY ID # N O B I D
3.2 Polymer Modified Cold Asphalt Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Locatic
3.2.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto
County trucks 745-14 6778 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price/ton +
X * mileage x
County Facility mileage |multiplier multiplier [County Facility mileage [multiplier
Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport NO IBD NO BID
Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO IBD NO BID
Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO IBD NO BID
Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO IBD NO BID
Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID [Camp Mohawk NO IBD NO BID
Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO IBD NO BID
Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO IBD NO BID
Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO IBD NO BID
Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO IBD NO BID
Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO IBD NO BID
Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO IBD NO BID
San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO IBD NO BID
\W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID \W. Columbia Svc NO IBD NO BID
Low bid 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00
3.2.2 Price per ton as delivered to County Facility at: 745-14 6778 County Facility Price/ton Delivered County Facility Price/ton
Airport NO BID Airport NO
Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID Alvin Sve Ctr NG
Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO
Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NC
Camp Mohawk NO BID [Camp Mohawk NO
Clute Sve Ctr NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NG
Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NC
Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NC
Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO
Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO
Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NC
San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO
W. Columbia Svc NO BID W. Columbia Svc NG
Hauling ea add’l
Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile
3.2.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 745-14 6778 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.2.4 State Minimum if required NO BID
3.2.5 Price per 35# bag 745-14 6778 $9.34 / BAG DELIVERED NO BID
State Minimum if required 1120 BAGS = 16 PALLETS NO BID
3.2.6 Price per 50# bag 745-14 6778 $9.67 / BAG DELIVERED NO BID
State Minimum if required 896 BAGS = 16 PALLETS NO BID
BID DOCUMENTS INLCUDED INCLUDED NO BID
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

#09-16 ROAD MATERIALS - PATCHING MATERIALS

BIDDERS NAME

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2009
10:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM
APRIL 1, 2008 - MARCH 31, 2010

One (1) six (6) month renewal

I, INC.

ASPHALT PATCH ENT.

ADDRESS|

1332 AZALEA LANE

NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 78130

QUOTED BY]

CONTACT|

TELEPHONE NUMBER]

FAX NUMBER]

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES]

DESCRIPTION

3.0 PATCHING MATERIAL

3.1. Hot Mix-Cold Laid Asphaltic Concrete Pavement

3.1.1. Price per ton-bidder's plant / siding loaded onto
County trucks

745-14 6777

Price per Ton

Plant Location

NO BID NO BID

mileage * X i *
multiplier (County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier

P e noso | wosn | woso

-- NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
——_ NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
| ]} I e |ewoesce NosD | NosD NoBID
1 b ] voen cempmenm woso | woep NoBID
_-- NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
S 7 T I NosD | NosD NoBID
——_ NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
. P ] voep  |mespitocom NosD | NosD NoBID
——_ NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
1} ] noen |resonem NosD | NoBD NoBID
1 b ] woen fsenudscyee NosD | NosD NoBID
1 b | roen |wcoumnse NosD | NoBD NoBID
. 222§ } ] Low bid mutpier 100
Delivered County Facility Price/ton Delivered
e ED aipor NO BID
1 I [sp v sve o NO BID
... . @ 1 s Angleton sve ci NO BID
. ! [sD Brazora Sve Cir NO BID
... . . @ i | e camp oauk NO BID
e = = 7 [N ciue Sve ci NO BID
e anson park NO BID
1 I [sp Manvel svc cir NO BID
... . @ 1 s Mosquito Contol NO BID
. ! [sD Quintana ciy Park NO BID
... . . @ i | e Resoft Park NO BID
e = = 7 [N san Luis Cry Park NO BID
e W, Cotumbia Sve NO BID

mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile

3.1.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 745-14 6777 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.1.4 State Minimum if required NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

#09-16 ROAD MATERIALS - PATCHING MATERIALS

I, INC.

ASPHALT PATCH ENT.

1332 AZALEA LANE

NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 78130

BIDDERS NAME|
DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS|
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2009
. QUOTED BY|
10:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTACT]

CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2008 - MARCH 31, 2010 TELEPHONE NUMBER]

One (1) six (6) month renewal FAX NUMBER]

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES]

COMM

DESCRIPTION CODE |COUNTY ID #

745-14 6778

3.2 Polymer Modified Cold Asphalt

3.2.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto

NO BID

Price per Ton

Plant Location

.
County trucks - NO BID NO BID
mileage X
multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier
. - - & } ] wowo fumm woieo | nosp [ woeo
—_— NO BID Alvin Sve Ctr NO IBD NO BID NO BID
b | noeo |ageonswer noBp | Noei NOBID
e T noBp | Noein NOBID
bl nosn  compmonaw nosp | Noein NOBID
_-_ NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO IBD NO BID NO BID
. b ] ] noep |iansonrax nosp | Noei NOBID
—_— NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO IBD NO BID NO BID
b ] noep  |vesqutocoma nosp | Noein NOBID
.} | w0 |oummcyeax noBp | Noein NOBID
.l ] noep |resopa noBp | Noein NOBID
b b | woen |suscypax noBp | Noein NOBID
.} ] | noso |wcoummse noBp | Noein NOBID
. @@} ] Low bid mutplier 100
Delivered County Facility Price/ton Delivered
E e - = @ L B iport NO BID
. - - = = . B Jap i sve cir NO BID
e L B angleton Sve ci NO BID
E e - = @ L B Brazoria Sve Cir NO BID
. - - = = . B Jap Camp Mohawk NO BID
e L B cue Sve cir NO BID
E e - = @ L B Hanson park NO BID
. - - = = . B Jap Manvel Sve ot NO BID
e L B Mosquito Contol NO BID
E e - = @ L B Quintana cty Par NO BID
. - - = = . B Jap Resoft Park NO BID
e L B San Luis Cty Park NO BID
E e - = 0 L B W.Cotumbia Sve NO BID
mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile
3.2.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 745-14 6778 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.2.4 State Minimum if required NO BID
3.2.5 Price per 35# bag 745-14 6778 NO BID
State Minimum if required NO BID
3.2.6 Price per 50# bag 745-14 6778 NO BID
State Minimum if required NO BID
BID DOCUMENTS INLCUDED NO BID
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NO BID
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