BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET BID # 09-15 ROAD MATERIALS - AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENT

BIDDERS NAME]

VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LP

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

TARMAC MATERIALS, LLC

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

3.0 Aggregate for Surface
Treatment

3.1. Natural Limestone Rock Asphalt Price per Ton

Plant Location

Price per Ton

Plant Location

Price per Ton

Plant Location

Price per Ton

DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS| 800 ISOM ROAD, STE 300 5303 NAVIGATION BLVD 939 SH 36 PO BOX 967
Thursday, February 26, 2009 SAN ANTONIO, TX 78216 HOUSTON, TX 77011 ROSENBERG, TX 77471 CLUTE, TX 77531
QUOTED BY|
10:00 A.M., Local Time PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
CONTACT
CONTRACT TERM: PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
TELEPHONE]
APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010 NUMBER] 210-524-3507 713-292-2875 281-342-9314
WITH THE OPTION FOR ONE (1) SIX (6) MO.
RENEWAL FAX NUMBER| 210-524-3555 713-292-2885 281-342-2878
PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS] GARY EAGLE - 800-535-0949 JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988 RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314
COMM
DESCRIPTION CODE |counTY ID 4 NO BID

Plant Location

3.1.1 TxDOT Item 302, Type PB, Grade 2
3.1.1.1 Price per ton plant/siding loaded onto
County trucks 745-77

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.50 ROSENBERG, TX NO BID NO BID
Price/ton + Price/ton + Price/ton + Price/ton +
mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage *
County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier
Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport 0 $0.00 $39.50 Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID
Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $0.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID
Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $74.50 Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 3 $3.00 $42.50 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $0.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID
Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
W. Columbia Sve NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Sve NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Sve 35 $35.00 $74.50 W. Columbia Sve NO BID NO BID NO BID
Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

Airport NO BID Airport NO BID Airport NO BID Airport NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park $50.50 Hanson Park NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr $50.25 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID

W. Columbia Sve NO BID W. Columbia Svc NO BID W. Columbia Svc $50.50 W. Columbia Svc NO BID

Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l
Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile

3.1.1.3 Price per ton as delivered to
jobsite 745-77 6769 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.50 $2.50 $0.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.1.1.4 State Minimum if required NO BID NO BID 12 TONS NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET BID # 09-15 ROAD MATERIALS - AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENT

DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM:

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

WITH THE OPTION FOR ONE (1) SIX (6) MO.
RENEWAL

BIDDERS NAME VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LP CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD TARMAC MATERIALS, LLC VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
ADDRESS 800 ISOM ROAD, STE 300 5303 NAVIGATION BLVD 939 SH 36 PO BOX 967
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78216 HOUSTON, TX 77011 ROSENBERG, TX 77471 CLUTE, TX 77531
QUOTED BY]
PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
CONTACT]
PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
TELEPHONE}
NUMBER] 210-524-3507 713-292-2875 281-342-9314
FAX NUMBER) 210-524-3555 713-292-2885 281-342-2878

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

GARY EAGLE - 800-535-0949

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988

RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

3.1.2 TXDOT ltem 302, Type PB, Grade 3

3.1.2.1 Price per ton bidder's plant/siding loaded
onto County trucks

Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location
5730 OLD ALVIN ROAD
NO BID NO BID $42.00 ROSHARON, TX 77583 $40.50 ROSENBERG, TX NO BID NO BID
Price/ton + Price/ton + Price/ton + Price/ton +
mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * ileage x ileage *
County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier
Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport 28 $28.00 $70.00 Airport 0 $0.00 $40.50 Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID
Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $16.00 $58.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Alvin Svc Cir NO BID NO BID NO BID
Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $26.00 $68.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $32.00 $74.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk 20 $20.00 $62.00 Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $0.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID
Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 39 $39.00 $81.00 Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $77.00 Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $75.50 Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $9.00 $51.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 3 $3.00 $43.50 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control 27 $27.00 $69.00 Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $0.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID
Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park 42 $42.00 $84.00 Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park 18 $18.00 $60.00 Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park 42 $42.00 $84.00 San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
W. Columbia Sve NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Sve 35 $35.00 $77.00 W. Columbia Sve 35 $35.00 $75.50 W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID
Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

County Facility Price/ton Delivered County Facility Price/ton Delivered County Facility Price/ton Delivered County Facility Price/ton Delivered
Airport $43.65 Airport $49.00 Airport NO BID Airport NO BID
Alvin Sve Ctr $45.48 Alvin Sve Ctr $47.00 Alvin Sve Ctr NO BID Alvin Sve Ctr NO BID
Angleton Svc Ctr $43.65 Angleton Svc Ctr $48.75 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID
Brazoria Svc Ctr $44.79 Brazoria Svc Ctr $50.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID
Camp Mohawk $45.05 Camp Mohawk $48.25 Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID
Clute Svc Ctr $43.79 Clute Svc Ctr $51.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID
Hanson Park $44.90 Hanson Park $48.25 Hanson Park $51.50 Hanson Park NO BID
Manvel Svc Ctr $45.62 Manvel Svc Ctr $46.00 Manvel Svc Ctr $51.25 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID
Mosquito Control $43.65 Mosquito Control $47.95 Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID
Quintana Cty Park $45.21 Quintana Cty Park $52.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID
Resoft Park $46.45 Resoft Park $45.75 Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID
San Luis Cty Park $47.26 San Luis Cty Park $51.50 San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID
W. Columbia Sve $44.10 W. Columbia Sve $48.25 W. Columbia Sve $51.50 W. Columbia Sve NO BID
Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l
Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile
3.1.2.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 745-77 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 42.00( $ 250 $ 0.15 $40.50 $2.50 $0.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.1.2.4 State Minimum if required | NO B|||3 | 14 TON|S | 12 TON|S | | NO BllD |
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET BID # 09-15 ROAD MATERIALS - AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENT

DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM:

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

WITH THE OPTION FOR ONE (1) SIX (6) MO.
RENEWAL

BIDDERS NAME]

VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LP

CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD

TARMAC MATERIALS, LLC

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

ADDRESS 800 ISOM ROAD, STE 300 5303 NAVIGATION BLVD 939 SH 36 PO BOX 967
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78216 HOUSTON, TX 77011 ROSENBERG, TX 77471 CLUTE, TX 77531

QUOTED BY]
PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ

CONTACT]
PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ

TELEPHONE}
NUMBER] 210-524-3507 713-292-2875 281-342-9314
FAX NUMBER) 210-524-3555 713-292-2885 281-342-2878

3.1.3 TXDOT ltem 302, Type PB, Grade 4

3.1.3.1 Price per ton bidder's plant/siding
loaded onto County trucks

3.1.3.2 Price per ton as delivered to
County Facility at:

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

GARY EAGLE - 800-535-0949

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988

RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-

9314

745-77

Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location
5730 OLD ALVIN ROAD
NO BID $42.00 ROSHARON, TX 77583 $38.50 ROSENBERG, TX NO BID NO BID
Pricefton + Pricefton + Pricefton + Pricefton +

mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * il X il *
County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier
Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport 28 $28.00 $70.00 Airport 0 $0.00 $38.50 Airport NO BID [ NO BID NO BID
Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $16.00 $58.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $26.00 $68.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $32.00 $74.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk 20 $20.00 $62.00 Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $0.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID
Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 39 $39.00 $81.00 Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $77.00 Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $73.50 Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $9.00 $51.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 3 $3.00 $41.50 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control 27 $27.00 $69.00 Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $0.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID
Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park 42 $42.00 $84.00 Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park 18 $18.00 $60.00 Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park 42 $42.00 $84.00 San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID _ Jw. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $77.00 W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $73.50 W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID
Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

745-7

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

B Airport $43.65 Airport $49.00 Airport NO BID Airport NO BID
P Ain Sve Cir $45.48 Ain Sve o $47.00 Ain Svc o NO BID Ain Sve o NO BID
- Angleton Svc Ctr $43.65 Angleton Svc Ctr $48.75 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID
- Brazoria Svc Ctr $44.79 Brazoria Svc Ctr $50.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID
_ Camp Mohawk $45.05 Camp Mohawk $48.25 Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID
B Clute Sve Cr $43.79 Clute Sve Cir $51.00 Clute Sve Cir NO BID Clute Sve Cir NO BID
- Hanson Park $44.90 Hanson Park $48.25 Hanson Park $49.50 Hanson Park NO BID
- Manvel Svc Ctr $45.62 Manvel Svc Ctr $46.00 Manvel Svc Ctr $49.25 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID
- Mosquito Control $43.65 Mosquito Control $47.95 Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID
_ Quintana Cty Park $45.21 Quintana Cty Park $52.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID
- Resoft Park $46.45 Resoft Park $45.75 Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID
- San Luis Cty Park $47.26 San Luis Cty Park $51.50 San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID
] W, Columbia Sve $44.10 W, Columbia Sve $48.25 W, Columbia Sve $49.50 \W. Columbia Svc NO BID
- . ‘ ] ‘ HaulingAea add'l . ‘ ] ‘ HaulingAea add'l . ‘ ] ‘ HaulingAea add'l . ‘ ] ‘ HaulingAea add'l
Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile

3.1.3.3 Crushed Concrete (Price per ton as

delivered to jobsite) 745-77 6771 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 42.00] $ 2.50| $ 0.15 $38.50 $2.50 $0.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID

3.1.3.4 _State Minimum truckload if required MINIMUM COMBINED ORDER 4,000 TONS 14 TONS 12 TONS NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET BID # 09-15 ROAD MATERIALS - AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENT

BIDDERS NAME VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LP CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD TARMAC MATERIALS, LLC VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS| 800 ISOM ROAD, STE 300 5303 NAVIGATION BLVD 939 SH 36 PO BOX 967
Thursday, February 26, 2009 SAN ANTONIO, TX 78216 HOUSTON, TX 77011 ROSENBERG, TX 77471 CLUTE, TX 77531

QUOTED BY]

10:00 A.M., Local Time PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
CONTACT]

CONTRACT TERM: PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
TELEPHONE]

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010 NUMBER} 210-524-3507 713-292-2875 281-342-9314

WITH THE OPTION FOR ONE (1) SIX (6) MO.
RENEWAL FAX NUMBER 210-524-3555 713-292-2885 281-342-2878

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

GARY EAGLE - 800-535-0949

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988

RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

3.1.4 TXDOT Item 302, Type PB, Grade 5 -- Price per ton Plant Location Price per ton Plant Location Price per ton Plant Location Price per ton Plant Location
3.1.4.1 Price per ton bidder's plant/siding loaded
onto County trucks 745-77 6772 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.50 ROSENBERG, TX NO BID NO BID
_-- ] Pr.ice/mnx+ ] Pr.ice/mnx+ ] Pr.ice/mnx+ ) Pr.ilce/tonx+
mileage x mileage mileage x mileage mileage x mileage X

County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier
—-— Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport 0 $0.00 $38.50 Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
—_— Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk 0 $0.00 $0.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID
—-— Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 0 $0.00 $0.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $73.50 Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
—_— Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 3 $3.00 $41.50 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control 0 $0.00 $0.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
—-— Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park 0 $0.00 $0.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
—_— W. Columbia Sve NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Sve NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Sve 35 $35.00 $73.50 W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00
e P
Facilities at: 745-77 6772 County Facility Price/ton Delivered County Facility Price/ton Delivered County Facility Price/ton Delivered County Facility Price/ton Delivered

L T g $44.65 Airport NO BID Airport NO BID Airport NO BID
1 1 |awiswer $46.48 Alvin Sve Cir NO BID Alvin Sve Cir NO BID Alvin Sve Cir NO BID
_-_ Angleton Svc Ctr $44.65 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID
_-_ Brazoria Svc Ctr $45.79 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID
——— Camp Mohawk $46.05 Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID
L b oweswor $44.79 Clute Svc Ot NO BID Clute Svc Ot NO BID Clute Sve Crr NO BID
_—_ Hanson Park $45.90 Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park $49.50 Hanson Park NO BID
_-_ Manvel Svc Ctr $46.62 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr $49.25 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID
_-_ Mosquito Control $46.21 Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID
——— Quintana Cty Park $47.45 Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID
_-_ Resoft Park $47.45 Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID
_—_ San Luis Cty Park $48.26 San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID
_-- W. Columbia Sve $45.10 W. Columbia Sve NO BID W. Columbia Svc $49.50 W. Columbia Svc NO BID
—-- . - ‘ Hauling ea add'l . - ‘ Hauling ea add'l . - ‘ Hauling ea add'T . - ‘ Hauling ea add'l

Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile
3.1.4.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 745-77 6772 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.50 $2.50 $0.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.1.4.4 State Minimum truckload if required MINIMUM COMBINED ORDER 4,000 TONS NO BID 12 TONS NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET BID # 09-15 ROAD MATERIALS - AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENT

BIDDERS NAME| VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LP CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD TARMAC MATERIALS, LLC VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS| 800 ISOM ROAD, STE 300 5303 NAVIGATION BLVD 939 SH 36 PO BOX 967
Thursday, February 26, 2009 SAN ANTONIO, TX 78216 HOUSTON, TX 77011 ROSENBERG, TX 77471 CLUTE, TX 77531

QUOTED BY]|

10:00 A.M., Local Time PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
CONTACT]

CONTRACT TERM: PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
TELEPHONE}

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010 NUMBER] 210-524-3507 713-292-2875 281-342-9314

WITH THE OPTION FOR ONE (1) SIX (6) MO.
RENEWAL FAX NUMBER 210-524-3555 713-292-2885 281-342-2878
PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS] GARY EAGLE - 800-535-0949 JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988 RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

3.2 Trap Rock

3.2.1 TxDOT Item 302, Type C, Grade 2 Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location
3.2.1.1 Price per ton-bidder's plant/ siding --
ed onto County trucks 750-60 6773 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
- ] Pr.ice/mn + ] Pr.ice/mn + ] Pr.ice/mn + ] Pr.ice/mn +
mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * | X | *
County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier

_ Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID  JAlvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID _ JAlvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID _|Alvin Svc Cir NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID |Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID  JAngleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID  JHanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID  JHanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
— Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID  Manvel Svc Cir NO BID NO BID NO BID  Manvel Svc Cir NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID  [Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID _ |Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID  |camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID  |camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID |camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID _|Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID |Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID
— Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID  JResoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID  |Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID |san Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID |san Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID |san Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID  Jw. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID  Jw. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID _ |w. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

Airport NO BID Airport NO BID Airport NO BID Airport NO BID
Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID
Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID
Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID
Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID
Clute Svc Ctr NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID
Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NO BID
Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID
Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID
Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID
Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID
San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID
W. Columbia Sve NO BID W. Columbia Sve NO BID W. Columbia Sve NO BID W. Columbia Sve NO BID
Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l
Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile
3.2.1.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-60 6773 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO NO BID NO BID NO
3.2.1.4 State Minimum truckload if required | NO BII|3 NO B|||3 NO B|||3 | NO BllD
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET BID # 09-15 ROAD MATERIALS - AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENT

DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM:

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

WITH THE OPTION FOR ONE (1) SIX (6) MO.
RENEWAL

BIDDERS NAME VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LP CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD TARMAC MATERIALS, LLC VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
ADDRESS 800 ISOM ROAD, STE 300 5303 NAVIGATION BLVD 939 SH 36 PO BOX 967
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78216 HOUSTON, TX 77011 ROSENBERG, TX 77471 CLUTE, TX 77531
QUOTED BY]
PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
CONTACT]
PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
TELEPHONE}
NUMBER] 210-524-3507 713-292-2875 281-342-9314
FAX NUMBER) 210-524-3555 713-292-2885 281-342-2878

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

GARY EAGLE - 800-535-0949

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988

RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

3.2.2 TxDOT Item 302, Type C, Grade 3

3.2.2.1 Price per ton-bidder's plant / siding
loaded onto County trucks

Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Price/ton + Price/ton + Price/ton + Price/ton +
mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * ileage x ileage *

County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier
Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID
Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID
Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID
Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID
Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
W. Columbia Sve NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Sve NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Sve NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Sve NO BID NO BID NO BID
Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport $60.25 Airport NO BID Airport NO BID Airport NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr $60.25 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr $60.25 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr $60.25 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID

Camp Mohawk $60.25 Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr $60.25 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID

Hanson Park $60.25 Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr $60.25 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID

Mosquito Control $60.25 Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID

Quintana Cty Park $60.25 Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID

Resoft Park $60.25 Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID

San Luis Cty Park $60.25 San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID

W. Columbia Sve $60.25 W. Columbia Sve NO BID W. Columbia Sve NO BID W. Columbia Sve NO BID

Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l Hauling ea add'l
Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile

3.2.2.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-06 6774 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.2.2.4 State Minimum truckload if required 25 TONS NO BID NO BID NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET BID # 09-15 ROAD MATERIALS - AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENT

DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM:

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

WITH THE OPTION FOR ONE (1) SIX (6) MO.
RENEWAL

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

3.2.3 TxDOT Item 302, Type C, Grade 4

3.2.3.1 Price per ton-bidder's plant / siding
ed onto County trucks

BIDDERS NAME VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LP CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD TARMAC MATERIALS, LLC VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
ADDRESS 800 ISOM ROAD, STE 300 5303 NAVIGATION BLVD 939 SH 36 PO BOX 967
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78216 HOUSTON, TX 77011 ROSENBERG, TX 77471 CLUTE, TX 77531
QUOTED BY]
PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
CONTACT]
PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
TELEPHONE]
NUMBER] 210-524-3507 713-292-2875 281-342-9314
FAX NUMBER) 210-524-3555 713-292-2885 281-342-2878
GARY EAGLE - 800-535-0949 JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988 RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314
- Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price/ton + Price/ton + Price/ton + Price/ton +
mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * ileage x ileage *
County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier
e m NOBID | NOBID NOBID |aiport NOBID | NOBID NOBID |aiport NOBID | NOBID NOBID |aiport NOBID | NOBID NO BID
| Javinsweor NOBID | NOBID NOBID Jawinswcor NOBID | NOBID NOBID Jawinswcor NOBID | NOBID NOBID Jawinswcor NOBID | NOBID NO BID
_ Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
— Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID
— Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
| |w.coumbiaswe NOBID | NOBID NOBID _ |w. Columbia Sve NOBID | NOBID NOBID _ |w. Columbia Sve NOBID | NOBID NOBID _ |w. Columbia Sve NOBID | NOBID NO BID
_ Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

6775

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

[ o NO BID Airport NO BID Airport NO BID Airport NO BID
| |avinsweor NO BID Alvin Sve Ot NO BID Alvin Sve Ot NO BID Alvin Sve Ot NO BID
_ Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID
_ Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID
_ Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID
| Joueswor NO BID Clute Sve Cir NO BID Clute Sve Cir NO BID Clute Sve Cir NO BID
— Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NO BID
_ Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID
_ Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID
_ Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID
_ Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID
— San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID
| ]w.coumbiaswe NO BID W. Columbia Svc NO BID W, Columbia Svc NO BID \W. Columbia Svc NO BID
- . - ‘ Hauling ea add'l . - ‘ Hauling ea add'l . - ‘ Hauling ea add'l . - ‘ Hauling ea add'l
Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile
3.2.3.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite] 750-60 6775 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.2.3.4 State Minimum truckload if required NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT BID TABULATION SHEET BID # 09-15 ROAD MATERIALS - AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENT

BIDDERS NAME VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS LP CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD TARMAC MATERIALS, LLC VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
DATE OF BID OPENING ADDRESS| 800 ISOM ROAD, STE 300 5303 NAVIGATION BLVD 939 SH 36 PO BOX 967
Thursday, February 26, 2009 SAN ANTONIO, TX 78216 HOUSTON, TX 77011 ROSENBERG, TX 77471 CLUTE, TX 77531

QUOTED BY]

10:00 A.M., Local Time PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
CONTACT]

CONTRACT TERM: PAT WOOTTON RICHARD GREER ERIC SUAREZ
TELEPHONE]

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010 NUMBER} 210-524-3507 713-292-2875 281-342-9314

WITH THE OPTION FOR ONE (1) SIX (6) MO.
RENEWAL FAX NUMBER 210-524-3555 713-292-2885 281-342-2878

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS]

GARY EAGLE - 800-535-0949

JOHNNY MCPEEK - 713-923-1988

RHONDA SHEPPARD - 281-342-9314

3.2.4.2 Price per ton as deliverd to County Facility
at: 750-60 6776

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

Price/ton Delivered

County Facility

3.2.4 TxDOT ltem 302, Type C Grade 5 -- Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location Price per Ton Plant Location
3.2.4.1 Price per ton-bidder's plant /
siding loaded onto County trucks 750-60 6776 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
—.- Price/ton + Price/ton + Price/ton + Price/ton +
mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage * mileage x mileage *
County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier County Facility mileage [multiplier multiplier
1 1 s NOBID | NOBID NOBID |aiport NOBID | NOBID NOBID |aiport NOBID | NOBID NOBID |airport NOBID | NOBID NO BID
. b wieswor NOBID | NOBID NOBID Jawinswcor NOBID | NOBID NOBID Jawinswcor NOBID | NOBID NOBID |awvinswcor NOBID | NOBID NO BID
_-_ Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID _ JAngleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
——— Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID
_—_ Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Servcie Center NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID
——— Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Service Center NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID _ JQuintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
_—_ Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
_-_ San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID
. 1 I ]wcoumbasw NOBID | NOBID NOBID _ |w. Columbia Sve NOBID | NOBID NOBID _ |w. Columbia Sve NOBID | NOBID NOBID _|w. Columbia Sve NOBID | NOBID NO BID
——— Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

Price/ton Delivered

e = $60.25 Airport NO BID Airport NO BID Airport NO BID
| |avinsweer $60.25 Ain Svc o NO BID Ain Svc o NO BID Ain Sve Cir NO BID
- Angleton Svc Ctr $60.25 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID
— Brazoria Svc Ctr $60.25 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID
- Camp Mohawk $60.25 Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID
| oweswer $60.25 Clute Sve Cir NO BID Clute Sve Cir NO BID Clute Sve Cr NO BID
_ Hanson Park $60.25 Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NO BID Hanson Park NO BID
- Manvel Svc Ctr $60.25 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID
— Mosquito Control $60.25 Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID
- Quintana Cty Park $60.25 Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID
- Resoft Park $60.25 Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID Resoft Park NO BID
_ San Luis Cty Park $60.25 San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID
| | coumbiaswe $60.25 \W. Columbia Suc NO BID \W. Columbia Svc NO BID W, Columbia Sve NO BID
- . - ‘ Hauling ea add'l . - ‘ Hauling ea add'l . - ‘ Hauling ea add'l . - ‘ Hauling ea add'l
Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile Material cost Hauling first mile mile

3.2.4.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-60 6776 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3.2.4.4 State Minimum truckload if required 25 TONS NO BID NO BID NO BID

BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED NO BID

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE NONE NONE NO BID
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