
DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

3.0 Flexible Base
3.1. Crushed limestone (Per TxDOT 
Item 247, Type A, Grade1 Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton

3.1.1 Price per ton-bidder's plant / 
siding loaded onto County trucks 750-52 6745 $14.75 20.50 NO BID 21.75 

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

LESS 3% LOCAL
BIDDERS
PREFRENCE

Airport 19 $19.00 $33.75 Airport 28 $28.00 $48.50 Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport 15 $15.00 $36.75 $35.65 

Alvin Svc Ctr 38 $38.00 $52.75 Alvin Svc Ctr 16 $16.00 $36.50 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 40 $40.00 $61.75 $59.90 

Angleton Svc Ctr 20 $20.00 $34.75 Angleton Svc Ctr 26 $26.00 $46.50 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 13 $13.00 $34.75 $33.71 

Brazoria Svc Ctr 18 $18.00 $32.75 Brazoria Svc Ctr 32 $32.00 $52.50 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 20 $20.00 $41.75 $40.50 

Camp Mohawk 32 $32.00 $46.75 Camp Mohawk 20 $20.00 $40.50 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk 33 $33.00 $54.75 $53.11 

Clute Svc Ctr 8 $8.00 $22.75 Clute Svc Ctr 39 $39.00 $59.50 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 3.5 $3.50 $25.25 $24.49 

Hanson Park 26 $26.00 $40.75 Hanson Park 35 $35.00 $55.50 Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park 34 $34.00 $55.75 $54.08 

Manvel Svc Ctr 33 $33.00 $47.75 Manvel Svc Ctr 9 $9.00 $29.50 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 41 $41.00 $62.75 $60.87 

Mosquito Control 18 $18.00 $32.75 Mosquito Control 27 $27.00 $47.50 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control 11 $11.00 $32.75 $31.77 

Quintana Cty Park 5 $5.00 $19.75 Quintana Cty Park 42 $42.00 $62.50 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park 8 $8.00 $29.75 $28.86 

Resoft Park 41 $41.00 $55.75 Resoft Park 18 $18.00 $38.50 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park 42 $42.00 $63.75 $61.84 

San Luis Cty Park 20 $20.00 $34.75 San Luis Cty Park 42 $42.00 $62.50 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park 18 $18.00 $39.75 $38.56 

W. Columbia Svc 27 $27.00 $41.75 W. Columbia Svc 35 $35.00 $55.50 W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc 32 $32.00 $53.75 $52.14 

Low bid mutiplier $1.00 Low bid mutiplier $1.00 Low bid mutiplier $1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

3.1.2 Price per ton as deliverd to 
County Facility at: 750-52 6745

$26.34 

$30.31 

$25.07 

$26.43 

$28.95 

$23.23 

$29.15 

$30.51 

$24.69 

$24.10 

$30.70 

$26.04 

$28.76 

LORI SORRELLS - 979-233-6655

CHAS E. CADENHEAD

FREEPORT, TX 77541
2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

MIKE SORRELL TRUCKING AND MATERIALS, INC.

ANTHONY REYNOLDS - 979-233-6655

979-233-7313

979-233-6655

CATARINO RIOS

CATARINO RIOS

STAFFORD, TX 77477
12603 SOUTHWEST FWY, STE 300

Plant Location

OYSTER CREEK

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Resoft Park

Quintana Cty Park

Camp Mohawk

Mosquito Control

Manvel Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

Clute Svc Ctr

W. Columbia Svc

San Luis Cty Park

Airport

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr

Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr

Brazoria Svc Ctr

W. Columbia Svc

$23.90 

$27.31 

Quintana Cty Park

Angleton Svc Ctr

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

MARTIN MARIETTA MATERIALSVULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, LP

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

EAWRL CADENHEAD

Airport $27.15 

Alvin Svc Ctr $31.25 

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Angleton Svc Ctr $25.85 

$27.25 

Camp Mohawk $29.85 

Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Resoft Park

San Luis Cty Park

Manvel Svc Ctr $31.45 

NO BID

Price/ton Delivered

NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr $23.95 

Hanson Park $30.05 

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Airport

Alvin Svc Ctr

County Facility

$21.96 Resoft Park

$18.37 

$23.16 

$24.93 

$18.61 $24.83 

San Luis Cty Park

$25.75 

$24.17 

$26.79 

Quintana Cty Park

Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

$27.31 

$26.04 

281-276-4900

County Facility
Price/ton Delivered

*Prices are based on trailer rate

1055 TURNING BASIN, PORT 
FREEPORT, TX 77541 OR

14047 INDUSTRIAL
HOUSTON, TX 77015

Plant Location

 

W. Columbia Svc

281-276-4999

$18.52 Airport

$19.30 

County Facility

$18.61 

$21.12 

$17.72 

$26.18 

Price/ton Delivered

$25.11 

$23.78 

MARY SPARKS - 713-436-0990

$18.37 

$20.13 

$17.72 

$19.23 

$20.45 

KIM O'CONNELL - 713-987-0000

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Mosquito ControlNO BID

Resoft Park

$25.45 

Quintana Cty Park $24.85 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$31.65 

San Luis Cty Park $26.85 

281-441-6844

281-441-6807

713-436-0071

Plant Location Plant Location

5730 OLD ALVIN RD
ARCOLA, TX 77583

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

713-436-0990

MARY SPARKS

MARY SPARKS

HOUSTON, TX 77048
6131 SELINSKY

HUMBLE, TX 77396
15409 OLD HUMBLE ROAD

ANDY BATSELL

ANDY BATSELL

LUCY ACEVES - 281-441-6807

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES LORRAINE HORTON - 281-276-4900

CATARINO RIOS - 281-276-4900 LUCY ACEVES - 281-441-6807

 

W. Columbia Svc $29.65 

ITB #09-13 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET



DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

LORI SORRELLS - 979-233-6655

CHAS E. CADENHEAD

FREEPORT, TX 77541
2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

MIKE SORRELL TRUCKING AND MATERIALS, INC.

ANTHONY REYNOLDS - 979-233-6655

979-233-7313

979-233-6655

CATARINO RIOS

CATARINO RIOS

STAFFORD, TX 77477
12603 SOUTHWEST FWY, STE 300

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

MARTIN MARIETTA MATERIALSVULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, LP

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

EAWRL CADENHEAD

281-276-4900

 

281-276-4999

MARY SPARKS - 713-436-0990

KIM O'CONNELL - 713-987-0000

281-441-6844

281-441-6807

713-436-0071

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

713-436-0990

MARY SPARKS

MARY SPARKS

HOUSTON, TX 77048
6131 SELINSKY

HUMBLE, TX 77396
15409 OLD HUMBLE ROAD

ANDY BATSELL

ANDY BATSELL

LUCY ACEVES - 281-441-6807

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES LORRAINE HORTON - 281-276-4900

CATARINO RIOS - 281-276-4900 LUCY ACEVES - 281-441-6807

 

ITB #09-13 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

3.1.3 Crushed Limestone (Price per 
ton as delivered to jobsite) 750-52 6745 Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile

$14.75 NO BID 20.50 0.15 NO BID NO BID 21.75 0.20 

3.1.4   State Minimum if required

3.2 Reclaimed Base 
Blend Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton

3.2.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / 
siding loaded onto County trucks 750-72 6746 NO BID NO BID 11.25 $14.00

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport 36 $36.00 $47.25 Airport 15 $15.00 $29.00 $28.13 

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 20 $20.00 $31.25 Alvin Svc Ctr 40 $40.00 $54.00 $52.38 

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 35 $35.00 $46.25 Angleton Svc Ctr 13 $13.00 $27.00 $26.19 

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 48 $48.00 $59.25 Brazoria Svc Ctr 20 $20.00 $34.00 $32.98 

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk 29 $29.00 $40.25 Camp Mohawk 33 $33.00 $47.00 $45.59 

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 45 $45.00 $56.25 Clute Svc Ctr 3.5 $3.50 $17.50 $16.97 

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park 45 $45.00 $56.25 Hanson Park 34 $34.00 $48.00 $46.56 

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 11 $11.00 $22.25 Manvel Svc Ctr 41 $41.00 $55.00 $53.35 

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control 34 $34.00 $45.25 Mosquito Control 11 $11.00 $25.00 $24.25 

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park 56 $56.00 $67.25 Quintana Cty Park 8 $8.00 $22.00 $21.34 

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park 20 $20.00 $31.25 Resoft Park 42 $42.00 $56.00 $54.32 

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park 66 $66.00 $77.25 San Luis Cty Park 18 $18.00 $32.00 $31.04 

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc 43 $43.00 $54.25 W. Columbia Svc 32 $32.00 $46.00 $44.62 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

3.2.2 Price per ton as delivered to 
County Facility at: 750-72 6746

$17.94 

$22.79 

$17.56 

$18.91 

$21.44 

$15.71 

$22.06 

$22.99 

$17.17 

$16.59 

$23.18 

$18.53 

$21.24 

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Airport

Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk

Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr

Airport

Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr

Airport

NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

Resoft Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park

NO BID $15.50 

$17.75 

Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park

Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park

NO BID

1.95 

$18.90 

$16.50 

NO BID San Luis Cty ParkSan Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc NO BID W. Columbia Svc

$14.75 

$16.85 

$17.15 

NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

$13.75 

$13.40 

Resoft Park

NO BID

24 TONS

NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr

NO BID

N/A

Hauling first mile

San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Hauling first mile

$15.50 

NO BID

$17.15 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Price/ton Delivered

Hauling first mile

NO BID

County Facility

NO BID

NO BID

Plant Location

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk

Plant Location

606 ALAMEDA ROAD
FRESNO, TX 

$14.00 

$15.50 

County Facility

Airport

Alvin Svc Ctr

Price/ton Delivered

Angleton Svc Ctr

$23.50 

$18.10 

$19.50 

Hauling first mile

1.70 

15 TONS

Plant Location

OYSTER CREEK

$18.50 

$22.10 

$16.20 

Hanson Park $22.74 
Clute Svc Ctr

Manvel Svc Ctr $23.70 

Mosquito Control $17.70 

Quintana Cty Park $17.10 

Resoft Park $23.90 

San Luis Cty Park $19.10 

$21.90 W. Columbia Svc

Plant Location

NO BID

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

NO BID



DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

LORI SORRELLS - 979-233-6655

CHAS E. CADENHEAD

FREEPORT, TX 77541
2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

MIKE SORRELL TRUCKING AND MATERIALS, INC.

ANTHONY REYNOLDS - 979-233-6655

979-233-7313

979-233-6655

CATARINO RIOS

CATARINO RIOS

STAFFORD, TX 77477
12603 SOUTHWEST FWY, STE 300

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

MARTIN MARIETTA MATERIALSVULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, LP

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

EAWRL CADENHEAD

281-276-4900

 

281-276-4999

MARY SPARKS - 713-436-0990

KIM O'CONNELL - 713-987-0000

281-441-6844

281-441-6807

713-436-0071

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

713-436-0990

MARY SPARKS

MARY SPARKS

HOUSTON, TX 77048
6131 SELINSKY

HUMBLE, TX 77396
15409 OLD HUMBLE ROAD

ANDY BATSELL

ANDY BATSELL

LUCY ACEVES - 281-441-6807

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES LORRAINE HORTON - 281-276-4900

CATARINO RIOS - 281-276-4900 LUCY ACEVES - 281-441-6807

 

ITB #09-13 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

3.2.3 Price per ton as delivered to 
jobsite 750-72 6746 Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.00 0.13 14.00 0.20 

3.2.4   State Minimum if required

3.3 Crushed Concrete Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton

3.3.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / 
siding loaded onto County trucks 750-52 6747  NO BID NO BID $11.25 $14.00

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport 41 $41.00 $52.25 Airport 15 $15.00 $29.00 $28.13 

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 27 $27.00 $38.25 Alvin Svc Ctr 40 $40.00 $54.00 $52.38 

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 41 $41.00 $52.25 Angleton Svc Ctr 13 $13.00 $27.00 $26.19 

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 50 $50.00 $61.25 Brazoria Svc Ctr 20 $20.00 $34.00 $32.98 

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk 35 $35.00 $46.25 Camp Mohawk 33 $33.00 $47.00 $45.59 

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 55 $55.00 $66.25 Clute Svc Ctr 3.5 $3.50 $17.50 $16.97 

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park 18 $18.00 $29.25 Hanson Park 34 $34.00 $48.00 $46.56 

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 18 $18.00 $29.25 Manvel Svc Ctr 41 $41.00 $55.00 $53.35 

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control 42 $42.00 $53.25 Mosquito Control 11 $11.00 $25.00 $24.25 

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park 62 $62.00 $73.25 Quintana Cty Park 8 $8.00 $22.00 $21.34 

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park 23 $23.00 $34.25 Resoft Park 42 $42.00 $56.00 $54.74 

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park 69 $69.00 $80.25 San Luis Cty Park 18 $18.00 $32.00 $31.04 

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc 50 $50.00 $61.25 W. Columbia Svc 32 $32.00 $46.00 $44.62 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

3.3.2 Price per ton as delivered 
to County Facility at: 750-52 6747

$17.94 

$22.79 

$17.56 

$18.91 

$21.44 

$15.71 

$22.06 

$22.99 

$17.17 

$16.59 

$23.18 

$18.53 

$21.24 

Hauling first mile

4601 HOLMES ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77048

Plant Location

1.25 

Price/ton Delivered

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

County Facility

NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr

Airport

Alvin Svc Ctr

NO BIDAirport

Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park

Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr

Resoft Park

San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc

Angleton Svc Ctr

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr

Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park

Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park

San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID $17.00 

$19.10 

$17.10 

$17.40 

$14.25 

$15.75 

$17.40 

$15.03 

$13.45 

$15.75 

$18.00 

$14.00 

NO BID

$15.75 

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Airport

Price/ton Delivered

Alvin Svc Ctr

County Facility

Angleton Svc Ctr

San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Plant Location

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

NO BIDAngleton Svc Ctr

NO BID

Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

NO BID 15 TONS

Hauling first mile

Plant Location

OYSTER CREEK

Brazoria Svc Ctr

NO BID

Plant Location

NO BID

1.70 

15 TONS

Hauling first mile

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport $18.50 

Alvin Svc Ctr $23.50 

Angleton Svc Ctr $18.10 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $19.50 

Camp Mohawk $22.10 

Clute Svc Ctr $16.20 

Hanson Park $22.74 

Manvel Svc Ctr $23.70 

Mosquito Control $17.70 

Quintana Cty Park $17.10 

Resoft Park $23.90 

San Luis Cty Park $19.10 

$21.90 W. Columbia Svc

NO BID

NO BID

Hauling first mile



DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

LORI SORRELLS - 979-233-6655

CHAS E. CADENHEAD

FREEPORT, TX 77541
2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

MIKE SORRELL TRUCKING AND MATERIALS, INC.

ANTHONY REYNOLDS - 979-233-6655

979-233-7313

979-233-6655

CATARINO RIOS

CATARINO RIOS

STAFFORD, TX 77477
12603 SOUTHWEST FWY, STE 300

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

MARTIN MARIETTA MATERIALSVULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, LP

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

EAWRL CADENHEAD

281-276-4900

 

281-276-4999

MARY SPARKS - 713-436-0990

KIM O'CONNELL - 713-987-0000

281-441-6844

281-441-6807

713-436-0071

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

713-436-0990

MARY SPARKS

MARY SPARKS

HOUSTON, TX 77048
6131 SELINSKY

HUMBLE, TX 77396
15409 OLD HUMBLE ROAD

ANDY BATSELL

ANDY BATSELL

LUCY ACEVES - 281-441-6807

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES LORRAINE HORTON - 281-276-4900

CATARINO RIOS - 281-276-4900 LUCY ACEVES - 281-441-6807

 

ITB #09-13 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

3.3.3 Crushed Concrete (Price 
per ton as delivered to jobsite) 750-52 6747 Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.25 $0.13 $14.00 $0.20
3.3.4   State Minimum 
truckload if required

3.4 Crushed Asphalt Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton

3.4.1 Price per ton bidder's 
plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 745-68 6748 NO BID  NO BID NO BID $28.50

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport 15 $15.00 $43.50 

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr 40 $40.00 $68.50 

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr 13 $13.00 $41.50 

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr 20 $20.00 $48.50 

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk 33 $33.00 $61.50 

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr 3.5 $3.50 $32.00 

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park 34 $34.00 $62.50 

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr 41 $41.00 $69.50 

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control 11 $11.00 $39.50 

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park 8 $8.00 $36.50 

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park 42 $42.00 $70.50 

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park 18 $18.00 $46.50 

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc 32 $32.00 $60.50 
Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

3.4.2 Price per ton as delivered to 
County Facilities at: 745-68 6748

Camp Mohawk

Airport Airport Airport

$1.25

Hauling first mile

Plant Location

NO BID

W. Columbia Svc

Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park

San Luis Cty Park

Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park

San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc

Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park

San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

County Facility Price/ton DeliveredCounty Facility Price/ton Delivered

Hauling first mile

Plant Location

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr

Brazoria Svc Ctr

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr

NO BID

Plant Location

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Hauling first mile

15 TONS

NO BID

Hauling first mile

$1.70

15 TONS

Plant Location

OYSTER CREEK

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport $33.00 

Alvin Svc Ctr $38.00 

Angleton Svc Ctr $32.60 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $34.00 

Camp Mohawk $36.60 

Clute Svc Ctr $30.70 

Hanson Park $37.24 

$38.20 

San Luis Cty Park $33.60 

W. Columbia Svc $36.40 

Mosquito Control $32.20 

Resoft Park $38.40 

Manvel Svc Ctr

Quintana Cty Park $31.60 



DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

LORI SORRELLS - 979-233-6655

CHAS E. CADENHEAD

FREEPORT, TX 77541
2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

MIKE SORRELL TRUCKING AND MATERIALS, INC.

ANTHONY REYNOLDS - 979-233-6655

979-233-7313

979-233-6655

CATARINO RIOS

CATARINO RIOS

STAFFORD, TX 77477
12603 SOUTHWEST FWY, STE 300

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

MARTIN MARIETTA MATERIALSVULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, LP

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

EAWRL CADENHEAD

281-276-4900

 

281-276-4999

MARY SPARKS - 713-436-0990

KIM O'CONNELL - 713-987-0000

281-441-6844

281-441-6807

713-436-0071

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

713-436-0990

MARY SPARKS

MARY SPARKS

HOUSTON, TX 77048
6131 SELINSKY

HUMBLE, TX 77396
15409 OLD HUMBLE ROAD

ANDY BATSELL

ANDY BATSELL

LUCY ACEVES - 281-441-6807

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES LORRAINE HORTON - 281-276-4900

CATARINO RIOS - 281-276-4900 LUCY ACEVES - 281-441-6807

 

ITB #09-13 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

3.4.3 Crushed Asphalt (Price per ton 
as delivered to jobsite) 745-68 6748 Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile Material cost

Hauling ea add'l 
mile

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 28.50 0.20 
3.4.4 State Minimum truckload if 
required

NONE

BID DOCUMENTS ENCLOSED

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE NONE

INCLUDED

INCLUDED
DID NOT SIGN BLOCKED PERSONS AFFIRMATION

PAGE 21 OF 22 INCLUDED

NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Hauling first mile Hauling first mile

NONE

1.70 

15 TONS

INCLUDED



DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

3.0 Flexible Base
3.1. Crushed limestone (Per TxDOT 
Item 247, Type A, Grade1

3.1.1 Price per ton-bidder's plant / 
siding loaded onto County trucks 750-52 6745

3.1.2 Price per ton as deliverd to 
County Facility at: 750-52 6745

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

ITB #09-13 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton

NO BID $21.25

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

LESS 3% LOCAL
BIDDERS
PREFRENCE

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport Airport 14 $14.00 $35.25 $34.19 

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr 37 $37.00 $58.25 $56.50 

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $35.25 $34.19 

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr Brazoria Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $35.25 $34.19 

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk 28 $28.00 $49.25 $47.77 

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr 1 $1.00 $22.25 $21.58 

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park Hanson Park 25 $25.00 $46.25 $44.86 

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr 38 $38.00 $59.25 $57.47 

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control Mosquito Control 14 $14.00 $35.25 $34.19 

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park 11 $11.00 $32.25 $31.28 

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park Resoft Park 36 $36.00 $57.25 $55.53 

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park 20 $20.00 $41.25 $40.01 

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc 25 $25.00 $46.25 $44.86 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

$24.83 

$29.29 

$24.83 

$24.83 

$27.55 

$22.31 

$26.97 

$29.49 

$24.83 

$24.25 

$29.10 

$26.00 

$26.97 

KENNETH K. VERNOR

FREEPORT, TX 77541
435 COMMERCE STREET

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO,, INC.

HOLLY CARLSON - 979-233-6330

979-233-6167

979-233-3366

HOLLY CARLSON

SHARON FOREMAN - 979-233-3366

OPTION #2 PLANT LOCATION

JANICE CONWAY - 281-987-8789

San Luis Cty Park $26.80 

W. Columbia Svc $27.80 

Quintana Cty Park $25.00 

Resoft Park $30.00 

Manvel Svc Ctr $30.40 

Mosquito Control $25.60 

Clute Svc Ctr $23.00 

Hanson Park $27.80 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $25.60 

Camp Mohawk $28.40 

Alvin Svc Ctr $30.20 

Angleton Svc Ctr $25.60 

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport $25.60 

FREEPORT, TX

Plant Location

San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc

Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk

Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport

Plant Location

SOUTHERN CRUSHED CONCRETE, LLC
14329 CHRISMAN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77039

SCOTT BRADY

SCOTT BRADY

281-987-8789

281-987-8791

SCOTT BRADY - 832-731-1080

JANICE CONWAY - 281-987-8789

San Luis Cty Park NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport NO BID

Plant Location

SCOTT BRADY

281-987-8789

281-987-8791

SCOTT BRADY - 832-731-1080

SOUTHERN CRUSHED CONCRETE, LLC
14329 CHRISMAN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77039

SCOTT BRADY



DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

ITB #09-13 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

3.1.3 Crushed Limestone (Price per 
ton as delivered to jobsite) 750-52 6745

3.1.4   State Minimum if required

3.2 Reclaimed Base 
Blend

3.2.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / 
siding loaded onto County trucks 750-72 6746

3.2.2 Price per ton as delivered to 
County Facility at: 750-72 6746

KENNETH K. VERNOR

FREEPORT, TX 77541
435 COMMERCE STREET

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO,, INC.

HOLLY CARLSON - 979-233-6330

979-233-6167

979-233-3366

HOLLY CARLSON

SHARON FOREMAN - 979-233-3366

OPTION #2 PLANT LOCATION

JANICE CONWAY - 281-987-8789

SOUTHERN CRUSHED CONCRETE, LLC
14329 CHRISMAN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77039

SCOTT BRADY

SCOTT BRADY

281-987-8789

281-987-8791

SCOTT BRADY - 832-731-1080

JANICE CONWAY - 281-987-8789

SCOTT BRADY

281-987-8789

281-987-8791

SCOTT BRADY - 832-731-1080

SOUTHERN CRUSHED CONCRETE, LLC
14329 CHRISMAN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77039

SCOTT BRADY

Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile

NO BID NO BID 21.25 0.20 

Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton

NO BID $14.00

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport $0.00 $0.00 Airport 14 $14.00 $28.00 $27.16 

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr $0.00 $0.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 37 $37.00 $51.00 $49.47 

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr $0.00 $0.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $28.00 $27.16 

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr $0.00 $0.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $28.00 $27.16 

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk $0.00 $0.00 Camp Mohawk 28 $28.00 $42.00 $40.74 

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr $0.00 $0.00 Clute Svc Ctr 1 $1.00 $15.00 $14.55 

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park $0.00 $0.00 Hanson Park 25 $25.00 $39.00 $37.83 

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr $0.00 $0.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 38 $38.00 $52.00 $50.44 

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control $0.00 $0.00 Mosquito Control 14 $14.00 $28.00 $27.16 

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park $0.00 $0.00 Quintana Cty Park 11 $11.00 $25.00 $24.25 

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park $0.00 $0.00 Resoft Park 36 $36.00 $50.00 $48.50 

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park $0.00 $0.00 San Luis Cty Park 20 $20.00 $34.00 $32.98 

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc $0.00 $0.00 W. Columbia Svc 25 $25.00 $39.00 $37.83 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

$17.80 

$22.26 

$17.80 

$17.80 

$20.52 

$15.28 

$19.93 

$22.46 

$17.80 

$17.22 

$22.07 

$18.96 

$19.93 

San Luis Cty Park $19.55 

W. Columbia Svc $20.55 

Quintana Cty Park $17.75 

Resoft Park $22.75 

Manvel Svc Ctr $23.15 

Mosquito Control $18.35 

Clute Svc Ctr $15.75 

Hanson Park $20.55 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $18.35 

Camp Mohawk $21.15 

Alvin Svc Ctr $22.95 

Angleton Svc Ctr $18.35 

7018 VERNOR ROAD
FREEPORT, TX

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport $18.35 

Hauling first mile

1.75 

14 TONS

Plant Location

San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc

Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk

Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport

Hauling first mile

Plant Location

San Luis Cty Park NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport NO BID

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID

Plant Location



DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

ITB #09-13 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

3.2.3 Price per ton as delivered to 
jobsite 750-72 6746

3.2.4   State Minimum if required

3.3 Crushed Concrete

3.3.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / 
siding loaded onto County trucks 750-52 6747

3.3.2 Price per ton as delivered 
to County Facility at: 750-52 6747

KENNETH K. VERNOR

FREEPORT, TX 77541
435 COMMERCE STREET

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO,, INC.

HOLLY CARLSON - 979-233-6330

979-233-6167

979-233-3366

HOLLY CARLSON

SHARON FOREMAN - 979-233-3366

OPTION #2 PLANT LOCATION

JANICE CONWAY - 281-987-8789

SOUTHERN CRUSHED CONCRETE, LLC
14329 CHRISMAN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77039

SCOTT BRADY

SCOTT BRADY

281-987-8789

281-987-8791

SCOTT BRADY - 832-731-1080

JANICE CONWAY - 281-987-8789

SCOTT BRADY

281-987-8789

281-987-8791

SCOTT BRADY - 832-731-1080

SOUTHERN CRUSHED CONCRETE, LLC
14329 CHRISMAN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77039

SCOTT BRADY

Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile

NO BID NO BID $14.00 $0.20

Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton

$12.50 $14.00 $14.00

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport 47.6 $47.60 $60.10 Airport $0.00 $14.00 Airport 14 $14.00 $28.00 $27.16 

Alvin Svc Ctr 31.5 $31.50 $44.00 Alvin Svc Ctr $0.00 $14.00 Alvin Svc Ctr 37 $37.00 $51.00 $49.47 

Angleton Svc Ctr 47.2 $47.20 $59.70 Angleton Svc Ctr $0.00 $14.00 Angleton Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $28.00 $27.16 

Brazoria Svc Ctr 42.6 $42.60 $55.10 Brazoria Svc Ctr $0.00 $14.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr 14 $14.00 $28.00 $27.16 

Camp Mohawk 38.1 $38.10 $50.60 Camp Mohawk $0.00 $14.00 Camp Mohawk 28 $28.00 $42.00 $40.74 

Clute Svc Ctr 59.7 $59.70 $72.20 Clute Svc Ctr $0.00 $14.00 Clute Svc Ctr 1 $1.00 $15.00 $14.55 

Hanson Park 56.3 $56.30 $68.80 Hanson Park $0.00 $14.00 Hanson Park 25 $25.00 $39.00 $37.83 

Manvel Svc Ctr 22.7 $22.70 $35.20 Manvel Svc Ctr $0.00 $14.00 Manvel Svc Ctr 38 $38.00 $52.00 $50.44 

Mosquito Control 43.7 $43.70 $56.20 Mosquito Control $0.00 $14.00 Mosquito Control 14 $14.00 $28.00 $27.16 

Quintana Cty Park 67.6 $67.60 $80.10 Quintana Cty Park $0.00 $14.00 Quintana Cty Park 11 $11.00 $25.00 $24.25 

Resoft Park 28.5 $28.50 $41.00 Resoft Park $0.00 $14.00 Resoft Park 36 $36.00 $50.00 $48.50 

San Luis Cty Park $0.00 $12.50 San Luis Cty Park 40 $40.00 $54.00 San Luis Cty Park 20 $20.00 $34.00 $32.98 

W. Columbia Svc $0.00 $12.50 W. Columbia Svc 54.9 $54.90 $68.90 W. Columbia Svc 25 $25.00 $39.00 $37.83 

Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

$17.80 

$22.26 

$17.80 

$17.80 

$20.52 

$15.28 

$19.93 

$22.46 

$17.80 

$17.22 

$22.07 

$18.96 

$19.93 

San Luis Cty Park $19.55 

W. Columbia Svc $20.55 

Quintana Cty Park $17.75 

Resoft Park $22.75 

Manvel Svc Ctr $23.15 

Mosquito Control $18.35 

Clute Svc Ctr $15.75 

Hanson Park $20.55 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $18.35 

Camp Mohawk $21.15 

Alvin Svc Ctr $22.95 

Angleton Svc Ctr $18.35 

7018 VERNOR ROAD
FREEPORT, TX

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport $18.35 

Hauling first mile

$1.75

14 TONS

Plant Location

San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc

Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk

Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr

HARBORSIDE DRIVE
GALVESTON, TX 

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport

Hauling first mile

Plant Location

San Luis Cty Park $18.00 

W. Columbia Svc $18.90 

Quintana Cty Park $19.20 

Resoft Park $15.25 

Manvel Svc Ctr $15.25 

Mosquito Control $18.60 

Clute Svc Ctr $18.90 

Hanson Park $18.90 

Brazoria Svc Ctr $18.60 

Camp Mohawk $15.25 

Alvin Svc Ctr $15.25 

Angleton Svc Ctr $18.60 

5001 GASMER & S POST OAK
HOUSTON, TX

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport $18.60 

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID

Plant Location



DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

ITB #09-13 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

3.3.3 Crushed Concrete (Price 
per ton as delivered to jobsite) 750-52 6747

3.3.4   State Minimum 
truckload if required

3.4 Crushed Asphalt

3.4.1 Price per ton bidder's 
plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 745-68 6748

3.4.2 Price per ton as delivered to 
County Facilities at: 745-68 6748

KENNETH K. VERNOR

FREEPORT, TX 77541
435 COMMERCE STREET

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO,, INC.

HOLLY CARLSON - 979-233-6330

979-233-6167

979-233-3366

HOLLY CARLSON

SHARON FOREMAN - 979-233-3366

OPTION #2 PLANT LOCATION

JANICE CONWAY - 281-987-8789

SOUTHERN CRUSHED CONCRETE, LLC
14329 CHRISMAN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77039

SCOTT BRADY

SCOTT BRADY

281-987-8789

281-987-8791

SCOTT BRADY - 832-731-1080

JANICE CONWAY - 281-987-8789

SCOTT BRADY

281-987-8789

281-987-8791

SCOTT BRADY - 832-731-1080

SOUTHERN CRUSHED CONCRETE, LLC
14329 CHRISMAN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77039

SCOTT BRADY

Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile

$14.00 $0.10 $14.00 $0.20

Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton

NO BID NO BID

County Facility mileage
mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier County Facility mileage

mileage x 
multiplier

Price/ton + 
mileage * 
multiplier

Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID Airport $0.00 Airport NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Alvin Svc Ctr $0.00 Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Angleton Svc Ctr $0.00 Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Brazoria Svc Ctr $0.00 Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID Camp Mohawk $0.00 Camp Mohawk NO BID NO BID NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Clute Svc Ctr $0.00 Clute Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Hanson Park $0.00 Hanson Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID Manvel Svc Ctr $0.00 Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID NO BID NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID Mosquito Control $0.00 Mosquito Control NO BID NO BID NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Quintana Cty Park $0.00 Quintana Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID Resoft Park $0.00 Resoft Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID San Luis Cty Park $0.00 San Luis Cty Park NO BID NO BID NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID W. Columbia Svc $0.00 W. Columbia Svc NO BID NO BID NO BID
Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00 Low bid mutiplier 1.00

San Luis Cty Park NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID

Quintana Cty Park NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport NO BID

Hauling first mile

$1.75

14 TONS

Plant Location

San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc

Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park

Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control

Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park

Brazoria Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk

Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport

Hauling first mile

Plant Location

Quintana Cty Park NO BID

Resoft Park NO BID

Manvel Svc Ctr NO BID

San Luis Cty Park NO BID

W. Columbia Svc NO BID

Mosquito Control NO BID

Clute Svc Ctr NO BID

Hanson Park NO BID

Brazoria Svc Ctr NO BID

Camp Mohawk NO BID

Alvin Svc Ctr NO BID

Angleton Svc Ctr NO BID

County Facility Price/ton Delivered

Airport NO BID

Hauling first mile

$1.50

13 TONS

Plant Location



DATE OF BID OPENING
Thursday, February 26, 2009

10:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

APRIL 1, 2009 - MARCH 31, 2010

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

ITB #09-13 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

3.4.3 Crushed Asphalt (Price per ton 
as delivered to jobsite) 745-68 6748

3.4.4 State Minimum truckload if 
required

BID DOCUMENTS ENCLOSED

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS

KENNETH K. VERNOR

FREEPORT, TX 77541
435 COMMERCE STREET

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO,, INC.

HOLLY CARLSON - 979-233-6330

979-233-6167

979-233-3366

HOLLY CARLSON

SHARON FOREMAN - 979-233-3366

OPTION #2 PLANT LOCATION

JANICE CONWAY - 281-987-8789

SOUTHERN CRUSHED CONCRETE, LLC
14329 CHRISMAN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77039

SCOTT BRADY

SCOTT BRADY

281-987-8789

281-987-8791

SCOTT BRADY - 832-731-1080

JANICE CONWAY - 281-987-8789

SCOTT BRADY

281-987-8789

281-987-8791

SCOTT BRADY - 832-731-1080

SOUTHERN CRUSHED CONCRETE, LLC
14329 CHRISMAN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77039

SCOTT BRADY

Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile Material cost
Hauling ea add'l 

mile

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NONE

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID

INCLUDED

Hauling first mile

NONE

Hauling first mile

NO BID

NO BID

INCLUDED


