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1.1 01017 6337 Reynolds 625
ALUMINUM FOIL,  EXTRA HEAVY 
DUTY (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 18"X1000' RL 13 RL REYNOLDS 625 18"X1000' EA $67.09 REYNOLDS 625 18X1M RL $86.95 REYNOLDS 615 RL RL $59.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.2 01017 6338 Reynolds 632
ALUMINUM FOIL, EXTRA HEAVY 
DUTY  (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 18"X500' RL 38 RL REYNOLDS 632 18"X500' EA $69.21 REYNOLDS 632 18X500 RL $81.90 REYNOLDS 632 RL RL $92.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.3 66524 6339  - 28-6-643
BAG, 7"X12" 4MIL POLY FLAT  
(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 1000/CS 10 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CONCORD not legible 1M CS $49.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.4 64060 6340 Specialty 1201

BAG, SANDWICH WAX PAPER, 
SQUARE-OPEN END, 3" x 1 3/4" x 6 
1/2"  (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 8/1000/CS 45 CS SPECIALTY 1201 8/1000 CS $11.00 SPECIALTY 8X1000 8M CS $80.00

NOT 
LEGIBLE 1201 8M CS $89.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.5 66577 6341 Johnson DRK94602
BAG, ZIPLOC STORAGE GALLON 
SIZE  (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 250/CS 2 CS REYNOLDS RS1011 250/CS CS $24.00 REYNOLDS RS1011 250 CS $28.00

SC 
JOHNSON 94602 CTN CS $26.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.6 66577 6342 Johnson DRK94601
BAG, ZIPLOC STORAGE QT  1.75MIL  
(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 500/CS 4 CS REYNOLDS RS78 500/CS CS $29.90 REYNOLDS RS78 500 CS $39.99

SC 
JOHNSON 94601 CTN CTN $32.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.7 64060 6343 Huck 10PPIB
BAG, ICE 10#, 11" X 21" PLAIN POLY  
(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 1000/CS 1 CS HUCK 10PPIB 1000 CS $52.00

WOCKSTE
R 10LB 1000 CS $42.99 HUCK 10PPIB 500 CTN $58.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.8 64060 6344 Pactiv TH10012

BOWL, 12 OZ WHITE SATIN 
PLACESETTER SATIN TABLEWARE  
(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 8/125 1M/CS 27 CS PACTIV TH10012 8/125 1M/CS CS $28.40 PACTIV TH0012 1000 CS $22.50 TENNECO TH1-0012 1000 CTN $29.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.9 88540 6345
 - 

LF
CAN FUEL, JELLED 6 HOURS  
(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) CS 5 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID STERNO

NOT 
LEGIBLE 72 CS $49.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.10 16533 6346 Sweethear EAD15

DISPENSER, CUP ADJUSTABLE  
STAINLESS STEEL, PULL TYPE FOR 4-
155 CUPS  (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) EA 2 EA SWEETHEART EAD15 EA EA $43.00 SOLO EAD15 1 EA $15.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.11 64060 6389 8J8

CUPS, 8 OZ  STYROFOAM
(WINN OR SWEETHEART BRAND 
ONLY) 1M/CS 23 CS DART 8J8 1M/CS CS $17.40 DART 8J8 1000 CS $18.00 DART 8J8 1000 CTN $20.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.12 64060 6347 10J10

CUPS, 10 OZ STYROFOAM 
(WINN OR SWEETHEART BRAND 
ONLY) 1M/CS 5 CS DART 10J10 1M/CS CS $22.00 DART 10J10 1000 CS $25.00 DART 10J10 1000 CTN $26.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.13 64060 6348 12J12

CUPS, 12 OZ STYROFOAM
(WINN OR SWEETHEART BRAND 
ONLY) 1M/CS 117 CS DART 12J12 1M/CS CS $23.95 DART 12J12 1000 CS $23.80 DART 12J12 1000 CTN $29.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.14 64060 6350 14J16

CUPS, 14 OZ STYROFOAM
(WINN OR SWEETHEART BRAND 
ONLY) 1M/CS 6 CS DART 14J14 1M/CS CS $32.00 DART 14J14 1000 CS $34.00 DART 14J16 1000 CTN $41.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.15 64060 6387 16J16

CUPS, 16 OZ STYROFOAM
(WINN OR SWEETHEART BRAND 
ONLY) 1M/CS 22 CS DART 16J16 1M/CS CS $35.40 DART 16J16 1000 CS $36.99 DART 16J16 1000 CTN $42.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.16 64060 6351 Solo SO-42BR

CUPS, CONE WATER CUP 
ROLLEDRIM,   4-1/4 OZ  (BRAND OR 
EQUIVALENT)

200/PK 
5M/CS 6 CS KONI 42RCON 5M/CS CS $50.00 SOLO 42RCON 5M CS $49.00 KONEX 42BR 5000 CTN $71.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.17 64050 6388 Solo 4BB
CUPS, 4 OZ CONICAL WATER CUP,   
(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 5M/CS 1 CS KONI 4RCON 5M/CS CS $50.00 SOLO

NOT 
LEGIBLE 5M CS $49.50 KONEX 4BR 5000 CTN $69.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.18 64060 Solo Y5JJ

CUPS, 5 OZ. PLASTICE 
TRANSLUCENT  (BRAND OR 
EQUIVALENT) 2M/CS 1 CS DART 5N25 2500/CS CS $37.00 SOLO Y5JJ 2M CS $29.99 DART T5S 1000 CTN $59.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.19 64060 6352 Solo Y4JJ
CUPS, 7 OZ  PLASTIC TRANSLUCENT  
(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)

200/PK 
2M/CS 1 CS DART 7N25 2500/CS CS $43.00 SOLO Y7JJ 2M CS $39.00 DART T7S 1000 CTN $56.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.20 64050 6353 Dixie DIX15CX
CUPS, BAKING PAPER  (BRAND OR 
EQUIVALENT) 20/500 1 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID DIXIE 15CX 10M CS $59.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.21 64060 6354 Dispozo5003PCSPK

,
KNIFE, FORK, SPOON, SALT & 
PEPPER, NAPKIN (INDIVIDUALLY 
PACKAGED)  (BRAND OR 250/CS 22 CS DISPOZO PICPAK 5/100/CS CS $43.80 SOLO

NOT 
LEGIBLE 250 CS $21.99 MAXIPAC 42FAI 250 CTN $29.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.22 20142 6355 Galaxy GLX 370L

GLOVES, FOOD POLY SERVING LINE, 
EMBOSSED, LARGE, CLEAR  (BRAND 
OR EQUIVALENT) 10 BX/100 60 CS TIDI 10473 10/100/CS CS $15.41 GALAXY 3702 10X100 CS $14.35 GALAXY GLX370L 10/100 CS $10.60

DASH 
POLY PE500L 10/500 CS $35.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.23 65243 6356 Cellucap HN500

HAIRNET, LT WT 15-DENIER SINGLE 
STRAND NYLON BLACK, 1/4" 
APERTURE   28" X-LARGE  (BRAND 10 BX/144 5 CS CELLOCAP HN500 10/144 CS $135.44 ROYAL HN500 144 CS $29.99 IMPACT 7386K 10/100 CS $17.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.24 64080 6357 Dispozo BPL-R29
LINER, PAN FULL SIZE, PARCHMENT 
PAPER  (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 1M/CS 12 CS GP L010 1M/CS CS $36.17 PRIME BPCR29 1000 CS $32.00 PAPERCON 35 1000 CTN $45.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.25 64060 6358 10CPWQ

PLATES, 3 COMPARTMENT 10.25", 
STYROFOAM  (BRAND OR 
EQUIVALENT) 125/500 14 CS DART 10CPHQ 500/CS CS $30.60 DART 100CPWC 500 CS $32.00 DART 10CPWQ 5000 CTN $38.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.26 64060  - Pactiv TH1009
PLATES, DINNER, 9", STYROFOAM  
(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 4/125 12 CS DART 9PWC 500/CS CS $19.20 DART CICPW 500 CS $21.99 TENNECO THI009 500 CTN $24.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.0  FOOD SERVICE

770-495-1044

W.W. Grainger, Inc

1657 Shermer Rd
Northbrook, IL 60062
Pat Santore

847-753-5409
877-879-9973

VWR International

1050 Satellite Blvd. NW
Suwanee, GA 30024
Jeanette Boyd

979-265-2720
979-265-2764

Dash Medical Gloves

10180 S. 54th Street
Franklin, WI 53132
Robert Kargl

800-523-2055
800-523-7795

ARC Supply, Inc.

132 Commerce
Clute TX 77531
Richard Craw

979-265-6149
979-265-7266

K & L Supply, Inc.

505 Bains, Suite 325
Brookshire, TX 77423-9317
Mike Brahm

800-288-2744
281-934-3590

Gulf Coast Paper

P.O. Box 1540
Clute, TX 77531
Glenn Williams
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1.0  FOOD SERVICE

1.27 64060 6359 Solo SO-05700
SPOONS, MED WT PLASTIC, WHITE   
(BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 1M/CS 23 CS DIZOPZO WMS 1000/CS CS $8.95 SOLO 6700 1000 CS $9.50 SOLO 5700 1000 CTN $14.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.28 64060 6360 Pactiv TH10100

TRAY, 1 COMP HINGED LID CARRY-
OUT CONTAINERS, 9-1/8"X9"X3-1/4" 
WHITE  (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)

4/125       
200/CASE 5 CS PACTIV TD19901 200/CS CS $21.60 DART 2904 200 CS $19.99 DART 95HT1 200 CTN $22.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.29 64060 6361 Pactiv TH10101

TRAY, 3 COMP HINGED LID CARRY-
OUT CONTAINERS, 9-1/8"X9"X3-1/4" 
WHITE  (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT)

4/125       
200 /CASE 30 CS PACTIV TD19903 200/CS CS $21.60 DART 2905 200 CS $19.99 DART 95HT3 200 CTN $22.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.30 64060 6362 Pactiv TH10500

TRAY, 5 COMP SCHOOL LUNCH, 8-
1/4" X 10-1/4" WHITE  (BRAND OR 
EQUIVALENT) 500/CS 12 CS PACTIV TH10500 500/CS CS $29.90 DART 304 500 CS $32.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID CTN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.31 64060 6363 Reynolds RY-91518
WRAP, PLASTIC 18" X 3000'   (BRAND 
OR EQUIVALENT) RL 42 RL REYNOLDS 915 RL RL $29.20 REYNOLDS 915 18X3M EA $25.49 PRIME PW18 RL RL $18.77 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

REFERENCED TXMAS CONTRACT 2-539030

NO

TXMAS CONTRACT TERMS AND CONDITIONS

ESCALATION AFTER 6 MONTHS 7%  PLUS OR MINUS 5% 10% 0%

ONLY QUOTED ONE ITEM

INCLUDED

NONE

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NONE

INCLUDED

NONE

NONE

INCLUDED

NONE

BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS

NONE

INCLUDED

NONE

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS
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