RFQ#09-08 OFFICE SUPPLIES AND RELATED PRODUCTS

Opening Date:

Wednesday, October 15, 2008

2:00 p.m C.S.T.

RESPONDENTS NAME:
ADDRESS:

CHALLENGE OFFICE PRODUCTS, INC

CORPORATE EXPRESS US, INC.
a STAPLES COMPANY

OFFICE MAX INCORPORATED

OFFICE DEPOT, INC

6015 SOUTH LOOP EAST

6400 HOLLISTER

6355 CLARA ROAD #100

6225 WEST BY NORTHWEST BLVD

HOUSTON, TX 77033

HOUSTON, TX 77040

HOUSTON, TX 77041

HOUSTON, TX 77040

CONTACT

JOHN BARBOSA

TOMMY LAMB

KIM MULES

JOHN C. PATONE

TELEPHONE NO.

713-644-4007

713-934-6400

713-849-8600

713-996-3142

FAX NUMBER 713-644-3926 713-934-8608 713-937-4968
EMAIL ADDRESS: jbarbosa@challengeofficeproducts.com tommy.lamb@cexp.com kimberleymules@officemax.com

TX-MAS #6-75030-2
CONTRACT TERM: 2/29/2012
RENEWAL: QUARTERLY WITH

NATIONAL INTERGOVERNMENTAL

PURCHASING ALLIANCE

PSA (PURCHASING SOLUTIONS

ALLIANCE)
CONTRACT TERM: 3 YEARS WITH (2)

CONTRACT TERM: 7/1/08-6/30/09

RENEWAL:(3) (1) YEAR RENEWALS

(1) YEAR EXTENTIONS - 5 YEARS
RENEWAL: AUTO RENEWAL AFTER (1)

NAME OF CO-OPERATIVE CONTRACT UPDATED TXMAS PRICING AFTER 6/30/09 YEAR UNLESS EARLY TERMINATION NO BID
DESCRIPTION ITEM / CATEGORY MFGR NAME ITEM # UOM UNIT PRICE UOM UNIT PRICE uoM UNIT PRICE UoM UNIT PRICE
1.0 GENERAL OFFICE SUPPLY
Binder, Heavy Duty EZ D Ring, 2 inch
Capacity, Maroon AVERY 79362 EA $7.05 EA $4.70 EA $9.99 EA NO BID
Binder, Easy Open Super Life, Slant D Ring,
Vinyl, Black, 5" ca. CARDINAL 14052 EA $31.31 EA $38.75 EA $32.26 EA NO BID
Book, Message, Telephone, 400 sets, 4 calls pe
page ADAMS ABFSC1154D EA $3.50 EA $4.16 EA $4.39 EA NO BID
Book, Phone, Message, 1 call per page, 4 1/4" X
6" 50 sets ADAMS ABFSC9711D EA $2.50 EA $3.72 EA $2.76 EA NO BID
Book, Receipt, Money 3 Part, 4 per page, 2 3/4
x 7 100 / bx, consecutively #d TOPS 46808 EA $6.15 EA $6.04 EA $10.05 EA NO BID
Cassette, Audio, Instant Start Series, 60
minutes (10/BX) MAXELL MAX116010 EA $1.55 EA $0.95 EA $1.30 EA NO BID
Cassette, Video, P/l Plus T120, 2 hrs SP, 4 hrs
LO, 6 hrs EP MAXELL MAX214112 EA $2.85 EA $1.14 EA $3.40 EA NO BID
CD-R, 700MB, 80 Min, Branded, Spindle, 52x
50/ PK VERBATIM 94523 PK $20.75 PK $28.50 PK $18.75 PK NO BID
CD-RW, 650 MB, 74 Min 2-4x Inkjet Printalbe 91664
Matte White, Jewel Case VERBATIM V -95160 EA $84.60 EA $0.81 EA $1.00 EA NO BID
DPS90002
Clip, Binder, LG, 12/BX 1" DPS V - UNV10220 BX $1.59 BX $0.83 BX $9.99 BX NO BID
DPS90001
Clip, Binder, MED 12 / BX 5/8" DPS V- UNV10210 BX $0.65 BX $0.28 BX $0.70 BX NO BID
DPS90000
Clip, Binder, SM 12 / BX 3/4" DPS V- UNV10200 BX $0.27 BX $0.18 BX $0.83 BX NO BID
Clip, Paper, Saver Brand GEM, # 1 Regular DPS03551
100/ BX, Smooth DPS V- UNV72210 BX $1.37 BX $0.04 BX $0.10 BX NO BID
Clip, Paper, Saver Brand GEM, Jumbo, DPS03514
Regular 100 / BX, Smooth DPS V-UNV72220 BX $4.21 BX $0.30 BX $0.35 BX NO BID
Clipboard, Hardboard, letter size, 9 x 12.5 olC 83100 EA $1.61 EA $0.51 EA $1.81 EA NO BID
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Clock, 14" Profile, Wall, Black SETH THOMAS 2758 EA $28.49 EA $37.79 EA $31.46 EA NO BID
EXP4001
Correction Fluid, All Purpose, 22 mi EXP V-UNV75407 EA $0.61 EA $0.21 EA $0.41 EA NO BID
Correction Tape, Bic Wite-Out Brand, White, |
line BIC WOTAPP11 EA $1.48 EA $1.70 EA $2.55 EA NO BID
Correction Tape, Disposable, Dryline grip,
white LIQUID PAPER 06604 EA $2.31 EA $1.62 EA $2.93 EA NO BID
Correction Tape, Mono, Single line, White TOMBOW 68620 EA $1.89 EA $1.64 EA $2.74 EA NO BID
Disk, 3 1/2" Optical, DS-HD, PC 1.44 MB 10/
BX SONY IMATION 12881 BX $5.14 BX $3.49 BX $1.41 BX NO BID
Envelope, Regular, # 10, White Wove, Sub 24, | corporaTE ExPRESS CEBO0331
500/BX (OR EQUAL) V- UNV35210 BX $7.39 BX $8.25 BX $6.99 BX NO BID
Envelope, Regular, Traditional Business, # 10, 11112
Sub 24, White, 500 / BX QUALITY PARK V- UNV35211 BX $15.63 BX $0.68 BX $26.67 BX NO BID
Evelope, Clasp, Heavy Duty, Brown Kraft, , CORPORATE EXPRESS CEBO03310
Sub 28,9 x 12 100 / BX (OR EQUAL) V- UNV35264 BX $7.15 BX $5.30 BX $4.74 BX NO BID
DPS40139
Fastener, Self Adhesive 2 3/4" c-c, 2" 100 / BX DPS V-UNV81002 BX $1.42 BX $5.04 BX $7.24 BX NO BID
File, Folder, Letter, Manilla, 1/3 Assorted
Tabls, 1 ply 11 pt Recycled, 100/ BX SMEAD SMD153L BX $8.66 BX $7.17 BX $13.57 BX NO BID
File, Folder, Ltr, 11Pt, 1.3 Assorted Tabs, 2 Ply
Manilla, 100 / BX SMEAD 10344 BX $17.50 BX $11.16 BX $18.85 BX NO BID
File, Hanging Letter, Green, 1 /3 cut, Recycled,| -orporaTE EXPRESS CEB03409
25/BX (OR EQUAL) V-UNV14113 BX $5.76 BX $4.21 BX $8.49 BX NO BID
File, Pocket, LTR, Red Rope, 5.25 Exp, Red CORPORATE EXPRESS CEBO03420
(50/BX) (OR EQUAL) V-UNV15262 BX $10.54 BX $30.23 BX $5.51 BX NO BID
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File, Pocket, Recycled, Red Rope, 9.5 x 14.75, WLJI74R SOLD IN BOX
3.5 exp. Red, Legal WILSON JONES V-UNV15161 EA $28.52 OF 25 $2.26 EA $41.91 EA NO BID
File, Rotary, Cards, 4 x 2.25 White, 100/BX ROLODEX 67570 PK $0.93 PK $0.66 PK $1.03 PK NO BID
6805
Flags, Post-1t, Yellow 50 / PK 3M V- DISC PK DISC. PK $1.24 PK $2.09 PK NO BID
Glue Stick Bonus Pack (15 +3 bonus sticks) AVERY 98089 PK $6.85 PK $7.72 PK $8.78 PK NO BID
Glue, Elmer's Glue-All, 1 1/4 0z ELMER'S BORE372 EA $1.24 EA $0.83 EA $1.29 EA NO BID
Highlighter, Desk-Style, Flourescent Yellow,
Chisel Tip AVERY 24000 Dz $4.40 Dz $4.02 Dz $3.10 DZ NO BID
Highlighter, Major, Accent, Broad Point, SHARPIE
Flourescent Orange ACCENT 25006 EA $5.69 DZ $0.13 EA $0.59 EA NO BID
Index Dividers, Worksaver Big Tab Insertable, CL2138
8 tab, Multicolor AVERY V-AVE12433 ST $35.13 ST $1.26 ST $0.83 ST NO BID
CORPORATE EXPRESS
Ink Refill, 10 ML per bottle, Blue (OR EQUAL) EXP99666 EA DISC. EA $2.09 EA $4.19 EA NO BID
Labels, White Laser Mailing , 1" x 2 5/8", 750 /|
PK AVERY 05260 PK $8.74 PK $6.49 PK $4.59 PK NO BID
Labels, White Laser Pres-A-Ply, 1" x 2 5/8",
750/ PK AVERY 30610 PK $4.07 PK $4.10 PK $6.80 PK NO BID
Mailer, Jiffy Padded, 10.5 x 16, #5 100/ BX | corporate ExprESS CEBM5
(10/PK) (OR EQUAL) V- SEL10190 PK $22.98 PK $5.38 PK $10.83 PK NO BID
Marker, Dryerase, 4 Color, Chisel Point EXPO SANFORD 83074 ST $3.64 ST $3.22 ST $2.28 ST NO BID
Marker, Marks-A-Lot Permanent, Black,
Regular, Chisel Tip AVERY 07888 EA $5.92 DZ $0.41 EA $0.78 EA NO BID
SHARPIE
Marker, Permanent, Sharpie, Fine, Black ACCENT 30001 Dz $7.18 Dz $5.12 Dz $5.00 Dz NO BID
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SHARPIE
Marker. Permanent, Sharpie, Extra Fine, Black ACCENT 35001 DZ $7.72 DZ $5.15 DZ $7.09 DZ NO BID
Mat, Chair, Plush Mat, 36 x 48 Stardard Lip RUBBERMAID 23580 EA $44.67 EA $58.09 EA $49.99 EA NO BID
Notebook, Rigid Kraft Covered Steno Book, | corporaTE EXPRESS EXP2000
Green Tint, Gregg, 60 Sheets (OR EQUAL) V-UNV76620 EA $1.09 EA $0.48 EA $0.30 EA NO BID
Notebook, Steno, Gregg, Green, 6 x 9, 70
Sheets, 12/PK SPARCO G69 EA $0.91 EA $0.48 EA $1.86 EA NO BID
Notes, Adhesive, 1 3/8 x 1 7/8 Aquatic Colors
12/ PK 3M 65312AQ PK $6.64 PK $4.27 PK $6.89 PK NO BID
Notes, Adhesive, Post-It, PIn, 1.5 x 2 Ultra
Colors 12/ PK 3M 653AU PK $6.64 PK $4.27 PK $6.99 PK NO BID
Notes, Adhesive, Post-It, PIn, 3 x 3 Yellow 12 .
PK 3M 654YW PK $9.91 PK $2.95 PK $6.80 PK NO BID
Notes, Adhesive, Post-It, Ruled, 3 x 3 Yellow 6
PD/PK 3M 6306PK PK $6.03 PK $4.35 PK $9.49 PK NO BID
Notes, Adhesive, Premium, 3 x 3 Yellow 12 CORPORATE EXPRESS EXP3X3YW
PD/PK (OR EQUAL) V-UNV35668 12PK $3.15 12PK $2.02 12PK $3.47 12PK NO BID
Organizer, Desktop, File, 11 DIV, Silver Wire FELLOWES 72012 EA $5.31 EA $6.72 EA $5.60 EA NO BID
Organizer, Optimizer, 4 way Organizer
w/drawers RUBBERMAID 94600 EA $38.50 EA $37.70 EA $40.30 EA NO BID
Pad, Important Message, 4.25 x 5.5 Pink, 12/
PK TOPS 3002S DZ $3.16 Dz $2.50 Dz $4.74 DZ NO BID
Pad, Legal ruled, Legal Size, Canary, 50 DPS20005
Sheets, 12 /PK DPS V-40000 Dz $11.54 Dz $12.08 Dz $6.99 DZ NO BID
Pad, Legal ruled, Letter Size, White, 50 Sheets, DPS20002
12/ PK DPS V-20630 Dz $5.96 Dz $9.33 Dz $7.71 DZ NO BID
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Pad, Legal Rulled, Letter Size, Canary, 50 DPS20003
Sheets 12 / PK DPS V-10630 Dz $5.96 DZ $9.33 DZ $6.99 DZ NO BID
Paper, Adding Machine, Roll, 2.25 x 150, CORPORATE EXPRESS CEB20215
White, 12 /PK (OR EQUAL) V-UNV35715 12PK $7.92 12PK $3.03 12PK $9.99 12PK NO BID
Paper, Adding Machine, Roll, 3 x 165 50 / PK SPARCO 23000 EA $0.84 EA $4.43 EA $3.06 EA NO BID
Pen Refill, Gel, Black, Medium AVERY 49561 EA $2.18 2/PK $0.49 EA $2.39 EA NO BID
Pen, Ball Point, Stay-Put, Black w/ square
blackbase, 24" chain ROGERS 21026 EA $2.24 EA $2.19 EA $2.84 EA NO BID
Pen, Ball Point, Stick, Medium, Blue PAPER MATE 33111 DZ $1.06 DZ $0.07 DZ $1.29 DZ NO BID
Pen, Ball Point, The Better Retractable, Fine,
Tinted Crystal, Black PILOT 30000 EA $0.94 DZ $0.08 EA $15.99 EA NO BID
Pen, Ball Point, Ultra Flexgrip, Retractable,
Black PAPER MATE 95301 EA $0.91 DZ $0.70 EA $6.90 EA NO BID
Pen, Bic Round Stick Blue BIC GSM-11BE BX $1.21 BX $1.15 BX $0.61 BX NO BID
Pen, Gel, Uniball Gel Grip, Clear Barrel, Black UNI-BALL
0.7mm SANFORD 65450 EA $0.85 EA $0.77 EA $7.40 EA NO BID
Pen, Refill, G-2, Fine, Black 2 EA / PK PILOT 77240 2PK $1.12 2PK $0.79 2PK $0.59 2PK NO BID
Pen, Refill, Gel, Uniball Signo Gel RT, Gel UNI-BALL
Impact RT, Med, Black 12 ea/ BX SANFORD 65423 EA DISC. EA $0.96 EA $0.65 EA NO BID
Pen, Refill, Stay-Put, Black ROGERS 21016 EA $1.47 EA $1.16 EA $1.61 EA NO BID
Pen, Rollerball, G-2, Fine, Retractable, Clear,
Black PILOT 31020 EA $0.95 DZ $0.72 EA $14.99 EA NO BID
Pencil, # 2 Mirado Classic, 12 / BX PAPER MATE 02097 DZ $1.88 DZ $1.03 DZ $0.65 DZ NO BID
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Pencil, # 2. American 12 / BX PAPER MATE 12132 Dz $0.72 Dz $0.51 Dz $0.36 Dz NO BID

Pencil, Mechanical, Twist-Erase |11 Automatic

with rubber comfort grip, .9 MM Black PENTEL QE519A EA $3.54 EA $1.98 EA $4.15 EA NO BID

Punch, 2 - 3 Hole, High VVolume, Electric,

Gray, 30 Sheets SPARCO 96003 EA $74.87 EA $107.52 EA $83.55 EA NO BID

Punch, 2 Hole, Black with Chrome Handle, 40

Sheets SWINGLINE 74060 EA $31.42 EA $33.19 EA $47.99 EA NO BID

Punch, 2-3 Hole, Commercial, Desktop, Black

11 Sheets SWINGLINE 74101 EA $15.74 EA $0.00 EA $16.99 EA NO BID
CORPORATE EXPRESS CEB90088

Punch, 2-Hole, Black, Punch 20 Sheets (OR EQUAL) V-UNV74222 EA $3.28 EA $18.10 EA $7.99 EA NO BID

Punch, 2-Hole, Plastic handles assorted colors,

punch 8 sheets SPARCO 00727 EA $4.96 EA $0.00 EA $2.94 EA NO BID

MASTER

Punch, 3 Hole, Gel Padded, 40 Sheets, Black PRODUCTS MP50 EA $37.97 EA $29.04 EA $41.65 EA NO BID

Report Cover, Presshoard, 20 pt, 8.5 CC, 11 x SMD6N129

8.5 Green 3" cap. 25/ BX SMEAD V-SMD81452 EA $1.92 EA $0.00 EA $2.99 EA NO BID

Report Covers, Presshoard Tyvek (ACCO)

Reinforced ACCO 25976 EA $1.02 EA $1.15 EA $0.58 EA NO BID

Report Covers, Presshoard Tyvek (ACCO)

Reinforced (Side Binding) ACCO 33038 EA $3.17 EA $3.34 EA $3.39 EA NO BID

OXFORD

Report Covers, Pressguard, Letter, 2", Black ESSELTE 71106 EA $2.71 EA $1.79 EA $2.95 EA NO BID
CORPORATE EXPRESS EXP00607

Rubber Band, 1 Ib 3 /12" L x 1/16" W, Size 19 (OR EQUAL) V-UNV00119 BG $3.04 BG $1.94 BG $4.49 BG NO BID
CORPORATE EXPRESS EXP00608

Rubber Band, 1 Ib 3" L x 1/8" W, Size 32 (OR EQUAL) V-UNV00132 BG $3.04 BG $1.94 BG $4.49 BG NO BID
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RENEWAL:(3) (1) YEAR RENEWALS

(1) YEAR EXTENTIONS - 5 YEARS

RENEWAL: AUTO RENEWAL AFTER (1)

NAME OF CO-OPERATIVE CONTRACT UPDATED TXMAS PRICING AFTER 6/30/09 YEAR UNLESS EARLY TERMINATION NO BID
DESCRIPTION ITEM / CATEGORY MFGR NAME ITEM # UOM UNIT PRICE UOM UNIT PRICE UOM UNIT PRICE UOM UNIT PRICE

CORPORATE EXPRESS EXP00612

Rubber Band, 1 Ib 7" L X 1/8" W, Size 117B (OR EQUAL) V-UNV01117 BG $3.04 BG $1.24 BG $4.49 BG NO BID
CORPORATE EXPRESS EXP00610

Rubber Band, 1 Ib Assorted Sizes (OR EQUAL) V-UNV00154 BG $3.04 BG $1.94 BG $8.49 BG NO BID

Scissors, Deskworks, Red, Straight, LH/RH, 8"

Full FISKARS 21087797 EA $2.79 EA $3.00 EA $3.19 EA NO BID

Seal, Notarial, 2" Dia, gold, 42/PK AVERY 05868 PK $2.04 PK $1.92 PK $3.06 PK NO BID
CORPORATE EXPRESS EXP99624

Stamp, Pre-Inked, "Copy" Red (OR EQUAL) V-UNV10021 EA $3.57 EA $3.68 EA $8.49 EA NO BID

Stand, Telephone, Black OIC 22802 EA $14.85 EA $14.91 EA $16.81 EA NO BID

Stapler, 747 Accent, Black cap 210 SWINGLINE 74741 EA $11.25 EA $10.45 EA $16.99 EA NO BID
CORPORATE EXPRESS EXP90040

Stapler, Economy, Full Strip, Descktop, Black (OR EQUAL) V-UNV43118 EA $2.98 EA $1.61 EA $1.85 EA NO BID

STANLEY

Staples, B-8, Chisel Pt. 5000 / BX BOSTITCH STCRP2115 1/4 BX $3.58 BX $2.24 BX $3.29 BX NO BID

Staples, Chisel Pt, Std, 5000 / BX 1/2"W x 1/4" DPS40022

L DPS V-UNV79000 BX $0.59 BX $0.21 BX $1.79 BX NO BID

Staples, SF4-5M Speedpoint., 5000 / BX, 1/2"

W x 1/4" L SWINGLINE 35450 BX $2.15 BX $1.67 BX $1.54 BX NO BID

Staples, Std., Chisel Pt., Round Wire, 5000 / STANLEY

BX BOSTITCH SBS19 1/4-CP BX $0.59 BX $0.80 BX $1.73 BX NO BID

Surge Protector, Protectit! Series, 1900 Joules,

8 ft cord, 8 outlets TRIPP LITE TLP808 EA $23.02 EA $31.46 EA $22.99 EA NO BID
CORPORATE EXPRESS CEB40038

Tape, Dispenser, Black (OR EQUAL) V-UNV15001 EA $0.95 EA $1.05 EA $3.49 EA NO BID
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RFQ#09-08 OFFICE SUPPLIES AND RELATED PRODUCTS

Opening Date:

RESPONDENTS NAME:

Wednesday, October 15, 2008

ADDRESS:

2:00 p.m C.S.T.

CHALLENGE OFFICE PRODUCTS, INC

CORPORATE EXPRESS US, INC.
a STAPLES COMPANY

OFFICE MAX INCORPORATED

OFFICE DEPOT, INC

6015 SOUTH LOOP EAST

6400 HOLLISTER

6355 CLARA ROAD #100

6225 WEST BY NORTHWEST BLVD

HOUSTON, TX 77033

HOUSTON, TX 77040

HOUSTON, TX 77041

HOUSTON, TX 77040

CONTACT

JOHN BARBOSA

TOMMY LAMB

KIM MULES

JOHN C. PATONE

TELEPHONE NO.

713-644-4007

713-934-6400

713-849-8600

713-996-3142

FAX NUMBER 713-644-3926 713-934-8608 713-937-4968
EMAIL ADDRESS: jbarbosa@challengeofficeproducts.com tommy.lamb@cexp.com kimberleymules@officemax.com

TX-MAS #6-75030-2
CONTRACT TERM: 2/29/2012
RENEWAL: QUARTERLY WITH

NATIONAL INTERGOVERNMENTAL

PURCHASING ALLIANCE

PSA (PURCHASING SOLUTIONS

ALLIANCE)
CONTRACT TERM: 3 YEARS WITH (2)

CONTRACT TERM: 7/1/08-6/30/09
RENEWAL:(3) (1) YEAR RENEWALS

(1) YEAR EXTENTIONS - 5 YEARS
RENEWAL: AUTO RENEWAL AFTER (1)

NAME OF CO-OPERATIVE CONTRACT UPDATED TXMAS PRICING AFTER 6/30/09 YEAR UNLESS EARLY TERMINATION NO BID
DESCRIPTION ITEM / CATEGORY MFGR NAME ITEM # UOoM UNIT PRICE uoM UNIT PRICE uoM UNIT PRICE UoM UNIT PRICE
CORPORATE EXPRESS CEB34X100PK10
Tape, Invisible, 3/4 x 1000 12 / PK (10 /PK) (OR EQUAL) V-810P10K 10PK $19.10 10PK $5.72 10PK $13.59 10PK NO BID
CORPORATE EXPRESS CEB34X36
Tape, Invisible, 3/4 x 1296 (36 yds) (OR EQUAL) V-UNV83436 EA $0.85 EA $0.45 EA $4.49 EA NO BID
Tape, Invisible, 3/4 x 1296 12 / PK 3M 620034X1296 EA $7.24 EA $1.01 EA $1.31 EA NO BID
Tape, Scotch, 3 /4" x 1000, 10 / PK w / Black
Dispenser 3M 810P10K-DS PK $19.20 PK $14.92 PK $21.99 PK NO BID
Tape, Scotch, 3 /4" x 1000, 12 / PK (10/PK) 3M MMM810P10K 10PK $19.00 10PK $14.92 10PK $20.99 10PK NO BID
MMM37502CL
Tape, Sealing, 2" 60yd, Clear 3M V-UNV61000 EA $1.04 PK/6 $3.78 EA $18.58 EA NO BID
Tape, Sealing, 2" 60yd, Clear HENKEL (DUCK) HP260C EA $3.20 EA $4.33 EA $5.44 EA NO BID
DPS03019
Tray Legal, Stackable, Sideloading, Smoke DPS V-UNV53112 EA $4.03 EA $4.22 EA $5.98 EA NO BID
Tray Letter, Stackable, Sideloading, Smoke DPS DPS3550 EA $3.94 EA $4.27 EA $2.49 EA NO BID
CORPORATE EXPRESS
Tray, Desk, Wire, 5" Legal, Black (OR EQUAL) CEB40237 EA $4.42 EA $2.81 EA $6.99 EA NO BID
2.0 CALENDARS AND PERSONAL
ORGANIZATION ITEMS
Board, Fabric Contour, 24 x 36, mauve Fab /
Burgundy Frame GBC 7693M EA $47.87 EA $62.73 EA $44.98 EA NO BID
Board, Cork, Aluminum Frame, 3 x 2 QUARTET QRT2303 EA $28.48 EA $23.98 EA $29.98 EA NO BID
Board, Cork, Wood Frame, 3 x 2 QUARTET QRT303 EA $31.97 EA $24.94 EA $32.48 EA NO BID
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RFQ#09-08 OFFICE SUPPLIES AND RELATED PRODUCTS

Opening Date:

Wednesday, October 15, 2008

2:00 p.m C.S.T.

RESPONDENTS NAME:
ADDRESS:

CHALLENGE OFFICE PRODUCTS, INC

CORPORATE EXPRESS US, INC.
a STAPLES COMPANY

OFFICE MAX INCORPORATED

OFFICE DEPOT, INC

6015 SOUTH LOOP EAST

6400 HOLLISTER

6355 CLARA ROAD #100

6225 WEST BY NORTHWEST BLVD

HOUSTON, TX 77033

HOUSTON, TX 77040

HOUSTON, TX 77041

HOUSTON, TX 77040

CONTACT

JOHN BARBOSA

TOMMY LAMB

KIM MULES

JOHN C. PATONE

TELEPHONE NO.

713-644-4007

713-934-6400

713-849-8600

713-996-3142

FAX NUMBER 713-644-3926 713-934-8608 713-937-4968
EMAIL ADDRESS: jbarbosa@challengeofficeproducts.com tommy.lamb@cexp.com kimberleymules@officemax.com

TX-MAS #6-75030-2
CONTRACT TERM: 2/29/2012
RENEWAL: QUARTERLY WITH

NATIONAL INTERGOVERNMENTAL

PURCHASING ALLIANCE

PSA (PURCHASING SOLUTIONS

ALLIANCE)
CONTRACT TERM: 3 YEARS WITH (2)

CONTRACT TERM: 7/1/08-6/30/09
RENEWAL:(3) (1) YEAR RENEWALS

(1) YEAR EXTENTIONS - 5 YEARS
RENEWAL: AUTO RENEWAL AFTER (1)

NAME OF CO-OPERATIVE CONTRACT UPDATED TXMAS PRICING AFTER 6/30/09 YEAR UNLESS EARLY TERMINATION NO BID
DESCRIPTION ITEM / CATEGORY MFGR NAME ITEM # UOM UNIT PRICE UOM UNIT PRICE uoM UNIT PRICE UoM UNIT PRICE
Board, Melamine with Aluminum Frame, 3 x 2 QRT5533
(Dry Erase) QUARTET V-QRTS533 EA $33.25 EA $8.00 EA $64.25 EA NO BID
Board, Message, Unframed, Post-It, 18 x 23
Charcoal 3M 558CL EA $10.57 EA $7.78 EA $13.69 EA NO BID
Calendar, Wall Planner, Erasable, monthly / VISUAL
quarterly 2-Sided 24 x 36 ORGANIZERS A1102 EA $13.52 EA $16.71 EA $13.68 EA NO BID
Calendar, Wall Planner, Erasable, yearly 24 x VISUAL
36 ORGANIZERS Al101 EA $16.25 EA $16.71 EA $1.73 EA NO BID
3.0 COMPUTER PERIPHERIALS AND
ACCESSORIES
Cleaner, Air, Dust-off Nonflammable FALCON SAFETY
Compressed Gas 10 0z can 2 / PK PRODUCTS DPNXL2 PK $24.50 PK $35.70 PK $29.99 PK NO BID
COMPUCESSOR
Cleaner, Air, Power Duster, 10 0z. can Y 24305 EA $4.47 EA $8.39 EA $5.79 EA NO BID
Riser, Monitor, Gray FELLOWES 91456 EA $20.38 EA $28.83 EA $19.93 EA NO BID
READ RIGHT
ADVANTUS
Wipes, Glarekleen, Tub 75 Ct CORP RR1419 EA $6.93 EA $9.37 EA $6.08 EA NO BID
READ RIGHT
ADVANTUS
Wipes, One Step Screen Cleaner, Tub 75 Ct CORP RR1409 EA $6.92 EA $9.48 EA $7.89 EA NO BID
Wrist Rest, Keyboard, Crystal Blue, 19 5/16" w
x 25/16" D x 15/16" H FELLOWES 91137 EA $11.76 EA $10.50 EA $15.99 EA NO BID
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RFQ#09-08 OFFICE SUPPLIES AND RELATED PRODUCTS

Opening Date:

Wednesday, October 15, 2008

2:00 p.m C.S.T.

RESPONDENTS NAME:
ADDRESS:

CHALLENGE OFFICE PRODUCTS, INC

CORPORATE EXPRESS US, INC.
a STAPLES COMPANY

OFFICE MAX INCORPORATED

OFFICE DEPOT, INC

6015 SOUTH LOOP EAST

6400 HOLLISTER

6355 CLARA ROAD #100

6225 WEST BY NORTHWEST BLVD

HOUSTON, TX 77033

HOUSTON, TX 77040

HOUSTON, TX 77041

HOUSTON, TX 77040

CONTACT

JOHN BARBOSA

TOMMY LAMB

KIM MULES

JOHN C. PATONE

TELEPHONE NO.

713-644-4007

713-934-6400

713-849-8600

713-996-3142

FAX NUMBER 713-644-3926 713-934-8608 713-937-4968
EMAIL ADDRESS: jbarbosa@challengeofficeproducts.com tommy.lamb@cexp.com

kimberleymules@officemax.com

TX-MAS #6-75030-2
CONTRACT TERM: 2/29/2012
RENEWAL: QUARTERLY WITH

NATIONAL INTERGOVERNMENTAL

PURCHASING ALLIANCE

PSA (PURCHASING SOLUTIONS

ALLIANCE)
CONTRACT TERM: 3 YEARS WITH (2)

CONTRACT TERM: 7/1/08-6/30/09
RENEWAL:(3) (1) YEAR RENEWALS

(1) YEAR EXTENTIONS - 5 YEARS
RENEWAL: AUTO RENEWAL AFTER (1)

NAME OF CO-OPERATIVE CONTRACT UPDATED TXMAS PRICING AFTER 6/30/09 YEAR UNLESS EARLY TERMINATION NO BID
DESCRIPTION ITEM / CATEGORY MFGR NAME ITEM # UOM UNIT PRICE UOM UNIT PRICE UOM UNIT PRICE UoM UNIT PRICE
Wrist Rest, Keyboard, Gel, Classic Series, 18"
W x31/4"Dx 13/16" H 3M WR310MB EA $18.82 EA $15.65 EA $18.55 EA NO BID
BELINDA BLACK, OFFICE MANAGER TOMMY LAMB RANDY PANG
NAME OF PERSON FOR INVOICE ISSUES: 713-644-4007 713-934-6400 281-541-0756 NO BID
ON LINE ORDER REBATES - % NONE NONE PSA AGREEMENT NO BID
VENDOR TO PROVIDE HP PURCHASE
EDGE PROGRAM- BRAZORIA COUNTY
RECEIVES REBATE POINTS FOR
TONER & INK CARTRIDGE RECYCLE NETWORK PRINTERS, SCANNERS OR
PROGRAM DIGITAL CAMERAS. SEE QUOTE RESPONSE SEE QUOTE RESPONSE NO BID
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS NONE YES - SEE QUOTE RESPONSE NONE NO BID
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