BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
ITB#09-03 OIL & LUBRICANTS

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
AVIATION OIL & GREASES
OIL, AVIATION, SINGLE GRADE, ASHLESS, 100, 50 WT, 55
GAL DRM - 4 CYCLE CERTIFIED AIRCRAFT
RECIPROCATING PISTON ENGINE
Brand: AeroShell W 100 Plus SHELL 60071
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40542 2951 NO BID $49.00 $47.53 NO BID
OIL, AVIATION, STRAIGHT MINERAL, ASHLESS, 100, 50
WT - FOR PISTON TYPE AIRCRAFT ENGINE OR BREAK-IN
OF NEWLY OVERHAULED ENGINE
Brand: Aircraft Engine Oil 100 TEXACO 467
BULK* 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40542 7047 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, AVIATION, PREMIUM, ASHLESS, 80, 40 WT - FOR 4
CYCLE CERTIFIED AIRCRAFT PISTON ENGINES BULK PRICING STATED AS GALLONS
Brand: AeroShell W 80 SHELL 60065
BULK* 40542 NO BID $12.74 $12.36 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40542 2954 NO BID $41.67 $40.42 NO BID
OIL, AVIATION, MULTIGRADE, ASHLESS, 15W50 - FOR 4
CYCLE CERTIFIED AIRCRAFT PISTON ENGINES BULK PRICING STATED AS GALLONS
Brand: AeroShell 15W-50 SHELL 60070
BULK* 40542 NO BID $18.03 $17.49 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1GALJUG 40542 7048 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40542 2957 NO BID $57.54 $55.81 NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
OIL, AVIATION, STRAIGHT MINERAL OIL, 100, 50 WT - FOR|
4 CYCLE CERTIFIED AIRCRAFT PISTON ENGINES OR
EEEALY OF ENENES BULK PRICING STATED AS GALLONS
Brand: AeroShell 100 SHELL 60005
BULK* 40542 NO BID $12.51 $12.13 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40542 2959 NO BID $40.98 $39.75 NO BID
OIL, AVIATION, STRAIGHT MINERAL OIL, 120, 60 WT - FOR|
4 CYCLE CERTIFIED AIRCRAFT PISTON ENGINES BULK PRICING STATED AS GALLONS
Brand: AeroShell 120 SHELL 60006
BULK* 40542 NO BID $12.57 $12.19 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40542 7049 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40542 NO BID $40.98 $39.75 NO BID
PHILLIPS PH XC

XC 25W60 AVIATION MULTIVISCOSITY OIL 66 2560
BULK* 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, AVIATION, HYDRAULIC, MINERAL OIL BASED - FOR
AIRCRAFT HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS OPERATING AT LOW
TEMP PRODUCT DISCONTINUED
Brand: Aircraft Hydraulic Oil 5606H (Product name
changed) TEXACO 1554
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40542 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
OIL, AVIATION, PISTON
BRAND: CASTROL AVIATOR AD 100 CASTROL AD100
CASE OF 12 (12 QT) JUGS 40542 7050 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GREASE, AVIATION, MULTIPURPOSE, LOW
TEMPERATURE VENDOR QUOTED CS OF 30 X 14.1 OZ/TUBES
Brand: AeroShell Grease 7 SHELL 70149
CASE OF 12 (11 0z) TUBES 40542 7051 NO BID 157.56 152.83 NO BID
GREASE, AVIATION, MULTIPURPOSE VENDOR QUOTED CS OF 30 X 14.1 OZ/TUBES
Brand: AeroShell Grease 22 SHELL 70022
CASE OF 12 (11 0z) TUBES 40542 7052 NO BID 235.04 227.99 NO BID
BRAKE FLUID
BRAKE FLUID, HYDRAULIC, DOT BULK PRICING STATED AS GALLONS. VENDOR
Brand: Havoline DOT 3 TEXACO 2204 QUOTED SHELL; NOT TEXACO
BULK* 06018 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 06018 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (12 0Z) CANS 06018 2974 NO BID $16.59 $16.09 NO BID
CASE OF 10 FLUID OZ CANS 06018 NO BID NO BID NO BID
COOLANT - ENGINE (Anti-Freeze)
ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, UNIVERSAL, GREEN
Brand: Texaco Anti-Freeze / Coolant TEXACO 2353 VENDOR QUOTED SHELL; NOT TEXACO
BULK* 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 06003 2975 NO BID 392.65 380.87 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 06003 2976 NO BID 44.15 42.83 NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE

ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, UNIVERSAL, EXT LIFE, ORANGE
Brand: Havoline Dex-Cool Extended Life *VENDOR SUBSTITUTED WITH SHELL DEXCOOL
Antifreeze/Coolant TEXACO 7994 ELC
BULK* 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 06003 2978 NO BID $56.69 $54.99 NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, UNIVERSAL, EXTENDED LIFE,
PRE-MIXED 50/50, ORANGE
Brand: Havoline Dex-Cool Extended Life *VENDOR SUBSTITUTED WITH SHELL DEXCOOL
Antifreeze/Coolant Pre-Mixed 50/50 TEXACO 7995 ELC 50/50; VENDOR QUOTED CS Of 6 X 1 GAL
BULK* 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 06003 NO BID $35.31 $34.25 NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, EXTENDED LIFE, RED
Brand: Texaco Extended Life Coolant / Anti-freeze TEXACO 7997
BULK* 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 06003 2981 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 06003 2982 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
COOLANT - ENGINE (Anti-Freeze)
ANTIFREEZE, COOLANT, EXTENDED LIFE, PREMIXED
50/50, RED
Brand: Texaco Extended Life Prediluted 50/50 Coolant /
Anti-Freeze TEXACO 7998 PRODUCT DISCONTINUED
BULK* 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 06003 2984 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 06003 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GAS TREATMENT
GAS TREATMENT, DEPOSIT CONTROL
Brand: BG MI 3000 Plus BG 203
30 GAL DRUM 40507 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40507 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 24 (5.2 FLUID OZ) CANS 40507 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 24 (11 FLUID OZ) CANS 40507 3015 6.35 /EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
GREASE
GREASE, LUBRICANT & CORROSION INHIBITOR WITH
TEFLON
BRAND: TRI-FLOW TRI-FLOW TF20027
CASE OF 12 (12 OZ) AEROSOL CANS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VENDOR QUOTED SHELL RETINAX LX2; QUOTED

GREASE, LUBRICANT, MULTIPURPOSE, LITHIUM SOAP % 1 B TS NSTAD Gl
Brand: Marfak Multipurpose 2 TEXACO 958
BULK* 40524 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 KEG (120 LBS OR 16 GAL) 40524 3023 NO BID $236.28 $229.19 NO BID
CASE OF 40 - 14 OZ TUBES (35 LBS) 40524 3024 NO BID $56.40 $54.71 NO BID
CASE OF 50 - 14 OZ TUBES 40524 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 60 - 14 OZ TUBES 40524 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 40 - 12 OZ TUBES 40524 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

Thursday, September 25, 2008

2:00 P.M.C.S.T.

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

8703 FALLBROOK DR.

22614 N. HWY 288-B

P.O. BOX 2495

HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318

ANGLETON, TX 77515

SPRING, TX 77383

PAMELA SLUSHER

BRENT HARRISON

PAMELA SLUSHER

BRENT HARRISON

281-970-2394

281-369-3835

281-353-9688

281-970-9672

281-369-0828

BULK*

40524

NO BID

NO BID

BULK* 40524 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40524 3025 NO BID $712.80 $691.42 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40524 3026 NO BID $66.99 $64.98 NO BID
1 KEG (120 LBS OR 16 GAL) 40524 3027 NO BID $225.72 $218.95 NO BID
CASE OF 50 - 14 OZ TUBES 40524 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 60 - 14 OZ TUBES 40524 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 40 - 14 OZ TUBES (35 LBS) $54.43 $52.80

NO BID

NO BID

1 GAL JUG

40524

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

CASE OF 60 - 14 OZ TUBES

BULK*

40524

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

1 GAL JUG

40524

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS

BULK* 40524 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 GAL DRUM**(NO LONGER AVAILABLE)
USE 16 GAL (120 LB) KEG 40524 3035 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BULK* 40524 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 50 - 14 OZ TUBES-NOT AVAILABLE
USE CASE OF 40 14 OZ TUBES 40524 7054 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Page 6 of 16



DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE

14.5 0Z CANS 40524 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GREASE, LUBRICANT, HEAVY-DUTY MOLYBDENDUM DISULFIDE __|ZEP 731301
CASE OF 12 (20 0Z) AEROSOL CANS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GREASE — INDUSTRIAL APPLICATIONS
GREASE, INDUSTRIAL, ORGANOCLAY, EXTREME
PRESSURE
Brand: Thermatex EP 1 TEXACO 2313 PRODUCT DISCONTINUED
55 GAL DRUM 40527 3048 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 GAL KEG (120 LBS) 40527 3049 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40527 3047 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 10 FLUID OZ CANS 40527 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL - CIRCULATING
OIL, CIRCULATING, HIGH PERFORMANCE
Brand: Regal R&O 68 TEXACO 702
BULK* 40551 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG - NOT AVAILABLE
USE 5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40551 3054 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS 40551 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40551 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40551 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL - GEAR
OIL, GEAR, MULTIGEAR, PETROLEUM BASED, HIGH
TEMPERATURE, 80W90 VENDOR QUOTED SHELL SPIRAX HDGO
Brand: Multigear EP SAE 80W-90 TEXACO 2316
BULK* 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40549 3060 NO BID $607.20 $588.98 NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40549 3061 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.

BC CONTRACT RELEASE #

ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:

PAMELA SLUSHER

BRENT HARRISON

TELEPHONE NUMBER

281-970-2394

281-369-3835

281-353-9688

FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
OIL, GEAR, MULTIGEAR, PETROLEUM BASED, HIGH
TEMPERATURE, 85W140 VENDOR QUOTED SHELL SPIRAX HDGO
Brand: Multigear EP SAE 85W-140 TEXACO 2317
BULK* 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40549 3062 NO BID $607.20 $588.98 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40549 3063 NO BID $56.21 $54.52 NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, GEAR, MULTIPURPOSE, PREMIUM PERFORMANCE,
80W90
Brand: 80W90 SAE Premium Performance NAPA
BULK* 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, GEAR, SYNTHETIC, HEAVY DUTY, 80W140 VENDOR QUOTED SHELL SPIRAX ASX
Brand: Syn-Star GL 80W-140 TEXACO 1913
BULK* 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40549 3066 NO BID $112.04 $108.68 NO BID
O, CIEAR, SVNAIETIC, G VENDOR QUOTED SHELL SPIRAX ASX
BRAND: SPIRAX S 80W-140 SHELL 59227
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS 7055 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL KEG (120 LBS) 7056 NO BID $112.04 $108.68 NO BID
16 GAL PAIL (120 LBS) 40549 7057 NO BID $384.12 $372.60 NO BID
55 GAL DRUM **(140 LBS) 40549 7058 NO BID $1,249.60 $1,212.11 NO BID
BULK* 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Page 8 of 16



DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code ID UoMm UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
OIL, GEAR, MULTIPURPOSE, SYNTHETIC, EXTENDED
WARRANTY, HEAVY DUTY, 75W90
Brand: Spirax EW SAE 75W90 SHELL 59202
BULK* 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40549 3068 NO BID $946.00 $917.62 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40549 3069 NO BID $86.24 $83.65 NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40549 7059 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, GEAR, INDUSTRIAL, EXTREME PRESSURE VENDOR LISTED "OMA" IN PRODUCT DESCRIPTION
Brand: Meropa 220 TEXACO 2321
BULK* 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40549 NO BID $607.20 $588.98 NO BID
1 GAL JUG-NOT AVAILABLE
USE 5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40549 3070 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL - GEAR CONDITIONER
OIL, GEAR, CONDITIONER, CONCENTRATE, GEAR OIL
SUPPLEMENT
Brand: BG MGC Concentrate BG 325
BULK* 40538 $6.85/TUBE (6 0Z) NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40538 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 GAL PAIL 40538 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
80W80 REAR AXLE
BULK* 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40549 3090 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40549 3091 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1GAL JUG 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 11 FLUID OZ SPRAY CANS 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
OIL, GEAR, LUBRICANT, SPRAYABLE, LITHIUM SOAP,
OPEN GEAR, CSF
Brand: Crater CSF TEXACO 1968
BULK* 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40549 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, MARINE, 2 CYCLE
OIL, MARINE, 2 CYCLE
Brand: 2 Cycle Oil TEXACO 498
BULK* 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 24 (¥ PINT) CANS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL - MOTOR
BULK PRICING STATED AS GALLONS
OIL, MOTOR, HIGH PERFORMANCE, HEAVY DUTY, 15W40
Brand: RIMULA PREMIUM 15W-40 SHELL 54269
BULK* 40539 3106 NO BID $8.23 $7.98 NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40539 3107 NO BID $559.02 $542.25 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40539 3108 NO BID $44.90 $43.55 NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 3109 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40539 3110 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
BULK PRICING STATED AS GALLONS. VENDOR
OIL, MOTOR, LIGHT DUTY, GAS ENGINE, 10W30 QUOTED SHELL FORMULASHELL
Brand: HAVOLINE FORMULA 3 SAE 10W-30 TEXACO 2199
BULK* 40539 NO BID $7.69 $7.46 NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40539 3111 NO BID $533.01 $517.02 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40539 3113 NO BID $29.34 $28.46 NO BID
VENDOR QUOTED SHELL FORMULASHELL; QUOTED
OIL, MOTOR, HEAVY DUTY, HIGH TEMP, 10W40 3X 1 GAL JUGS INSTEAD OF SINGLE GALLON
Brand: HAVOLINE FORMULA 3 SAE 10W-40 TEXACO 2191
BULK* 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS)-NOT AVAILABLE
USE 55 GAL DRUM 40539 3114 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40539 7060 NO BID $29.30 $28.42 NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, MULTIGRADE, HEAVY DUTY, DIESEL,15W40
Brand: URSA SUPER PLUS SAE 15W-40 TEXACO 2109
BULK* 40539 3117 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS-NO LONGER AVAILABLE
USE CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 7061 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40539 3121 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, MULTIGRADE, HD ALL SEASON, 15W4C
Brand: ROTELLA T MULTIGRADE 15W-40 SHELL 50012
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40539 3124 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 3125 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40539 3126 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
BULK PRICING STATED AS GALLONS. VENDOR
OIL, MOTOR, T MULTIGRADE SAE 15W-40 (CJ-4), (USE IN QUOTED 3 X 1 GAL JUGS INSTEAD OF 6 X 1 GAL
ALL AGE VEHICLES) UGS
BRAND: ROTELLA T MULTIGRADE SAE 15W-40 CJ4 SHELL 5071355
BULK* NO BID $9.96 $9.66
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 3130 NO BID $35.94 $34.86 NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, MONOGRADE, MED LT DUTY, DIESEL, 40WT
Brand: URSA SUPER PLUS SAE 30W TEXACO 2112
1 GAL JUG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS 7062 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, MONOGRADE, MED LT DUTY, DIESEL, 40WT
Brand: URSA SUPER PLUS SAE 40W TEXACO 2113
1 GAL JUG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
|OIL, MOTOR, SINGLE GRD, HEAVY DUTY, GAS DIESEL,
VENDOR QUOTED 3 X 1 GAL JUGS INSTEAD OF 6 X 1

o GAL JUGS
Brand: ROTELLA T 30W SHELL 54103
1 GAL JUG 40539 3119 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS-NO LONGER AVAILABLE
USE CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 3140 NO BID $33.40 $32.40 NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, SINGLE GRD, HEAVY DUTY, GAS DIESEL, VENDOR QUOTED 3 X 1 GAL JUGS INSTEAD OF 4 X 1
4ow GAL JUGS
Brand: ROTELLA T 40W SHELL 54104
1GALJUG 40539 3144 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 NO BID $33.40 $32.40 NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, HEAVY DUTY, HIGH TEMP, 20W50 VENDOR QUOTED SHELL FORMULASHELL
Brand: HAVOLINE FORMULA 3 SAE 20W-50 TEXACO 2196
BULK* 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS)-NOT AVAILABLE
USE 55 GAL DRUM 40539 3156 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS-NO LONGER AVAILABLE
USE CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 3157 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS 40539 3158 NO BID $29.44 $28.56 NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M.C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.0. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOoM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
OIL, MOTOR, HEAVY DUTY, HIGH TEMP, 30W VENDOR QUOTED SHELL FORMULASHELL 30
Brand: HAVOLINE FORMULA 3 SAE 30 TEXACO 2193
BULK* 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS)-NOT AVAILABLE
USE 55 GAL DRUM 40539 3159 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL UG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS 40539 3160 NO BID $29.44 $28.56 NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, 30W PLUS
Brand: HAVOLINE PLUS 30W. TEXACO
BULK* 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GALJUG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, ANTIWEAR, HIGH TEMP, GAS ENGINE, VENDOR RESPONDED SEE ITEM 2 ON PAGE 7 OF
10W30 ATTACHMENT A IN BID PKG. SAME PRODUCT AS
Brand: FORMULA SHELL 10W30 SHELL | 50203 SHELL 2199 FORMULASHELL 10WS0
BULK* 40539 7063 NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40539 7064 NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40539 NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 4 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 7065 NO BID NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, NON-DETERGENT, 30
Brand: MYSTIK NON-DETERGENT 30 MYSTIK | 663102
BULK* 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, LIGHT DUTY, GAS ENGINE, 5W2C VENDOR QUOTED SHELL FORMULASHELL
Brand: HAVOLINE 5W20 TEXACO 2197
BULK* 40539 NO BID $8.17 $7.92 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40539 3155 NO BID $20.36 $28.48 NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code 1D UOM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
OIL, MOTOR, LIGHT DUTY, GAS ENGINE, 5W3C
Dk VRN GYED TBEEH ar VENDOR QUOTED SHELL FORMULASHELL
BULK* 40539 NO BID $7.79 $7.56 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS)-NOT AVAILABLE
USE 55 GAL DRUM 40539 3163 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40539 3164 NO BID $29.83 $28.94 NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, 2 CYCLE
OIL, MOTOR, 2 CYCLE
Brand: HAVOLINE TWO-CYCLE ENGINE OIL TC-W3 TEXACO 1896
CASE OF 48 (2.5 0Z) CANS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 24 (% PINT) CANS 40539 3185 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, 2 CYCLE, LITHIUM OIL
Brand: JOHN DEERE LITHIUM OIL
BULK* 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 24 (% PINT) CANS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, 2 CYCLE
Brand: OPTI-2 STIMNAX | E-GDT
CASE OF 48 (1 MIX) 1.8 OZ PACKETS 40539 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, MOTOR, SUPPLEMENT
OIL, MOTOR, SUPPLEMENT, ADV FORMULA, 110
Brand: BG MOA (ADVANCE FORMULA) BG 110
CASE OF 12 (32 FLUID OZ) CANS 40538 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 24 (11 FLUID OZ) CANS 40538 3195 $6.90/EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL - TRANSMISSION & DRIVE TRAIN
OIL, TRANSMISSION AND DRIVE TRAIN, 50 VENDOR QUOTED SHELL DONAX TC 50
Brand: TO-4 OIL SAE 50 TEXACO 1971
BULK* 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40536 3203 NO BID $589.27 $571.59 NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.0. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG# | Code D UoMm UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
POWER STEERING FLUID
*VENDOR SUBMITTED *VENDOR LISTED CASE OF (12 - 120Z) CANS INSTEAD
POWER STEERING FLUID, GM CHRYSLER CASE OF 12 (12 02) CANS OF 1002
Brand: POWERSTRAG FUILD SHELL 51203
BULK* 40585 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40585 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 10 FLUID OZ CANS 40585 3210 NO BID $15.97 $15.49 NO BID
TRANSMISSION DIFFERENTIAL HYDRAULIC
FLUID
OIL, TRANSMISSION HYDRAULIC FLUID, OFFROAD EQUIP
Brand: DONAX TD (BLUE) (Equal to TDH Oil Special) SHELL 53175
BULK* 40536 3216 NO BID $8.50 $8.25 NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40536 3217 NO BID $520.85 $505.22 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40536 3218 NO BID $47.35 $45.93 NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TRANSMISSION FLUID, AUTOMATIC
OIL, TRANSMISSION, SYNTHETIC, HD LOW TEMP, 50 VENDOR QUOTED SHELL SPIRAX GSX 50
Brand: SYN -STAR TL 50 TEXACO 1965
BULK* 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40536 3221 NO BID $1,221.00 NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40536 3223 NO BID $109.99 NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS-NOT AVAILABLE
USE 16 GAL KEG (120 LBS) 40536 3222 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, TRANSMISISON FLUID, CAR LIGHT DUTY TRUCK e
Brand: FORMULA SHELL ATF MERCON / DEXRON IiI SHELL | 53010
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40536 3225 NO BID $503.97 NO BID
1 GAL JUG 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40536 3228 NO BID $27.36 NO BID
OIL, TRANSMISISON FLUID, CAR LIGHT DUTY TRUCK
Brand: HAVOLINE AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID
MERCON / DEXRON-II TEXACO | 1854
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDER'S NAME

LUBRICATION SPECIALISTS OF TEXAS

OIL PATCH-BRAZOS VALLEY INC

SUNDANCE FUELS, LTD

Thursday, September 25, 2008

BC VENDOR #

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. BC CONTRACT RELEASE #
ADDRESS 8703 FALLBROOK DR. 22614 N. HWY 288-B P.O. BOX 2495
HOUSTON, TX 77064-3318 ANGLETON, TX 77515 SPRING, TX 77383
QUOTED BY:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
CONTACT:
PAMELA SLUSHER BRENT HARRISON
TELEPHONE NUMBER 281-970-2394 281-369-3835 281-353-9688
FAX NUMBER 281-970-9672 281-369-0828
Comm | County LESS 3% LOCAL BUSINESS
DESCRIPTION MFG NAME| MFG # Code D UoM UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE UOM PRICE
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40536 3232 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OIL, TRANSMISSION FLUID, FORD, AUTOMATIC TRANS
Brand: HAVOLINE AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID VENDOR QUOTED SHELL
MERCON V TEXACO 2127
BULK* 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (1 QT) CANS (3 GAL) 40536 3239 NO BID $37.10 NO BID
OIL, TRANSMISSION FLUID QUAKER
Brand: QUAKER STATE FLUID #3 STATE
BULK* 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 GAL DRUM** (400 LBS) 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 6 (1 GAL) JUGS 40536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TRANSMISSION FLUID, AUTOMATIC,
CONDITIONER
OIL, TRANSMISSION FLUID, CONDITIONER
Brand: BG ATC+ BG 310
5 GAL PAIL (35 LBS) 40538 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 12 (32 FLUID OZ) CANS 40538 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE OF 24 (11 FLUID OZ) CANS 40538 3266 $7.70/EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
Availability of Product N/A N/A NO BID
Shipment can be made in days after receipt of
order 3 DAYS 2 DAYS NO BID
Exceptions to Terms & Conditions NONE NONE NO BID
Bid Documents Included INCLUDED INCLUDED NO BID
Additional Comments NONE
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