ITB #08-43 MEDICAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

Bidders Name

Central Texas Medical Equipment & Supplies

Medco Supply

Bid Open Date: Friday, February 22, 2008 at 10:00 A.M.

*Note: Vendor must fill in Manufacturer, Vendor Part #, Packaging, & UOM Price.

Address 8212 Georgian Dr 500 Fillmore Ave
Austin, TX 78753 Tenawanda, NY 14150
Quoted By Charles Miller Mike Christ
Contact Chales Miller Mike Christ

Telephone Number

512-451-9704

800-556-3326 x334

Vendor must bid Brand specified or equivalent. Fax Number 512-451-9760 800-222-4150
COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM | CODE D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE
ALCOHOL, ISOPROPYL, 70%, 16 OZ (BRAND OR CUMBERLAND CUMBERLAND
1 19025 EQUIVALENT) SWAN CUMS08484V EA MCKESSON 49176 EA 3.07 SWAN 340CIM EA 1.08
ALCOHOL WIPES, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED (BRAND
2 19025 OR EQUIVALENT) TRIAD TRI10-3101 200/BX MCKESSON 191089 200/BOX 2.72 TRIAD 68141 200/BOX 3.19
APPLICATORS, SCOPETTES, JR, STERILE COTTON (WRONG SIZE 6")
3 47567 TIPS, JUMBO 8" (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) BIRCHWOOD BIR34-7021-12 100/PK BIRCHWOOD 35628 100/PK 26.16 PURITAN 316C2M 500/PK 5.35
APPLICATORS, WOOD, COTTON TIP, 6" STERILE,
4 47567 (BRAND OR EQUIVLANET) PURITAN HAR25-806-2WC 100PK/BX PURITAN 285694 100PK/BX 10.18 PURITAN 25111 100PK/BOX 5.35
BANDAGE JR, SHEER, 3/8 X 1 1/2 (BRAND OR
5 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO ASOCBD2027-012-000 12BX/CS ASO 329355 12BX/CS 55.50 MEDCO 261847 100/BOX 2.74
BANDAGE, PLASTIC, 3/4 X 3 (BRAND OR JOHNSON &
6 47509 EQUIVALENT) JOHNSON JJS5634 12BX/CS ASO 329357 12BX/CS 57.28 J&J 559486 12BX/CS 48.10
BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE FABRIC, 7/8 SPOT (BRAND OR
7 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO AGPCBD4022 100/BOX ASO 329356 100/BOX 4.48 HARTMANN 555906 100/BOX 3.55
CONTAINER, SHARP, 4 QT, RED, MEDIUM, MEDICAL ACTION
8 99867 STACKABLE (BRAND OR EQUIVALNET) IND 8703 EA MCKESSON 586905 EA 6.66 BD 123008 EA 5.26
CONTAINER SHARP 8.2 QT RED LARGE (BRAND OR BECTON
9 99867 EQUIVALENT) DICKINSON 305490 EA BECTON DICKINSON 169748 EA 13.88 BD 900988 EA 9.85
COTTON BALLS MEDIUM NON-STERILE (BRAND OR
10 99867 EQUIVALENT) DYNAREX DYN3170 2000/BAG MCKESSON 493863 2000/BAG 28.99 DYNAREX 32060 2000/BAG 8.95
CUP, PLASTIC, TRANSLUCENT (BRAND OR
11 64050 EQUIVALENT) DART 7N25DART 25PK/CS MEDLINE 488528 25PK/CS 98.05 507 39032M 25PK/CS 53.95
DRAPE SHEET 2 PLY 40 X 48 BLUE (BRAND OR
12 47564 EQUIVALENT) GRAHAM MEDICAL GRA48615 100/CS | GRAHAM MEDICAL 169896 100/CS 40.37 GRAHAM MEDICAL 8302CC 100/CS 20.65
DRESSING, TEGADERM, W/ ABSORBENT PAD,
13 47509 (BRAND ONLY) 3Mm 3586 25/BOX 3M MMM3586 25/BOX 60.00 3Mm 98906 25/BOX 33.25
GLOVE EXAM SYNTHETIC MEDIUM POWDER-FREE (wrong brand)
14 20142 SENSICARE (BRAND ONLY) MEDLINE MED484312 10X100/CS 427034 10X100/CS 157.25 NO BID NO BID 10X100/CS NO BID
GLOVE, EXAM, LATEX, TEXTURED, POWDER FREE, CARDINAL
15 20142 NOVAPLUS, (BRAND ONLY) HEALTH V8841 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10X100/CS NO BID
GLOVE EXAM VINYL SMALL POWDER-FREE (BRAND
16 20142 OR EQUIVALENT) GENERIC BRAND MMS5300-S 10X100/CS | CYPRESS MED 490585 10X100/CS 68.45 BASIC 10225 10X100/CS 64.60
LUER HOLDER, MULTI-SAMPLE, 5ML, DISPOSABLE,
17 47567 NON-STERILE (BRAND ONLY) EXELENT INT'L CO 26530 10X100/CS EXELENT 642406 10X100/CS 206.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SPECULA VAGINAL, DISPOSABLE, MEDIUM (BRAND
18 47567 OR EQUIVALENT) SANI-SPEC C0082330 10/BG SANI-SPEC 328981 10/BG 10.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
19 47582 NEEDLE BLOOD 22 X 1 1/4 ECLIPSE (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368608 48/BOX BD ECLIPSE 373903 48/BOX 49.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
20 47582 NEEDLE ECLIPSE 23 X 1 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305762 100/BOX BD ECLIPSE 442026 100/BOX 42.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3ML 23 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON
21 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305271 4BXICS BD INTEGRA 626957 4BXICS 404.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 25 X 5/8 RETRACTING BECTON
22 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305269 4BXI/CS BD INTEGRA 449100 4BXICS 404.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
23 47582 SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3CC 23 X 1 LL (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 309571 100/BX BD INTEGRA 456 100/BX 24.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER| VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM | CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFER NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #] PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #] PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE

SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 22 X 1 1/2 RETRACTING BECTON

24 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305272 4BXICS BD INTEGRA 449103 4BXICS 404.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 25 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON

25 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305270 4SP/BX BD INTEGRA 449101 4SP/BX 101.07 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VACUTAINER SAFETY-LOK BLOOD COLLECTION SET, BECTON

26 47582 23 X .75 NEEDLE WITH 12" TUBING (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368653 8SP/CS BD INTEGRA 510039 8SP/CS 531.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SPUTUM COLLECTION KIT WITH TUBE, STERILE

27 99867 (BRAND ONLY) KENDALL 2650SA 50/CS KENDALL 140897 50/CS 286.77 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STETHOSCOPE, DUAL-HEAD, RED (BRAND OR

28 99867 EQUIVALENT) PHYSICIAN SALES 44625 EA OMRON 2441282 EA 15.73 OMRAN 118C11M EA 14.35

29 47564 TOWEL, 3 PLY, 13.5" X 18", WHITE (BRAND ONLY) KAY-PEES 911898 10X50/CS KAY-PEES 43890 10X50/CS 78.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOURNIQUET, LATEX-FREE, 1" X 18" (BRAND OR

30 46588 EQUIVALENT) TECH-MED 4407 100/BOX | MEDICAL ACTION 351550 100/BOX 39.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PROFESSIONAL
DISPOSABLES
31 47564 TOWELETTE, OBSTETRICAL (BRAND ONLY) INTL D74800 1X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Documents Included YES YES
[$90.00 MINIMUM ORDER FOR FREE SHIPPING, WROTE “N/A FOR BACK ORDERS, NO USAGE REPORTS
Exceptions to the Terms & Conditions NONE JAVAILABLE. OTHER EXCEPTIONS THAT REFER TO MEDCO'S TERMS & CONDITIONS

Additional Comments

5% ESCALATION AFTER 6 MONTHS

ICALL AFTERCONTRACT TERM FOR ESCALTION %
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ITB #08-43 MEDICAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

Bidders Name

Moore Medical

Products Unlimited, Inc

Bid Open Date: Friday, February 22, 2008 at 10:00 A.M.

Address 1690 New Britain Ave 115 E First Street
Farmington, CT 06032 Justin, TX 76247
Quoted By Nancy Vitulano Janey Cooper

Contact

Nancy Vitulano

Janey Cooper

Telephone Number

800-234-1464 x5441

800-865-4683 x 106

*Note: Vendor must fill in Manufacturer, Vendor Part #, Packaging, & UOM Price.

Vendor must bid Brand specified or equivalent. Fax Number 877-354-5916 940-648-3407
COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM | CODE D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE
ALCOHOL, ISOPROPYL, 70%, 16 OZ (BRAND OR CUMBERLAND
1 19025 EQUIVALENT) SWAN CUMS08484V EA AARON 81768 EA 1.05 MCKESSON 49176 EA 1.33
ALCOHOL WIPES, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED (BRAND
2 19025 OR EQUIVALENT) TRIAD TRI10-3101 200/BX MOORE 68534 200/BOX 1.30 MCKESSON 127569 200/BOX 157
APPLICATORS, SCOPETTES, JR, STERILE COTTON
3 47567 TIPS, JUMBO 8" (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) BIRCHWOOD BIR34-7021-12 100/PK NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PSS SELECT 53195 500/CS 39.98
APPLICATORS, WOOD, COTTON TIP, 6" STERILE,
4 47567 (BRAND OR EQUIVLANET) PURITAN HAR25-806-2WC 100PK/BX MOORE 69622 100PK/BOX 1.77 PSS SELECT 23024 100/BOX 3.03
BANDAGE JR, SHEER, 3/8 X 1 1/2 (BRAND OR
5 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO ASOCBD2027-012-000[ 12BX/CS MOORE 68186 100/BOX 1.40 ASO 2027-012-000 12BOX/CS 25.31
BANDAGE, PLASTIC, 3/4 X 3 (BRAND OR JOHNSON &
6 47509 EQUIVALENT) JOHNSON JJS5634 12BX/CS J&J 4043 100/BOX 2.82 PSS SELECT 41630 12BOX/CS 25.40
BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE FABRIC, 7/8 SPOT (BRAND OR
7 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO AGPCBD4022 100/BOX COVERLET 8079 100/BOX 3.44 ASO 4022 12BOX/CS 26.99
CONTAINER, SHARP, 4 QT, RED, MEDIUM, MEDICAL ACTION
8 99867 STACKABLE (BRAND OR EQUIVALNET) IND 8703 EA KENDALL 34983 EA 2.27 MEDICAL ACTION 8703 24/CS 92.00
CONTAINER SHARP 8.2 QT RED LARGE (BRAND OR BECTON
9 99867 EQUIVALENT) DICKINSON 305490 EA BD 74573 EA 6.09 JC BD 305490 12/CS 85.00
COTTON BALLS MEDIUM NON-STERILE (BRAND OR
10 99867 EQUIVALENT) DYNAREX DYN3170 2000/BAG MOORE 17433 2X2000BAG/CS 8.99 PSS SELECT 47315 2000/BAG 8.00
CUP, PLASTIC, TRANSLUCENT (BRAND OR
11 64050 EQUIVALENT) DART 7N25DART 25PK/CS MOORE 75048 25X100PK/CS 35.50 DART 7N25DART 25PK/CS 97.80
DRAPE SHEET 2 PLY 40 X 48 BLUE (BRAND OR
12 47564 EQUIVALENT) GRAHAM MEDICAL| GRA48615 100/CS MOORE 76987 100/CS 17.13 GRAHAM 48615 100/CS 19.99
DRESSING, TEGADERM, W/ ABSORBENT PAD,
13 47509 (BRAND ONLY) 3M 3586 25/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3M 3586 100/CS 97.00
GLOVE EXAM SYNTHETIC MEDIUM POWDER-FREE (wrong brand)
14 20142 SENSICARE (BRAND ONLY) MEDLINE MED484312 10X100/CS 65916 100/BOX 4.84 MEDLINE 484312 10BX/CS 63.00
GLOVE, EXAM, LATEX, TEXTURED, POWDER FREE, CARDINAL
15 20142 NOVAPLUS, (BRAND ONLY) HEALTH V8841 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CARDINAL V8841 10BX/CS 59.90
GLOVE EXAM VINYL SMALL POWDER-FREE (BRAND
16 20142 OR EQUIVALENT) GENERIC BRAND MMS5300-S 10X100/CS CYPRESS 77104 10X100BX/CS 24.90 SELECT 58376 10BX/CS 36.45
LUER HOLDER, MULTI-SAMPLE, 5ML, DISPOSABLE,
17 47567 NON-STERILE (BRAND ONLY) EXELENT INT'L CO 26530 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID EXEL 26530 10BX/CS 96.50
SPECULA VAGINAL, DISPOSABLE, MEDIUM (BRAND
18 47567 OR EQUIVALENT) SANI-SPEC C0082330 10/BG MOORE 68722 10/BAG 3.07 SANI-SPEC 82330 10/BG 5.40
BECTON
19 47582 NEEDLE BLOOD 22 X 1 1/4 ECLIPSE (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368608 48/BOX BD 66384 48/BOX 19.15 BD 368608 48/BOX 22.75
BECTON
20 47582 NEEDLE ECLIPSE 23 X 1 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305762 100/BOX BD 74868 100/BOX 17.96 BD 305762 100/BOX 23.00
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3ML 23 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON
21 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305271 4BXI/CS BD 73733 4X100BX/CS 192.08 BD 305271 100/BOX 53.50
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 25 X 5/8 RETRACTING BECTON
22 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305269 4BXI/CS BD 73731 4X100BX/CS 192.08 BD 305269 100/BOX 53.50
BECTON
23 47582 SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3CC 23 X 1 LL (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 309571 100/BX BD 8778 100/BOX 11.70 BD 309571 100/BOX 12.00
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COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM] CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE

SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 22 X 1 1/2 RETRACTING BECTON

24 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305272 4BXI/CS BD 73734 4X100BX/CS 192.08 BD 305272 4BXI/CS 215.00
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 25 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON

25 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305270 4SP/BX BD 73732 4X100BX/CS 192.08 BD 305270 4BXI/CS 215.00
VACUTAINER SAFETY-LOK BLOOD COLLECTION SET, BECTON

26 47582 23 X .75 NEEDLE WITH 12" TUBING (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368653 8SP/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID BD 368653 8BX/CS 275.00
SPUTUM COLLECTION KIT WITH TUBE, STERILE

27 99867 (BRAND ONLY) KENDALL 2650SA 50/CS KENDALL 78562 EA 2.04 KENDALL 2650SA 50/CS 124.00
STETHOSCOPE, DUAL-HEAD, RED (BRAND OR

28 99867 EQUIVALENT) PHYSICIAN SALES 44625 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PSS SELECT 44625 EA 4.30

29 47564 TOWEL, 3 PLY, 13.5" X 18", WHITE (BRAND ONLY) KAY-PEES 911898 10X50/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID KAYPEES 911898 10BX/CS 37.00
TOURNIQUET, LATEX-FREE, 1" X 18" (BRAND OR

30 46588 EQUIVALENT) TECH-MED 4407 100/BOX TECH MED 65324 10/PKG 1.15 PSS SELECT 127548 250/CS 39.72

PROFESSIONAL
DISPOSABLES
31 47564 TOWELETTE, OBSTETRICAL (BRAND ONLY) INTL D74800 1X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PDI D74800 10BX/CS 22.00
Bid Documents Included YES YES
Exceptions to the Terms & Conditions NONE NONE

Additional Comments

3% AFTER 6 MONTHS

5% AFTER 6 MONTHS
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ITB #08-43 MEDICAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

Bidders Name

Diamond Medical Supply

Bound Tree Medical

Bid Open Date: Friday, February 22, 2008 at 10:00 A.M.

*Note: Vendor must fill in Manufacturer, Vendor Part #, Packaging, & UOM Price.

Address 639 Kolter Drive 5200 Rings Rd Ste A
Indiana, PA 15701 Dublin, OH 43017
Quoted By Barbara Wilson Jennifer Landrine

Contact

Barbara Wilson

Cathy Taynor

Telephone Number

888-520-2500

800-533-0523

Vendor must bid Brand specified or equivalent. Fax Number 888-551-2500 800-257-5713
COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER| VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER| VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM| CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #] PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #] PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE
ALCOHOL, ISOPROPYL, 70%, 16 OZ (BRAND OR CUMBERLAND
1 19025 EQUIVALENT) SWAN CUMS08484V EA SWAN 1368992 EA 0.99 CUMBERLAND 201001 EA 1.70
ALCOHOL WIPES, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED (BRAND
2 19025 OR EQUIVALENT) TRIAD TRI10-3101 200/BX KENDALL 174-920 200/BOX 1.38 KENDALL 606818 200/BOX 1.89
APPLICATORS, SCOPETTES, JR, STERILE COTTON
3 47567 TIPS, JUMBO 8" (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) BIRCHWOOD BIR34-7021-12 100/PK BIRCHWOOD 34-7021-12 100/BOX 19.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
APPLICATORS, WOOD, COTTON TIP, 6" STERILE,
4 47567 (BRAND OR EQUIVLANET) PURITAN HAR25-806-2WC 100PK/BX DYNAREX 4305DYN 2/PK 0.04 DYNAREX F165600 100PK/BOX 2.19
BANDAGE JR, SHEER, 3/8 X 1 1/2 (BRAND OR
5 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO ASOCBD2027-012-000| 12BX/CS DYNAREX 100/BOX 1.49 J&J 152514 100/BOX 6.03
BANDAGE, PLASTIC, 3/4 X 3 (BRAND OR JOHNSON &
6 47509 EQUIVALENT) JOHNSON JJS5634 12BX/CS DYNAREX 3601DYN 100/BOX 1.55 J&J 84634 100/BOX 3.21
BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE FABRIC, 7/8 SPOT (BRAND OR
7 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO AGPCBD4022 100/BOX CURAD 2243814 50/BOX 2.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINER, SHARP, 4 QT, RED, MEDIUM, MEDICAL ACTION
8 99867 STACKABLE (BRAND OR EQUIVALNET) IND 8703 EA BD 1959147 EA 3.41 KENDALL 58676038 EA 2.68
CONTAINER SHARP 8.2 QT RED LARGE (BRAND OR BECTON
9 99867 EQUIVALENT) DICKINSON 305490 EA BD 1443431 EA 3.41 BD 605491 EA 6.94
COTTON BALLS MEDIUM NON-STERILE (BRAND OR
10 99867 EQUIVALENT) DYNAREX DYN3170 2000/BAG DYNAREX 3170DYN 200/BAG 8.06 DUKAL 86101 2X200BG/CS 10.84
CUP, PLASTIC, TRANSLUCENT (BRAND OR
11 64050 EQUIVALENT) DART 7N25DART 25PK/CS MEDLINE NONO3005 100/SL 1.55 CARDINAL 0271-95 100/BAG 0.98
DRAPE SHEET 2 PLY 40 X 48 BLUE (BRAND OR
12 47564 EQUIVALENT) GRAHAM MEDICAL| GRA48615 100/CS COMPLETE WHITE-76973 100/CS 18.76 TIDI E814503 100/CS 17.17
DRESSING, TEGADERM, W/ ABSORBENT PAD, (WRONG BRAND)
13 47509 (BRAND ONLY) 3M 3586 25/BOX 3M 3586 25/BOX 33.28 TW-MEDICAL 81624 100/BX 31.00
GLOVE EXAM SYNTHETIC MEDIUM POWDER-FREE (WRONG BRAND)
14 20142 SENSICARE (BRAND ONLY) MEDLINE MED484312 10X100/CS 1ST CHOICE 13017 100/BOX 297 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVE, EXAM, LATEX, TEXTURED, POWDER FREE, CARDINAL (WRONG BRAND)
15 20142 NOVAPLUS, (BRAND ONLY) HEALTH V8841 10X100/CS DELTA PM103 100/BOX 3.9 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVE EXAM VINYL SMALL POWDER-FREE (BRAND
16 20142 OR EQUIVALENT) GENERIC BRAND MMS5300-S 10X100/CS 1ST CHOICE 13016 100/BOX 2.97 MICROFLEX R4291 100/BX 3.64
LUER HOLDER, MULTI-SAMPLE, 5ML, DISPOSABLE,
17 47567 NON-STERILE (BRAND ONLY) EXELENT INT'L CO 26530 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID EXCEL 601037 10/BG 0.81
SPECULA VAGINAL, DISPOSABLE, MEDIUM (BRAND
18 47567 OR EQUIVALENT) SANI-SPEC C0082330 10/BG DYNAREX 10/BAG 2.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
19 47582 NEEDLE BLOOD 22 X 1 1/4 ECLIPSE (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368608 48/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
20 47582 NEEDLE ECLIPSE 23 X 1 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305762 100/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3ML 23 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON
21 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305271 4BXI/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID BD 625271 EA 0.55
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 25 X 5/8 RETRACTING BECTON
22 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305269 4BXI/CS BD 305269 100/BOX 43.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
23 47582 SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3CC 23 X 1 LL (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 309571 100/BX BD 309571 100/BOX 7.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM] CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE

SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 22 X 1 1/2 RETRACTING BECTON

24 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305272 4BXI/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 25 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON

25 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305270 4SP/BX BD 305270 100/BOX 43.94 BD 1632-27025 400/CS 218.50
VACUTAINER SAFETY-LOK BLOOD COLLECTION SET, BECTON

26 47582 23 X .75 NEEDLE WITH 12" TUBING (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368653 8SP/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SPUTUM COLLECTION KIT WITH TUBE, STERILE

27 99867 (BRAND ONLY) KENDALL 2650SA 50/CS KENDALL 2650SA 50/CS 150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STETHOSCOPE, DUAL-HEAD, RED (BRAND OR

28 99867 EQUIVALENT) PHYSICIAN SALES 44625 EA PRESTIGE S122 EA 8.67 ADC 5402202 EA 6.61

29 47564 TOWEL, 3 PLY, 13.5" X 18", WHITE (BRAND ONLY) KAY-PEES 911898 10X50/CS KAYPEES 911898 10X50/CS 51.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOURNIQUET, LATEX-FREE, 1" X 18" (BRAND OR

30 46588 EQUIVALENT) TECH-MED 4407 100/BOX CARDINAL 65324 100/PK 17.98 CERTIFIED SAFETY 352160 EA 1.31

PROFESSIONAL
DISPOSABLES (WRONG BRAND)
31 47564 TOWELETTE, OBSTETRICAL (BRAND ONLY) INTL D74800 1X100/CS TRIAD 68544 100/BOX 2.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Documents Included YES YES
Exceptions to the Terms & Conditions NONE NONE

Additional Comments

NO ESCALATION

5% ESCALATION AFTER 6 MONTHS
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ITB #08-43 MEDICAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

Bidders Name

Kentron Health Care, Inc

Henry Schein, Inc.

Bid Open Date: Friday, February 22, 2008 at 10:00 A.M.

*Note: Vendor must fill in Manufacturer, Vendor Part #, Packaging, & UOM Price.

Address 3604 Kelton Jackson Road 135 Duryea Rd.
Springfield, TN 37172 Melville, NY 11747
Quoted By Nari Sadarangani Chantale Bergeau

Contact

Nari Sadarangani

Chantale Bergeau

Telephone Number

615-384-0573

800-851-0400

Vendor must bid Brand specified or equivalent. Fax Number 615-384-0574 631-390-8173
COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER| VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER| VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM| CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #] PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #] PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE
ALCOHOL, ISOPROPYL, 70%, 16 OZ (BRAND OR CUMBERLAND
1 19025 EQUIVALENT) SWAN CUMS08484V EA SWAN AL101 12/CS 15.00 HIS 102-4716 EA 1.47
ALCOHOL WIPES, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED (BRAND
2 19025 OR EQUIVALENT) TRIAD TRI10-3101 200/BX KENDALL 5150 200/BOX 1.65 DUKAL 933-7192 200/BOX 1.54
APPLICATORS, SCOPETTES, JR, STERILE COTTON
3 47567 TIPS, JUMBO 8" (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) BIRCHWOOD BIR34-7021-12 100/PK NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID BIRCHWOOD 120-7829 500/CS 46.17
APPLICATORS, WOOD, COTTON TIP, 6" STERILE,
4 47567 (BRAND OR EQUIVLANET) PURITAN HAR25-806-2WC 100PK/BX KENTRON 451260 100PK/BOX 2.25 HIS 100-9249 100/BX/2 2.80
BANDAGE JR, SHEER, 3/8 X 1 1/2 (BRAND OR
5 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO ASOCBD2027-012-000| 12BX/CS KENTRON 880015 3600/CS 26.00 DYNAREX 267-1224 100/BX/2 0.79
BANDAGE, PLASTIC, 3/4 X 3 (BRAND OR JOHNSON &
6 47509 EQUIVALENT) JOHNSON JJS5634 12BX/CS KENTRON 880075 2400/CS 25.00 J&J 555-6278 100/BX/2 3.30
BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE FABRIC, 7/8 SPOT (BRAND OR
7 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO AGPCBD4022 100/BOX KENTRON 880175 2400/CS 26.00 ASO 166-8856 100/BX/2 2.28
CONTAINER, SHARP, 4 QT, RED, MEDIUM, MEDICAL ACTION
8 99867 STACKABLE (BRAND OR EQUIVALNET) IND 8703 EA KENDALL 1676236 40/CS 120.00 MEDICAL ACTION 153-2682 EA 3.34
CONTAINER SHARP 8.2 QT RED LARGE (BRAND OR BECTON
9 99867 EQUIVALENT) DICKINSON 305490 EA BD 305490 12/CS 78.00 BD 987-6359 EA 6.28
COTTON BALLS MEDIUM NON-STERILE (BRAND OR
10 99867 EQUIVALENT) DYNAREX DYN3170 2000/BAG KENTRON 440010 4000/CS 12.00 ABCO 152-2021 2000/BG 5.50
CUP, PLASTIC, TRANSLUCENT (BRAND OR
11 64050 EQUIVALENT) DART 7N25DART 25PK/CS FABRICAL 5N25 2500/CS 62.00 CROSSTEX 104-9869 100/PK 1.66
DRAPE SHEET 2 PLY 40 X 48 BLUE (BRAND OR
12 47564 EQUIVALENT) GRAHAM MEDICAL| GRA48615 100/CS GRAHAM 48615 100/CS 29.00 TIDI 979-3360 100/CS 19.21
DRESSING, TEGADERM, W/ ABSORBENT PAD,
13 47509 (BRAND ONLY) 3M 3586 25/BOX 3M 3586 100/CS 92.00 3M 777-8726 100/CS 107.08
GLOVE EXAM SYNTHETIC MEDIUM POWDER-FREE
14 20142 SENSICARE (BRAND ONLY) MEDLINE MED484312 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MEDLINE 987-9080 100/BX/2 4.64
GLOVE, EXAM, LATEX, TEXTURED, POWDER FREE, CARDINAL
15 20142 NOVAPLUS, (BRAND ONLY) HEALTH V8841 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVE EXAM VINYL SMALL POWDER-FREE (BRAND
16 20142 OR EQUIVALENT) GENERIC BRAND MMS5300-S 10X100/CS DYNAREX 882611 1000/CS 35.00 BALDUR 107-9964 100/BX/2 3.32
LUER HOLDER, MULTI-SAMPLE, 5ML, DISPOSABLE,
17 47567 NON-STERILE (BRAND ONLY) EXELENT INT'L CO 26530 10X100/CS EXCEL 26530 1000/CS 122.00 EXEL 337-7113 100/BX/2 8.33
SPECULA VAGINAL, DISPOSABLE, MEDIUM (BRAND
18 47567 OR EQUIVALENT) SANI-SPEC C0082330 10/BG KENTRON 300002 10/BAG 2.45 COOPER SURG. 119-6009 10/PK 3.00
BECTON
19 47582 NEEDLE BLOOD 22 X 1 1/4 ECLIPSE (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368608 48/BOX BD 368608 48/BX 19.00 ?2? 987-2645 48/BX 21.54
BECTON
20 47582 NEEDLE ECLIPSE 23 X 1 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305762 100/BOX BD B305762 100/BX 22.00 BD 987-4963 100/BX/2 21.92
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3ML 23 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON
21 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305271 4BXI/CS BD B305271 100/CS 55.00 BD 987-6244 100/BX/2 56.03
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 25 X 5/8 RETRACTING BECTON
22 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305269 4BXI/CS BD B305269 100/CS 55.00 BD 987-5659 100/BX/2 56.03
BECTON
23 47582 SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3CC 23 X 1 LL (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 309571 100/BX BD B309571 100/BX 12.00 BD 987-7076 100/BX/2 13.65
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COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM] CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE

SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 22 X 1 1/2 RETRACTING BECTON

24 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305272 4BXI/CS BD B305272 100/CS 55.00 BD 987-5497 100/BX/2 56.03
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 25 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON

25 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305270 4SP/BX BD B305270 100/CS 55.00 BD 987-9348 100/BX/2 56.03
VACUTAINER SAFETY-LOK BLOOD COLLECTION SET, BECTON

26 47582 23 X .75 NEEDLE WITH 12" TUBING (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368653 8SP/CS BD B368653 200/CS 265.00 BD 987-8940 25/BX 35.90
SPUTUM COLLECTION KIT WITH TUBE, STERILE

27 99867 (BRAND ONLY) KENDALL 2650SA 50/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID KENDALL 666-6544 50/CS 96.65
STETHOSCOPE, DUAL-HEAD, RED (BRAND OR

28 99867 EQUIVALENT) PHYSICIAN SALES 44625 EA KENTRON 711412 EA 2.95 MABIS 101-7536 EA 3.81

(WRONG BRAND)

29 47564 TOWEL, 3 PLY, 13.5" X 18", WHITE (BRAND ONLY) KAY-PEES 911898 10X50/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID TDIE 895-5218 50/BX 3-38
TOURNIQUET, LATEX-FREE, 1" X 18" (BRAND OR

30 46588 EQUIVALENT) TECH-MED 4407 100/BOX KENTRON 991100 100/BX 10.00 GRAHAM 395-0016 100/PK 16.38

PROFESSIONAL
DISPOSABLES (WRONG BRAND)
31 47564 TOWELETTE, OBSTETRICAL (BRAND ONLY) INTL D74800 1X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NICE-PAK 113-5633 100/BX/2 171
Bid Documents Included YES SIGNATURES MISSING
Exceptions to the Terms & Conditions NONE NONE

Additional Comments

5% ESCALATION AFTER 6 MONTHS

NO MENTION OF ESCALATION
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ITB #08-43 MEDICAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

Bidders Name

Henry Schein Matrix Medical

Medical Wholesale

Bid Open Date: Friday, February 22, 2008 at 10:00 A.M.

*Note: Vendor must fill in Manufacturer, Vendor Part #, Packaging, & UOM Price.

Address 140 Crouch Commercial Court 1211 Arion Parkway, Suite 118
Irmo, SC 29063 San Antonio, TX 78216
Quoted By Jesse Garringer Suzanne Glines

Contact

Elaine Keen

Suzanne Glines

Telephone Number

800-845-3550

800-397-0557

Vendor must bid Brand specified or equivalent. Fax Number 800-533-4793 210-366-1250
COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM] CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE
ALCOHOL, ISOPROPYL, 70%, 16 OZ (BRAND OR CUMBERLAND
1 19025 EQUIVALENT) SWAN CUMS08484V EA SWAN 1028806 EA 1.01 SWAN 0810-43 PINT 1.20
ALCOHOL WIPES, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED (BRAND
2 19025 OR EQUIVALENT) TRIAD TRI10-3101 200/BX DUKAL 1046352 200/BX 0.99 ECIALTY MED SUPP| MWI-1000 200/BX 1.25
APPLICATORS, SCOPETTES, JR, STERILE COTTON
3 47567 TIPS, JUMBO 8" (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) BIRCHWOOD BIR34-7021-12 100/PK BIRCHWOOD 1209765 100/BX 8.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
APPLICATORS, WOOD, COTTON TIP, 6" STERILE,
4 47567 (BRAND OR EQUIVLANET) PURITAN HAR25-806-2WC 100PK/BX HARDWOOD 1205460 100/BX 3.58 DYNAREX 4305 100/BX 2.25
BANDAGE JR, SHEER, 3/8 X 1 1/2 (BRAND OR
5 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO ASOCBD2027-012-000| 12BX/CS KENDALL 1029409 100/BX 2.23 DYNAREX 3608 12BX/CS 12.00
BANDAGE, PLASTIC, 3/4 X 3 (BRAND OR JOHNSON &
6 47509 EQUIVALENT) JOHNSON JJS5634 12BX/CS NUTRAMAX 1007565 100/BX 0.87 NUTRAMAX 9993 12BX/CS 13.20
BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE FABRIC, 7/8 SPOT (BRAND OR
7 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO AGPCBD4022 100/BOX NUTRAMAX 1555713 100/BX 1.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINER, SHARP, 4 QT, RED, MEDIUM, MEDICAL ACTION
8 99867 STACKABLE (BRAND OR EQUIVALNET) IND 8703 EA MEDACTION 1532682 EA 2.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINER SHARP 8.2 QT RED LARGE (BRAND OR BECTON
9 99867 EQUIVALENT) DICKINSON 305490 EA BD 9876359 EA 5.26 BD 305490 EA 8.30
COTTON BALLS MEDIUM NON-STERILE (BRAND OR
10 99867 EQUIVALENT) DYNAREX DYN3170 2000/BAG ABCO 1522021 2000/BAG 5.02 DYNAREX 3170 2000/BG 5.55
CUP, PLASTIC, TRANSLUCENT (BRAND OR
11 64050 EQUIVALENT) DART 7N25DART 25PK/CS SOLO 3951445 100/PK 2.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DRAPE SHEET 2 PLY 40 X 48 BLUE (BRAND OR
12 47564 EQUIVALENT) GRAHAM MEDICAL| GRA48615 100/CS TIDI 1001797 100/CS 10.04 BANTA 980924 100/CS 31.50
DRESSING, TEGADERM, W/ ABSORBENT PAD,
13 47509 (BRAND ONLY) 3M 3586 25/BOX 3M 7778726 100/BX 89.09 3M 3586 25/BX 28.50
GLOVE EXAM SYNTHETIC MEDIUM POWDER-FREE
14 20142 SENSICARE (BRAND ONLY) MEDLINE MED484312 10X100/CS MEDLINE 9879080 100/BX 4.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVE, EXAM, LATEX, TEXTURED, POWDER FREE, CARDINAL
15 20142 NOVAPLUS, (BRAND ONLY) HEALTH V8841 10X100/CS CARDINAL 1538841 100/BX 4.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVE EXAM VINYL SMALL POWDER-FREE (BRAND
16 20142 OR EQUIVALENT) GENERIC BRAND MMS5300-S 10X100/CS SEMPERMED 1026721 100/BX 2.46 INNOVATIAC 161100 10BX/CS 32.50
LUER HOLDER, MULTI-SAMPLE, 5ML, DISPOSABLE,
17 47567 NON-STERILE (BRAND ONLY) EXELENT INT'L CO 26530 10X100/CS EXEL 3377113 100/BX 7.31 EXEL 26530 10BX/100CS 115.00
SPECULA VAGINAL, DISPOSABLE, MEDIUM (BRAND
18 47567 OR EQUIVALENT) SANI-SPEC C0082330 10/BG DUKAL 1025397 10/BG 1.68 DYNAREX 4912 10/BG 2.90
BECTON
19 47582 NEEDLE BLOOD 22 X 1 1/4 ECLIPSE (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368608 48/BOX BD 9872645 48/BX 17.93 BD 368608 48/BX 24.50
BECTON
20 47582 NEEDLE ECLIPSE 23 X 1 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305762 100/BOX BD 9874963 100/BX 18.96 BD 305762 100/BX 25.50
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3ML 23 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON
21 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305271 4BXI/CS BD 9876244 100/BX 46.62 BD 305271 4/BXICS 254.00
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 25 X 5/8 RETRACTING BECTON
22 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305269 4BXI/CS BD 9875659 100/BX 48.68 BD 305269 4/BXICS 254.00
BECTON
23 47582 SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3CC 23 X 1 LL (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 309571 100/BX BD 9877076 100/BX 12.27 BD 309571 100/BX 15.50
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COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM] CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE

SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 22 X 1 1/2 RETRACTING BECTON

24 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305272 4BXI/CS BD 9875497 100/BX 46.62 BD 305272 4BXICS 253.50
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 25 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON

25 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305270 4SP/BX BD 9879348 100/BX 46.62 BD 305270 4BXI/CS 254.00
VACUTAINER SAFETY-LOK BLOOD COLLECTION SET, BECTON

26 47582 23 X .75 NEEDLE WITH 12" TUBING (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368653 8SP/CS BD 9878940 25/BX 29.87 BD 368653 8BX/CS 324.00
SPUTUM COLLECTION KIT WITH TUBE, STERILE

27 99867 (BRAND ONLY) KENDALL 2650SA 50/CS KENDALL 6666544 50/CS 105.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STETHOSCOPE, DUAL-HEAD, RED (BRAND OR

28 99867 EQUIVALENT) PHYSICIAN SALES 44625 EA MABIS 1017535 EA 3.30 MABIS 10-426-080 EA 4.50

29 47564 TOWEL, 3 PLY, 13.5" X 18", WHITE (BRAND ONLY) KAY-PEES 911898 10X50/CS KAYPEE 8955218 50/BX 2.81 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOURNIQUET, LATEX-FREE, 1" X 18" (BRAND OR

30 46588 EQUIVALENT) TECH-MED 4407 100/BOX MOTION 7535317 25/PK 5.95 DONAVAN NLT4371 EA 0.25

PROFESSIONAL
DISPOSABLES
31 47564 TOWELETTE, OBSTETRICAL (BRAND ONLY) INTL D74800 1X100/CS PRO. DISP. 1135633 100/BX 1.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Documents Included YES YES
Exceptions to the Terms & Conditions NONE NONE

Additional Comments

0% ESCALATION

5% ESCALATION AFTER 6 MONTHS
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ITB #08-43 MEDICAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

Bidders Name

McKesson Medical-Surgical

Laerdal Medical Corporation

Bid Open Date: Friday, February 22, 2008 at 10:00 A.M.

*Note: Vendor must fill in Manufacturer, Vendor Part #, Packaging, & UOM Price.

Address 8121 10th Avenue north 167 Myers Corners Rd
Golden Valley, MN 55427 Wappingers Falls, NY 12590
Quoted By Marty Swan Catherine A. Masten
Contact Marty Swan Catherine A. Masten

Telephone Number

800-328-8111

845-297-7770

Vendor must bid Brand specified or equivalent. Fax Number N/A 800-227-1143
COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM] CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE
ALCOHOL, ISOPROPYL, 70%, 16 OZ (BRAND OR CUMBERLAND
1 19025 EQUIVALENT) SWAN CUMS08484V EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALCOHOL WIPES, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED (BRAND
2 19025 OR EQUIVALENT) TRIAD TRI10-3101 200/BX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
APPLICATORS, SCOPETTES, JR, STERILE COTTON
3 47567 TIPS, JUMBO 8" (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) BIRCHWOOD BIR34-7021-12 100/PK NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
APPLICATORS, WOOD, COTTON TIP, 6" STERILE,
4 47567 (BRAND OR EQUIVLANET) PURITAN HAR25-806-2WC 100PK/BX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BANDAGE JR, SHEER, 3/8 X 1 1/2 (BRAND OR
5 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO ASOCBD2027-012-000| 12BX/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BANDAGE, PLASTIC, 3/4 X 3 (BRAND OR JOHNSON &
6 47509 EQUIVALENT) JOHNSON JJS5634 12BX/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE FABRIC, 7/8 SPOT (BRAND OR
7 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO AGPCBD4022 100/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINER, SHARP, 4 QT, RED, MEDIUM, MEDICAL ACTION
8 99867 STACKABLE (BRAND OR EQUIVALNET) IND 8703 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINER SHARP 8.2 QT RED LARGE (BRAND OR BECTON
9 99867 EQUIVALENT) DICKINSON 305490 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COTTON BALLS MEDIUM NON-STERILE (BRAND OR
10 99867 EQUIVALENT) DYNAREX DYN3170 2000/BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUP, PLASTIC, TRANSLUCENT (BRAND OR
11 64050 EQUIVALENT) DART 7N25DART 25PK/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DRAPE SHEET 2 PLY 40 X 48 BLUE (BRAND OR
12 47564 EQUIVALENT) GRAHAM MEDICAL| GRA48615 100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DRESSING, TEGADERM, W/ ABSORBENT PAD,
13 47509 (BRAND ONLY) 3M 3586 25/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVE EXAM SYNTHETIC MEDIUM POWDER-FREE
14 20142 SENSICARE (BRAND ONLY) MEDLINE MED484312 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVE, EXAM, LATEX, TEXTURED, POWDER FREE, CARDINAL
15 20142 NOVAPLUS, (BRAND ONLY) HEALTH V8841 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVE EXAM VINYL SMALL POWDER-FREE (BRAND
16 20142 OR EQUIVALENT) GENERIC BRAND MMS5300-S 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LUER HOLDER, MULTI-SAMPLE, 5ML, DISPOSABLE,
17 47567 NON-STERILE (BRAND ONLY) EXELENT INT'L CO 26530 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SPECULA VAGINAL, DISPOSABLE, MEDIUM (BRAND
18 47567 OR EQUIVALENT) SANI-SPEC C0082330 10/BG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
19 47582 NEEDLE BLOOD 22 X 1 1/4 ECLIPSE (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368608 48/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
20 47582 NEEDLE ECLIPSE 23 X 1 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305762 100/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3ML 23 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON
21 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305271 4BXI/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 25 X 5/8 RETRACTING BECTON
22 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305269 4BXI/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
23 47582 SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3CC 23 X 1 LL (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 309571 100/BX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM] CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 22 X 1 1/2 RETRACTING BECTON
24 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305272 4BXI/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 25 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON
25 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305270 4SP/BX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VACUTAINER SAFETY-LOK BLOOD COLLECTION SET, BECTON
26 47582 23 X .75 NEEDLE WITH 12" TUBING (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368653 8SP/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SPUTUM COLLECTION KIT WITH TUBE, STERILE
27 99867 (BRAND ONLY) KENDALL 2650SA 50/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STETHOSCOPE, DUAL-HEAD, RED (BRAND OR
28 99867 EQUIVALENT) PHYSICIAN SALES 44625 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 47564 TOWEL, 3 PLY, 13.5" X 18", WHITE (BRAND ONLY) KAY-PEES 911898 10X50/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOURNIQUET, LATEX-FREE, 1" X 18" (BRAND OR
30 46588 EQUIVALENT) TECH-MED 4407 100/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PROFESSIONAL
DISPOSABLES
31 47564 TOWELETTE, OBSTETRICAL (BRAND ONLY) INTL D74800 1X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Documents Included NO BID NO BID
Exceptions to the Terms & Conditions NO BID NO BID
Additional Comments NO BID NO BID
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ITB #08-43 MEDICAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

Bidders Name

Fox Scientific

William V. MacGill & Co.

Bid Open Date: Friday, February 22, 2008 at 10:00 A.M.

*Note: Vendor must fill in Manufacturer, Vendor Part #, Packaging, & UOM Price.

Address 8221 East FM 917 1000 Lombard Rd
Alvarado, TX 76009 Lombard, IL 60148
Quoted By Elaine (last name is illegible) Melissa (last name is illegible)

Contact

Telephone Number

800-369-9524

800-323-2841

Vendor must bid Brand specified or equivalent. Fax Number
COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM] CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE
ALCOHOL, ISOPROPYL, 70%, 16 OZ (BRAND OR CUMBERLAND
1 19025 EQUIVALENT) SWAN CUMS08484V EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALCOHOL WIPES, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED (BRAND
2 19025 OR EQUIVALENT) TRIAD TRI10-3101 200/BX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
APPLICATORS, SCOPETTES, JR, STERILE COTTON
3 47567 TIPS, JUMBO 8" (BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) BIRCHWOOD BIR34-7021-12 100/PK NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
APPLICATORS, WOOD, COTTON TIP, 6" STERILE,
4 47567 (BRAND OR EQUIVLANET) PURITAN HAR25-806-2WC 100PK/BX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BANDAGE JR, SHEER, 3/8 X 1 1/2 (BRAND OR
5 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO ASOCBD2027-012-000| 12BX/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BANDAGE, PLASTIC, 3/4 X 3 (BRAND OR JOHNSON &
6 47509 EQUIVALENT) JOHNSON JJS5634 12BX/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE FABRIC, 7/8 SPOT (BRAND OR
7 47509 EQUIVALENT) ASO AGPCBD4022 100/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINER, SHARP, 4 QT, RED, MEDIUM, MEDICAL ACTION
8 99867 STACKABLE (BRAND OR EQUIVALNET) IND 8703 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINER SHARP 8.2 QT RED LARGE (BRAND OR BECTON
9 99867 EQUIVALENT) DICKINSON 305490 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COTTON BALLS MEDIUM NON-STERILE (BRAND OR
10 99867 EQUIVALENT) DYNAREX DYN3170 2000/BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUP, PLASTIC, TRANSLUCENT (BRAND OR
11 64050 EQUIVALENT) DART 7N25DART 25PK/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DRAPE SHEET 2 PLY 40 X 48 BLUE (BRAND OR
12 47564 EQUIVALENT) GRAHAM MEDICAL| GRA48615 100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DRESSING, TEGADERM, W/ ABSORBENT PAD,
13 47509 (BRAND ONLY) 3M 3586 25/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVE EXAM SYNTHETIC MEDIUM POWDER-FREE
14 20142 SENSICARE (BRAND ONLY) MEDLINE MED484312 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVE, EXAM, LATEX, TEXTURED, POWDER FREE, CARDINAL
15 20142 NOVAPLUS, (BRAND ONLY) HEALTH V8841 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLOVE EXAM VINYL SMALL POWDER-FREE (BRAND
16 20142 OR EQUIVALENT) GENERIC BRAND MMS5300-S 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LUER HOLDER, MULTI-SAMPLE, 5ML, DISPOSABLE,
17 47567 NON-STERILE (BRAND ONLY) EXELENT INT'L CO 26530 10X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SPECULA VAGINAL, DISPOSABLE, MEDIUM (BRAND
18 47567 OR EQUIVALENT) SANI-SPEC C0082330 10/BG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
19 47582 NEEDLE BLOOD 22 X 1 1/4 ECLIPSE (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368608 48/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
20 47582 NEEDLE ECLIPSE 23 X 1 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305762 100/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3ML 23 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON
21 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305271 4BXI/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 25 X 5/8 RETRACTING BECTON
22 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305269 4BXI/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BECTON
23 47582 SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3CC 23 X 1 LL (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 309571 100/BX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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COMM| COUNTY MANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG JMANUFACTURER VENDOR UOM VENDOR PKG
ITEM] CODE 1D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFG PKG NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE NAME VENDOR PART #| PKG (SOLD AS) PRICE
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 22 X 1 1/2 RETRACTING BECTON
24 47582 (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 305272 4BXI/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SYRINGE / NEEDLE 25 X 1 RETRACTING (BRAND BECTON
25 47582 ONLY) DICKINSON 305270 4SP/BX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VACUTAINER SAFETY-LOK BLOOD COLLECTION SET, BECTON
26 47582 23 X .75 NEEDLE WITH 12" TUBING (BRAND ONLY) DICKINSON 368653 8SP/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SPUTUM COLLECTION KIT WITH TUBE, STERILE
27 99867 (BRAND ONLY) KENDALL 2650SA 50/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STETHOSCOPE, DUAL-HEAD, RED (BRAND OR
28 99867 EQUIVALENT) PHYSICIAN SALES 44625 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 47564 TOWEL, 3 PLY, 13.5" X 18", WHITE (BRAND ONLY) KAY-PEES 911898 10X50/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOURNIQUET, LATEX-FREE, 1" X 18" (BRAND OR
30 46588 EQUIVALENT) TECH-MED 4407 100/BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PROFESSIONAL
DISPOSABLES
31 47564 TOWELETTE, OBSTETRICAL (BRAND ONLY) INTL D74800 1X100/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Documents Included NO BID NO BID
Exceptions to the Terms & Conditions NO BID NO BID
Additional Comments NO BID NO BID
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